

RFB 42-30NOV23 - Shop Fluids - Term & Supply			Ed Miller Auto Supply, Inc.	Safety Kleen Systems, Inc.	MFA Oil
Bid Tabulation			Bidder 1	Bidder 2	Bidder 3
Item #	Unit of Measure	Description	Columbia, Mo.	Norwell, MA	Columbia, Mo.
4.9.1	2.5 GAL	Universal Tractor Fluid	\$ 55.22	\$8.07/G	\$ 37.70
4.9.2	55-GAL barrel	Universal Tractor Fluid	\$ 583.24	\$ 498.00	\$ 800.25
4.9.3	2.5 GAL	15W-40 (Extended Service)	\$ 742.50	\$10.10/G	\$ 32.57
4.9.4	55-GAL barrel	15W-40 (Extended Service)	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 684.75
4.9.5	2.5 GAL	Hydraulic Oil (ISO-46)	\$ 50.00	\$7.10/G	\$ 26.72
4.9.6	55-GAL barrel	Hydraulic Oil (ISO-46)	\$ 514.45	\$ 460.00	\$ 558.80
4.9.7	GAL	Coolant (DexCool or equal)	\$ 7.10	\$ 412.70	\$ 6.25
4.9.8	GAL	Coolant (Extended Life) 50/50.	\$ 10.07	No Bid	\$ 14.33
4.9.9	55-GAL barrel	Coolant (Extended Life) 50/50.	\$ 421.75	\$ 315.00	\$ 695.75
4.9.10	QTS	Gear Lubricant 75w90 syn.	\$ 16.25	No Bid	\$ 627.00
4.9.11	55-GAL.	Gear Lubricant 75w90 syn.	\$ 523.88	\$ 1,069.00	\$ 1,471.80
4.9.12	barrel	Grease (Cartridge) NLGI #2	\$ 4.99	\$ 55.20	\$ 3.27
4.9.13	Tube	Grease (Cartridge) NLG1	\$ 7.21	\$ 81.10	\$ 4.38
4.9.14	Tube	Automatic Transmission Fluid	\$ 62.05	No Bid	\$ 18.60
4.9.15	GAL	Automatic Transmission Fluid	\$ 2,005.67	No Bid	\$ 973.50
4.9.16	55-GAL barrel	0W-20	\$ 822.22	\$ 604.00	\$ 794.75
4.9.17	55-GAL barrel	5W-40	\$ 1,342.26	\$ 1,206.00	\$ 1,283.15

RFB 42-30NOV23 - Shop Fluids - Term & Supply			Ed Miller Auto Supply, Inc.	Safety Kleen Systems, Inc.	MFA Oil
Bid Tabulation			Bidder 1	Bidder 2	Bidder 3
Item #	Unit of Measure	Description	Columbia, Mo.	Norwell, MA	Columbia, Mo.
4.9.18	55-GAL barrel	5W-20	\$ 817.38	\$ 642.00	\$ 752.95
4.9.19	55-GAL barrel	5W-30	\$ 822.22	\$ 642.00	\$ 793.65
4.9.20	55-GAL barrel	Hydraulic Oil (ISO-68)	\$ 746.15	\$ 498.00	\$ 27.47
4.9.21	55 GAL. barrel	Hydraulic Oil (ISO-68)	\$ 20.00	No Bid	\$ 575.30
4.9.32	1	TOTAL 4.9.1-4.9.21	\$ 49,593.28	\$ 33,041.94	\$ 49,738.68
4.10.1	1	1st Renewal Price Increase	3%	2%	15%
4.10.2	1	2nd Renewal Price Increase	3%	2%	15%
4.10.3	1	3rd Renewal Price Increase	2%	2%	15%
4.10.4	1	4th Renewal Price Increase	2%	2%	15%
4.10.5	1	5th Renewal Price Increase	2%	2%	15%
4.11	1	Minimum Discount Off List Price	5%	NA	20%
Delivery ARO			30	5	3
Co-Op			Yes	Yes	Yes