

| <b>RFB 11-27FEB23</b>   | <b>Bidders</b>             |                    |                           |                                 |  |
|---|----------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------|---------------------------------|--|
| <b>Large Truck Repair Services</b>  | <b>Premier Truck Group</b> | <b>Joe Machens</b> | <b>Rush Truck Centers</b> | <b>MHC Kenworth of Columbia</b> |  |
| <b>Line Item</b>  |                            |                    |                           |                                 |  |
| 4.10.1 Mechanical Repair - Regular Business Hours   | \$ 157.00                  | See Bid            | \$ 145.00                 | \$ 171.25                       |  |
| 4.10.2 Mechanical Repair – Overtime and Holiday Hours   | \$ 157.00                  | See Bid            | \$ 218.00                 | \$ 171.25                       |  |
| 4.10.3 Firm, fixed discount that will be applied to the current Manufacturer Suggested Retail Price (MSRP) for repair parts and supplies.   | 28%                        | \$ 128.00          | 40%                       | 20%                             |  |
| 4.10.4 Mark-Up: Quote a firm, fixed Mark-Up % that will be applied to the current vendor's list price – must be less than the Manufacturer Suggested Retail Price (MSRP) for repair parts and supplies. | No Bid                     | No Bid             | 50%                       | Varies (See Bid)                |  |
| 4.10.5 Body Repair - Regular Business Hours   | No Bid                     | No Bid             | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |
| 4.10.6 Body Repair – Overtime and Holiday Business Hours  | No Bid                     | No Bid             | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |
| 4.10.7 Painting - Regular Business Hours  | No Bid                     | No Bid             | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |
| 4.10.8 Painting – Overtime and Holiday Business Hours   | No Bid                     | No Bid             | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |

| <b>RFB 11-27FEB23</b>  | <b>Bidders</b>             |                    |                           |                                 |  |
|--|----------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------|---------------------------------|--|
| <b>Large Truck Repair Services</b>   | <b>Premier Truck Group</b> | <b>Joe Machens</b> | <b>Rush Truck Centers</b> | <b>MHC Kenworth of Columbia</b> |  |
| 4.10.9 Firm, fixed discount that will be applied to the current Manufacturer Suggested Retail Price (MSRP) for repair parts and supplies.  | No Bid                     | No Bid             | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |
| 4.10.10 Mark-Up: Quote a firm, fixed Mark-Up % that will be applied to the current vendor's list price – must be less than the Manufacturer Suggested Retail Price (MSRP) for repair parts and supplies. | No Bid                     | 25%                | No Bid                    | No Bid                          |  |
| 4.11.1. Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment<br>1st Renewal Period   | 3%                         | 5%                 | 10%                       | 12%                             |  |
| 4.11.2 Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment<br>2nd Renewal Period  | 3%                         | 5%                 | 10%                       | 12%                             |  |
| 4.11.3 Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment<br>3rd Renewal Period  | 3%                         | 5%                 | 10%                       | 12%                             |  |
| 4.11.4 Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment<br>4th Renewal Period  | 3%                         | 5%                 | 10%                       | 12%                             |  |
| Regular Business Hours   | See bid                    | See bid            | See bid                   | See bid                         |  |
| Holidays   | See bid                    | See bid            | See bid                   | See bid                         |  |
| Cooperative Procurement  | Yes                        | Yes                | Yes                       | No                              |  |