

20-29APR22 - Bituminous Materials - Term & Supply

	Vendor		Coastal Energy Corp			Missouri Petroleum Products Co., LLC			Vance Brothers, inc.		
	Item	QTY	Delivered Price/gal	Picked up-Price/gal 1000 gal minimum	Picked up Price/gal full transport load	Delivered Price/gal	Picked up-Price/gal 1000 gal minimum	Picked up Price/gal full transport load	Delivered Price/gal	Picked up-Price/gal 1000 gal minimum	Picked up Price/gal full transport load
1	CRS-2	200,000 gal	\$2.69	\$2.63	\$2.63	\$2.73	\$2.54	\$2.54	\$2.52	\$2.41	\$2.41
2	MC 3000	1,500 gal	\$3.51	\$3.45	\$3.45	\$4.33	\$4.08	\$4.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	PEP	6,000 gal	\$4.50	\$4.44	\$4.44	\$2.65	\$2.46	\$2.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	SS-1	Full Tanker	\$2.56	\$2.50	\$2.50	\$2.65	\$2.46	\$2.46	\$2.52	\$2.41	\$2.41
5	CRS-2P	230,000 gal	\$2.99	\$2.93	\$2.93	\$3.01	\$2.82	\$2.82	\$3.08	\$2.97	\$2.97
6	MC-800	Full Tanker	\$3.56	\$3.50	\$3.50	\$4.48	\$4.29	\$4.29	\$3.84	\$3.73	\$3.73
7	MC-30	Full Tanker	\$4.16	\$4.10	\$4.10	\$5.04	\$4.85	\$4.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	AEP	6,000 gal	\$3.00	\$2.96	\$2.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	CHFRS2-P	150,000 gal	\$3.04	\$2.98	\$2.98	\$3.07	\$2.88	\$2.88	\$3.08	\$2.97	\$2.97
10	EA-90	200,000 gal	\$2.76	\$2.70	\$2.70	\$2.75	\$2.56	\$2.56	\$2.57	\$2.46	\$2.46
11	EA-90P	150,000 gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.97	\$2.78	\$2.78	\$3.08	\$2.97	\$2.97
12	Demurrage Charge	Per Hour	\$75.00			\$100.00			\$70.00		
13	Demurrage begins after:	# Hours	2			1.5			1.5		
14	Delivery turnaround:	Days	1			1			1		
15	Renewals: Maximum % increase for any renewal period	%	25%			40%			50%		
16	Coop?	Yes / No	Yes			Yes			No		