

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.1	Mattress Minimum 25" W X 75"L X 4"H Cover and batting meet/exceed federal correctional flammability standards (16 CFR Part 1633, DOC Federal Flammability FF-4-72, and California Technical Bulletins 129 and 603)	\$ 62.29	\$ 61.90	\$ 64.00	NO BID All Items	NO BID All Items	NO BID All Items
4.10.2	Mattress Cover Heavy-duty vinyl laminate – Open-end, must slip-over/fit mattress specified above (item for easy-on/off use; flame resistant, mildew and water resistant – wipes clean with soap and water	\$ 15.22	\$ 17.90	\$ 20.18			
4.10.3	Pillow Minimum 20" X 26" full size pillow, includes breathable PVC-coated polyester knit cover, dark green, wipes clean, includes tear-resistant cover, flame resistant – meets NFPA 701 flammability requirements, 100% polyester fiber pillow -	\$ 7.49	\$ 5.98	\$ 17.62			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.4	Wool Blanket Grey woven wool blanket Minimum 4#'s each Overstitched all sides Fire-resistant in accordance with federal standard 16 CFR Part 1610, and/or ASTM D4151-92, Washable and dryable Minimum 66"X90" Acceptable minimum wool content: 52%	\$ 7.93	\$ 8.18	\$ 12.67			
4.10.5	Poly-cotton, Durable Prison Blanket Minimum 55% polyester/30% acrylic/ 10% cotton/ 5% other fibers, minimum 60" X 90" size, safe and fire resistant, meets/exceeds the ASTM D4151 flammability test, strong, durable, seamless construction with stitching on all four-sides to prevent unraveling, soft/plush feel, Grey with blue striping, individually packed in a poly bag, sold individually or per case of 12	\$ 6.47	\$ 6.90	\$ 11.71			
4.10.6	Heavy Duty Sandal One-piece molded PVC vinyl construction, soft and flexible for indoor and outdoor use. No air pocket in sole. Durable and long-lasting. Sizes: 6-16 Packaging: 24 pair per case	\$ 2.55	\$ 2.18	\$ 7.32			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.7	Mildew-Resistant Shower Sandal Everyday PVC Sandal No-Skid Form-fitting, prevents slippage Flexible B-chek (or equal) to reduce odors Mildew resistant	\$ 2.65	No Bid	\$ 5.98			
4.10.8	Every-day Wear Clog Designed for comfortable all-day wear Convertible non-metal riveted heel strap Vented to promote airflow in the tow-box Cushioned sole Defined outside ridges for non-slip, surface-gripping traction Water-resistant and non-marking Color: Black	\$ 4.58	\$68.18/DZ	\$ 9.41			
4.10.9	Sweatpants Adult Grey cotton/poly blend Elastic cuffs No drawstring and no pockets Minimal shrinkage Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 5.22	\$ 9.18	\$ 16.86			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.10	Sweatshirt Adult crew neck pullover Grey cotton/poly blend Collar, Cuffs and waistband shall be cover seamed and ribbed with elastic cuff and waistband Minimal shrinkage No hood, no drawstring and no pockets Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 5.16	\$ 9.89	\$ 16.86			
4.10.11	T-Shirt Minimum 5-oz Medium weight 100% Cotton, Maroon, No-Pocket T-shirt Double-needle cover-stitched front neck Seamless ribbed collar with shoulder-to-shoulder tape Double-needle stitched bottom hem and sleeves Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 2.62	\$2.98/\$4.90	\$ 12.13			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
Bidders:		Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
Bid Tabulation		Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.12	Women's Underwear Poly/cotton blend Brief-style with double panel crotch with soft knitted leg and waistband for snug, comfortable fit. Shall withstand several washings/dryings Must include all sizes: size 5-size 18 (S-3XL) Packaging: 12/pack	\$8.40/\$12.95	\$ 10.90	\$ 23.54			
4.10.13	Toothpaste Minimum 1.5 oz. fluoride toothpaste Mint, white All plastic tube with twist cap No animal fat or by-products, and no alcohol	\$ 33.12	\$ 46.90	\$ 51.04			
4.10.14	Toothbrush, 3.25" Super Shorty, minimum 25-tuft, nylon bristles, individually sealed in clear bags	\$ 6.48	\$ 8.90	\$ 10.99			
4.10.15	Deodorant Soap, Individually Wrapped Minimum 1.5 oz. bar deodorant bar soap No animal fat or by-products Packaging: 500/case	\$ 56.54	\$ 68.90	\$ 99.81			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.16	Anti-bacterial Soap, Unwrapped 1.5# unwrapped antibacterial bar deodorant soap; average minimum 1.2 oz. bar No animal fat or by-products Packaging: 500/case	\$ 64.02	\$ 64.90	\$ 93.94			
4.10.17	Shampoo Clear shampoo in clear bottle Quality shampoo Alcohol-free, Animal-fat free Individual Bottle: Minimum 2 fluid oz. 96 bottles per case	\$ 29.00	\$ 36.90	\$ 41.04			
4.10.18	Razor Single-stainless steel blade, clear plastic handle and razor head with clear removable safety cap, one-piece construction Packaged: 10 razors per package, 100 packages per box for 1,000 razors per case	\$ 69.00	\$ 99.90	\$ 190.52			
4.10.19	Comb, Pocket – No Handle Black Plastic Minimum 5" Packaging: 2,160/case Price by the case	\$ 41.04	\$ 52.90	\$ 66.59			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.20	<p>Cleaning Detergent Single Pack concentrated detergent/disinfectant, formulated to clean, disinfect, and deodorize hard surfaces in institutional settings. Fights mildew, bacteria and viruses: Kills HIV-1 on pre-cleaned surfaces Easy-to-use: one-packet is used in one-bucket of water to dilute – dissolves quickly in water Each packet makes 1-gallon of cleaning solution 180-packets in a resealable, recyclable plastic tubs Brand Reference: Bob Barker EasyPak Detergent Disinfectant #90650</p>	\$ 55.36	\$ 66.90	\$ 165.59			
4.10.21	<p>ID Band with Fasteners Orange/white plastic polyethylene bracelet with metal fastener, stretch-resistant, can be written-on Brand-reference: Bob Barker Clincher II Write-On Laminate, Plastic Fasteners</p>	\$ 156.00	\$ 229.90	\$ 238.29			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.22	ID Band Fastener Tool Compatible for use with above plastic ID band Brand Reference: Bob Barker Fastening Tool for Clincher, #647	\$ 98.59	\$ 89.90	\$ 133.31			
4.10.23	Pen, Black-Ink Jail safe flex pens, flexible and bendable, minimum 4.5" total length, black ink, clear plastic body and cap - Price by the box/144 pens per box Brand Reference: ICS Jail Supplies M04FXP	\$ 14.69	\$ 14.98	\$ 24.62			
4.10.24	Tampons Bulk Sanitax Tampons Individually wrapped with cardboard applicator Regular 500/case	\$ 62.50	\$ 84.89	\$ 82.27			
4.10.25	Sanitary Napkins, Bulk Minimum 8.5 inches long Center adhesive strip provides stay-in-place adhesion Individually folded and wrapped Packaging: 250/case	\$ 11.00	\$ 39.90	\$ 29.08			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.26	Washcloths, Bath Economy Washcloths, Brown Minimum .75# per dozen Minimum 12" X 12" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12 per package	\$ 3.52	\$ 4.18	\$ 3.58			
4.10.27	Towels, Bath – Dozen Pack Economy Bath Towels White Minimum 6#/dozen Minimum 22" X 44" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12/pack	\$ 15.12	\$ 19.90	\$ 23.13			
4.10.28	Towels, Bath – Bale Economy Bath Towels White Minimum 6#/dozen Minimum 22" X 44" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12-pack Price per bale or 25 12-packs (300 cloths)	\$ 378.00	\$ 472.50	\$ 578.25			
4.10.29	Catalog Discount for Miscellaneous Items Firm, fixed discount off current list price or MSRP, whichever is lower	15%	5%	5%			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.30	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - Medium	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.31	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - Large	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.32	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - XLarge	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.33	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 2X	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.34	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 3X	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.90	\$ 17.72			
4.10.35	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 4X	\$ 6.67	\$ 8.54	\$ 17.72			
4.10.36	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 6X	\$ 6.67	\$ 8.90	\$ 19.57			
4.10.37	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -8X	\$ 8.95	\$ 9.90	\$ 19.57			
4.10.38	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -9X	\$ 8.95	\$ 10.90	\$ 21.56			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.39	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -10X	\$ 12.66	\$ 10.90	\$ 21.56			
4.10.40	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -Medium	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.41	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -Large	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.42	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -XLarge	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.43	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -2X	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.90	\$ 14.25			
4.10.44	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -3X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.54	\$ 15.57			
4.10.45	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -4X	\$ 5.55	\$ 7.90	\$ 15.57			
4.10.46	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -6X	\$ 5.55	\$ 8.54	\$ 17.63			
4.10.47	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -8X	\$ 7.55	\$ 8.90	\$ 17.63			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.48	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -9X	\$ 7.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 19.39			
4.10.49	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -10X	\$ 7.76	\$ 9.54	\$ 19.39			
4.10.50	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - Medium	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.51	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - Large	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.52	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - XLarge	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.53	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 2X	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.54	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 3X	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.90	\$ 15.22			
4.10.55	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 4X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.54	\$ 15.22			
4.10.56	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 6X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.90	\$ 17.07			
4.10.57	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -8X	\$ 9.05	\$ 9.90	\$ 17.07			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.58	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -9X	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.90	\$ 19.06			
4.10.59	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -10X	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.90	\$ 19.06			
4.10.60	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - Medium	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.61	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - Large	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.62	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - XLarge	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.63	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 2X	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.90	\$ 11.75			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.64	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 3X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.07			
4.10.65	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 4X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.90	\$ 13.07			
4.10.66	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 6X	\$ 5.45	\$ 8.54	\$ 15.13			
4.10.67	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 8X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.90	\$ 15.13			
4.10.68	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 9X	\$ 8.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 16.89			
4.10.69	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 10X	\$ 8.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 16.89			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.70.1	1st Renewal options Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
4.10.70.2	2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
4.10.70.3	3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
	Notes:						
	Co-Op	Y	Y	Y			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.1	Mattress Minimum 25" W X 75"L X 4"H Cover and batting meet/exceed federal correctional flammability standards (16 CFR Part 1633, DOC Federal Flammability FF-4-72, and California Technical Bulletins 129 and 603)	\$ 62.29	\$ 61.90	\$ 64.00	NO BID All Items	NO BID All Items	NO BID All Items
4.10.2	Mattress Cover Heavy-duty vinyl laminate – Open-end, must slip-over/fit mattress specified above (item for easy-on/off use; flame resistant, mildew and water resistant – wipes clean with soap and water	\$ 15.22	\$ 17.90	\$ 20.18			
4.10.3	Pillow Minimum 20" X 26" full size pillow, includes breathable PVC-coated polyester knit cover, dark green, wipes clean, includes tear-resistant cover, flame resistant – meets NFPA 701 flammability requirements, 100% polyester fiber pillow -	\$ 7.49	\$ 5.98	\$ 17.62			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.4	Wool Blanket Grey woven wool blanket Minimum 4#'s each Overstitched all sides Fire-resistant in accordance with federal standard 16 CFR Part 1610, and/or ASTM D4151-92, Washable and dryable Minimum 66"X90" Acceptable minimum wool content: 52%	\$ 7.93	\$ 8.18	\$ 12.67			
4.10.5	Poly-cotton, Durable Prison Blanket Minimum 55% polyester/30% acrylic/ 10% cotton/ 5% other fibers, minimum 60" X 90" size, safe and fire resistant, meets/exceeds the ASTM D4151 flammability test, strong, durable, seamless construction with stitching on all four-sides to prevent unraveling, soft/plush feel, Grey with blue striping, individually packed in a poly bag, sold individually or per case of 12	\$ 6.47	\$ 6.90	\$ 11.71			
4.10.6	Heavy Duty Sandal One-piece molded PVC vinyl construction, soft and flexible for indoor and outdoor use. No air pocket in sole. Durable and long-lasting. Sizes: 6-16 Packaging: 24 pair per case	\$ 2.55	\$ 2.18	\$ 7.32			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.7	Mildew-Resistant Shower Sandal Everyday PVC Sandal No-Skid Form-fitting, prevents slippage Flexible B-chek (or equal) to reduce odors Mildew resistant	\$ 2.65	No Bid	\$ 5.98			
4.10.8	Every-day Wear Clog Designed for comfortable all-day wear Convertible non-metal riveted heel strap Vented to promote airflow in the tow-box Cushioned sole Defined outside ridges for non-slip, surface-gripping traction Water-resistant and non-marking Color: Black	\$ 4.58	\$68.18/DZ	\$ 9.41			
4.10.9	Sweatpants Adult Grey cotton/poly blend Elastic cuffs No drawstring and no pockets Minimal shrinkage Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 5.22	\$ 9.18	\$ 16.86			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.10	Sweatshirt Adult crew neck pullover Grey cotton/poly blend Collar, Cuffs and waistband shall be cover seamed and ribbed with elastic cuff and waistband Minimal shrinkage No hood, no drawstring and no pockets Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 5.16	\$ 9.89	\$ 16.86			
4.10.11	T-Shirt Minimum 5-oz Medium weight 100% Cotton, Maroon, No-Pocket T-shirt Double-needle cover-stitched front neck Seamless ribbed collar with shoulder-to-shoulder tape Double-needle stitched bottom hem and sleeves Sizes: S-3XL Price per each	\$ 2.62	\$2.98/\$4.90	\$ 12.13			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.12	Women's Underwear Poly/cotton blend Brief-style with double panel crotch with soft knitted leg and waistband for snug, comfortable fit. Shall withstand several washings/dryings Must include all sizes: size 5-size 18 (S-3XL) Packaging: 12/pack	\$8.40/\$12.95	\$ 10.90	\$ 23.54			
4.10.13	Toothpaste Minimum 1.5 oz. fluoride toothpaste Mint, white All plastic tube with twist cap No animal fat or by-products, and no alcohol	\$ 33.12	\$ 46.90	\$ 51.04			
4.10.14	Toothbrush, 3.25" Super Shorty, minimum 25-tuft, nylon bristles, individually sealed in clear bags	\$ 6.48	\$ 8.90	\$ 10.99			
4.10.15	Deodorant Soap, Individually Wrapped Minimum 1.5 oz. bar deodorant bar soap No animal fat or by-products Packaging: 500/case	\$ 56.54	\$ 68.90	\$ 99.81			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.16	Anti-bacterial Soap, Unwrapped 1.5# unwrapped antibacterial bar deodorant soap; average minimum 1.2 oz. bar No animal fat or by-products Packaging: 500/case	\$ 64.02	\$ 64.90	\$ 93.94			
4.10.17	Shampoo Clear shampoo in clear bottle Quality shampoo Alcohol-free, Animal-fat free Individual Bottle: Minimum 2 fluid oz. 96 bottles per case	\$ 29.00	\$ 36.90	\$ 41.04			
4.10.18	Razor Single-stainless steel blade, clear plastic handle and razor head with clear removable safety cap, one-piece construction Packaged: 10 razors per package, 100 packages per box for 1,000 razors per case	\$ 69.00	\$ 99.90	\$ 190.52			
4.10.19	Comb, Pocket – No Handle Black Plastic Minimum 5" Packaging: 2,160/case Price by the case	\$ 41.04	\$ 52.90	\$ 66.59			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.20	<p>Cleaning Detergent Single Pack concentrated detergent/disinfectant, formulated to clean, disinfect, and deodorize hard surfaces in institutional settings. Fights mildew, bacteria and viruses: Kills HIV-1 on pre-cleaned surfaces Easy-to-use: one-packet is used in one-bucket of water to dilute – dissolves quickly in water Each packet makes 1-gallon of cleaning solution 180-packets in a resealable, recyclable plastic tubs Brand Reference: Bob Barker EasyPak Detergent Disinfectant #90650</p>	\$ 55.36	\$ 66.90	\$ 165.59			
4.10.21	<p>ID Band with Fasteners Orange/white plastic polyethylene bracelet with metal fastener, stretch-resistant, can be written-on Brand-reference: Bob Barker Clincher II Write-On Laminate, Plastic Fasteners</p>	\$ 156.00	\$ 229.90	\$ 238.29			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.22	ID Band Fastener Tool Compatible for use with above plastic ID band Brand Reference: Bob Barker Fastening Tool for Clincher, #647	\$ 98.59	\$ 89.90	\$ 133.31			
4.10.23	Pen, Black-Ink Jail safe flex pens, flexible and bendable, minimum 4.5" total length, black ink, clear plastic body and cap - Price by the box/144 pens per box Brand Reference: ICS Jail Supplies M04FXP	\$ 14.69	\$ 14.98	\$ 24.62			
4.10.24	Tampons Bulk Sanitax Tampons Individually wrapped with cardboard applicator Regular 500/case	\$ 62.50	\$ 84.89	\$ 82.27			
4.10.25	Sanitary Napkins, Bulk Minimum 8.5 inches long Center adhesive strip provides stay-in-place adhesion Individually folded and wrapped Packaging: 250/case	\$ 11.00	\$ 39.90	\$ 29.08			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.26	Washcloths, Bath Economy Washcloths, Brown Minimum .75# per dozen Minimum 12" X 12" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12 per package	\$ 3.52	\$ 4.18	\$ 3.58			
4.10.27	Towels, Bath – Dozen Pack Economy Bath Towels White Minimum 6#/dozen Minimum 22" X 44" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12/pack	\$ 15.12	\$ 19.90	\$ 23.13			
4.10.28	Towels, Bath – Bale Economy Bath Towels White Minimum 6#/dozen Minimum 22" X 44" 100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth Packaging: 12-pack Price per bale or 25 12-packs (300 cloths)	\$ 378.00	\$ 472.50	\$ 578.25			
4.10.29	Catalog Discount for Miscellaneous Items Firm, fixed discount off current list price or MSRP, whichever is lower	15%	5%	5%			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.30	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - Medium	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.31	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - Large	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.32	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - XLarge	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.33	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 2X	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.54	\$ 16.20			
4.10.34	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 3X	\$ 6.67	\$ 7.90	\$ 17.72			
4.10.35	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 4X	\$ 6.67	\$ 8.54	\$ 17.72			
4.10.36	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes - 6X	\$ 6.67	\$ 8.90	\$ 19.57			
4.10.37	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -8X	\$ 8.95	\$ 9.90	\$ 19.57			
4.10.38	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -9X	\$ 8.95	\$ 10.90	\$ 21.56			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.39	Institutional Trousers - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -10X	\$ 12.66	\$ 10.90	\$ 21.56			
4.10.40	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -Medium	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.41	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -Large	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.42	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -XLarge	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 14.25			
4.10.43	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -2X	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.90	\$ 14.25			
4.10.44	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -3X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.54	\$ 15.57			
4.10.45	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -4X	\$ 5.55	\$ 7.90	\$ 15.57			
4.10.46	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -6X	\$ 5.55	\$ 8.54	\$ 17.63			
4.10.47	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -8X	\$ 7.55	\$ 8.90	\$ 17.63			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.48	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -9X	\$ 7.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 19.39			
4.10.49	Institutional V-Neck Shirts - Black & White Horizontal Stripes -10X	\$ 7.76	\$ 9.54	\$ 19.39			
4.10.50	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - Medium	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.51	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - Large	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.52	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - XLarge	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.53	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 2X	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.70			
4.10.54	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 3X	\$ 6.95	\$ 7.90	\$ 15.22			
4.10.55	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 4X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.54	\$ 15.22			
4.10.56	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering - 6X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.90	\$ 17.07			
4.10.57	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -8X	\$ 9.05	\$ 9.90	\$ 17.07			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	Bidders:	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.58	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -9X	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.90	\$ 19.06			
4.10.59	Institutional Trousers - Green No Lettering -10X	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.90	\$ 19.06			
4.10.60	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - Medium	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.61	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - Large	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.62	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - XLarge	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.54	\$ 11.75			
4.10.63	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 2X	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.90	\$ 11.75			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.64	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 3X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.54	\$ 13.07			
4.10.65	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 4X	\$ 5.45	\$ 7.90	\$ 13.07			
4.10.66	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering - 6X	\$ 5.45	\$ 8.54	\$ 15.13			
4.10.67	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering -8X	\$ 6.95	\$ 8.90	\$ 15.13			
4.10.68	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering -9X	\$ 8.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 16.89			
4.10.69	Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green No Lettering -10X	\$ 8.55	\$ 9.54	\$ 16.89			

RFB 09-16MAR22 - Detainee Hygiene-Other Supplies and Detainee Uniform Items							
	<i>Bidders:</i>	Bob Barker	Charm-Tex	ICS Jail Supply	Interboro Packaging	Kiesler Police Supply	Mc Gilton Construction
	Bid Tabulation	Fuquay-Varina, NC	Brooklyn, NY	Waco, TX			
Line Item							
4.10.70.1	1st Renewal options Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
4.10.70.2	2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
4.10.70.3	3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price Adjustment	3%	15%-20%	15%			
	Notes:						
	Co-Op	Y	Y	Y			