

**32-01OCT20 - TIRES - PASSENGER VEHICLES, PATROL VEHICLES, LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS, and TRAILERS**

<b>BID TABULATION</b>								
4.9.	<b>PRICING</b>		<b>McKnight Tire Company, Inc</b>	<b>Pomp's Tire Service</b>	<b>The Goodyear Tire &amp; Rubber Company</b>			
<b>Category A – Passenger Vehicle Tires</b>								
	<b>Tire Size</b>	<b>Load Rating</b>	<b>Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)</b>	<b>Tire (Only)</b>	<b>Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)</b>	<b>Tire (Only)</b>	<b>Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)</b>	<b>Tire (Only)</b>
1	P205/65 R15	SL	\$69.78	\$47.28	\$70.00	\$47.00	No Bid	\$60.38
2	P235/75 R15	SL	\$123.40	\$100.90	\$123.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$90.40
2.1.	P235/75 R15	XL	\$121.90	\$99.40	\$122.00	\$99.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	P205/65 R16	SL	\$76.46	\$53.96	\$76.00	\$53.00	No Bid	\$70.19
4	P215/55 R16	SL	\$85.59	\$63.09	\$86.00	\$63.00	No Bid	\$73.07
5	P215/60 R16	SL	\$82.50	\$60.00	\$78.00	\$55.00	No Bid	\$69.55
6	P215/70 R16	SL	\$78.66	\$56.16	\$70.00	\$47.00	No Bid	\$75.59
7	P225/60 R16	SL	\$78.74	\$56.24	\$79.00	\$56.00	No Bid	\$71.50
8	P235/65 R16	SL	\$81.00	\$58.50	\$81.00	\$58.00	No Bid	\$75.99
9	P225/65 R17	SL	\$86.83	\$64.33	\$85.00	\$62.00	No Bid	\$84.00
9.1.	P225/65 R17	XL	No bid	No Bid	\$118.00	\$93.00	No Bid	No Bid
10	P235/55 R17	SL	\$98.26	\$75.76	\$98.00	\$75.00	No Bid	\$85.36
11	P245/65 R17	SL	\$120.17	\$97.67	\$120.00	\$97.00	No Bid	\$115.82
11.1.	P245/65 R17	XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$135.00	\$112.00	No Bid	No Bid
12	P265/70 R17	SL	\$145.16	\$122.66	\$145.00	\$122.00	No Bid	\$104.84
13	P245/55 R18	SL	\$99.30	\$76.80	\$99.00	\$76.00	No Bid	No Bid
14	P245/60 R18	SL	\$126.05	\$103.55	\$126.00	\$103.00	No Bid	\$105.18
15	P255/60 R18	SL	No Bid	No Bid	\$164.00	\$141.00	No Bid	\$141.30
15.1.	P255/60 R18	XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$162.00	\$139.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Total Category A</b>			<b>\$1,473.80</b>	<b>\$1,136.30</b>	<b>\$2,037.00</b>	<b>\$1,598.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$1,223.17</b>

4.9.	<u>PRICING</u>	McKnight Tire Company, Inc	Pomp's Tire Service	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company				
<b>Category B - Light Duty Truck / SUV / Van Tires</b>								
	Tire Size	Load Rating	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)
16	235/75 R15	SL	\$121.90	\$99.40	\$123.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$62.40
16.1.	235/75 R15	C	No Bid	No Bid	\$136.00	\$113.00	No Bid	\$132.45
17	215/85 R16	E	\$127.26	\$104.76	\$127.00	\$104.00	No Bid	\$115.00
18	225/70 R16	SL	\$89.72	\$67.22	\$123.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$72.01
19	225/75 R16	SL	\$122.10	\$99.60	\$127.00	\$104.00	No Bid	\$111.26
19.1.	225/75 R16	E	\$128.94	\$106.44	\$129.00	\$106.00	No Bid	\$113.00
20	235/85 R16	SL	No Bid	No Bid	\$126.00	\$103.00	No Bid	No Bid
20.1.	235/85 R16	E	\$126.36	\$103.86	\$137.00	\$114.00	No Bid	\$108.34
21	245/70 R16	SL	\$149.38	\$126.88	\$127.00	\$104.00	No Bid	\$110.81
21.1.	245/70 R16	E	No Bid	No Bid	\$149.00	\$126.00	No Bid	No Bid
22	245/75 R16	SL	\$134.77	\$112.27	\$123.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$107.87
22.1.	245/75 R16	E	\$130.32	\$107.82	\$130.00	\$107.00	No Bid	\$118.00
23	255/70 R16	SL	\$155.53	\$133.03	\$141.00	\$118.00	No Bid	\$99.24
24	265/70 R16	SL	\$141.06	\$118.56	\$148.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$102.21
25	265/75 R16	SL	\$146.12	\$123.62	\$140.00	\$117.00	No Bid	\$110.08
25.1.	265/75 R16	E	\$135.79	\$113.29	\$136.00	\$113.00	No Bid	\$135.00
26	225/70 R17	SL	No Bid	No Bid	\$165.00	\$142.00	No Bid	No Bid
27	235/70 R17	XL	\$151.06	\$128.56	\$147.00	\$124.00	No Bid	\$129.16
28	235/80 R17	E	\$141.56	\$119.06	\$142.00	\$119.00	No Bid	\$134.00
29	245/70 R17	SL	\$126.26	\$103.76	\$126.00	\$103.00	No Bid	\$122.00
29.1	245/70 R17	E	\$144.66	\$122.16	\$145.00	\$122.00	No Bid	\$125.00
30	245/75 R17	E	\$152.27	\$129.77	\$152.00	\$129.00	No Bid	\$135.00
31	255/65 R17	SL	\$137.33	\$114.83	\$137.00	\$114.00	No Bid	\$97.85
32	255/70 R17	SL	\$165.32	\$142.82	\$148.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$122.00
33	265/70 R17	SL	\$145.16	\$122.66	\$145.00	\$122.00	No Bid	\$104.84
33.1.	265/70 R17	E	\$154.16	\$131.66	\$154.00	\$131.00	No Bid	\$140.00
<b>Total Category B</b>			<b>\$3,027.03</b>	<b>\$2,532.03</b>	<b>\$3,583.00</b>	<b>\$2,985.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$2,607.52</b>

4.9.	<u>PRICING</u>	McKnight Tire Company, Inc	Pomp's Tire Service	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
------	----------------	----------------------------	---------------------	------------------------------------

**Category C- Pursuit Tires**

	Size		Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)
34	P225/60 R16		\$124.50	\$102.00	\$92.00	\$69.00	No Bid	\$93.00
35	P235/55 R17		\$138.50	\$116.00	\$127.00	\$104.00	No Bid	\$108.00
36	P265/60 R17		\$151.50	\$129.00	\$143.00	\$120.00	No Bid	\$120.00
37	P225/60 R18		\$145.50	\$123.00	\$137.00	\$114.00	No Bid	\$115.00
38	P255/60 R18		\$161.50	\$139.00	\$162.00	\$139.00	No Bid	\$139.00
39	P245/55 R18		\$157.50	\$135.00	\$149.00	\$126.00	No Bid	\$124.00
<b>Total Category C</b>			<b>\$879.00</b>	<b>\$744.00</b>	<b>\$810.00</b>	<b>\$672.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$699.00</b>

**Category D – Trailer Tires**

	Size	Load Rating	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)	Price (Including all services in 2.2.2.)	Tire (Only)
40	ST175/80 D13	C	\$82.50	\$60.00	\$59.00	\$46.00	No Bid	No Bid
41	ST205/75 R15	C	\$107.50	\$85.00	\$80.00	\$67.00	No Bid	\$78.73
41.1.	ST205/75 R15	D	\$113.50	\$91.00	\$81.00	\$68.00	No Bid	\$78.73
42	ST235/80 R16	E	\$143.50	\$121.00	\$112.00	\$99.00	No Bid	\$107.39
42.1.	ST235/80 R16	F	\$147.50	\$125.00	\$123.00	\$110.00	No Bid	No Bid
43	ST235/85 R16	E	\$143.50	\$121.00	\$121.00	\$108.00	No Bid	\$118.33
43.1.	ST235/85 R16	F	\$167.50	\$145.00	\$133.00	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid
44	285/75 R16	E	\$196.75	\$174.25	\$167.00	\$154.00	No Bid	\$130.55
<b>Total Category D</b>			<b>\$1,102.25</b>	<b>\$922.25</b>	<b>\$876.00</b>	<b>\$772.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$513.73</b>

**Category E – Tire Related Services**

1	Tire Repair – In Shop (each)		\$18.95		\$20.00		No Bid	
2	Tire Rotation		\$15.00		\$5.00 /tire		No Bid	
3	Alignment – Front End (each)		\$54.95		\$69.95		No Bid	
	Alignment - Front and Rear (each)		\$72.95		\$79.95		No Bid	
5	Computer Balancing of Tire (each)		\$10.00		\$15.00		No Bid	
6	Mount Tires		\$5.00		\$5.00 /tire		No Bid	
7	Service Call in County per hour		\$85.00		\$85.00		No Bid	
8	Service Call in County per mile		\$2.00		\$0.00		No Bid	
9	Flat Shop Rate per hour		\$65.00		\$75.00		No Bid	
10	Mounting and Dismounting Tires (per cross section inch)		\$4.50		\$10.00		No Bid	
11	Tire Disposal Fee per tire		\$3.50		\$3.00		No Bid	
12	Tire Fee per Senate Bill 225		\$0.50		\$0.50		No Bid	
13	Valve Stem		\$2.00		\$2.50		No Bid	
14	TPMS Sensor Replacement (Ford/Chevrolet/Dodge)	10% Mark-up \$15 Labor			\$43.00 part	\$12.00 Labor	No Bid No Bid	
15	List any other Fees or Charges not covered by aforementioned services in Category 4	TPMS Service Kit: \$5.99			No Bid		No Bid	
<b>Total Category E</b>			<b>\$339.35</b>		<b>\$360.90</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>Grand Total Categories A-E</b>			<b>\$6,821.43</b>	<b>\$5,673.93</b>	<b>\$7,666.90</b>	<b>\$6,387.90</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$5,043.42</b>

<b>COOP? (Yes or No)</b>	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Maximum % Increase for 1st Renewal Period</b>	0%	5%	2%
<b>Maximum % Increase for 1st Renewal Period</b>	0%	5%	2%
<b>Maximum % Increase for 1st Renewal Period</b>	0%	5%	2%
<b>Minimum % discount off retail for all product lines introduced after inception of the contract, and all existing lines not specified herein</b>	10%	Current Govt Pricing	No Bid

No Bid: Lee's Tire Company