
RFB 28 -06JUN19 

Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 
Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period 
4.10.1 Document Scanner 16174 SmartLF ex 40e C2610067R $ 45.00 $ 96.83 $ 111.83 $ 1,080.35 

4.10.2 Document Scanner 16082 Fujitsu 5750C 102162 $ 12.00 NB $ 13.33 $ 761.60 

4.10.3 Document Scanner 16082 Fujitsu 5750C 102086 $ 12.00 NB $ 13.33 $ 761.60 

4.10.4 Document Scanner 16081 Fujitsu 5750C 102156 $ 12.00 NB $ 13.33 $ 761.60 

4.10.5 Server 15575 Dell PowerEdge SC430 96FQ6B1 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 3.50 $ 61.20 

4.10.6 Server 14844 HP Proliant DL360 G4 EA00MSGZ48 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 9.97 $ 275.40 

4.10.7 Server 14845 HP Proliant DL360 G4 USE514A3K5 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 9.97 $ 275.40 

4.10.8 Server 15356 HP Proliant ML350 G4p USE607N2B9 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 39.00 $ 149.60 

4.10.9 Server 16173 HP Proliant DL360 GS USE716N0T1 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 20.20 $ 195.50 

4.10.10 Server 16148 HP Proliant DL360 GS USE806N096 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 20.20 $ 195.50 

4.10.11 Server 17478 HP Proliant DL360 G7 USE032N461 $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 8.47 $ 351.90 

4.10.12 Server 18564 HP Proliant DL360 G7 USE330ACNA $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 8.47 $ 351.90 
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RFB 28 -06JUN19 

Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 
Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 

Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period 

4.10.13 Server 18S88 HP Proliant DL360 G7 USE334CDMC $ 12.00 $ 30.SS $ 8.47 $ 351.90 

4.10.14 Server 17985 HP Proliant DL380 G7 USE2161SWP $ 12.00 $ 30.SS $ 13.83 $ 436.05 

4.10.15 Server 17903 HP Proliant DL380 G7 USE208WE9B $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 13.83 $ 436.05 

4.10.16 Server 18062 HP Proliant DL380 G7 USE22688WP $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 13.83 $ 436.05 

4.10.17 Server 18615 Dell PowerEdge T620 7ZXV8Z1 $ 18.00 $ 30.58 $ 89.97 $ 306.00 

4.10.18 Server 19380 HP Proliant DL360e GS MXQ43700PM $ 12.00 $ 30.58 $ 8.27 $ 195.50 

4.10.19 Plotter 16414 HP DesignJet 26100 42" SG7B52900N $ 45.00 $ 56.08 $ 86.50 $ 942.65 

4.10.20 Notebook 18028 Panasonic Toughbook CF-19 2DKYA45192 $ 15.00 $ 12.17 $ 8.53 $ 159.80 

4.10.21 Notebook 19119 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75599 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.22 Notebook 18454 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3CTYB32915 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.23 Notebook 19152 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75596 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.24 Notebook 19121 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4BTYA87471 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 
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RFB 28 -06JUN19 

Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 
Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 

Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the lnltla I Contract 

Period Period Period 

4.10.25 Notebook 19116 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75531 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.26 Notebook 19149 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA92840 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.27 Notebook 19153 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75527 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 
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RFB 28 -06JUN19 

Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 
Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 

Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period 

4.10.28 Notebook 19335 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA97443 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.29 Notebook 18453 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3CTYB33091 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.30 Notebook 19150 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA91791 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.31 Notebook 19339 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA96317 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.32 Notebook 18455 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3CTYB32615 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.33 Notebook 19336 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA97405 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.34 Notebook 19334 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4DTYA03089 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.35 Notebook 19147 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA93132 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.36 Notebook 19337 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4DTYA03060 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.37 Notebook 19118 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75676 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.38 Notebook 18456 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3CTYB33073 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.39 Notebook 19155 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75551 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 
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RFB 28 -06JUN19 
Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 

Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 
Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period 

4.10.40 Notebook 18452 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3CTYB32879 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.41 Notebook 19113 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75868 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.42 Notebook 19148 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75563 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.43 Notebook 19120 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4BTYA87757 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.44 Notebook 19112 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75786 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.45 Notebook 19154 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75602 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.46 Notebook 19151 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75515 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.47 Notebook 19114 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75566 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.48 Notebook 19122 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4BTYA87620 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.49 Notebook 19338 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CTYA96263 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

Page 5 of 12 



RFB 28 -06JUN19 

Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair 
Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 

Bid Tabulation Bidder 1: 

NPA Computer, Inc. 
Computer Plus Sales & Service, The Jasper Group International, LogixService, Inc. 

Inc. Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Service 

Line Item Item Tag# Item Description Serial Number Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Number Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period 

4.10.50 Notebook 19117 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75749 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.51 Notebook 19115 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 3LTYA75744 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.52 Notebook 19123 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4BTYA87548 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.53 Notebook 19124 Panasonic Toughbook CF-31 4CYTA92693 $ 18.00 $ 12.17 $ 23.30 $ 159.80 

4.10.54 Notebook 19676 Panasonic Toughbook CF-54 5ATSA01257 $ 22.00 $ 12.17 $ 56.63 $ 159.80 

4.10.55 Notebook 19675 Panasonic Toughbook CF-54 5ATSA01242 $ 22.00 $ 12.17 $ 56.63 $ 159.80 

Renewal Option 1 3% 2.5% 3% 5% 

Renewal Option 2 3% 2% 3% 5% 

Renewal Option 3 3% 2% 3% 5% 

Renewal Option 4 3% 2% 3% 5% 

Cooperative Procurement Yes Yes Yes Yes 
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Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 

Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 85.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 

Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 

Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 
Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Page 10 of 12 



Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 
Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 
Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Bidder 5: Bidder 6: Bidder 7: Bidder 8: Bidder 9: Bidder 10: 

Dynamic Advantage, Inc. Midwest Computech TurnKey Mobile, Inc. Image Quest Inc. American Micro OnSite Repair 

Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Price Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service Firm, Fixed Monthly Service 

Price for the Initial Contract for the Initial Contract Period Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract Price for the Initial Contract 

Period Period Period Period Period 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$ 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5% 

5% 

5% 

5% 

Yes 
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