
Bid Tabulation RFB 20-14MAY18 -

Automotive Supplies 

Updated 6/5/18 - See Fife Memo 

QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands carquest of 

Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Inc. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.1 Oil Filter - LFP3000XL 3 $ 17.11 $ 55.67 $ 18.03 $ 26.47 $ 32.17 $ 20.27 $ 18.77 $ 24.12 $ 20.70 $ 28.00 

4.12.2 Oil Filter - LFPS090 26 $ 19.94 No Bid $ 18.04 $ 19.95 No Bid $ 16.73 No Bid $ 18.46 $ 17.90 No Bid 

4.12.3 Oil Filter - LFP6043 s $ 22.80 $ 46.21 $ 20.44 $ 21.13 $ 25.87 $ 18.33 $ 18.40 $ 19.32 $ 20.46 No Bid 

4.12.4 Oil Filter - PHSOO 68 $ 3.01 $ 1.95 $ 2.92 $ 2.96 $ 3.60 $ 2.36 $ 2.62 $ 2.73 $ 2.70 $ 3.50 

4.12.S Oil Filter - PH48 40 $ 3.49 $ 2.30 $ 3.51 $ 2.84 $ 3.79 $ 1.10 $ 2.48 $ 2.87 $ 2.60 $ 2.66 

4.12.6 Oil Filter - LFPS214 17 $ 36.09 $ 33.13 $ 16.02 $ 16.77 $ 22.13 $ 30.02 $ 14.42 $ 16.60 $ 32.39 $ 16.80 

4.12.7 Oil Filter - LFP4836 11 $ 8.42 $ 18.47 $ 7.84 $ 9.23 $ 11.22 $ 7.00 $ 7.06 $ 8.42 $ 7.56 $ 7.35 

4.12.8 Oil Filter - LFP2051 20 $ 9.82 $ 21.31 $ 9.47 $ 11.00 $ 13.23 $ 8.13 $ 8.52 $ 9.92 $ 8.82 $ 8.40 

4.12.9 Oil Filter - PH253 8 $ 3.99 $ 2.30 $ 2.95 $ 4.77 $ 7.54 $ 2.98 $ 2.65 $ 3.02 $ 3.14 $ 2.87 

4.12.10 Fuel Filter - L5091F 2 $ 56.12 $ 117.32 $ 47.48 $ 40.45 $ 53.39 $ 47.84 $ 42.99 $ 40.05 $ 50.36 $ 58.80 

4.12.11 Fuel Filter - LFF6963 15 $ 77.97 $ 109.43 $ 47.19 $ 58.47 $ 68.77 $ 65.94 $ 42.47 $ 51.57 $ 71.15 $ 54.60 

4.12.12 Fuel Filter - LFF6964 15 $ 77.97 $ 94.95 $ 42.18 $ 48.70 $ 57.29 $ 67.21 $ 37.96 $ 42.97 $ 72.53 $ 47.60 

4.12.13 Fuel Filter - G6593 9 $ 5.57 $ 7.18 $ 5.26 $ 5.36 $ 6.51 $ 4.75 $ 5.31 $ 4.93 $ 5.00 $ 3.67 
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QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory M otor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands Carquest of 

Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Int . (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.14 Fuel Filter - L5467FNXL 1 $ 10.31 $ 21.85 $ 9.33 $ 11.03 $ 13.37 $ 8.44 $ 8.39 $ 10.03 $ 9.25 $ 11.20 

4.12.15 Air Filter - AF2884 46 $ 6.36 $ 7.49 $ 29.00 $ 6.48 $ 7.85 $ 5.80 No Bid $ 5.94 $ 5.70 $ 37.80 

4.12.16 Air Filter - LAF6986 1 $ 55.14 $ 127.37 $ 51.70 $ 51.05 $ 62.18 $ 43.93 $ 46.53 $ 46.63 $ 49.50 $ 61.95 

4.12.17 Air Filter - LAF1519 44 $ 8.58 No Bid $ 8.89 $ 9.55 No Bid $ 7.51 No Bid $ 9.14 $ 7.70 $ 2.66 

4.12.18 Air Filter - LAF6902 12 $ 14.16 $ 31.07 $ 14.47 $ 15.78 $ 19.17 $ 11.78 $ 13.02 $ 14.38 $ 12.71 $ 12.25 

4.12.19 Air Filter - LAF8669 15 $ 34.82 $ 77.92 $ 32.60 $ 41.39 $ 49.92 $ 28.96 $ 29.33 $ 37.44 $ 31.24 $ 39.20 

4.12.20 Hydraulic Filter - LFH9347 20 $ 47.11 $ 83.54 No Bid $ 41.93 $ 15.90 $ 39.92 $ 32.21 $ 38.17 $ 43.08 $ 42.00 

4.12.21 Hydraulic Filter - LFH7221 5 $ 22.35 $ 37.38 $ 17.26 $ 18.66 $ 23.51 $ 18.59 $ 15.33 $ 17.63 $ 20.06 $ 18.90 

4.12.22 Hydraulic Filter - LH4582G 2 $ 44.41 $ 95.44 $ 40.11 $ 47.84 $ 57.22 $ 36.00 $ 36.10 $ 42.91 $ 39.84 $ 47.95 

4.12.23 Cabin Filter - CAF1885P 45 $ 4.80 $ 8.49 No Bid $ 5.66 $ 7.81 $ 4.56 No Bid $ 5.92 $ 4.30 $ 9.44 

4.12.24 Cabin Filter - CAF24016 41 $ 8.75 $ 18.64 $ 7.71 $ 9.67 $ 11.78 $ 6.66 $ 6.93 $ 8.83 $ 7.89 $ 9.45 

4.12.25 Subtotal -All Filters Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment De leted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 112 

4.12.26 Brake Shoes/Pads {Raybestos) 20 No Bid $ 44.97 $ 58.46 $ 36.06 $ 72.24 $ 56.75 No Bid $ 53.28 No Bid $ 51.99 

- PFH161120 (Front) 
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QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands Carquest of 

Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Inc. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.27 Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybestos) 3 No Bid $ 58.13 $ 40.60 $ 30.14 $ 73.29 $ 48.78 No Bid $ 53.29 No Bid $ 49.39 

- PFH161220 (Back) 

4.12.28 Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybestos) 1 No Bid $ 42.49 $ 82.52 $ 54.78 $ 96.04 $ 77.66 No Bid $ 73.16 No Bid $ 45.49 
- PFH106610 

4.12.29 Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybestos) 1 No Bid $ 27.51 $ 43.64 $ 28.77 $ 39.94 $ 58.74 No Bid $ 41.61 No Bid $ 30.54 

- 960(Rear) 

4.12.30 Rotors/Drums (Raybestos) 40 No Bid $ 83.94 No Bid $ 80.30 No Bid $ 182.19 No Bid $ 57.93 No Bid s 63.24 
BRRF-318-lX(Front) 

4.12.31 Rotors/Drums (Raybestos) 6 No Bid s 57.05 No Bid $ 65.71 No Bid $ 167.26 No Bid $ 36.62 No Bid s 38.49 

BRRF-92-lX(Rear) 

4.12.32 Rotors/Drums (Raybestos) 2 No Bid $ 120.34 No Bid $ 67.87 $ 74.71 $ 97.57 No Bid $ 81.39 No Bid $ 72.79 

PRT5731 

4.12.33 Sub Total - Brakes (Part 1) Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

4.12.34 Brake Drums - 9003687X 1 No Bid $ 148.53 $ 189.69 No Bid $ 165.27 s 186.17 No Bid $ 236.38 No Bid $ 134.84 

4.12.35 Brake Drums - 3600AX 4 No Bid $ 85.63 $ 79.99 No Bid $ 123.08 $ 61.73 No Bid s 143.32 No Bid $ 100.43 

(Balanced) 

(Qty: 16/order) 

4.12.36 Air Brake Chambers/Spring 11 No Bid No Bid s 76.18 No Bid No Bid $ 47.79 No Bid $ 60.46 No Bid $ 97.64 

Brake MGM (OEM) 

GC3030LCW 

4.12.37 Brake Show Kits w/ Hardware 1 No Bid $ 78.49 $ 71.87 No Bid $ 76.58 s 69.69 No Bid $59.95 (new) No Bid $ 73.00 

XK2124715QP ot $53.78 (reman) 

4.12.38 Brake Show Kits w/ Hardware - 5 No Bid $ 58.99 $ 56.90 No Bid s 62.84 s 41.82 No Bid $59.85 (new) No Bid $ 51.61 

FLT4707QP23K ot $58.24 (reman) 

(Qty: 16/order) 

4.12.39 Brake Show Kits w/ Hardware - 1 No Bid No Bid $ 58.45 No Bid No Bid $ 41.82 No Bid $67.13 (new) No Bid s 59.98 

4709 23K ot $61.99 (reman) 
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QlY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands carquest of 

M aintenance Parts, LLC dba M HC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Inc. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.40 Sub Total - Brakes (Part 2) Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Delet ed Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

4.12.41 Windshield Wiper Blades SP16 2 $ 5.97 $ 9.93 $ 6.49 $ 4.92 $ 7.99 No Bid No Bid $ 14.11 $ 5.47 $ 9.35 

(Profile) 

4.12.42 Windshield Wiper Blades SP20 8 $ 5.97 $ 10.25 $ 6.49 $ 6.88 $ 8.67 No Bid No Bid $ 14.11 $ 5.47 $ 12.23 

(Profile) 

4.12.43 Windshield Wiper Blades SP22 95 $ 5.59 $ 10.95 $ 6.49 $ 6.88 $ 9.59 No Bid No Bid $ 15.80 $ 5.06 $ 13.67 

(Profile) 

4.12.44 Windshield Wiper Blades 6 $ 5.97 $ 11.85 $ 6.49 $ 6.88 $ 10.39 No Bid No Bid $ 15.80 $ 5.47 $ 13.67 

SP24(Profile) 

4.12.45 Windshield Wiper Blades Item It em Deleted By It em Deleted By Item Deleted By Item Deleted By lte m Deleted By Item Deleted By Item Deleted By Item Deleted By Item Deleted By Item Deleted By 

31-22 Deleted By Addendum #1 Addendum #l Addendum#l Addendum#l Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 

Addendum 

4.12.46 Windshield Wiper Blades 23 $ 5.97 $ 12.60 $ 6.49 $ 4.59 $ 11.19 No Bid No Bid $ 15.80 $ 5.47 $ 13.67 

SP26(Profile) 

4.12.47 Windshield Wiper Blades 1 $ 3.99 $ 8.90 $ 3.32 $ 1.66 $ 1.99 $ 3.68 No Bid $ 4.22 $ 2.37 $ 7.19 

31-22 

4.12.48 Windshield Wiper Blades 9 $ 5.11 $ 11.63 $ 8.41 $ 3.85 $ 9.99 $ 5.28 No Bid $ 14.93 $ 3.98 $ 10.07 

31-22 

4.12.49 Windshield Wiper Blades 1 $ 5.11 $ 9.69 $ 8.25 $ 3.85 $ 8.49 $ 5.88 No Bid $ 13.34 $ 4.11 $ 8.63 

30-20 

4.12.50 Windshield Wiper Blades 1 $ 3.99 $ 7.91 $ 3.24 $ 1.66 $ 1.99 $ 4.78 No Bid $ 4.18 $ 2.37 $ 7.19 

31-20 

4.12.51 Windshield Wiper Blades 1 $ 3.99 $ 10.29 $ 3.44 $ 1.66 $ 1.99 $ 4.18 No Bid $ 5.69 $ 2.37 $ 7.19 

31-24 

4.12.52 SubTotal Windshield Wipers Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment De leted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 
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QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive SCheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands carquest of 
Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Inc. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.53 Lamps - H6024 9 No Bid $ 9.55 $ 9.21 $ 7.24 $ 6.59 $ 11.45 No Bid No Bid $ 5.35 $ 9.63 

4.12.54 Lamps - H6054 1 No Bid $ 8.48 $ 8.61 $ 7.25 $ 6.59 $ 8.86 No Bid No Bid $ 6.28 $ 8.39 

4.12.55 Lamps - H4651 1 No Bid $ 6.96 $ 8.43 $ 7.25 $ 6.59 $ 7.37 No Bid No Bid $ 5.34 $ 6.85 

4.12.56 Lamps - 3357 1 No Bid $ 1.19 $ 0.67 $ 0.92 $ 6.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7.16 $ 1.08 

4.12.57 Lamps -3157 1 No Bid $ 0.60 $ 0.63 $ 0.57 $ 5.74 $ 0.86 No Bid No Bid $ 4.40 $ 0.57 

4.12.58 Lamps -3156 1 No Bid $ 0.60 $ 1.18 $ 0.48 $ 5.33 $ 1.30 No Bid No Bid $ 4.00 $ 0.58 

4.12.59 Lamps -3157-NA 4 No Bid $ 1.09 $ 1.83 $ 1.08 $ 5.74 $ 2.14 No Bid No Bid $ 8.27 $ 1.02 

4.12.60 Lamps -9012 1 No Bid $ 23.99 $ 49.22 $ 21.82 $ 17.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.19 $ 20.99 

4.12.61 Lamps - H9007 2 No Bid $ 3.96 $ 3.88 $ 2.98 $ 6.45 $ 2.44 No Bid No Bid $ 3.05 $ 3.91 

4.12.62 Lamps - H9006 1 No Bid $ 3.96 $ 3.40 $ 3.16 $ 6.47 $ 2.39 No Bid No Bid $ 2.33 $ 3.91 

4.12.63 Lamps - H9005 3 No Bid $ 3.96 $ 3.40 $ 2.98 $ 6.43 $ 1.90 No Bid No Bid $ 2.30 $ 3.91 

4.12.64 Lamps - H9003 4 No Bid $ 3.96 $ 6.91 $ 3.07 $ 6.34 $ 4.38 No Bid No Bid $ 3.06 $ 3.91 

4.12.65 Lamps - 4057 1 No Bid $ 1.07 $ 1.68 $ 2.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.29 $ 1.08 
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QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands Carquest of 

Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Int. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.66 Lamps- 4157 1 No Bid $ 1.29 $ 1.31 $ 1.06 $ 13.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.79 $ 1.18 

4.12.67 Tail Light - 561BR LED 6" 6 No Bid $26.16 or $21.06 $ 9.39 $ 16.23 No Bid $ 9.11 No Bid No Bid $ 7.27 $ 22.09 

Oval/Stop/Turn 

4.12.68 Tail Light - 542BR LED 4" 2 No Bid $ 25.70 $ 10.43 $ 2.83 No Bid $ 7.57 No Bid No Bid $ 7.54 $ 15.80 

Round Stop/ Tai I/ Turn 

4.12.69 Marker Light - 504BR LED 2.5'' 14 No Bid $ 7.83 $ 5.23 $ 5.65 No Bid $ 2.76 No Bid No Bid $ 3.64 $ 6.11 

RED Clearance Marker Light 

4.12.70 Marker Light -504BA LED 2.5" 8 No Bid $ 7.83 $ 5.33 $ 1.89 No Bid $ 2.63 No Bid No Bid $ 36.64 $ 6.11 

AMBER Clearance Marker 

Light 

4.12.71 Marker Light -533BR LED 2" 10 No Bid $ 7.54 $ 5.57 $ 2.00 No Bid $ 2.44 No Bid No Bid $ 3.56 $ 5.94 

RED Clearance Marker Light 

4.12.72 Marker Light -533BA LED 2" 6 No Bid $ 7.54 $ 5.57 $ 3.66 No Bid $ 2.44 No Bid No Bid $ 3.56 $ 5.94 

AMBER Clearance Marker 

Light 

4.12.73 Marker Light - 513BR LED Low 2 No Bid $ 18.94 $ 13.59 $ 23.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7.11 $ 38.67 

Profile Identification 3 Light 

Bar 

4.12.74 Back-up Light - 561BC LED 6" 4 No Bid $ 51.01 $ 16.55 $ 19.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12.33 $ 42.92 

Oval 

4.12.75 SubTotal Lamps Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

4.12.76 35 Windshield Washer Fluid 60 No Bid $ 3.79 $ 4.18 $ 2.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 or $3.75 $ 4.59 

Pre-mix-1 G 

4.12.77 SubTotal Windshield Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

Washer/Antifreeze Solvent - #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

Winter 

4.12.78 20 Windshield Washer Fluid 65 No Bid $ 3.79 $ 2.10 $ 1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.79 $1.12 or $2.25 $ 2.75 

Pre-mix -1 G 
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QTY 

Line Item Description Vehicle Ashland Auto & Ag Ozark Kenworth Factory Motor Parts O'Reilly Automotive Scheppers Farm & City Supply Ed Miller Auto Champion Brands Carquest of 
Maintenance Parts, LLC dba MHC Kenworth Stores, dba O'Reilly International Truck LLC Supply Inc. (NAPA) LLC Columbia 

Program, Inc. Auto Parts Center 

4.12.79 Sub Total Windshield Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

Washer/ Antifreeze Solvent - #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

Summer 
4.12.80 High-Power Brake Cleaner 328 No Bid $ 5.59 $ 1.99 $ 2.65 $ 4.47 No Bid No Bid $ 2.39 $ 2.30 $ 3.57 

-
4.12.81 Sub Total Brake Cleaner Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

Total All Items Bid Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment Deleted Amendment 

#2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 #2 

4.13 Firm, Fixed Discount off MSRP 48.7% - 50% 0% Cost+ 20% 30%- 71% List - 41% or better 62% 64% 20% 0% 0% 

for all other Automotive 
Supply or Part not identified in 
the above price table 

Cooperative Yes Unknown Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Procurement: 
Yes or No 

Delivery: 3-4 calendar days 3-4 calendar days 3-4 calendar days 3-4 calendar days 3-4 calendar days 3-4 calendar days 3-5 calendar days Same day 2 calendar days 1 calendar day 

Warranty: Standard Unknown One year from date Manufacturers' 90 days 12 months parts only Fleetguard warranty Champion brands Manufacturers' 

Manufacturer of purchase warranties terms warranty warranties 

Warranty 


