
ITEM # Unit of Measure DESCRIPTION QTY
Proposed Brand UNIT PRICE

EXT PRICE  (Qty 
x Unit Price) Proposed Brand UNIT PRICE

EXT PRICE  (Qty 
x Unit Price)

4.8.1. GAL Universal Tractor 
Fluid 500 PA Tractor Fluid 4.41 $2,205.00 DOC 5.92 $2,960.00

4.8.2. 2.5 GAL Container Universal Tractor 
Fluid 8 PA Tractor Fluid 5.76/Gal $115.20 DOC 20.75 $166.00

4.8.3. GAL Universal Tractor 
Fluid 8 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 8.17 $65.36

4.8.4. GAL 15W-40 (Extended 
Service) 2750 5.78 $15,895.00 DOC 7.80 $21,450.00

4.8.5. 2.5 GAL Container 15W-40 (Extended 
Service) 8 7.13/Gal $142.60 DOC 25.43 $203.44

4.8.6. GAL 15W-40 (Extended 
Service) 8 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 10.17 $81.36

4.8.7. GAL Hydraulic Oil (ISO-
46) 500 PA AW 46 3.89 $1,945.00 DOC 5.90 $2,950.00

4.8.8. 2.5 GAL Container Hydraulic Oil (ISO-
46) 8 PA AW 46 5.24/gal $104.80 DOC 17.48 $139.84

4.8.9. GAL Hydraulic Oil (ISO-
46) 8 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 6.99 $55.92

4.8.10. GAL Coolant (DexCool or 
equal) 60 Peak 8.20 $492.00 DOC 7.90 $474.00

4.8.11. GAL Coolant (Extended 
Life) 50/50 18 OW Final Charge 7.59 $136.62 DOC 7.90 $142.20

4.8.12. 55 GAL Barrel Coolant (Extended 
Life) 50/50 220 OW Final Charge 7.35/gal $88,935.00 DOC 269.00 $59,180.00

4.8.13. QTS Gear Lubricant 
75w90 syn 24 Syngard 4.75 $114.00 Valvoline 11.72 $281.28

4.8.14. 55 GAL Barrel Gear Lubricant 
75w90 syn 1 Citgo HDS 1,090.91 $1,090.91 DOC 1,012.00 $1,012.00

4.8.15. Tube Grease (cartridge) 
NLGI #2 40 NWWB 1.99 $79.60 DOC 2.95 $118.00

4.8.16. Tube Grease (cartridge) 
NLGI 40 Citgo CM #1 2.31 $92.40 Lubriplate 5.70 $228.00

4.8.17. 120 lb Barrel Grease NLGI #2 1 NWWB 279.77 $279.77 DOC 290.00 $290.00

4.8.18. GAL ATF 8 PA Full Syn ATF 9.62 $76.96 DOC Dex VI 15.00 $120.00 DOC Syn295 16.00 $128.00

4.8.19. 55 GAL Barrel ATF 4 PA Full Syn ATF 454.85 $1,819.40 DOC Dex VI 527.00 $2,108.00 DOC Syn295 783.00 $3,132.00

4.8.20. 1 Qt Container 0W-20 60 Syngard 0/20 2.89 $173.40 Dexos Mag1 4.34 $260.40

4.8.21 55 GAL Barrel 5W-40 6 PA 5/40 689.70 $4,138.20 DOC 927.40 $5,564.40

4.8.22 1 Qt Container 5W-20 60 Syngard 5/20 2.89 $173.40 DOC 2.36 $141.60

4.8.23 1 Qt Container 5W-30 300 Syngard 5/30 2.89 $867.00 DOC 2.36 $708.00

4.8.24 1 Qt Container 10W-30 12 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 2.36 $28.32

4.8.25 1 Qt Container Power Steering Fluid 12 No Bid No bid No Bid Valvoline 2.28 $27.36

4.8.26 55 GAL Barrel Propylene Glycol 
(50/50) 4 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 690.00 $2,760.00

4.8.27 5 GAL Container Propylene Glycol 
(50/50) 10 No Bid No bid No Bid DOC 85.00 $850.00

4.8.28 2.5 GAL Container Diesel Exhaust Fluid 75 BlueDef 7.04 $528.00 DOC 8.50 $637.50

4.8.29 GAL
Diesel Exhaust Fluid 

- Bladder Skid 
Mounted

3300 Ultra Pure 1.33 $4,389.00 DOC 1.44 $4,752.00

4.8.30 55 GAL Barrel Hydraulic Oil (ISO-
68) 2 PA AW68 251.35 $502.70 DOC 375.00 $750.00

4.8.31 2.5 GAL Container Hydraulic Oil (ISO-
68) 8 PA AW68 5.42/Gal $108.40 DOC 22.50 $180.00

4.8.32 per Oil Hose Reel 1 American 429.00 $429.00 Samson 445.90 $445.90

4.8.33 per Electronic Meter 1 American 337.00 $337.00 Liquid Dynamics 816.40 $816.40

(Optional) 4.8.34 per Stub Pump 1 Doughton 495.00 $495.00 Liquid Dynamics 499.00 $499.00

(Optional) 4.8.35 per Storage Tank 1 We-Mac 499.00 $499.00 Liquid Dynamics 479.00 $479.00

4.8.36 $126,164.36 $110,925.28

4.9.

4.10.

4.11.

4.12.

TOTAL (4.8.1 – 4.8.35)

BID TABULATION Heathwood Oil Company Dennis Oil Company

Maximum % Increase / Decrease for any renewal period 15% 3%

Options

Minimum discount from list for all products introduced after 
inception of the contract and all existing products not 

specified herein
5% 0%

Delivery ARO within 8 working days 3-5 days

Champion Laboratories

Cooperative Purchasing (Y or N) N Y

No Bids
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Proposed Brand UNIT PRICE

EXT PRICE  (Qty 
x Unit Price) Proposed Brand UNIT PRICE

EXT PRICE  (Qty 
x Unit Price)

4.8.1. Champion 4000 5.62 $2,810.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.2. Champion 4000 16.90 $135.20 Carquest 760-05 47.83/5 Gal $191.32

4.8.3. Champion 4000 7.02 $56.16 Carquest 760-01 12.87 $102.96

4.8.4. Champ. 4152AB 7.04 $19,360.00 Ch. AFT 15W40 8.39 $23,072.50 Ch. UltraFleet 
15W40 9.39 $25,822.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.5. Champ. 4152U 20.68 $165.44 Ch. AFT 15W40 22.05 $176.40 Ch. UltraFleet 
15W40 23.34 $186.72 Carquest CQ645-5 56.99/5 Gal $227.96

4.8.6. Champ. 4152N 8.45 $67.60 Ch. AFT 15W40 9.26 $74.08 Ch. UltraFleet 
15W40 10.24 $81.92 Carquest CQ645-1G 12.34 $98.72

4.8.7. Champ. 4180AB 4.97 $2,485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.8. Champ. 4180D 15.75 $126.00 Carquest 946-05 43.23/5 Gal $172.92

4.8.9. Champ. 4180N 6.30 $50.40 Carquest 946-01 12.87 $102.96

4.8.10. Champ. 4119F 7.71 $462.60 Carquest 501 15.19 $911.40

4.8.11. Champ. 4116F 5.05 $90.90 Carquest 301 14.24 $256.32

4.8.12. Champ. 4116AN 4.64/gal $56,144.00 Fleet Charge 297.00 $65,340.00 Peak PSA0B1 880.64 $193,740.80

4.8.13. Champ. 4314H 6.95 $166.80 Carquest 685-32 9.19 $220.56

4.8.14. Champ. 4314AN 925.98 $925.98 Valvoline VV7002b 2142.02 $2,142.02

4.8.15. Champ. 4053T 2.30 $92.00 Carquest 614-14 3.67 $146.80

4.8.16. Royal 951TAT 3.77 $150.80 Carquest 816-14 3.95 $158.00

4.8.17. Champ. 4053C 298.90 $298.90 Carquest 614-120 349.59 $349.59

4.8.18. Ch. Global 
Trans4357N 14.29 $114.32 Carquest CQ420-1G 18.04 $144.32

4.8.19. Ch. Global 
Trans4357AB 670.40 $2,681.60 Carquest CQ420-55 759.99 $3,039.96

4.8.20. Ch. SynGold 
4429h/b 3.65 $219.00 Carquest CQ900 5.41 $324.60

4.8.21 Ch. AFT 4173A 1,303.48 $7,820.88 Carquest 116.15/6 Gal Box $6,388.25

4.8.22 Ch. SynGold 
4430H/b 3.40 $204.00 Carquest CQ920 5.41 $324.60

4.8.23 Ch. SynGold 
4431H/b 3.60 $1,080.00 Carquest CQ930 5.41 $1,623.00

4.8.24 Champ. 4232H 1.77 $21.24 Carquest CQ940 5.41 $64.92

4.8.25 Champ. 4182H 2.28 $27.36 Carquest 4.96 $59.52

4.8.26 421.30 $1,685.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.27 91.04 $910.40 Prestone 6.64/Gal $332.00

4.8.28 KDEF002 7.50 $562.50 Peak DEF002 13.79 $1,034.25

4.8.29 BlueDef 9585T 1.32 $4,356.00 Peak DEF330P 3.90 $12,879.90

4.8.30 Champ. 4268A 421.30 $842.60 Carquest 968-55 439.99 $879.98

4.8.31 Champ. 4268U 23.50 $188.00 Carquest 968-05 43.23 $345.84

4.8.32 8078B 397.75 $397.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.33 3670B 268.00 $268.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

(Optional) 4.8.34 9968 450.00 $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

(Optional) 4.8.35 3300T 960.00 $960.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.8.36 $106,376.63 $226,263.47

4.9.

4.10.

4.11.

4.12.

 

Carquest

Varies

No Response

1 Day

Y

Options

Champion Brands

No Response

Options

No Response

2-10 days

Y

No Bids
Champion Laboratories
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