

23-25MAY17 - RIVER OAKS RD. CULVERTS REPLACEMENTS-2017			Only ONE (1) Bidder for Option 2				NO BID		NO BID	
BID TABULATION			ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE		Rhad A Baker Constructin, LLC		CL Richardson Construction Co., Inc.		Mera Excavating, LLC	
Option 2 - Trenchless Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
MOBILIZATION	1	LS	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
TRAFFIC CONTROL	1	LS	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
CLEARING AND GRUBBING	1	LS	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
EARTHWORK	1	LS	\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
ROCK EXCAVATION	10	CY	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
TRENCHLESS CULVERT REPLACEMENT	1	LS	\$80,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$72,400.00	\$72,400.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
FENCE REPAIR	1	LS	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
ROCK BLANKET w/ FILTER FABRIC	123	CY	\$90.00	\$11,070.00	\$75.00	\$9,225.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
RESTORATION w/ EROSION CONTROL BLANKET	1	LS	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
						\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Bid Total				\$133,070.00		\$128,875.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Bid Response					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Work Authorization Certification					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Statement of Bidders Qualifications					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Anti-Collusion Statement					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Bid Bond					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Signature and Identity of Bidder					Y			NO BID		NO BID
Bidders Acknowledgment					Y			NO BID		NO BID