
RFB #: 76-30NOV15 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products 

Fred Weber, 
Stockman 

Capital Mid-Missouri Mid-Missouri Con-Agg of 
BID TABULATION Inc. - Iron Mtn 

Stoneworks 
Quarries Limestone, Inc. Limestone, Inc. Missouri d/b/a 

Trap Rock Company, Inc. (Millersburg) (Riggs) Boone Quarries 

5.2. Base Bid Pricing No Bid $ 1,602,325 .00 $ 1,900,825.00 $ 1,983,625.00 $ 2,055,725.00 $ 2,080,705.00 
5.3. Chip Seal Pricing: FOB Plant Only $ 74,400.00 $ 82,650.00 No Bid $ 122,400.00 $ 122,400.00 $ 100,050.00 

5.4. 
Renewal Pricing Increases for 

5% 
Sections 5.2. and 5.3. 1.5-2% 5% 10% 10% 10% 

5.5. 
Delivery Pricing - Crushed Stone 

No Bid Aggregate (Not Chip Seal) $ 370.62 $ 423.20 $ 368.11 $ 368.11 $ 378.77 
GRAND TOTAL $ 74,000.00 $ 1,685,345.62 $ 1,901,248.20 $ 2,106,393.11 $ 2,178,493.11 $ 2,181,133. 77 
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RFB #: 76-30NOV15 - Crushed Stone 
Aggregate and Chip Seal Products Fred Weber, Inc. Iron Mtn 

Stockman Stoneworks 
Capital Quarries Company, 

BID TABULATION 
Trap Rock Inc. 

5.2. Base Bid Pricing 
Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total 

5.2.1. RSB 50,000 $ - $ - $ 5.25 $ 262,500.00 $ 6.40 $ 320,000.00 
5.2.2. SRl 75,000 $ - $ - $ 5.25 $ 393,750.00 $ 7.00 $ 525,000.00 
5.2.3. SRl.5 50,000 $ - $ - $ 5.25 $ 262,500.00 $ 7.00 $ 350,000.00 
5.2.4. SR2.5 25,000 $ - $ - $ 5.25 $ 131 ,250.00 $ 7.00 $ 175,000.00 
5.2.5. CRl 50,000 $ - $ - $ 8.25 $ 412,500.00 $ 9.15 $ 457,500.00 
5.2.6. CR2 500 $ - $ - $ 7.50 $ 3,750.00 $ 8.15 $ 4,075.00 
5.2.7. CR3 1,500 $ - $ - $ 7.50 $ 11,250.00 $ - No Bid 
5.2.8. MS 3,500 $ - $ - $ - No Bid $ - No Bid 
5.2.9. QR 1,500 $ - $ - $ 4.25 $ 6,375.00 $ 6.50 $ 9,750.00 
5.2.10. GQR 500 $ - $ - $ 10.25 $ 5, 125.00 $ 11.00 $ 5,500.00 
5.2.11. SP 500 $ - $ - $ 7.90 $ 3,950.00 $ 11.00 $ 5,500.00 
5.2.12. WR 2,000 $ - $ - $ 3.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 3.75 $ 7,500.00 
5.2.13. GQR6X9 1,500 $ - $ - $ 8.25 $ 12,375.00 $ 10.00 $ 15,000.00 
5.2.14. GQR6Xl2 1,000 $ - $ - $ 8.25 $ 8,250.00 $ 10.00 $ 10,000.00 
5.2.15. SC.375 1,500 $ - $ - $ 9.50 $ 14,250.00 $ - No Bid 
5.2.16. SC.5 6,000 $ - $ - $ 9.50 $ 57,000.00 $ - No Bid 
5.2.17. SP=Spalls 1,000 $ - $ - $ 8.00 $ 8,000.00 $ 11.00 $ 11,000.00 
5.2.18. Fill Material 1,000 $ - $ - $ 3.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 5.00 $ 5,000.00 
5.2.19. Pugged Rock 1,000 $ - $ - $ 0.50 $ 500.00 $ - No Bid 
5.2.20. Total No Bid $ 1,602,325.00 $ 1,900,825.00 
5.3. Chip Seal Pricing: FOB Plant Only 
5.3.1. SC.375 1200 $ 12.00 $ 14,400.00 $ 9.50 $ 11,400.00 $ - $ -
5.3.2. SC.5 7500 $ 8.00 $ 60,000.00 $ 9.50 $ 71,250.00 $ - $ -
5.3.3. Total $ 74,400.00 $ 82,650.00 No Bid 
5.4. Renewal Pricing Increases for Sections 

5.2. and 5.3. 
5.4.1 . l st Renewal Term 5% l.5 % 5% 
5.4.2. 2nd Renewal Term 5% 2% 5% 

GRAND TOTAL $ 74,400.00 $ 1,684,975.00 $ 1,900,825.00 
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RFB #: 76-30NOV15 - Crushed Stone 
Aggregate and Chip Seal Products Mid-Missouri Limestone, Inc. Mid-Missouri Limestone, Inc. Con-Agg of Missouri d/b/a 

BID TABULATION 
(Millersburg) (Riggs) Boone Quarries 

5.2. Base Bid Pricing Iii 

Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total 

5.2.1. RSB 50,000 $ 5.75 $ 287,500.00 $ 6.25 $ 312,500.00 $ 6.75 $ 337,500.00 

5.2.2. SRI 75,000 $ 6.90 $ 517,500.00 $ 7.00 $ 525,000.00 $ 7.15 $ 536,250.00 

5.2.3. SRl.5 50,000 $ 6.90 $ 345,000.00 $ 7.00 $ 350,000.00 $ 7.15 $ 357,500.00 
5.2.4. SR2.5 25,000 $ 6.70 $ 167,500.00 $ 7.00 $ 175,000.00 $ 7.15 $ 178,750.00 
5.2.5. CRl 50,000 $ 9.00 $ 450,000.00 $ 9.50 $ 475,000.00 $ 9.50 $ 475 ,000.00 
5.2.6. CR2 500 $ 8.50 $ 4,250.00 $ 8.70 $ 4,350.00 $ 8.65 $ 4,325.00 

5.2.7. CR3 1,500 $ 8.50 $ 12,750.00 $ 8.70 $ 13,050.00 $ 8.65 $ 12,975 .00 

5.2.8. MS 3,500 $ 9.45 $ 33,075.00 $ 9.45 $ 33,075.00 $ 5.35 $ 18,725.00 
5.2.9. QR 1,500 $ 6.50 $ 9,750.00 $ 6.75 $ 10, 125.00 $ 7.75 $ 11 ,625.00 

5.2.10. GQR 500 $ 10.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10.65 $ 5,325 .00 

5.2.11. SP 500 $ 9.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 9.25 $ 4,625.00 $ 10.55 $ 5,275.00 
5.2.12. WR 2,000 $ 3.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 3.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 4.05 $ 8,100.00 

5.2.13 . GQR6X9 1,500 $ 9.00 $ 13,500.00 $ 9.50 $ 14,250.00 $ 10.55 $ 15,825.00 

5.2.14. GQR6Xl2 1,000 $ 9.25 $ 9,250.00 $ 9.70 $ 9,700.00 $ 10.55 $ 10,550.00 
5.2.15. SC.375 1,500 $ 14.50 $ 21,750.00 $ 14.50 $ 21 ,750.00 $ 11.50 $ 17,250.00 
5.2.16. SC.5 6,000 $ 14.00 $ 84,000.00 $ 14.00 $ 84,000.00 $ 11.50 $ 69,000.00 
5.2.17. SP=Spalls 1,000 $ 9.00 $ 9,000.00 $ 9.00 $ 9,000.00 $ 10.55 $ 10,550.00 
5.2.18. Fill Material 1,000 $ 3.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 3.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 5.63 $ 5,630.00 
5.2.19. Pugged Rock 1,000 $ 0.30 $ 300.00 $ 0.30 $ 300.00 $ 0.55 $ 550.00 
5.2.20. Total $ 1,983,625.00 $ 2,055,725.00 $ 2,080,705.00 
5.3. Chip Seal Pricing' FOB Plant Only 
5.3.1. SC.375 1200 $ 14.50 $ 17,400.00 $ 14.50 $ 17,400.00 $ 11.50 $ 13,800.00 
5.3.2. SC.5 7500 $ 14.00 $ 105,000.00 $ 14.00 $ 105,000.00 $ 11.50 $ 86,250.00 
5.3.3. Total $ 122,400.00 $ 122,400.00 $ 100,050.00 

5.4. Renewal Pricing Increases for Sections 
5.2. and 5.3. 

5.4.1. 1st Renewal Term 10 % 10 % 10 % 
5.4.2. 2nd Renewal Term 10 % 10 % 10 % 

GRAND TOTAL $ 2,106,025.00 $ 2,178,125.00 $ 2,180,755.00 
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76-30NOV15 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products 

BID TABULATION 

5.5. Deliverv Pricin2 - Crushed Stone APPre2ate (Not Chio Seal) 
Schedule A B c D E F G H I 

Fuel Price <$1.75 $1.75- <2.00 $2.00 - <2.25 $2.25 - <2.50 $2.50 - <2. 75 $2.75 - <3.00 $3.00 - <3.25 $3.25 - <3.50 $3.50- <3.75 
Distance (Miles) $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton 

5.5.1. 0 - <5 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.73 $ 2.85 $ 2.95 $ 3.05 
u 5.5.2. 5 - < JO $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.38 $ 3.51 $ 3.64 $ 3.77 
c: - 5.5.3. 10 - < 15 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 4.06 $ 4.19 $ 4.32 $ 4.45 a) 
c: 5.5.4. I 5 - <20 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.89 $ 5.02 $ 5.15 $ 5.28 0 .... 

5.5.S. 20 - <25 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.60 $ 5.73 $ 5.86 $ 5.99 "' Cll ~ 

E "' 5.5 .6. 25 - <30 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 6.10 $ 6.23 $ 6.36 $ 6.49 
·- tlO ..... tlO 
·~ a: 5.5.7. 30 - <35 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.75 $ 6.88 $ 7.01 $ 7.14 
:::i-

5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.55 $ 7.68 $ 7.81 $ 7.94 0 

"' "' 5.5.9. Total $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 41.06 $ 42.09 $ 43.10 $ 44. 11 ~ -c 5.6. RenewaJ Pricing Increases for Section 5.5. 
~ 5.6.1. 1st Renewal Term 10 % GRAND TOTAL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I $ 368.11 

5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term 10 % 

S.S . I. 0 - <5 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.60 $ 2.73 $ 2.85 $ 2.95 $ 3.05 
u 5.5 .2. 5 - < JO $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.25 $ 3.38 $ 3.5 I $ 3.64 $ 3.77 
c: - 5.5.3. 10 - <IS $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 3.90 $ 4.06 $ 4.19 $ 4.32 $ 4.45 a) 
c: 5.5.4. 15 - <20 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.70 $ 4.89 $ 5.02 $ 5.15 $ 5.28 
o~ 
t; ~ 5.5.5 . 20 - <25 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.40 $ 5.60 $ 5.73 $ 5.86 $ 5.99 
Cll :::I 
E .o 5.5.6. 25 - <30 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 5.85 $ 6.10 $ 6.23 $ 6.36 $ 6.49 ·- "' ........ 

$ $ ·- Cll 5.5.7. 30 - <35 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.50 $ 6.75 $ 6.88 $ 7.01 7.14 ... -
:::I= 

5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ 7.35 $ $ 7.68 $ 7.81 $ 7.94 0 ::!: 7.55 
~- 5.5 .9. Total $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 39.55 $ 41.06 $ 42.09 $ 43 .10 $ 44.11 ~ -c 5.6. Renewal Pricing Increases for Section 5.5 . 
~ 5.6. 1. 1st Renewal Term 10 % GRAND TOT AL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I $ 368.11 

5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term 10 % "' 
5.5.1. 0 - <S $ 2.15 $ 2.15 $ 2.15 $ 2.18 $ 2.21 $ 2.24 $ 2.27 $ 2.30 $ 2.33 
5.5 .2. 5 - < IO $ 3.08 $ 3.08 $ 3.08 $ 3.11 $ 3. 14 $ 3.17 $ 3.20 $ 3.23 $ 3.27 

"' 5.5.3. 10- < 15 $ 3.82 $ 3.82 $ 3.82 $ 3.85 $ 3.88 $ 3.91 $ 3.94 $ 3.97 $ 4.00 ..:.: 
0 5.5.4. 15 - <20 $ 4.65 $ 4.65 $ 4.65 $ 4.65 $ 4.71 $ 4.74 $ 4.77 $ 4.80 $ 4.83 
~ 
Cll 5.5.5. 20 - <25 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.50 $ 5.53 $ 5.56 $ 5.59 $ 5.62 $ 5.65 c: 
0 5.5.6. 25 - <30 $ 6.31 $ 6.3 1 $ 6.31 $ 6.34 $ 6.37 $ 6.40 $ 6.43 $ 6.47 $ 6.50 .... 
Ill 
c: 5.5.7. 30 - <35 $ 7.15 $ 7.15 $ 7.15 $ 7.18 $ 7.21 $ 7.24 $ 7.27 $ 7.30 $ 7.33 c: 
Ill 5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ 7.99 $ 7.99 $ 7.99 $ 8.02 $ 8.05 $ 8.08 $ 8.11 $ 8.14 $ 8.17 E 

..:.: 5.5.9. Total $ 40.62 $ 40.62 $ 40.62 $ 40.83 $ 41.10 $ 41.34 $ 41.58 $ 41.83 $ 42.08 u 
0 .... 5.6. Renewal Pricing Increases for Section 5.5 . Ill 

5.6.1. I st Renewal Term 1.5 % GRAND TOTAL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I $ 370.62 
5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term 2 % <o!i 
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76-30NOV15 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products 

BID TABULATION 

5.5. Delivery Pricin2 - Crushed Stone Al!l!rei.rnte (Not Chip Seal) 
Schedule A B c D E F G H I 

Fuel Price <$1.75 $1.75 - <2.00 $2.00 - <2.25 $2.25 - <2.50 $2.50 - <2.75 $2.75 - <3.00 $3.00-<3.25 $3.25 - <3.50 $3.50- <3.75 
Distance (Miles) $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $ I Ton $/Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton 

QI 5.5.1. 0 - <5 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.66 $ 2.78 $ 2.80 
c 

5.5.2. 5 - < 10 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.39 $ 3.55 $ 3.58 0 
0 
a:i 5.5.3. 
ra 

IO - <15 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 3.88 $ 4.07 $ 4.11 
....... 
.a 5.5.4. 15 - <20 $ 4.71 $ 4.71 $ 4.71 $ 4.71 $ 4.71 $ 4.7 1 $ 4.7 1 $ 4.93 $ 4.97 
....... 

5.5.5. 20 - <25 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.47 $ 5.74 $ 5.79 "C "' ·.:::: cu 
5.5.6. 25 - <30 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 5.92 $ 6.21 $ 6.26 :J ·.:::: 

0 ... 
"' ra 5.5.7. 30 - <35 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 6.84 $ 7. 17 $ 7.24 
"' ::I 
~a 5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 8.75 $ 9.08 $ 9.15 -0 5.5.9. Total $ 41.62 $ 4 1.62 $ 41.62 $ 41.62 $ 41.62 $ 41.62 $ 41.62 $ 43.53 $ 43.90 
QI) 

~ 5.6. Renewal Pricing Increases for Section 5.5. 
C: 5.6.1. l stRenewal Term 10 % GRAND TOT AL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I $ 378.77 0 
u 5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term 10 % 

5.5. 1. 0 - <5 $ 2.50 $ 2.75 $ 3.00 $ 3.25 $ 3.50 $ 3.75 $ 4.00 $ 4.25 $ 4.50 
u 5.5.2. 5 - < IO $ 3.25 $ 3.75 $ 4.00 $ 4.25 $ 4.50 $ 4.75 $ 5.00 $ 5.25 $ 5.50 .: 
> 5.5.3. 10 - <15 $ 3.80 $ 4.05 $ 4.30 $ 4.55 $ 4.80 $ 5.05 $ 5.30 $ 5.55 $ 5.80 
c 

5.5.4. 15 - <20 $ 4.35 $ 4.60 $ 4.85 $ 5.10 $ 5.35 $ 5.60 $ 5.85 $ 6. 10 $ 6.35 ra 
a. 
E 5.5.5. 20 - <25 $ 5.10 $ 5.35 $ 5.60 $ 5.85 $ 6. 10 $ 6.35 $ 6.60 $ 6.85 $ 7.10 
0 
u 5.5.6. 
"' 

25 - <30 $ 5.85 $ 6. 10 $ 6.35 $ 6.60 $ 6.85 $ 7.10 $ 7.35 $ 7.60 $ 7.85 
QI 5.5.7. 30 - <35 $ 6.60 $ 6.85 $ 7.1 0 $ 7.35 $ 7.60 $ 7.85 $ 8.1 0 $ 8.35 $ 8.60 ·;: ... 

5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ 7.35 $ 7.60 $ 7.85 $ 8.10 $ 8.35 $ 8.60 $ 8.85 $ 9.10 $ 9.35 ra 
::I a 5.5.9. Total $ 38.80 $ 4 1.05 $ 43.05 $ 45.05 $ 47.05 $ 49.05 $ 51.05 $ 53 .05 $ 55.05 
iii 

5.6 . Renewal Pricing Increases for Section 5.5. ... ·o. 
ra 5.6.1. I st Renewal Term 5% GRAND TOTAL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I $ 423.20 u 

5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term 5% 
5.5.1. 0- <5 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -

a. 
$ ra 5.5.2. 5 - < 10 -... $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -.... 

5.5.3. 10 - <15 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ c - - - - - - - - -... 
~ 5.5.4. 15 - <20 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
c 

5.5.5. 20 - <25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 0 - - - - - - - - -... 
"7 ~ 5.5.6. 25 - <30 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -. 0 
.E cc: 5.5.7. 30 - <35 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
... - 5.5.8. 35 - <40 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -QI 
.a 

5.5.9. Total $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ QI - - - - - - - - -
~ 5.6. Renewal Pricing Increases for Section 5.5. "C 
~ 5.6.1. I st Renewal Term % GRAND TOTAL OF 5.5.1 - 5.5.8 A - I No Bid u.. 

5.6.2. 2nd Renewal Term % 
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