RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories
Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 Champion Brands. LLC

4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 0-7 days
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if

Different from 10% restock fee
4.6.8. Catalog Name Champion Mailer
Jobber +/- % -

4.6.9. All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
% _
4.6.10. Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 0-10%

2nd Renewal 0-10%

4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 |Luber Finer $ 40.88 | $16.36
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 |Luber Finer $ 32.99 | $13.20
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 OEM Only - -
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 Champ $ 5.9 (s 1.71
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 Champ $ 4.99 | $ 1.45
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $ 71.39 | $28.56
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 |Luber Finer $ 18.74 | $ 7.50
Fuel Filters |
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 |Luber Finer $ 69.99 | $27.99
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $101.23 | $80.62
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $165.93 | $82.97
4.7.11. G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 Champ | $ 11.47 | $ 2.48
4.7.12, L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 |Luber Finer $ 20.71 | $10.36
Air Filters
4.7.13, AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 Champ $ 11.22 | $ 5.61
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 OEM Only - -
4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 Champ $ 10.94 | $ 5.47
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $ 81.64 | $32.66
Hyd. Filters
4,717, AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15| OEM Only - -
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $ 98.55 | $47.78
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Qil
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)
Brakes-Part |
Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 special Order
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos | |
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 Special Order




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I) ]

Brakes-Part Il (Hea

Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Special Order
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM - 3232951 -
Special Order
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware |
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Special Order
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
Windshield Wipers
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) each ANCO $ 13.99 | $ 4.85
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) each ANCO $ 13.99 | $ 4.85
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) each ANCO $ 13.99 | $ 4.85
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) each ANCO $ 13.99 | $ 4.85
4.7.37.|131-22 each ANCO $ 6.99 | $ 2.20
4.7.38.130-22 each ANCO $ 6.99 | $ 2.20
4.7.39./30-20 each ANCO $ 6.99 | $ 2.20
4.7.40.131-20 each ANCO $ 6.99 | $ 2.20
4.7.41.131-24 each ANCO $ 6.99 | $ 2.20
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
Lamps (Wagner
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 each Wagner $ 14.99 | $ 4.95
4.7.44.1H6054 each Wagner $ 18.27 | $ 6.09




4.7.45.|H4651 each Wagner $ 14.99 $ 4.95
4.7.46.(3357 Box of 10 Wagner $ 21.27 | $ 7.09
4.7.47.13157 Box of 10 Wagner $ 8.97 $ 2.99
4.7.48.|13156 Box of 10 Wagner $ 19.17 | $ 6.39
4.7.49.13157-NA Box of 10 Wagner $ 20.09 $ 10.01
4.7.50./19012 Box of 10 Wagner $ 11.85 | $ 3.95
4.7.51.19007 each Wagner $ 9.19 $ 3.09
4.7.52.|19006 each Wagner $ 6.99 | $ 2.19
4.7.53.19005 each Wagner $ 6.99 $ 2.19
4.7.54.19003 each Wagner $ 10.49 | $ 3.49
4.7.55.14007 Wagner - -

4.7.56.|14157 Box of 10 Wagner $ 17.99 | $ 8.33

Tail Light (Peterson)

4.7.57.|420R (Oval LED)

4.7.58.|417R (Round LED)

Special Order

Marker Light

4.7.59.]V162KR (Round 2 %"

LED w/Plug & Grommet)

4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2”

LED w/Plug & Grommet)

Special Order

Strobe Light

4.7.61./423SA-1 (Oval LED)

4.7.62.

SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Special Order

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Part# 4105F{gallon -20 Champion $ 4.99 | $ 2.04
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL Part# 93506{gallon -35 Wipe R Clean| $ 5.99 | $ 3.22

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid | | |

Mfg. Name

Price List ID

Price

Net Cost

4.7.65.[No summer mth (take Part# 4105F and cut with wat

Champion

gallon

$

1.02

4.7.66.]SUB-TOTAL | | |




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. Part # 08880 each 3M $ 563 | $ 2.19
4.7.90.[SUB-TOTAL |
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 p.m. B&C Truck Electric Service. Inc.

4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 15 workina davs

4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if Different Al items need to be new in unopened manufacture packaging and
from Requirements Stated in Bid: no more than 12 months old

4.6.8. Catalog Name
Jobber +/- %

4.6.9. All other parts will be sold to the
County at jobber +/-%

-15%
4.6.10. Will you honor the submitted
prices for purchase by other entities
in Boone County who participate in
cooperative purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/ No
Yes
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for
1st Renewal 204
2nd Renewal 20

4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS &
ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters (Luberfiner is current

brand unless otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price ListID| Price |Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series| 1995
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.11. G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015
4.7.15. LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15
Hyd. Filters
4,7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil Filters, Fuel

Filters, Air Filters)

Brakes-Part |

Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybestos) | Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price ListID| Price |Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.22, 3U222VV001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6l 2008
4.7.23. 4U272V200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.6l 2008
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos)
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID| Price |Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake Chambers/Spring
Brake MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke w/Welded Freightliner/Pacca] All Trucks | 2012-15 MGM - 3232951
Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part 11
Heavy Truck)
Windshield Wipers
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID| Price |Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) WEXCO 1.89
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) WEXCO 1.89
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) WEXCO 1.89
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) WEXCO 1.89
4.7.37.|131-22 ANCO 4.02
4.7.38.130-22 ANCO 4.26
4.7.39./30-20 ANCO WEXCO 2.95
4.7.40.131-20 ANCO WEXCO 2.95
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO WEXCO 3.76
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
Lamps (Wagner
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID| Price |Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024

4.7.44.

H6054




4.7.45.|H4651

4.7.46.|13357

4.7.47.13157

4.7.48.13156
4.7.49.|13157-NA
4.7.50.]19012

4.7.51.19007

4.7.52.19006

4.7.53.]19005

4.7.54.19003

4.7.55.14007

4.7.56.|14157

Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.]1420R (Oval LED)
4.7.58.]1417R (Round LED)
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 %" LED w/Plug
& Grommet)

4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” LED
w/Plug & Grommet)

Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED)
4.7.62.[SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)
Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type
Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID| Price |Net Cost

4.7.63.
4.7.64.|SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID| Price |Net Cost

4.7.65.
4.7.66.|SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name Price ListID Price Net Cost

4.7.67.
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 p.m. CARQUEST Auto Parts
4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order same dav |
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if meets requirements
Different from Requirements
4.6.8. Catalog Name USC
Jobber +/-% Retail - 5% - 64%  varies
4.6.9. All other parts will be sold to
the County at jebber +/-%
list - 5% - 64%

4.6.10. Will you honor the submitted
prices for purchase by other
entities in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone County,
Missouri? Yes/No

Yes Insert 4

4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for
1st Renewal 50
2nd Renewal 5%
4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS &
ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters (Luberfiner is current

brand unless otherwise
noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series| 1995 Baldwin 85748XD $ 24.66 same
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 Baldwin 84909 $ 18.00 same
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 Baldwin 84370 $ 18.90 same
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 Baldwin 84045 $ 2.70 same
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 Baldwin 84060 $ 2.73 same
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 84137 $ 14.22 same
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 Baldwin 84750 $ 8.49 same
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 Baldwin 86849 $ 36.00 same
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 86979 $ 51.84 same
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 86969 $ 45.00 same
4,7.11. G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 Baldwin 86595 $ 4.68 same
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 Baldwin 86651 XE $ 10.44 same
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 Baldwin 87982 $ 35.64 same
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 Baldwin 93009 $ 45.72 same
4.7.15. LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 Baldwin 87487 $ 7.98 same
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 87803 $ 39.60 same
Hyd. Filters
4,7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 86424 $ 39.60 same
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 Baldwin 84624 $ 39.60 same
4.7.19.[SUB-TOTAL (Oil Filters,

Fuel Filters, Air Filters)

Brakes-Part |

Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybestos)| Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 Raybestos | GPD1611A | $ 76.61 same
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 Raybestos [ GPD1612 $ 56.51 same
4.7.22. 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6l 2008 Raybestos GPD931 $ 57.36 same
4.7.23. 4U272V200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.6l 2008 | Raybestos | GPD1046A | $ 56.97 | same
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos)
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 Raybestos [ PR54188 $ 67.75 same
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 Raybestos | PR54189 $ 46.19 same




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App| Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 (CenmetHALDEX| 54248-018| $177.62 same
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 HALDEX 60001-018| $101.36 same
(Qty 16/order) same
Air Brake Chambers/Spring
Brake MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke  Freightliner/Pacca] All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM—3232954 GC3030LCW| $ 99.50 | same
w/Welded Yoke MAP
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 HALDEX CB4715Q0G | $ 79.97 | same
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD [ 2012-14 | HALDEX CB4707QG | $ 51.61 | same
(Qty 16/order) same
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part 11
Heavy Truck)
Windshield Wipers
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.[SP16 (Profile) B255-160 TRICO $ 9.51 | same
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) B255-200 TRICO $ 11.89 | same
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) B255-220 TRICO $ 12.59 | same
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) B255-240 TRICO $ 13.29 | same
4.7.37.|131-22 22-1 ANCO TRICO $ 7.69 | same
4.7.38.130-22 AC1022 ANCO TRICO $ 8.39 | same
4.7.39./30-20 AC1020 ANCO TRICO $ 6.99 | same
4.7.40.131-20 20-1 ANCO TRICO $ 6.99 | same
4.7.41.|131-24 24-1 ANCO TRICO $ 9.09 | same
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
Lamps (Wagner
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 Wagner H6024 $ 9.37 | same
4.7.44.1H6054 Wagner H6054 $ 8.39 | same




4.7.45.|H4651 Wagner H4651 $ 6.85 | same
4.7.46.|13357 Wagner 3357 $ 1.46 | same
4.7.47.13157 Wagner 3157 $ 1.25 | same
4.7.48.13156 Wagner 3156 $ 1.39 | same
4.7.49.13157-NA Wagner 3157NA $ 1.88 same
4.7.50.|19012 Sylvania 9012BP $ 24.49 | same
4.7.51.]19007 Sylvania 9007BP $ 7.69 | same
4.7.52.]19006 Sylvania 9006BP $ 7.69 | same
4.7.53.]19005 Sylvania 9005BP $ 7.69 | same
4.7.54.19003 Sylvania 9003BP $ 7.69 | same
4.7.55.(4007 Wagner 4007 $ 22.04 | same
4.7.56.|14157 Wagner 4157K $ 6.25 | same
Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.|420R (Oval LED) Grote G6002 $ 22.09 | same
4.7.58.[417R (Round LED) Grote G4002 $ 15.80 same
Marker Light
4.7.59.[V162KR (Round 2 %" LED G1032+91400+67050= $ 8.73 | same
w/Plug & Grommet)
4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” LED G1032+91400+67050= $ 8.73 | same
w/Plug & Grommet)
Strobe Light |
4.7.61.{423SA-1 (Oval LED) 77363+43222= $ 59.65 | same

4.7.62.

SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. RainX 5066517 $ 3.99 | same
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. Blue Coral| 5079594 $ 2.20 | same

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. CRL 1005 $ 4.13 | same
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories
Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30

4.6.5.
4.6.7.

4.6.8.

4.6.9.

4.6.10.

4.6.11.

4.7.

Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1 dav

Describe Return POllcy if open to all returns

Different from 20% restock fee applies to any electrical parts
Catalog Name Navistar

Jobber +/- % 15%

All other parts will be sold

to the County at jobber +/-

% 15%
Will you honor the

submitted prices for

purchase by other entities

in Boone County who

participate in cooperative

purchasing with Boone

County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 50
2nd Renewal 5%

PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 |Fleetguard $ 17.34 each
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 |Fleetguard $ 34.04 each
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 N/A - each
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 |Luber Finer $ 3.30 each
4.7.5. PHA48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 | Fleetguard $ 3.04 each
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | Fleetguard $ 16.03 each
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 | Fleetguard $ 7.76 each
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 |Luber Finer $ 40.40 each
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $ 16.52 each
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ Fleetguard $ 42.18 each
4.7.11. G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 |Fleetguard $ 5.15 each
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 | Fleetguard $ 8.77 each
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 | Fleetguard $ 8.50 each
4.7.14, LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 |Fleetguard 30.53 each
4.7.15. LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 | Fleetguard $ 8.71 each
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | Fleetguard $ 30.53 each
Hyd. Filters
4,717, AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 N/A - -
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer $ 52.64 each
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)
Brakes-Part |
Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 |Performance Friction | $ 46.20 each
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 |Performance Friction | $ 40.20 each
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2VO01BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008 |Performance Friction | $ 51.30 each
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.6Lf 2008 |Performance Friction [ $ 42.90 each
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24, PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 | Raybestos $ 82.96 each
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 Raybestos $ 55.96 each




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27, 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet $128.01 each
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | Fleetrite $ 70.00 each
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.] Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |[MGM - 3232951|X each
$111.22
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | Fleetrite |($40/core)| $ 50.38 each
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | Fleetrite |($24/core)| $ 36.34 each
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) Fleetrite $ 7.87 |each
4.7.34.[SP20 (Profile) Fleetrite $ 7.87 |each
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) Fleetrite $ 9.19 |each
4.7.36.[SP24 (Profile) Fleetrite $ 9.19 |each
4.7.37.|31-22 ANCO $ 4.52 |each
4.7.38./30-22 ANCO $ 6.97 |each
4.7.39./30-20 ANCO $ 6.78 |each
4.7.40.(31-20 ANCO $ 4.38 |each
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO $ 7.28 |each
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.{H6024 G.E. $ 10.28 |each
4.7.44.|H6054 G.E. $ 7.92 |each




4.7.45.|H4651 G.E. $ 6.25 |each
4.7.46.(3357 G.E. $ 0.76 |each
4.7.47.[3157 G.E. $ 1.09 |each
4.7.48.[3156 G.E. $ 1.09 |each
4.7.49.[3157-NA G.E. $ 1.94 |each
4.7.50.|19012 G.E. $ 0.68 |each
4.7.51.[9007 G.E. $ 5.87 |each
4.7.52./9006 G.E. $ 5.26 |each
4.7.53./9005 G.E. $ 6.10 |each
4.7.54./9003 G.E. $ 6.25 |each
4.7.55.(4007 G.E. $ 11.99 |each
4.7.56.14157 G.E. $ 6.18 |each
Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.|420R (Oval LED) Trucklite $ 7.93 |each
4.7.58.[417R (Round LED) Grote $ 35.69 |each
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 v2” Grote each
LED w/Plug & Grommet) $ 7.16
4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” Grote each
LED w/Plug & Grommet) $ 7.81
Strobe Light
4.7.61.|423SA-1 (Oval LED) Peterson $ 53.04 |each

4.7.62.

SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (p

er gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Splash $ 2.46 [each
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. Splash $ 2.46 |each

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. Gunk $ 3.05 |each
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 Factorv Motor Parts
4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1 dav
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if
Different from as specified
4.6.8. Catalog Name Factory Motor Parts
Jobber +/- % 2 page document attached

4.6.9. All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
% varies
4.6.10. Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 3

2nd Renewal 3%

4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App

Year

Mfg. Name

Price List ID

Price

Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 |Luber Finer] LFP3000 $ 41.69 | $ 19.59
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 |Luber Finerp LP5090 $ 33.66 | $ 15.82
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 Donaldson | P550812 $ 49.29 | $ 30.07
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 FVP R7502 $ 2.21 | $ 1.33
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 FVP PH48 $ 2.30 | $ 1.38
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finerl LFP5214 $ 75.59 | $ 35.53
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 |Luber Finerl LEP4836 $ 19.12 | $ 8.99
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 |Luber Finer] L5091F $ 71.40 | $ 33.56
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finerl LFF6963 $164.47 | $ 77.30
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | Donaldson | P551124 $ 96.25 | $ 58.71
4711, G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 FVP V3595 $ 8.86 | $ 5.32
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 |Luber Finer L5467FNXL| $ 24.74 [ $ 11.63
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 FVP P6935 $ 8.19 | $ 4.91
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 |Luber Finer] LAF6986 $424.19 | $199.37
4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 FVP P2487 $ 9.33 | $ 5.60
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finernl LAF8669 $ 83.28 | $ 39.14
Hyd. Filters
4.7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finernl LFH9347 $100.53 | $ 47.25
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |Luber Finer] LFH9347 $100.53 | $ 47.25
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil $642.75
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)

Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 [Motorcraft | BRF1475 $ 58.33 | $ 44.33
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 [Motorcraft| BRF1383 $ 67.40 | $ 51.22
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2VO01BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008 |Motorcraft| BRSD931 $ 67.95 | $ 51.64
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.6 2008 |Motorcraft| BRSD932 $ 54.66 | $ 41.54

Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 Centrie 12161072 | $ 43.85 | $ 25.87
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 Centrie 12161073 | $ 29.20 | $ 17.23




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I) $231.83
Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet - -
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 No Bid -
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |[MGM - 3232951 -
w/Welded Yoke -~
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 No Bid - -
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14| No Bid -
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) ANCO SP16 $ 8.07 | $ 5.16
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) ANCO SP20 $ 8.07 | $ 5.16
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) ANCO SP22 $ 8.07 | $ 5.16
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) ANCO SP24 $ 8.07 | $ 5.16
4.7.37.|31-22 ANCO 31-22 $ 4.94 | $ 3.17
4.7.38.130-22 ANCO 30-22 $ 9.40 | $ 6.02
4.7.39./30-20 ANCO 30-20 $ 9.40 | $ 6.02
4.7.40.131-20 ANCO 31-20 $ 4.95 | $ 3.17
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO 31-24 $ 4.95 | $ 3.17
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers) $ 42.19
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.{H6024 Wagner H6024 $ 12.48 | $ 6.61
4.7.44.|H6054 Wagner H6054 $ 12.77 | $ 6.77




4.7.45.|H4651 Wagner H4651 $ 12.50 | $ 6.63
4.7.46.(3357 Wagner 3357 $ 1.58 | $ 0.84
4.7.47.(3157 Wagner 3157 $ 0.78 1 $ 0.41
4.7.48.|3156 Wagner 3156 $ 0.83 | $ 0.44
4.7.49.13157-NA Wagner 3157NA $ 1.78 | $ 0.94
4.7.50.|19012 Wagner 9006 $ 5.44 | $ 2.88
4.7.51.{9007 Wagner 9007 $ 5.14 | $ 2.72
4.7.52.|19006 Wagner 9006 $ 5.44 | $ 2.88
4.7.53./9005 Wagner 9005 $ 5.15 | $ 2.72
4.7.54.19003 Wagner 9008 $ 5.29 | $ 2.80
4.7.55.14007 Wagner 4007 $ 23.58 | $ 12.50
4.7.56.(4157 Wagner 4157 $ 1.83 | $ 0.97

Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.]420R (Oval LED) Grote 53962 $ 33.58 | $ 30.22
4.7.58.|/417R (Round LED) Grote 53532 $ 22.88 | $ 20.59

Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 %2” No Bid -

LED w/Plug & Grommet) -
4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” No Bid -

LED w/Plug & Grommet) -

Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED) No Bid - -
4.7.62.|SUB-TOTAL (Lamps) $100.92

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (p

er gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Splash WASH $ 3.84 [ $ 1.80
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. Splash WW532 $ 2.43 | $ 1.14

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. 3M 8880 $ 6.68 | $ 2.34
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 0"Reillv Auto Parts
4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1 hour
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if
Different from Return any item for full credit within 13 months
4.6.8. Catalog Name FirstCall Online
Jobber +/- % —41%

4.6.9. All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
% ~41%
4.6.10. Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/
No
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for
1st Renewal
2nd Renewal
4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID

Price

Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 |WIX51748MP| ONLINE $ 91.51 | $ 25.60

4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 NO CROSS ONLINE - -

4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 NO CROSS ONL INE - -

4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 WIX57045 ONL INE $ 11.00 | $ 3.40

4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 WI1X57060 ONLINE $ 11.00 | $ 3.45

4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX57137 ONL INE $ 62.70 | $ 17.58

4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 | WIX577505 ONLINE $ 37.28 | $ 10.51
Fuel Filters

4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 W1X33849 ONLINE $162.70 | $ 45.77

4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX33979 ONLINE $228.80 | $ 64.36

4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX33969 ONLINE $196.60 | $ 55.65

4711, G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 WI1X33595 ONL INE $ 19.48 | $ 6.27

4.7.12, L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 |WIX33651XE| ONLINE $ 45.75 | $ 12.85
Air Filters

4.7.13, AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 WI1X46935 ONLINE $ 23.72 | $ 7.39

4.7.14, LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 |WIXWA10009| ONLINE $199.99 | $ 56.63

4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 NO CROSS ONL INE - -

4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX42803 ONLINE $174.56 | $ 49.18
Hyd. Filters

4.7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX57624 ONL INE $123.72 | $ 49.17

4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | WIX57624 ONLINE $123.72 | $ 49.17

4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil

Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)

Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 [PFC1611.20 ONL INE $137.28 | $ 62.18
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 [PFC1612.20 ONL INE $142.36 | $ 54.10
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008 |PFC0931.20 | ONLINE $154.22 | $ 65.22
4.7.23.| 4U2Z2V200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008 |PFC0932.20 | ONLINE $137.28 | $ 46.90

Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 |BBR680932RGY ONLINE $147.44 | $ 56.69
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 [BBR680983RGY ONLINE $ 93.21 | $ 36.39




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet Kics4248-018 | $476.26 | $217.52
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 |K1C54261-018 ONLINE $411.85 | $187.55
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |[MGM - 3232951 -
w/Welded Yoke -~
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | BBHPF4715QP20 ONL INE $ 15.83 | $ 64.46
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | BBHSF4707QP23 ONL INE $103.38 | $ 43.73
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) TRICO ONL INE $ 16.94 | $ 5.59
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) TRICO ONL INE $ 16.94 | $ 5.31
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) TRICO ONL INE $ 18.93 | $ 6.15
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) TRICO ONL INE $ 22.02 | $ 7.27
4.7.37.|131-22 ANCO TRICO $ 13.55 | $ 3.49
4.7.38.130-22 ANCO TRICO $ 23.72 | $ 7.99
4.7.39.|30-20 ANCO TRICO $ 20.33 | $ 6.99
4.7.40.131-20 ANCO TRICO $ 12.70 | $ 3.49
4.7.41.|131-24 ANCO TRICO $ 14.39 | $ 4.49
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 H6024 Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.59
4.7.44.1H6054 H6054 Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.59




4.7.45.|H4651 H4651 Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.59
4.7.46.|13357 Box of 10 |[3357-3457 Sylvania Online $ 23.72 | $ 6.70
4.7.47.|13157 Box of 10 |[3157 Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 4.77
4.7.48./3156 Box of 10 |[3156 Sylvania Online $ 20.33 | $ 4.07
4.7.49.13157-NA Box of 10 |[3157AA Elk Online $ 18.63 | $ 7.79
4.7.50.[9012 Box of 10 [912 Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 4.23
4.7.51.19007 9007BP | Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.39
4.7.52./9006 9006BP | Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.41
4.7.53.19005 9005BP | Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.37
4.7.54./9003 9003BP | Sylvania Online $ 18.63 | $ 6.28
4.7.55.14007 4007 Elk Online $ 16.94 | $ 5.99
4.7.56.(4157 Box of 10 [4157LL Sylvania Online $ 50.83 | $ 13.20
Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.]420R (Oval LED) 53962 Grote Online $105.07 | $ 45.98
4.7.58.|/417R (Round LED) No Cross - -
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 2” 47122 Grote $ 9.27
LED w/Plug & Grommet) Online $ 21.17
4.7.60.[V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” 47123 Grote $ 9.98
LED w/Plug & Grommet) Online $ 22.87
Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED) No Cross -

4.7.62.

SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (p

er gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. No Bid - | -
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. No Bid - -

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. 3vM8880 Online $ 8.97 | $ 4.47
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories
Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 vanauard Truck Center of St. Loui

4.6.5.
4.6.7.

4.6.8.

4.6.9.

4.6.10.

4.6.11.

4.7.

Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1-3 business days
Describe Return Policy if

Different from

Catalog Name

Jobber +/- %

All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
%

Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 3
2nd Renewal 3%

PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series 1995 ([2191-P553000 17.50
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 [2191-P551005 18.02
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 |2191-P550812 19.82
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 |
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 [2191-P550794 2.48
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 |
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 |2191-P550779 7.29
Fuel Filters |
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 |2191-P550954 49.16
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.11. G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 |2191-P551772 4.99
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 |2191-P551052 8.38
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015
4.7.15. LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 |2191-P548963 9.66
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 (2191-P537876 30.41
Hyd. Filters
4,7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 (2191-P574055 32.80

4.7.19.[SUB-TOTAL (Qil
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)

Brakes-Part |

Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost

4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014

4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014

4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008

4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos

4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014

4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Hea

Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet  [8235-85123399002 $135.19
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 8235-85123207002 $ 85.10
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM - 3232951(5554-3232951 $ 97.66
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 |4088-AX4715QPK $ 61.97
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 |4088-MV234707QPK $ 29.99
(Qty 16/order) 4088-AX47070QPK $ 49.99
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile)
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile)
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile)
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile)
4.7.37.|131-22 ANCO 8846-7522| $ 3.08
4.7.38.130-22 ANCO 8846-W22 | $ 6.86
4.7.39./30-20 ANCO 8846-W20 | $ 6.20
4.7.40.131-20 ANCO 8846-7520| $ 3.28
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO 8846-7524| $ 3.08
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 3132911 $ 8.82
4.7.44.1H6054 85106397 | $ 7.69




4.7.45.|H4651 3131231 $ 5.29
4.7.46.(3357
4.7.47.[3157 3945052 $ 1.66
4.7.48./3156 3096158 $ 1.07
4.7.49.[3157-NA 3099058 $ 1.86
4.7.50.19012
4.7.51.[9007 85106392 | $ 5.98
4.7.52./9006 85104910 | $ 6.11
4.7.53./9005 85104040 | $ 6.25
4.7.54./9003
4.7.55.(4007
4.7.56.|4157

Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.{420R (Oval LED) 8413-60250R| $ 23.49
4.7.58.[417R (Round LED) 8413-44882R| $ 42.82

Marker Light |
4.7.59.[V162KR (Round 2 %"

LED w/Plug & Grommet) 8413-10050H $ 8.68
4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2”

LED w/Plug & Grommet) 8413-10050Y $ 9.17

Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED)
4.7.62.|SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)
Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Splashwash| WWSD55 $ 1.91 | gallon
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL $ 90.72 |55 gallon

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65.

4.7.66.|SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. 1147-4520 $ 2.59
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 Ed Miller Aut I NAPA Auto Part
4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1 dav
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if

Different from
4.6.8. Catalog Name NAPA Auto Parts
Jobber +/- % 250
4.6.9. All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
% 25%

4.6.10. Will you honor the

submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 50

2nd Renewal 8%

4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 W1X NAPA Gold 1748 $ 63.99 | $ 28.45
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 WIX NAPA Gold 7909 $ 51.49 | $ 22.34
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 W1X NAPA Gold 7370 $ 52.99 | $ 23.45
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 WIX NAPA Gold 7045 $ 6.69 | $ 3.51
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 W1X NAPA Gold 7060 $ 6.69 | $ 3.45
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | V1x NAPA Gold 7137 $ 39.99 [ $ 17.58
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 W1X NAPA Gold 77505 $ 23.99 | $ 10.51
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 W1X NAPA Gold 3849 $104.00 | $ 45.77
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | V'X NAPA Gold 3979 $154.00 | $ 64.37
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ WX NAPA Gold 3969 $129.00 | $ 55.65
4711, G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 WIX NAPA Gold 3595 $ 12.49 | $ 6.27
4.7.12, L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 W1X NAPA Gold 3651XE $ 28.99 | $ 12.85
Air Filters
4.7.13, AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 W1X NAPA Gold 6935 $ 14.49 | $ 7.40
4.7.14, LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 WIX NAPA Gold 500009 $129.00 | $ 56.64
4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 W1X NAPA Gold 7060 $ 6.69 | $ 3.45
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | "1X NAPA Cold 2803 $114.00 [ $ 49.18
Hyd. Filters
4.7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ WX NAPA Gold 7624 $114.00 | $ 49.17
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ WX NaPA Gold 7624 $114.00 | $ 49.17
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Qil
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)
| BrakesPartl .
Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 NAPA UP8855-SD| $134.00 | $ 88.75
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 UP8825-SD| $104.00 | $ 70.20
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008 UP7834-SD| $ 81.99 | $ 59.35
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008 UP7944X $ 54.73 | $ 54.73
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 SD880982 | $179.00 | $127.92
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014 SD880983 | $219.00 | $155.94




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 |Cenmetcunite 3687X $254.00 | $193.20
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 KICUSA X60794 $129.00 | $ 98.00
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM - 3232951|GC3030LCW $ 86.07
$ 97.49
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware Meritor [4715E23(new) $104.00 | $ 58.15
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 MBI Hvesa715Qc(reman)| $ 61.99 | $ 51.60
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Meritor 4707E23(new) $127.36 | $ 63.69
(Qty 16/order) MBI Hves4707Q6(reman)[ 56 .99 $ 49.78
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) Federal Mogul 60-1643 $ 1599 | $ 9.88
4.7.34.[SP20 (Profile) Federal Mogul 60-2043 $ 17.99 | $ 10.35
4.7.35.[SP22 (Profile) Federal Mogul | 60-2243 | $ 18.99 | $ 11.58
4.7.36.[SP24 (Profile) Federal Mogul 60-2443 $ 19.99 | $ 12.35
4.7.37.|31-22 ANCO NP22 $ 5.99 | $ 3.48
4.7.38./30-22 ANCO NPW22 $ 8.99 | $ 7.38
4.7.39.|30-20 ANCO NPW20 $ 8.99 | $ 7.38
4.7.40.(31-20 ANCO NP20 $ 5.99 | $ 3.40
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO NP24 $ 7.99 | $ 4.26
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.{H6024 Wagner H6024 $ 10.49 | $ 8.64
4.7.44.|H6054 Wagner H6054 $ 9.99 | $ 8.84




4.7.45.|H4651 Wagner H4651 $ 10.69 | $ 8.65
4.7.46.(3357 Wagner 3357 $ 1.99 | $ 1.08
4.7.47.(3157 Wagner 3157 $ 1.29 | $ 0.53
4.7.48.|3156 Wagner 3156 $ 1.29 | $ 0.56
4.7.49.13157-NA Wagner 3157NA $ 2,29 |1 $ 1.20
4.7.50.|19012 Wagner 9012LL $ 29.99 | $ 25.54
4.7.51.19007 Wagner 9007 $ 10.99 | $ 3.57
4.7.52.|19006 Wagner 9006 $ 10.99 | $ 3.76
4.7.53.19005 Wagner 9005 $ 10.99 | $ 3.56
4.7.54.19003 Wagner 9003 $ 10.99 | $ 3.66
4.7.55.14007 Wagner 4007 $ 27.99 | $ 16.33
4.7.56.|14157 Wagner 4157LL $ 3.29 | $ 1.25
Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.|420R (Oval LED) Truck Lite| 60250R $ 39.99 | $ 25.37
4.7.58.|1417R (Round LED) Truck Lite| 44302R $ 23.49 | $ 14.86
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 v2” Truck Lite $ 10.61
LED w/Plug & Grommet) 10050R1 $ 16.99
4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2” Truck Lite $ 11.06
LED w/Plug & Grommet) 10050Y1 $ 17.49
Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED) Truck Lite| 60360Y $ 66.99 | $ 42.65

4.7.62.

SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Old World | Minus22 $ 2.39 | $ 2.12
4.7.64.|SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. old World Plus32 $ 1.79 | $ 1.54

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. MMM 8880 $ 499 | $ 2.33
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories
Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30 Ozark Kenworth d/b/a MHC Kenworth
4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order 1 to 2 days
4.6.7. Describe Return Policy if
Different from
4.6.8. Catalog Name N/ZA
Jobber +/- % 20%
4.6.9. All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
% 20%
4.6.10. Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/

No Yes
4.6.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal 20

2nd Renewal 204

4.7. PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Qil Filters Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series | 1995 |Fleetguard|LF3000FLG| $ 45.98 | $ 18.40
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012 |Fleetguard|[LF17511FLG] $ 46.81 [ $ 18.73
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015 |Fleetguard|LF16233FLG] $ 50.59 [ $ 20.24
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014 N/A - -
4.7.5. PHA48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 |Fleetguard| LF689FLG | $ 8.76 [ $ 3.51
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ Fleetguard [LF16106FLG] $ 41.29 [ $ 16.52
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014 |Fleetguard|LF16243FLG] $ 19.60 [ $ 7.84
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012 |Fleetguard [FK48556FLG| $118.25 [ $ 47.30
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15 N/A - -
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | Fleetguard| FS1096FLG| $105.44 [ $ 42.18
4711, G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003 |Fleetguard|FF5244FLG| $ 13.14 [ $ 5.26
4.7.12. L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015 |Fleetguard|FS19727FLG] $ 23.03 [ $ 9.22
Air Filters
4.7.13. AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014 |Fleetguard| AF994FLG | $ 71.08 [ $ 28.44
4.7.14. LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015 | Donaldson [ P614986 $149.98 | $ 89.28
4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009 N/A - -
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15 [ Fleetguard [AF25437FLG| $ 77.86 [ $ 31.15
Hyd. Filters
4,717, AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15 N/A — -
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15 | Fleetguard |HF29034FLG] $ 94.19 [ $ 37.68
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil $375.75
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)
. BrakesPartl
Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27. 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | Cenmet Gunite 3687X $331.20 | $158.95
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Gunite 3600AX $201.40 | $ 98.00
(Qty 16/order)
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke Freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM - 3232951|3232951X $ 95.14
$224.78
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Haldex RXGG4715QG| $103.92 | $ 68.92
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Haldex RXGG4707QG| $ 83.08 | $ 55.10
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|1SUB-TOTAL (Brakes- $476.11
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) Roadforce RFO-16 $ 38.00 | $ 9.50
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile) Roadforce RFO-20 $ 43.35 | $ 10.84
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile) Roadforce RFO-22 $ 45.90 | $ 11.48
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile) Roadforce RFO-24 $ 45.90 | $ 11.48
4737 31-22 Roadforce AN'@'@ RF5—22 $ 11-00 $ 2-75
4.7.38.130-22 Roadforce ANCO RFW-22 $ 19.35 | $ 4.84
4.7.39.130-20 Roadforce ANCO RFW-20 $ 19.35 $ 4.84
4.7.40.131-20 Roadforce ANCO RF5-20 $ 11.25 | $ 2.82
4.7.41. 31-24 Roadforce AN'@'@ RF5—24 $ 11-25 $ 2-82
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers) $ 61.37
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 EIKO RFH6024 $ 36.65 | $ 9.17
4.7.44.1H6054 EIKO RFH6054 $ 34.30 | $ 8.58




4.7.45.|H4651 E1KO RFH4651 $ 33.55 | $ 8.39
4.7.46.|3357 EIKO RF3357 $ 2.40 | $ 0.60
4.7.47.[3157 E1KO RF3157 $ 2.60 | $ 0.65
4.7.48.13156 EIKO RF3156 $ 4.45 | % 1.12
4.7.49.[3157-NA E1KO RE3157NA | $ 6.90 [ $ 1.73
4.7.50.|19012 EIKO RFOO12LL | $164.75 | $ 41.19
4.7.51.[9007 E1KO RF9007 $ 14.70 | $ 3.68
4.7.52./9006 EIKO RF9006 $ 12.90 | $ 3.23
4.7.53./9005 E1KO RF9005 $ 12.90 | $ 3.23
4.7.54./9003 EIKO RF9003 $ 28.60 | $ 7.15
4.7.55.[4007 E1KO RF4007 $ 73.75 | $ 18.44
4.7.56.|14157 EIKO RF4157K $ 4.90 | $ 1.23
Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.|420R (Oval LED) Peterson RF420R-5 | $ 41.80 | $ 11.00
4.7.58.[417R (Round LED) Peterson | RF417R-5 | $ 44.05 [ $ 11.60
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 ¥2” Peterson $ 6.72
LED w/Plug & Grommet) RFV162KR | $ 25.50
4.7.60.[V162KA (Round 2 %" Peterson $ 6.72
LED w/Plug & Grommet) RFV162KA | $ 25.50
Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED) Peterson | RF423SA-1| $227.45 | $ 59.86
4.7.62.[SUB-TOTAL (Lamps) $204.29

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (p

er gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. Prestone RFAS250 $12.80 [ $ 3.20
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. Prestone RFAS257 $ 9.75 | $ 2.44

4.7.66.

SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. Roadforce/GunK|RF1135298| $ 8.90 | $ 2.10
4.7.90.[SUB-TOTAL |
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)




RFB #: 24-29APR15 - Automotive Parts and Accessories

Bid Opening: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 at 1:30

4.6.5. Delivery Days After Receipt of Order

4.6.7.

4.6.8.

4.6.9.

4.6.10.

4.6.11.

4.7.

Describe Return Policy if
Different from

Catalog Name

Jobber +/- %

All other parts will be sold
to the County at jobber +/-
%

Will you honor the
submitted prices for
purchase by other entities
in Boone County who
participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone
County, Missouri? Yes/
No

Columbia Freightliner

1 to 2 days

35% off list

Yes

Maximum Percentage Increase for

1st Renewal

2nd Renewal
PRICING-STANDARD
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
& ACCESSORIES

Oil Filters, Fuel Filters,
Air Filters (Luberfiner is

current brand unless
otherwise noted)

Oil Filters

Manufacturer

Vehicle App

Year

Mfg. Name

Price List ID

Price

Net Cost




4.7.1. LFP3000 Cummins 8.3L C-Series [ 1995 No Bid
4.7.2. LFP5090 Detroit DD13 2012
4.7.3. LFP6043 Paccar MX13C 2015
4.7.4. PH500 Ford 3.7L 2014
4.7.5. PH48 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009
4.7.6. LFP5214 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.7. LFP4836 John Deere 6125M 2014
Fuel Filters
4.7.8. L5091F Detroit DD13 2012
4.7.9. LFF6963 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.10. LFF6964 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4711, G6593 Ford 4.6L 2003
4.7.12, L5467FNXL Paccar MX13 2015
Air Filters
4.7.13, AF2884 Ford 3.7L 2014
4.7.14, LAF6986 Kenworth MX13 2015
4.7.15, LAF1519 Chevrolet 5.3L 2009
4.7.16. LAF8669 John Deere 672G 2009-15
Hyd. Filters
4.7.17. AT335492 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.18. AT367840 John Deere 672G 2009-15
4.7.19.|SUB-TOTAL (Oil
Filters, Fuel Filters, Air
Filters)
| BrakesPartl .
Brake Shoes/Pads (Raybest¢ Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.20. GPD1611A(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014 No Bid
4.7.21. GPD1612(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.22.| 3U2Z2V001BA(Front) Ford Crown Vic 4.6L] 2008
4.7.23.] 4U272\VV200AB(Rear) Ford Crown Vic 4.61] 2008
Rotors/Drums (Raybestos
4.7.24. PR54188(Front) Ford Interceptor 2014
4.7.25. PR54189(Rear) Ford Interceptor 2014




4.7.26.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-Part I)

Brakes-Part Il (Heavy Truck
Drums Manufacturer | Vehicle App | Year Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.27, 107193 (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Conmet $109.00 each
4.7.28. 3600AX (Balanced) Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 | Alliance $ 75.00 each
(Qty 16/order) ABP1N42A1657UB
Air Brake
Chambers/Spring Brake
MGM (OEM)
4.7.29.| Type 30-30 Long Stroke freightliner/Paccal All Trucks | 2012-15 |MGM - 3232951 each
$108.00
w/Welded Yoke
Brake Shoe Kits w/Hardware
4.7.30. XK2124715QP Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Meritor $ 73.25 box
4.7.31. 4707DQ23 Q+ Freightliner 114SD 2012-14 Alliance $ 46.00 box
(Qty 16/order)
4.7.32.|SUB-TOTAL (Brakes-
Part Il Heavy Truck)
0 10 pDE
Blades Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.33.|SP16 (Profile) No Bid
4.7.34.|SP20 (Profile)
4.7.35.|SP22 (Profile)
4.7.36.|SP24 (Profile)
4.7.37.|131-22 ANCO
4.7.38.130-22 ANCO
4.7.39.|30-20 ANCO
4.7.40.131-20 ANCO
4.7.41.131-24 ANCO
4.7.42.|1SUB-TOTAL (Windshield Wipers)
O 0, adlne
Lamps Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.43.|H6024 No Bid

4.7.44.

H6054




4.7.45.|H4651

4.7.46.|13357

4.7.47.13157

4.7.48.13156
4.7.49.|13157-NA
4.7.50.]19012

4.7.51.19007

4.7.52./9006

4.7.53.]19005

4.7.54.(9003

4.7.55.14007

4.7.56.|14157

Tail Light (Peterson)
4.7.57.]1420R (Oval LED)
4.7.58.]1417R (Round LED)
Marker Light
4.7.59.|V162KR (Round 2 ¥2”
LED w/Plug & Grommet)

4.7.60.|V162KA (Round 2 ¥2”
LED w/Plug & Grommet)

Strobe Light
4.7.61.[423SA-1 (Oval LED)
4.7.62.[SUB-TOTAL (Lamps)
Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Winter De-lcer Type
Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.63. No Bid
4.7.64.[SUB-TOTAL

Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent (per gallon) Pre-Mix-Summer

Washer Fluid Mfg. Name | Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.65. No Bid
4.7.66.[SUB-TOTAL




Brake Cleaner 3M (per 14 0z. can minimum Mfg. Name  Price List ID Price Net Cost
4.7.67. No Bid
4.7.90.|SUB-TOTAL
4.8.|GRAND TOTAL ALL SUPPLIES (4.7.19+4.7.26+4.7.32+4.7.42+4.7.62+4.7.64+4.7.66+4.7.90)
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