

RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING		Truss Crane, Inc.			Kar Wing Trading Co, Inc.	
Item #	Description	Estimated Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4.7.1.	Mattresses-Section 2.5.1.	100 each		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.2.	Wool Blankets-Section 2.5.2.	300 each		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.3.	Poly Cotton Blankets-Section 2.5.3.	100 each		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.4.	Slip on PVC sandals-Section 2.5.4.1.	200 pair		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.5.	Slip on PVC sandals-Section 2.5.4.2.	20 pair		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.6.	Sandals, black-Section 2.5.4.3.	20 pair		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.7.	Toothpaste-Section 2.5.5.	35 cases	\$34.20/cs ; 144/cs; \$0.238/ea; #GTP4678	\$1,197.00		No Bid
4.7.8.	Toothbrushes-Section 2.5.6.1.	35 cases	\$54.62/cs ; 1440/cs; 144/bx, 10 bx/cs; \$0.038/ea; #TB20	\$1,911.70		No Bid
4.7.9.	Toothbrushes-Section 2.5.6.2.	5 cases	\$54.49/cs ; 1440/cs; \$0.038/ea; #TB5118	\$272.45		No Bid
4.7.10.	Soap-Section 2.5.7.1.	4 cases	\$54.90/cs ; 500/cs; \$0.110/ea; #SP15	\$219.60		No Bid
4.7.11.	Soap-Section 2.5.7.2.	75 cases		No Bid		No Bid

No Bids: Alamar Uniforms
Central Poly Corporation
Smith Paper

RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING		Truss Crane, Inc.			Kar Wing Trading Co, Inc.	
Item #	Description	Estimated Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4.7.12.	Razors-Sec 2.5.8.	50 cases	\$109.93/cs ; 2000/cs; \$.055/ea; #ER300	\$5,496.50		No Bid
4.7.13.	Shampoo-Sec 2.5.9.	100 cases	\$25.57/cs ; 96/cs; \$0.266/ea; #SSB02C	\$2,557.00		No Bid
4.7.14.	Combs-Sec 2.5.10.	25 cases	\$32.98/cs ; 2160/cs; \$0.015/ea; #C5	\$824.50		No Bid
4.7.15.	ID Bands-Sec 2.5.11.	75 cases		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.15.1.	Fastening Tool	1 ea		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.16.	Cleaning Detergent-Sec 2.5.12.	60 cases		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.17.	White Bath Towels-Sec 2.5.13.	10 bales		No Bid		
4.7.18.	Brown Bath Towels-Sec 2.5.13.	5 dozen		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.19.	Wash Cloths, Brown-Sec 2.5.13.	20 dozen		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.20.	Latex gloves-Sec 2.5.14. Submit Sample	100 boxes		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.21.	Sanitary Napkins-Sec 2.5.15.	25 cases		No Bid		No Bid

RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING		Truss Crane, Inc.			Kar Wing Trading Co, Inc.	
Item #	Description	Estimated Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4.7.22.	Tampons-Sec 2.5.16.	25 cases		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.23.	Women's Underwear-Sec 2.5.17.	25 dozen		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.24.	Shirts-Sec 2.5.18.	20 each		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.25.	Sweatpants-Sec 2.5.19.	20 each		No Bid		No Bid
4.7.26.	Shoes-Sec 2.5.20.	20 pair		No Bid	\$5.85/pr; Cruiser Style #BA3VM	\$117.00
4.7.27.	Pen-Sec 2.5.21.	15000 ea	\$0.149/ea; #FPNK02	\$2,238.00		No Bid
Grand Total Extended Prices						
4.8.	Minimum discount for all product lines not specified:		0%		NA	
4.9.	Delivery turnaround		7-15 DAYS		2-14 DAYS	
4.10.	Maximum % Increase on renewals	1st Renewal	5%		3.5%	
		2nd Renewal	5%		7%	
		3rd Renewal	5%		10.5%	
		4th Renewal	5%		14%	
4.11.	Cooperative Purchasing		Yes		Yes	