RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Pyramid School Products
Extended

Iltem # Description Estimated Qty |Unit Price Price Unit Price Extended Price
Mattresses-Section

4.7.1. 2.5.1. 100 each $39.00/ea; #LPM25EXSS $3,900.00 No Bid
Wool Blankets-

4.7.2. Section 2.5.2. 300 each $6.09/ea; #LO10X $1,827.00 No Bid
Poly Cotton Blankets-

4.7.3. Section 2.5.3. 100 each $6.09/ea; #L012 $609.00 No Bid
Slip on PVC sandals-

4.7.4. Section 2.5.4.1. 200 pair $1.48/pr; #M019 $296.00 No Bid
Slip on PVC sandals-

4.7.5. Section 2.5.4.2. 20 pair $1.48/pr; #M019 $29.60 No Bid
Sandals, black-

4.7.6. Section 2.5.4.3. 20 pair $1.83/pr; #MJAS-BK $36.60 No Bid
Toothpaste-Section

4.7.7. 2.5.5. 35 cases $29.24/cs; 144/cs; #T010P $1,023.40 No Bid
Toothbrushes-

4.7.8. Section 2.5.6.1. 35 cases $6.12/cs; 144/cs; #7021 $214.20 No Bid
Toothbrushes-

4.7.9. Section 2.5.6.2. 5 cases $5.51/cs; 144/cs; #TBSH $27.55 No Bid

4.7.10. Soap-Section 2.5.7.1. |4 cases $50.34/cs; 500/cs; #T044UN $201.36 No Bid

4.7.11. Soap-Section 2.5.7.2. |75 cases $35.32/cs; 1000/cs; #T040B $2,649.00 No Bid

No Bids:  Alamar Uniforms

Central Poly Corporation

Smith Paper




RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Pyramid School Products
Estimated Extended Extended
ltem # Description Qty Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
$102.89/cs; 2000/cs;

4.7.12. Razors-Sec 2.5.8. |50 cases #T100 $5,144.50 No Bid
Shampoo-Sec $22.02/cs; 96/cs;

4.7.13. 2.5.9. 100 cases [#T129 $2,202.00 No Bid

$34.93/cs; 2160/cs;

4.7.14. Combs-Sec 2.5.10. (25 cases #T123 $873.25 No Bid
ID Bands-Sec $196.38/cs; 500/cs;

4.7.15. 2.5.11. 75 cases #643M $14,728.50 No Bid

4.7.15.1. |Fastening Tool lea $76.94/ea; #692 $76.94 No Bid
Cleaning
Detergent-Sec $110.08/cs; 4/cs;

4.7.16. 2.5.12. 60 cases Gain $6,604.80 No Bid

S274.75/bale; 25

White Bath $400.00/bale; 25 dz/bale; A&B#W2040-

4.7.17. Towels-Sec 2.5.13.]|10 bales dz/bale; #L016 $4,000.00 |5.5 $2,747.50
Brown Bath

4.7.18. Towels-Sec 2.5.13.]5 dozen $13.75/dz; #LO16BR $68.75 No Bid
Wash Cloths,

4.7.19. Brown-Sec 2.5.13. |20 dozen $2.48/dz; #L017BR $49.60 No Bid
Latex gloves-Sec $6.99/bx; 50/box; 10
2.5.14. Submit $9.90/bx; 100/bx; boxes/cs; Amercare

4.7.20. Sample 100 boxes [#GPLHD $990.00 [#800-size $699.00
Sanitary Napkins- $16.26/cs; 250/cs; $26.98/cs; 250/cs;

4.7.21. Sec 2.5.15. 25 cases #TSN300 S406.50 |Gardo #147A $674.50




RFB 52-13NOV14 INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Pyramid School Products
Estimated Extended
ltem # Description Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Price
$53.98/cs; 500/cs;
4.7.22. Tampons-Sec 2.5.16. 25 cases $43.65/cs; 500/cs; #T067 $1,091.25 |Tampax#T500 $1,349.50
Women's Underwear-
4.7.23. Sec 2.5.17. 25 dozen $11.02/dz; #C062W $275.50 No Bid
4.7.24. Shirts-Sec 2.5.18. 20 each $5.60/ea; #G200 $112.00 No Bid
4.7.25. Sweatpants-Sec 2.5.19. |20 each $10.13/ea; #C047 $202.60 No Bid
4.7.26. Shoes-Sec 2.5.20. 20 pair $5.55/pair; #5C1011 $111.00 No Bid
4.7.27. Pen-Sec 2.5.21. 15000 ea $0.12/each; #MO4FXP $1,842.71 No Bid
Grand Total Extended Prices
Minimum discount for
all product lines not
4.8. specified: 5% 20%
4.9, Delivery turnaround 5-10 DAYS 7-10 DAYS
Maximum % Increase
4.10. on renewals 1st Renewal 5% 10%
2nd Renewal 5% 10%
3rd Renewal 5% 10%
4th Renewal 5% 10%
4.11. Cooperative Purchasing Yes Yes
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