
                                                                                                                                                                                  
Engineer's 
Estimate

GBH Builders, 
Inc. Glovecon Inc.

McAfee 
Construction, 

Inc.

Sircal 
Contracting 

Inc.

United HRB 
General 

Contractors

River City 
Construction, 

L.L.C.
Description Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

Base Bid Lump Sum $399,400.00 $499,500.00 $391,443.00 $384,200.00 $447,000.00 $363,000.00

Alternate Bid #1 - 2nd Floor of 101 N. 7th Street $5,526.00 $10,375.00 $2,706.00 $4,500.00 $3,700.00 $2,500.00
Alternate Bid #2 - Addition of walls, wet bar, extension of 
existing walls and add electric strike to existing exterior doors 
at 605 Walnut $22,237.00 $59,633.00 $30,481.00 $22,200.00 $33,000.00 $21,500.00
Alternate Bid #3 - Remove and replace all existing carpet and 
repaint all walls in 605 Walnut $44,750.00 $76,044.00 $42,305.00 $40,000.00 $49,700.00 $39,700.00
Alternate Bid #4 - Overlay existing parking lot with asphalt to 
drain toward E. Walnut St. No Bid $62,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,500.00

Bid Total $404,000.00 $707,552.00 $439,200.00
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Signature and Identity of Bidder Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bidder's Acknowledgment Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Anti-Collusion Statement Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Work Authorization Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Response Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Statement of Bidder's Qualifications Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendum #1 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendum #2 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attended the Mandatory Pre-Bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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