BID TABULATION

32-30JUL13 - PRE-PRINTED ENVELOPES

4.8.

Bear Graphics & Printing

Affordable Printing
Solutions

General Printing Service

Hampton Envelope Co.

St. Louis Print Group,

University of MO Printing
Services

Premiere Papers &

Monarch Industries, Inc.

Michael James Rafetta
DBA Accurate Forms &

Peregrine Corporation

PRICING (Centralia, MO) (Columbia, MO) (St. Louis, MO) LLC (St. Louis, MO) Packaging (Overland Park, KS) (Joplin, MO)
(Holts Summit, MO) (Columbia, MO) (Charlottesville, VA) Supplies (Hurst, TX)
D inti Unit Price Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended
escription oTY (Per 1000) | Extended Price| (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price (Per 1000) Price
#11 White Window
Envelopes 24lb, Larger
4.8.1.|Window, Single Sided. 135,000 $25.65 $3,462.75 $24.47 $3,303.45 $23.42 $3,161.70 $27.04 $3,650.40 $33.43 $4,513.05 $31.548 $4,258.98 $35.27 $4,761.45 No Bid $0.00 $53.25 $7,188.75 $52.83 $7,132.05
#10 Blue Window
Envelopes 24lb, Single
4.8.2.|Sided. 95,000 $19.68 $1,869.60 $20.34 $1,932.30 $23.85 $2,265.75 $24.49 $2,326.55 $22.81 $2,166.95 $27.010 $2,565.95 $21.79 $2,070.05 No Bid $0.00 $37.30 $3,543.50 $45.16 $4,290.20
#10 White Woven
Envelopes 24 Ib, Single
4.8.3.[Sided. 2,500 $19.68 $49.20 $19.97 $49.93 $42.40 $106.00 $55.50 $138.75 $34.05 $85.13 $33.572 $83.93 $46.92 $117.30 $43.30 $108.25 $48.25 $120.63 $57.32 $143.30
#10 Yellow Insert
Envelopes 24 Ib. Double
4.8.4.[Sided. 105,000 $19.68 $2,066.40 $20.34 $2,135.70 $20.90 $2,194.50 $22.94 $2,408.70 $22.14 $2,324.70 $26.026 $2,732.73 $24.04 $2,524.20 No Bid $0.00 $34.75 $3,648.75 $45.20 $4,746.00
#10 White Insert
envelopes 24 |b, Double
4.8.5.|Sided. 20,000 $19.68 $393.60 $19.97 $399.40 $28.92 $578.40 $26.46 $529.20 $34.05 $681.00 $23.470 $469.40 $25.20 $504.00 $28.66 $573.20 $34.75 $695.00 $32.46 $649.20
#9 White Insert
envelopes 24lb, Double
4.8.6.[Sided. 5,000 $28.65 $143.25 $35.00 $175.00 $43.20 $216.00 $45.11 $225.55 $48.20 $241.00 $33.550 $167.75 $34.96 $174.80 $38.35 $191.75 $44.75 $223.75 $50.18 $250.90
9" x 12" Brown Kraft
Window Envelopes,
4.8.7.|Single Sided. 1,000 $414.28 $414.28 $446.00 $446.00 $516.85 $516.85 $503.75 $503.75 $542.00 $542.00 $297.350 $297.35 $632.50 $632.50 No Bid $0.00 $557.99 $557.99 $359.95 $359.95
#10 White Window
Envelopes 24lb, Single
4.8.8.|Sided. 7,500 $29.45 $220.88 $19.97 $149.78 $30.74 $230.55 $28.07 $210.53 $34.05 $255.38 $27.220 $204.15 $34.82 $261.15 $38.70 $290.25 $37.30 $279.75 $33.12 $248.40
6 %2 x 9 ¥ Regular White
4.8.9.|Envelopes, Single Sided. 3,500 $62.40 $218.40 $35.08 $122.78 $80.40 $281.40 $51.13 $178.96 $71.80 $251.30 $93.130 $325.96 $84.64 $296.24 $85.70 $299.95 $86.55 $302.93 $99.70 $348.95
4.9.|TOTAL $8,838.36 * $8,714.33 $9,551.15 $10,172.38 $11,060.50 $11,106.20 $11,341.69 $1,463.40 $16,561.04 * $18,168.95

4.10.

Deviations

*Shipping & delivery to 3rd
floor $685.00

Total Bid Price:

$9399.33

Pricing based on doing all
at one time. +/- 10%

Unable to supply samples
by bid due date. Can
supply samples if
considered for bid.

One Time Delivery In Full

Quoted as being produced
and shipped all at the same
time

*Freight to 3rd Floor:
$800.00

Total Bid Price:
$18,968.95
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