
RED THE UNIFORM 

TAILOR ALAMAR UNIFORMS A UNIFORMED LIFE

Item Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

4.12.1. Boots:  Danner Acadia 8” 

Men’s/Women’s 200 grain 

Thinsulate, waterproof GORE-

TEX

$234.00 $218.00 NO BID

4.12.2. Boots:  Danner Acadia 8” 

Men’s/Women’s, waterproof 

GORE-TEX

$234.00 $205.00 NO BID

4.12.3.

Boots:  Elite Spider 5.0 #5516
$107.15 $99.00 NO BID

4.12.4. Boots:  Elite Spider 8.0 SZ 

#5186
$121.30 $113.00 NO BID

4.12.5. Boots: Women’s Stealth Force 

6.0 #5187
$89.30 $83.50 NO BID

4.12.6. Boots:  Women’s Elite Spider 

5.0 # 5517
$78.60 $73.50 NO BID

4.12.7. Boots:  Women’s Stealth Force 

6.0 WP #5155
$92.85 $86.50 NO BID

4.12.8.

Boots:  Stealth Force 6.0 #5248
$89.30 $83.50 NO BID

4.12.9. Boots:  Stealth Force 8.0 SZ 

#5198
$96.50 $90.00 NO BID

4.12.10. Boots:  UnderArmour Valsetz 

Tactical Boot
$86.50 $86.50 NO BID

4.12.11 Boots: Original SWAT WinX2 

Waterproof [1020]
NO BID $60.00 $66.92

4.12.12 Boots: Original SWAT 9" 

Tactical Waterproof [1270]
NO BID $67.00 $72.31

4.12.13 Boots: Original SWAT Air 

M.T. Tactical Waterproof 

[1234] 
NO BID $82.00 $89.23

4.12.14 Boots: Rocky 8” AlphaForce 

Zipper Waterproof Duty 

Boot (0002173)
$72.85 $76.50 $70.25

4.12.15 Boots:  Rocky 8” AlphaForce 

Duty Boot (0002165) $80.70 $76.50 $70.25

4.12.16 Boots: Rocky Fort Hood 

Waterproof Duty Boot 

(0002049)
$62.40 $62.00 $61.50

4.12.17 Boots: Rocky Fort Hood Zipper 

Waterproof Duty Boot 

(0002149)

$74.30 $70.00 $67.50

4.10. Max % Increase 1st Renewal
4 3

4.10. Max % Increase 2nd Renewal
4 5

4.9. COOP? (Yes or NO) NO YES

BID TABULATION

52-06DEC11 - Law Enforcement Boots


