49-08NOV11 - Photocopier Maintenance - Auditor, Assessor, & Prosecuting Attorney's Office

BID TABULAT'ON Image Technologies Data Comm Inc.
4.8.  |Description Annual Annual Overage — Cost Per | Annual Maintenance | Overage — Cost Per
Copies | Maintenance Cost Copy Cost Copy
4.8.1.|Copier #1 — Canon Image Runner 2270: Auditor _
IR2270 — fiscal year 2012 40,000 $440.00 $0.011 $360.00 $0.0090]
IR2270 — fiscal year 2013 40,000 $440.00 $0.011 $378.00 $0.0095
IR2270 — fiscal year 2014 40,000 $440.00 $0.011 $396.90 $0.0100]
IR2270 — fiscal year 2015 40,000 $484.00 $0.011 $415.39 $0.0105
IR2270 — fiscal year 2016 40,000 $532.00 $0.011 $436.15 $0.0110]
TOTAL $2,336.00 $1,986.44
4.8.2. |Copier #2 — Canon Image Runner 5000: Assessor
IR5000 — fiscal year 2012 100,000 $900.00 $500.00 $0.0050
IR5000 - fiscal year 2013 100,000 $900.00 $0.006 $525.00 $0.0053
IR5000 — fiscal year 2014 100,000 $900.00 $0.006 $551.25 $0.0056
IR5000 - fiscal year 2015 100,000 $990.00 $0.006 $578.81 $0.0059
IR5000 — fiscal year 2016 100,000 $1,089.00 $0.006 $607.75 $0.0062
TOTAL $4,779.00 $2,762.81
4.8.3. |Copier #3 — Gestetner 3235: Prosecuting Attorney
Gestetner 3235 — fiscal year 2012 10,000 $75.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Gestetner 3235 — fiscal year 2013 10,000 $75.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Gestetner 3235 — fiscal year 2014 10,000 $75.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Gestetner 3235 — fiscal year 2015 10,000 $83.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Gestetner 3235 — fiscal year 2016 10,000 $91.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
TOTAL $399.00
Note: Image Technologies replacing Gestetner with a used kyocera
Kyocera 5035- fiscal year 2012 210,000 $1,575.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Kyocera 5035 — fiscal year 2013 210,000 $1,575.00 $0.0075 No Bid No Bid
Kyocera 5035 — fiscal year 2014 210,000 $1,575.00 $0.0075 No Bid No Bid
Kyocera 5035 — fiscal year 2015 210,000 $1,732.00 $0.0075 No Bid| No Bid|
Kyocera 5035 — fiscal year 2016 210,000 $1,732.00 $0.0075 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $8,189.00
Auditor: $56/bx of 15,000; Assessor:
$50/box of 15,000; PA: $66/box of 10,000;
Staples Pricing Juvenile Office: $66/box of 25,000 Included
Image Technologies will replace the
Gestetner with a Used Kyocera KM-5035
or similar Kyocera with the same
Deviations functionality for copier #3 N/A
No Bids

Da-Com




