

28-24JUN11 - Towing and Recovery Services Term & Supply

BID TABULATION

| 4.7.3. | Standard Tow | Tiger Towing | Carl's Towing | AJ's Towing | Economy Towing |
|--------|---|---------------------|----------------------|--------------------|-----------------------|
| 1 | Small: Cars and Light Trucks (¾ ton or less standard tow) | \$40.00 | \$55.00 | \$70.00 | \$60.00 |
| 2 | Medium Duty Trucks (1 ton standard tow) | \$60.00 | \$75.00 | N/A | \$75.00 |
| 3 | Heavy Duty Trucks & Heavy Equipment (greater than 1 ton standard tow) | N/A | \$175.00 | N/A | No Bid |
| 4.7.4. | Additional Services | Tiger Towing | Carl's Towing | AJ's Towing | Economy Towing |
| 1 | Flat Tire Repair/Change (labor charge associated with tow) | \$10.00 | \$10.00 | No Charge | \$60.00 |
| 2 | Jump Start (labor charge associated with tow) | \$10.00 | \$10.00 | No Charge | \$50.00 |
| 3 | Pull Axle (labor charge associated with tow) | N/A | \$25.00 | \$15.00 | \$10.00 |
| 4 | Pull Drive Shaft, labor charge (labor charge associated with tow) | N/A | \$25.00 | \$15.00 | \$10.00 |
| 5 | Small Winch-Out, labor charge (labor charge in addition to tow charge, per 15 minute increments at recovery site) | \$10.00 | \$15.00 | \$40.00 | \$15.00 |
| 6 | Medium Winch-Out, labor charge (labor charge in addition to tow charge, per 15 minute increments at recovery site) | \$15.00 | \$25.00 | \$80.00 | \$15.00 |

| 4.7.3. | Standard Tow | Tiger Towing | Carl's Towing | AJ's Towing | Economy Towing |
|--------|--|---------------------|----------------------|--------------------|-----------------------|
| | 7 Heavy Winch-Out, labor charge (labor charge in addition to tow charge, per 15 minute increments at recovery site) | N/A | \$40.00 | N/A | No Bid |
| | 8 Extra man (labor charge associated with tow) | \$35.00 | \$20.00 | \$15.00 | \$7.50 |
| | 9 Small: Mileage Per Mile Charge to deliver or pick up vehicle outside specified range of 15 miles from city limits | \$2.00 | \$3.00 | \$2.50 | \$3.00 |
| | 10 Medium: Mileage Per Mile Charge to deliver or pick up vehicle outside specified range of 15 miles from city limits | \$2.00 | \$3.50 | N/A | \$3.00 |
| | 11 Heavy: Mileage Per Mile Charge to deliver or pick up vehicle outside specified range of 15 miles from city limits | N/A | \$4.00 | N/A | No Bid |
| 4.7.5. | Recovery Operations | Tiger Towing | Carl's Towing | AJ's Towing | Economy Towing |
| | 1 Small – Provide pricing for this service based on 15 minute increments above the standard rates already listed. | \$10.00 | \$15.00 | \$20.00 | \$25.00 |
| | 2 Medium – Provide pricing for this service based on 15 minute increments above the standard rates already listed. | \$15.00 | \$25.00 | N/A | \$25.00 |
| | 3 Heavy – Provide pricing for this service based on 15 minute increments above the standard rates already listed. | N/A | \$50.00 | N/A | No Bid |

| 4.7.3. | Standard Tow | Tiger Towing | Carl's Towing | AJ's Towing | Economy Towing |
|--------|---|---------------------|----------------------|--------------------|-----------------------|
| 4.8.1. | Maximum Percentage Increase for 1 st Renewal Term | 2% | 5% | 3% | 10% |
| 4.8.2. | Maximum Percentage Increase for 2nd Renewal Term | 4% | 5% | 5% | 0% |
| 4.8.3. | Maximum Percentage Increase for 3rd ^d Renewal Term | 4% | 5% | 5% | 10% |
| 4.8.4. | Maximum Percentage Increase for 4th Renewal Term | 4% | 5% | 5% | 0% |
| 4.14. | COOP (Yes or NO) | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |