56-24NOV10 - Shop Fluids Term and Supply

BID TABULATION
4.7. Pricing MFA Oil Champion Brands, LLC Brownfield Oil Co, LLC |Heathwood Qil Co, Inc. Heathwood Oil Co, Inc.
ITEM # | QTY DESCRIPTION | Proposed UNIT EXT PRICE | Proposed UNIT EXT PRICE | Proposed UNIT EXT PRICE | Proposed UNIT EXT PRICE | Proposed UNIT EXT PRICE
Brand PRICE Brand PRICE Brand PRICE Brand PRICE Brand PRICE
4.7.1. 2,750 [15W-40 MFA Oil $7.25|  $19,937.50|Champion $7.25|  $19,937.50(Sinclair $6.99|  $19,222.50|Premium $6.68|  $18,370.00|Castrol Tec $7.50]  $20,625.00
America Ex
472 2,750 |15W-40 (Extended |MFA Oil $7.25|  $19,937.50|Champion $8.24|  $22,660.00|Chevron $10.49]  $28,847.50|Premium $6.68|  $18,370.00|Castrol $9.22[  $25,355.00
Service) America Hypuran
4.7.3. 500 |Hydraulic Oil (ISO- |MFA Oil $5.50] $2,750.00|Champion $5.20 $2,600.00|Sinclair $5.99 $2,995.00|Premium $4.58 $2,290.00|
46) America
4.7.4. 60  |Coolant (DexCool or [MFA Oil $7.30] $438.00|Champion $6.71 $402.60|Chevron $12.68 $760.80|Peak mix $6.03 $361.80|
equal)
4.7.5. 110 [Coolant (Extended |Chevron $9.80 $1,078.00|Peak $8.68 $954.80|Chevron $8.86 $974.60|01d World $7.89 $867.90
Life) 50/50. ELC Final Mix
4.7.6. 55 Gear Lubricant MFA Oil $19.00 $1,045.00) Champion $16.23 $892.65|Sinclair $18.97 $1,043.35|CTGO $21.32 $1,172.60)
4.7.7. 36  |Grease (Cartridge) |MFA Oil $20.00 $720.00|Champion $20.84 $750.24|Chevron $26.44 $951.84|Heathwood $14.30 $514.80|
4.7.8. 1 Grease 120 Ib. MFA Oil $216.00) $216.00|Champion $206.00| $206.00|Chevron $241.50) $241.50|Heathwood $218.24] $218.24]
4.7.9. 30 Dexron IIT MFA Oil $2.25 $67.50| Champion $2.04 $61.20|Sinclair $7.97 $239.10]CTGO $2.56 $76.80
4.7.10. 60 Dexron VI MFA Oil $3.50] $210.00|Penzoil $4.22 $253.20|Sinclair $2.78 $166.50|Castrol $4.76 $285.60)
4.7.11. 120 [Mercon V MFA Oil $3.50] $420.00|Motorcraft $3.74 $448.80| Sinclair $2.78 $333.00|Motorcraft $3.14 $376.80)
4.7.12. 120 [Mercon LV MFA Oil $3.50] $420.00|Motorcraft $4.79 $574.80|Sinclair $2.78 $333.00|Motorcraft $2.87 $344.40)
4.7.13. 30 Mercon SP MFA Oil $3.50] $105.00]|Motorcraft $3.70 $111.00|Sinclair $2.78 $83.25|Motorcraft $3.61 $108.30)
4.7.14. 30 ATF +4 MFA Oil $3.50] $105.00|Citgo $3.85 $115.50|Sinclair $2.78 $83.25|Castrol $4.26 $127.80)
4.7.15. 110 [Allison Transmission |Mobil $29.00 $3,190.00|Champion $15.53] $1,708.30|Chevron $11.22] $1,234.20|BP $24.96 $2,745.60)
Fluid
4.7.16. 30 |5W-20 (5 quart No Bid No Bid No Bid Motorcraft $12.63 $378.90|No Bid No Bid No Bid Motorcraft $12.77 $383.10|
containers)
4.7.17. 60 5W-20 (1 quart MFA Oil $2.40] $144.00|Champion $2.25 $135.00|Sinclair $2.04 $122.10|Motorcraft $2.73 $163.80].
containers)
4.7.18. 30 |5W-30 (5 quart No Bid No Bid No Bid Motorcraft $12.34 $370.20|No Bid No Bid No Bid Motorcraft $12.43 $372.90|
containers)
4.7.19. 60 5W-30 (1 quart MFA Oil $2.40 $144.00|Champion $2.20 $132.00|Sinclair $2.02] $121.20|Motorcraft $2.56 $153.60]
containers)
4.7.20. 120 10W-30 MFA Oil $2.25 $270.00]|Champion $2.12] $254.40|Sinclair $1.96] $235.50|Motorcraft $2.47 $296.40|
4.7.21. 60  |Power Steering Fluid [Warren $2.50] $150.00|Champion $2.18 $130.80| Texaco $3.64 $218.40|Castrol $1.55 $93.00
Havoline
4.7.22.f 1000 [Universal Tractor MFA Oil $7.00] $7,000.00|Champion $5.61 $5,610.00|Sinclair $7.50] $7,500.00{Premium $5.30 $5,300.00
Fluid America
4.7.23.| 220  |Propylene Glycol Sierra $8.50) $1,870.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid Chemisphea $5.70] $1,254.00|01d World $6.65 $1,463.00)
(50/50) re
Exception to Terms and Note: Items 4.7.10; 4.7.11; 4.7.12;
Conditions 4.7.13; 4.7.14; 4.7.17; 4.7.19; 4.7.20;
4.7.21 - bid gallon instead of quart
4.8.|Maximum % Increase or
Decrease for any renewal period 5% 10% 10%
4.8.1.[Minimum discount from list for all
products introduced after
inception of contract and all
existing products not specified
herein. 5% 0% n/a
4.9.|Delivery Date ARO 3 No Response 10
4.10.|Cash Discount 0% 0% 0%
4.11.|Coop? (yes or no) Yes Yes No
No Bids

Myers Tire Supply




