Bid Tabulation: 54-02NOV10 - Fitness Equipment for the Boone County Sheriff's Ai

Pricing includes furnishing, delivery, installation
on items 4.8.1. - 4.8.6.

Healthcare International

Advanced Exercise

Make & Extended Make & Unit Extended
4.8. PRICING Model Oty | Unit Price Price Model Oty | Price Price
4.8.1.|Treadmill: Precor C952 or equal No Bid 2 No Bid No Bid HF95 Series 2 1$2,250.00] $4,500.00
4.8.1.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid Remanufactured
4.8.2.|Elliptical: Precor 546 V3 or equal No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid LIF95 Series 1 [$1,950.00] $1,950.00
4.8.2.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid Remanufactured
Crosstrainer: Life Fitness 9500 CT or
4.8.3.|equal No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid LIF95 Series 1 1$1,950.00( $1,950.00
4.8.3.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid Remanufactured
Upright Bike: Precor C846 VS 1
4.8.4.|Upright or equal No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid LIF95 Series 1 | $950.00 $950.00
4.8.4.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid Remanufactured
Recumbent Bike: Precor C846 VS 1
4.8.5.|Recumbent or equal No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid LIF95 Series 1 [$1,050.00] $1,050.00
4.8.5.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid Remanufactured
Rower: Proteus PAR-5500 Club
4.8.6.|Series or equal PAR 5500 1 $1,050.00 | $1,050.00 | Fluid Rower 1 $800.00 $800.00
4.8.6.1.|Remanufactured or new? New Remanufactured
4.8.7.|Kettle Bell: 10 Ib, black polished No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid KB-010 1 $9.63 $9.63
4.8.7.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
4.8.8.|Kettle Bell: 15 1b, black polished No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid KB-015 1 $14.45 $14.45
4.8.8.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid New




Pricing includes furnishing, delivery, installation
on items 4.8.1. - 4.8.6.

Healthcare International

Advanced Exercise

Make & Extended Make & Unit Extended
4.8. PRICING Model Qty | Unit Price Price Model Qty | Price Price
4.8.9.|Kettle Bell: 20 Ib, black polished No Bid No Bid No Bid KB-020 1 $19.27 $19.27
4.8.9.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
Agility Fitness Ball 55 cm (Anti-
4.8.10.|Burst) No Bid No Bid No Bid PKG-FB55 1 $20.01 $20.01
4.8.10.1.[Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
Agility Fitness Ball 65 cm (Anti-
4.8.11.|Burst) No Bid No Bid No Bid PKG-FB65 1 $24.01 $24.01
4.8.11.1.|Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
Agility Fitness Ball 75 cm (Anti-
4.8.12.|Burst) No Bid No Bid No Bid PKG-FB75 1 $28.01 $28.01
4.8.12.1.[Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
Military Bench with Wheels:
4.8.13.|Adjustable Flat/Incline/Decline No Bid No Bid No Bid 5005FW 1 $359.76 $359.76
4.8.13.1. Remanufactured or new? No Bid New
TOTAL (if bid all items) $11,675.14
If freight and installation was
added as a separate line item $0.00
Grand Total $11,675.14
4.15. |Delivery after receipt of order 15 days 0 days
5.16.[Location of service/repair facility No response St. Louis, MO




Pricing includes furnishing, delivery, installation
on items 4.8.1. - 4.8.6.

Healthcare International

Advanced Exercise

Make & Extended Make & Unit Extended
4.8. PRICING Model Oty | Unit Price Price Model Oty | Price Price
4.18. Warranty 2 yr. parts; Lifetime frame 6 month parts; warranty on all refurbished equipment
4.19. COOP ? (YES OR NO) Yes Yes




nnex

Fitness Resource Group, Inc. Healthline Promaxima Manufacturing
Make & Unit Extended Make & Unit Extended Unit Extended
Model Qty | Price Price Model Qty Price Price Make & Model | Qty | Price Price
Promaxima XS-
Precor 954 2 |$5,002.00($10,004.00| Precor C952 2 [$1,395.00| $2,790.00 400 2 1$2,499.00( $4,998.00
New Remanufactured New
Promaxima CV-
Precor 546 1 |$4,706.00| $4,706.00 | Precor 546 V3 1 |$1,695.00| $1,695.00 8016E 1 1%$2,699.00| $2,699.00
New Remanufactured New
Life Fitness Promaxima E-
Precor 556 1 |$4,504.00| $4,504.00 9500 CT 1 [$1,795.00( $1,795.00 5000 1 1$2,195.00( $2,195.00
New Remanufactured New
Precor C846
Precor 815U 1 1$2,202.00( $2,202.00 | VS 1 Upright 1 $995.00 | $995.00 Promaxima C8 1 $899.00 | $899.00
New Remanufactured New
VS1
Precor 815R 1 1$2,452.00| $2,452.00| Recumbent 1 1%$1,095.00( $1,095.00| Promaxima R8 1 $999.00 | $999.00
New Remanufactured New
5500 Club
Proteus Par 1 |$1,495.00( $1,495.00 | Series Rower 1 |$1,095.00| $1,095.00 PAR-5500 1 $899.00 | $899.00
New New New
TKO PBK4 1 $26.00 $26.00 | Kettle Bell 0 1 $12.15 $12.15 |Promaxima KB-10| 1 $12.15 $12.15
New New New
TKO PBKS8 1 $39.00 $39.00 Kettle Bell 0 1 $18.50 $18.50 [Promaxima KB-15| 1 $18.20 $18.20
New New New




Fitness Resource Group, Inc. Healthline Promaxima Manufacturing
Make & Unit | Extended Make & Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
Model Qty | Price Price Model Qty Price Price Make & Model | Qty Price Price
TKOPBKI12 | 1 $47.00 $47.00 Kettle Bell 0 1 $24.30 $24.30 [Promaxima KB-20| 1 $24.30 $24.30
New New New
TKOREBS5 | 1 $39.00 $39.00 Agility-55 1 $16.95 $16.95 |Promaxima AG-55| 1 $16.95 $16.95
New New
TKOREB65 | 1 $43.00 $43.00 Agility-65 1 $18.50 $18.50 [Promaxima AG-65| 1 $18.50 $18.50
New New
TKOREB75 | 1 $47.00 $47.00 Agility-75 1 $21.95 $21.95 |Promaxima AG-75| 1 $21.95 $21.95
New New
Promaxima PLR-
TKO D86 1 $416.00 | $416.00 FW-68 1 $235.00 | $235.00 610 1 $295.00 | $295.00
No Response New New
$26,020.00 $9,812.35 $13,096.05
$0.00 $1,750.00 $955.00
$26,020.00 $11,562.35 $14,051.05
No Response 7 weeks 14 days
No Response St. Louis, MO Have Service Reps all over the country




Fitness Resource Group, Inc. Healthline Promaxima Manufacturing
Make & Unit | Extended Make & Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
Model Qty | Price Price Model Qty Price Price Make & Model | Qty Price Price

TS5 Personal Viewing screens: 1 year (parts and
labor at service center only). 12" Personal
Viewing Screens (Experience Series): 2 years
(parts and labor at service center only).
Reveivers: 1 year (parts and services at service
center only). Transmitters: 3 years (parts and
services at service center only). Cardio: 5 years,
touch-sensitive display housing, 2 years. parts, 1
yr. labor. Strength: 5 yrs. Rotary Bearings,
Weight Stacks, Pulleys, Guide Rods, Structural
Moving Parts. 1 yr. Cable, Linear Bearings,

No Response

attached to bid for each piece

Yes

Yes

Yes




Legend Fitness Orthotech
Unit Extended Make & Unit Extended
Make & Model | Qty Price Price Model Qty [ Price Price
SportsArt T652 [ 2 [$3,624.16| $7,248.32 | Nautilus T916 | 2 |$4,895.00( $9,790.00
New New
SportsArt E870 1 |$4,206.71| $4,206.71 | Nautilus E916 [ 1 [$3,795.00| $3,795.00
New New
SportsArt E870 1 |%$4,206.71| $4,206.71 | Nautilus E916 [ 1 [$3,795.00| $3,795.00
New New
SportsArt
C570U 1 [$2,099.33]| $2,099.33 | Nautilus U916( 1 [$2,495.00| $2,495.00
New New
SportsArt
C570R 1 1$2,567.79 $2,567.79 | Nautilus RO16| 1 [$2,595.00| $2,595.00
New New
Concept I 1 $900.00 | $900.00 Concept 2 1 1$1,295.00( $1,295.00
New New
Troy KB10 1 $13.17 $13.17 No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid
New No Bid
Troy KB15 1 $19.75 $19.75 No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid
New No Bid




Legend Fitness Orthotech
Unit | Extended Make & Unit | Extended
Make & Model | Qty Price Price Model Qty [ Price Price
Troy KB20 1 $26.33 $26.33 No Bid 1 No Bid | No Bid
New No Bid
Power-Systems | 1 $44.89 $44.89 No Bid 1 No Bid | No Bid
New No Bid
Power-Systems 1 $49.89 $49.89 No Bid 1 No Bid | No Bid
New No Bid
Power-Systems | 1 $54.88 $54.88 No Bid 1 No Bid | No Bid
New No Bid
Legend 3164 1 $515.45 | $515.45 | Nautilus0-90 | 1 | $899.00 | $899.00
New No Response
Not all line
$21,953.22 items bid
$0.00 $0.00
Not all line
$21,953.22 items bid
Net 30 Approximately 6 weeks

No response

Kansas City, MO




Legend Fitness Orthotech
Unit | Extended Make & Unit | Extended
Make & Model | Qty Price Price Model Qty [ Price Price

See attached quote

Attached

Yes

Yes




