
58-12OCT09 - Printer Toner 

Cartridges Term and Supply

Alpha Laser and Imaging Quill Corporation Global Gov/Ed Solutions The Office Pal Ikon Office Solutions Smart Business Products Staples

PRINTER  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT

Printer:  Canon Inkjet BJ-30 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: BC-10 $36.67 $32.00 NO BID $30.91 N/A $36.63 $35.38
Item Number: BC1-10 $5.35 $17.90 $14.75 $11.36 $15.50 $36.63 $14.23

Printer:  Epson TM-U950 # Of Printers = 3

Item Number: ERC-31 $4.48 $1.85 $2.55 $2.50 N/A $4.50 $1.90
Printer:  HP 2000cxi Pro/2000 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP10] C4844A Black $29.93 $29.67 $30.75 $29.22 $30.75 $31.86 $29.31
Item Number: C4801A Cyan $31.05 $30.79 $31.85 $30.30 $32.00 $33.06 $31.05
Item Number: C4843A Magenta $30.26 $30.00 $31.85 $29.54 $32.00 $32.41 $30.26
Item Number: C4803A Yellow $31.05 $30.79 $31.85 $30.30 $32.00 $33.06 $34.12

Printer:  HP Deskjet D2430 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 21]C9351AN#141 Black $12.38 $12.27 $12.80 $12.38 $12.70 $13.04 $12.00

Item Number: [HP 22]C9352AN#140 Tri-Color $15.73 $16.08 $16.00 $15.59 $16.20 $16.74 $15.56

Item Number: [HP 58]C6658AN Photo $22.78 $23.29 $23.80 $22.36 $23.50 $24.00 $22.31

Printer:   HP Deskjet 970cxi # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 45] C6650FN#140 Black $52.93 $52.47 $54.35 $51.29 $54.50 $55.77 $60.16

Item Number: [HP 78] C6578DN Tri-Color $30.58 $31.27 $31.35 $49.55 $31.50 $32.22 $30.26

Printer:  HP Officejet Pro L7680 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 88]C9396AN#140 Black $31.34 $31.07 $32.15 $30.57 $32.20 $33.02 $30.69

Item Number: C9391AN#140 Cyan $20.78 $20.60 $21.40 $20.45 $21.50 $21.89 $20.56

Item Number: C9392AN#140 Magenta $20.78 $20.60 $21.40 $20.45 $21.50 $21.89 $20.56

Item Number: C9393AN#140 Yellow $20.78 $20.60 $21.40 $20.45 $21.50 $21.89 $20.56

Printer:  HP Laserjet 1012 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 12A] Q2612A $62.18 $61.65 $65.90 $59.67 $64.00 $66.20 $61.53

Printer:  HP Officejet H470B # Of Printers = 2

Item Number: [HP 98] C8765WN#140 Black $19.31 $19.14 $19.40 $19.03 $19.80 $20.56 $18.72

Item Number: [HP 97] C8766WN#140 Tri-Color $22.16 $21.97 $22.75 $21.76 $22.80 $23.59 $21.93

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2100m # Of Printers = 12

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 96A] C4096A $88.97 $88.21 $91.55 $85.38 $91.70 $93.66 $88.04

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2200dn # Of Printers = 11

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 96A] C4096A $88.97 $88.21 $91.55 $85.38 $91.70 $93.66 $88.04

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2200dn MICR # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Troy / Nukote

Item Number: 02-81038-001 $181.36 $196.00 $182.00 $191.05 $196.20 $191.75 $187.16

Item Number: LT121RMICR $90.00 $153.00 NO/BID $119.00 N/A $107.17 $51.16

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2300dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 10A] Q2610A $107.01 $106.10 $109.80 $102.70 $110.50 $115.11 $105.90

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4 # Of Printers = 5

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 98A] 92298A $97.65 $96.82 $100.00 $92.72 $100.50 $102.07 $96.64

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4000 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $113.74 $112.77 $115.90 $99.00 $117.25 $120.62 $114.95

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4050n # Of Printers = 7

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $113.74 $112.77 $115.90 $99.00 $117.25 $120.62 $114.95

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4050tn # Of Printers = 2

BID TABULATION

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Inked Ribbon   Manufacturer:  Epson

Ink Cartridge    Manufacturer: Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

UNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PERBidders must bid ALL ITEMS in order to be eligible for award. UNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PER

Ink Cartridge    Manufacturer: Cannon



Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $113.74 $112.77 $115.90 $99.00 $117.25 $120.62 $114.95

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4200dtn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 38A] Q1338A $136.46 $135.30 $137.95 $125.00 $140.75 $146.77 $135.04

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4p # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 74A] 92274A $94.27 $93.47 $97.00 $40.00 $97.00 $100.36 $93.29

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4si # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP21A] 92291A $104.58 $72.00 NO/BID $75.00 $110.50 $117.55 $133.93

Printer:  HP Laserjet 5000n # Of Printers = 2

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP29X] C4129x $145.73 $144.48 $147.25 $130.00 $150.20 $155.02 $147.28

Printer:  HP Laserjet 5550dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: C9730A Black $199.51 $197.80 $200.55 $92.00 $205.75 $214.61 $201.63

Item Number: C9731A Cyan $279.71 $277.32 $281.15 $92.00 $288.50 $300.65 $279.71

Item Number: C9733A Yellow $279.71 $277.32 $281.15 $92.00 $288.50 $300.65 $279.71

Item Number: C9733A Magenta $279.71 $277.32 $281.15 $92.00 $288.50 $300.65 $279.71

Printer:  HP Color Laserjet P4014dn # Of Printers = 1 .

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 64A] CC364A $137.42 $136.25 $138.85 $131.00 $142.00 $146.30 $135.99

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1140 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 28P2010 $309.99 $376.00 $344.60 $340.45 $375.00 $362.37 $356.05

Usage Kit  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 28P2625 $329.99 $378.00 $347.75 $344.88 $366.00 $404.87 $362.52

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1332 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P4305 $362.96 $356.25 $329.45 $328.69 $367.00 $336.09 $340.27

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1332/MICR 35 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: STI-204528-75P108 $469.99 $490.00 $320.65 $109.00 N/A $197.28 $112.04

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1585n # Of Printers = 2

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P6877 $194.52 $196.00 $184.50 $173.89 $205.25 $172.16 $190.39

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P6878 $165.20 $164.00 $151.90 $146.07 $167.00 $156.54 $156.52

Maintenance Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 39v2603 $633.56 $899.00 $830.25 $770.00 $926.50 $947.14 $869.05

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 40 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 90H3566 $272.04 $267.00 $245.70 $241.22 $278.50 $264.69 $252.43

Usage Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 90H3567 $632.57 $596.00 $245.70 $548.12 $625.00 $577.97 $573.11

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1767 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 39v2208(Cyan) $367.37 $445.00 $409.00 $380.00 $458.00 $424.82 $424.64

Item Number: 39V2209(Magenta) $367.37 $445.00 $409.00 $380.00 $458.00 $424.82 $424.64

Item Number: 39v2210(Yellow) $367.37 $445.00 $409.00 $380.00 $458.00 $424.82 $424.64

Item Number: 39v2211(Black) $210.52 $356.00 $327.55 $285.00 $366.00 $351.82 $339.72

Printer:  IBM Laser 4317-001 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 63H2401 $99.99 $67.00 NO/BID $65.00 N/A $189.94 $175.45

Printer:  IBM Laser 4317-001 MICR # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 63H2401 $199.99 $67.00 NO/BID $58.10 N/A $189.94 $175.45

Printer:  Konica Minolta Magicolor 2530DL # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: 1710587-004 $91.28 $73.91 $84.80 $65.00 $85.75 $94.26 $77.52

Printer:  Lexmark C510n # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Toner  Manufacturer:  Konica Minolta

Toner  Manufacturer: Source Technologies



Item Number: 20k1403 Black $175.61 $164.45 $159.90 $155.00 $167.00 $177.38 $156.41

Printer:  Lexmark C530dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C5220KS Black $101.43 $99.19 $98.70 $92.00 $100.50 $103.62 $94.33

Item Number: C5220CS Cyan $114.35 $111.84 $110.45 $105.00 $113.50 $115.54 $107.48

Item Number: C5220MS Magenta $114.35 $111.84 $110.45 $105.00 $113.50 $115.54 $107.48

Item Number: C5220YS Yellow $114.35 $111.84 $110.45 $105.00 $113.50 $115.54 $107.48

Item Number: C53034X $29.64 $110.98 $110.20 $105.00 $112.50 $119.70 $106.66

Printer:  Lexmark C534dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C5240KH Black $152.87 $149.50 $145.90 $138.00 $151.50 $157.78 $142.19

Item Number: C5340CS Cyan $177.25 $150.00 $167.80 $138.00 $175.75 $177.22 $187.22

Item Number: C5340MX Magenta $177.25 $150.00 $167.80 $138.00 $175.75 $177.22 $166.62

Item Number: C53040YX Yellow $177.25 $150.00 $167.80 $138.00 $175.75 $177.22 $166.62

Item Number: C53034X $29.64 $110.98 $110.30 $105.00 $112.50 $121.04 $106.66

Printer:  Lexmark C543dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C540H1KG Black $60.47 $59.14 $60.25 $54.00 $60.00 $61.79 $56.84

Item Number: C540H1YG Yellow $71.67 $70.10 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540H1MG Magenta $71.67 $70.10 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540H1CG Cyan $71.67 $70.00 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540x71G $160.18 $153.34 $152.45 $145.00 $157.00 $163.64 $161.88

Printer:  Lexmark C544dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C540H1KG Black $60.47 $59.14 $60.25 $54.00 $60.00 $61.79 $56.84

Item Number: C540H1YG Yellow $71.67 $70.10 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540H1MG Magenta $71.67 $70.10 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540H1CG Cyan $71.67 $70.10 $70.90 $65.00 $71.00 $73.23 $67.37

Item Number: C540x71G $160.18 $153.34 $152.45 $148.00 $157.00 $163.64 $161.88

Printer:  Lexmark C720 # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 15W0903 Black $138.79 $127.08 $125.00 $119.00 $129.00 $143.32 $135.71

Item Number: 15W0900 Cyan $207.24 $189.76 $183.65 $179.00 $192.00 $203.37 $202.62

Item Number: 15W0902 Yellow $207.24 $189.76 $183.65 $179.00 $192.00 $203.37 $202.62

Item Number: 15W0901 Magenta $207.24 $189.76 $183.65 $179.00 $192.00 $203.37 $202.62

Item Number: 15W0904 $173.96 $159.28 $155.85 $150.00 $163.00 $179.64 $171.89

Printer:  Lexmark C920dtn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C9202KH Black $216.07 $211.32 $206.00 $185.00 $214.20 $230.47 $200.98

Item Number: C9202CH Cyan $316.07 $309.13 $298.95 $275.00 $313.20 $333.41

Item Number: C9202MH Magenta $316.07 $309.13 $298.95 $275.00 $313.20 $333.41 $297.09

Item Number: C9202YH Yellow $316.07 $309.13 $298.95 $275.00 $313.20 $333.41 $297.09

Item Number: 12N0772 Color $183.97 $179.92 $175.60 $172.00 $182.50 $202.91 $172.92

Item Number: 12N0773 Black $54.34 $54.09 $54.40 $50.00 $54.50 $58.59 $56.72

Printer:  Lexmark E250dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: E250A11A $89.76 $87.79 $88.25 $83.00 $89.00 $91.71 $83.49

Printer:  Lexmark E321 # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A7405 $128.92 $123.40 $121.75 $112.00 $125.00 $128.19 $117.36

Printer:  Lexmark Optra R # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382150 $199.99 $332.07 $320.70 $299.00 $336.50 $339.76 $315.82

Printer:  Lexmark Optra s1620 # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382925 $219.99 $208.15 $201.95 $185.00 $211.00 $223.63 $197.97

Printer:  Lexmark T430dn # Of Printers = 35

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A8425 $204.84 $191.82 $185.70 $175.00 $194.50 $209.20 $182.44

Item Number: 56P2333 $349.99 $412.00 $381.00 $379.00 $360.50 $402.26 $362.39

Waste Toner Bottle  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Photoconductor Kit   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Maintenance Kit   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Waste Toner Bottle  Manufacturer:  Lexmark



Printer:  Lexmark T520n # Of Printers = 13

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A6835 $301.25 $294.64 $285.00 $65.00 $298.50 $317.79 $280.22

Printer:  Lexmark T630n # Of Printers = 7

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A7462 $309.80 $309.36 $299.00 $275.00 $294.68 $319.62 $294.22

Printer:  Lexmark T640n # Of Printers = 5

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 64015HA $308.62 $308.21 $298.00 $285.00 $293.58 $321.81 $293.12

Printer:  Lexmark T650n # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: T650A11A $139.10 $128.80 $127.70 $118.00 $123.22 $134.56 $123.79

Printer:  Lexmark 4039 10plus # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382150 $199.99 $332.07 $320.70 $299.00 $316.32 $339.76 $315.82

Printer:  Okidata Microline 390 Turbo # Of Printers = 3

Toner   Manufacturer:  NuKote

Item Number: BM249 $3.44 $5.00 NO/BID $4.50 $3.48 $5.88 $4.83

Printer:  Xerox DocuPrint N2825 # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Xerox

Item Number: 113R00443 $210.37 $218.00 $202.25 $165.00 $198.99 $221.64 $213.45
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MY INKWAREHOUSE MWAVE Dataspan Ribbons Express, Inc.

Royal Consumer 

Information Products

MCPC Computer 

Products & Consulting The Tree House Inc.

PRINTER  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT  CARTRIDGE/KIT

Printer:  Canon Inkjet BJ-30 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: BC-10 $41.99 N/A $36.67 $38.00 $31.38 $31.38 $31.15
Item Number: BC1-10 $18.53 N/A $15.50 $17.00 $12.07 $13.20 $31.15

Printer:  Epson TM-U950 # Of Printers = 3

Item Number: ERC-31 $3.95 $4.00 $7.00 $22.00 $3.13 NO BID $2.10
Printer:  HP 2000cxi Pro/2000 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP10] C4844A Black $33.80 $32.50 $30.78 $32.00 $30.85 $31.28 $28.55
Item Number: C4801A Cyan $37.95 $32.00 $34.86 $33.00 $32.01 $34.07 $28.95
Item Number: C4843A Magenta $36.95 $32.00 $34.38 $33.00 $31.20 $33.68 $28.95
Item Number: C4803A Yellow $37.95 $33.50 $34.86 $33.00 $32.01 $34.07 $28.95

Printer:  HP Deskjet D2430 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 21]C9351AN#141 Black $14.40 $15.00 $12.88 $15.00 $12.63 $12.94 $11.90

Item Number: [HP 22]C9352AN#140 Tri-Color $17.99 $18.50 $17.25 $19.00 $16.07 $16.57 $15.15

Item Number: [HP 58]C6658AN Photo $26.99 $25.50 $24.25 $25.00 $23.48 $23.79 $21.80

Printer:   HP Deskjet 970cxi # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 45] C6650FN#140 Black $64.99 $55.00 $55.28 $54.00 $54.59 $56.31 $50.55

Item Number: [HP 78] C6578DN Tri-Color $36.99 $33.00 $31.65 $33.00 $31.52 $32.13 $29.15

Printer:  HP Officejet Pro L7680 # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: [HP 88]C9396AN#140 Black $38.49 $33.80 $33.38 $33.75 $32.14 $33.41 $29.95

Item Number: C9391AN#140 Cyan $25.90 $23.50 $22.15 $24.00 $21.41 $21.88 $19.90

Item Number: C9392AN#140 Magenta $24.99 $23.50 $22.15 $24.00 $21.41 $21.88 $19.90

Item Number: C9393AN#140 Yellow $25.40 $23.50 $22.15 $24.00 $21.41 $21.88 $19.90

Printer:  HP Laserjet 1012 # Of Printers = 1

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Inked Ribbon   Manufacturer:  Epson

Ink Cartridge    Manufacturer: Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge   Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

BID TABULATION

Bidders must bid ALL ITEMS in order to be eligible for award.

Ink Cartridge    Manufacturer: Cannon

5th Renewal Period (January 01, 2011 through March 31, 2011)

8th Renewal Period (October 01, 2011 through December 31, 2011)

1st Renewal Period (January 01, 2010 through March 31, 2010)

2nd Renewal Period (April 01, 2010 through June 30, 2010)

6th Renewal Period (April 01, 2011 through June 30, 2011)

7th Renewal Period (July 01, 2011 through September 30, 2011)

UNIT PRICE PER

MAXIMUM PERCENTAGE INCREASE FOR EACH POTENTIAL RENEWAL PERIOD

Minimum Discount For Cartridges Not Specified

Delivery After Receipt of Order (Days)

COOP

3rd Renewal Period (July 01, 2010 through September 30, 2010)

4th Renewal Period (October 01, 2010 through December 31, 2010)

UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PERUNIT PRICE PER



Item Number: [HP 12A] Q2612A $72.20 $65.00 $62.90 $64.00 $63.85 $65.11 $59.60

Printer:  HP Officejet H470B # Of Printers = 2

Item Number: [HP 98] C8765WN#140 Black $21.99 $21.90 $20.74 $22.00 $19.90 $20.21 $18.45

Item Number: [HP 97] C8766WN#140 Tri-Color $25.95 $24.80 $23.66 $25.00 $22.84 $23.19 $21.25

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2100m # Of Printers = 12

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 96A] C4096A $100.00 $97.00 $88.38 $89.00 $91.60 $90.30 $84.80

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2200dn # Of Printers = 11

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 96A] C4096A $100.00 $97.00 $89.00 $91.60 $93.21 $84.80

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2200dn MICR # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Troy / Nukote

Item Number: 02-81038-001 $211.90 N/A $191.29 $125.00 N/A $201.59

Item Number: LT121RMICR $44.95 N/A $48.00 N/A NO BID $154.50

Printer:  HP Laserjet 2300dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 10A] Q2610A $123.99 $111.70 $105.87 $106.00 $109.64 $112.11 $101.90

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4 # Of Printers = 5

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 98A] 92298A $109.95 $104.50 $97.72 $98.00 $100.76 $103.13 $93.10

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4000 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $129.95 $118.80 $114.88 $112.00 $116.57 $117.86 $108.30

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4050n # Of Printers = 7

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $129.95 $118.80 $114.88 $112.00 $116.57 $117.86 $108.30

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4050tn # Of Printers = 2

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 27x] C4127x $129.95 $118.80 $114.88 $112.00 $116.57 $117.86 $108.30

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4200dtn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 38A] Q1338A $159.95 $144.50 $136.96 $133.50 $139.88 $144.15 $129.85

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4p # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 74A] 92274A $105.90 $99.50 $96.35 $95.00 $97.29 $92.20 $89.90

Printer:  HP Laserjet 4si # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP21A] 92291A $117.95 N/A NO BID N/A N/A $43.86 $39.95

Printer:  HP Laserjet 5000n # Of Printers = 2

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP29X] C4129x $174.95 $152.50 $147.20 $142.00 $149.61 $151.05 $138.85

Printer:  HP Laserjet 5550dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: C9730A Black $235.90 $208.60 $147.46 $194.00 $204.69 $202.70 $190.20

Item Number: C9731A Cyan $335.95 $290.00 $273.93 $272.00 $287.27 $284.19 $266.30

Item Number: C9733A Yellow $335.95 $290.00 $273.93 $272.00 $287.27 $284.19 $266.30

Item Number: C9733A Magenta $335.95 $290.00 $273.93 $272.00 $287.27 $284.19 $266.30

Printer:  HP Color Laserjet P4014dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Item Number: [HP 64A] CC364A $160.95 $145.00 $136.64 $135.00 $140.86 $138.88 $131.15

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1140 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 28P2010 $461.95 $365.00 $353.81 $353.00 $330.85 $335.78 $321.90

Usage Kit  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 28P2625 $449.99 N/A $355.40 $357.00 $401.59 $366.11 $358.85

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1332 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P4305 $429.30 $362.00 $337.76 $339.00 $373.30 $365.05 $330.20

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1332/MICR 35 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard

Ink Cartridge  Manufacturer:  Hewlett Packard



Item Number: STI-204528-75P108 $399.00 N/A $142.00 N/A $424.47 $205.20

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1585n # Of Printers = 2

Toner  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P6877 $219.50 $188.00 $189.80 $206.00 $203.09 $189.21 $183.90

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 75P6878 $199.95 $162.50 $161.79 $169.00 $173.40 $160.88 $152.15

Maintenance Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 39v2603 $1,040.00 $855.00 $889.37 $893.00 $955.32 $868.90 $841.40

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 40 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 90H3566 $294.43 $258.00 $255.90 $249.00 $267.02 $271.31 $247.00

Usage Kit  Manufacturer:  InfoPrint

Item Number: 90H3567 $659.00 N/A $560.39 $560.00 $590.43 $579.01 $547.90

Printer:  IBM Infoprint 1767 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 39v2208(Cyan) $519.09 $425.00 $443.60 $446.00 $471.28 $452.94 $416.00

Item Number: 39V2209(Magenta) $519.09 $425.00 $443.60 $446.00 $471.28 $452.94 $416.00

Item Number: 39v2210(Yellow) $519.09 $425.00 $443.60 $446.00 $471.28 $452.94 $416.00

Item Number: 39v2211(Black) $399.86 $425.00 $443.60 $359.00 $377.66 $366.21 $334.30

Printer:  IBM Laser 4317-001 # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 63H2401 $187.55 N/A $184.92 $187.00 $65.27 $209.89 $70.70

Printer:  IBM Laser 4317-001 MICR # Of Printers = 1

Toner  Manufacturer:  IBM

Item Number: 63H2401 $187.55 N/A $186.89 $187.00 $65.27 $209.89 $70.70

Printer:  Konica Minolta Magicolor 2530DL # Of Printers = 1

Item Number: 1710587-004 $99.95 $85.40 $86.72 $101.00 $71.60 $73.72 $81.80

Printer:  Lexmark C510n # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 20k1403 Black $199.90 $163.50 $161.52 $164.00 $128.72 $147.08 $157.95

Printer:  Lexmark C530dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C5220KS Black $113.49 $100.00 $97.22 $99.00 $85.53 $100.47 $95.20

Item Number: C5220CS Cyan $127.96 $113.00 $109.49 $110.00 $96.17 $113.22 $107.45

Item Number: C5220MS Magenta $127.96 $113.00 $109.49 $110.00 $96.17 $113.22 $107.45

Item Number: C5220YS Yellow $127.96 $113.00 $109.49 $110.00 $96.17 $113.22 $107.45

Item Number: C53034X $139.95 $113.00 $108.76 $119.00 $117.14 $119.72 $107.70

Printer:  Lexmark C534dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C5240KH Black $189.43 $150.00 $146.26 $148.00 $134.04 $150.21 $143.25

Item Number: C5340CS Cyan $204.90 $171.00 $169.17 $148.00 $170.41 $188.94 $166.20

Item Number: C5340MX Magenta $215.36 $171.00 $169.17 $148.00 $170.41 $188.94 $166.20

Item Number: C53040YX Yellow $215.36 $171.00 $169.17 $148.00 $170.41 $188.94 $166.20

Item Number: C53034X $139.95 $113.50 $108.76 $123.00 $117.14 $119.72 $107.70

Printer:  Lexmark C543dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C540H1KG Black $74.95 $60.00 $58.11 $62.00 $63.66 $59.87 $56.90

Item Number: C540H1YG Yellow $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540H1MG Magenta $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540H1CG Cyan $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540x71G $194.00 $163.00 $151.88 $156.00 $190.66 $155.23 $149.65

Printer:  Lexmark C544dn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C540H1KG Black $74.95 $60.00 $58.11 $62.00 $63.66 $59.87 $56.90

Item Number: C540H1YG Yellow $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540H1MG Magenta $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540H1CG Cyan $89.90 $71.00 $68.74 $73.00 $75.26 $70.96 $66.95

Item Number: C540x71G $194.00 $163.00 $151.88 $156.00 $190.66 $155.23 $149.65

Printer:  Lexmark C720 # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 15W0903 Black $163.95 $128.80 $124.58 $129.00 $140.00 $131.22 $122.85

Waste Toner Bottle  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Toner  Manufacturer:  Konica Minolta

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Photoconductor Kit  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Waste Toner Bottle  Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Toner  Manufacturer: Source Technologies



Item Number: 15W0900 Cyan $239.85 $188.00 $185.70 $186.00 $209.10 $196.05 $184.30

Item Number: 15W0902 Yellow $239.85 $188.00 $185.70 $186.00 $209.10 $196.05 $184.30

Item Number: 15W0901 Magenta $239.85 $188.00 $185.70 $186.00 $209.10 $196.05 $184.30

Item Number: 15W0904 $205.80 $162.50 $155.92 $163.00 $175.69 $179.17 $156.50

Printer:  Lexmark C920dtn # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: C9202KH Black $262.50 $212.80 $206.72 $108.00 $212.77 $226.85 $204.85

Item Number: C9202CH Cyan $389.33 $308.00 $297.50 $301.00 $311.70 $331.85 $297.70

Item Number: C9202MH Magenta $389.33 $308.00 $297.50 $301.00 $311.70 $331.85 $297.70

Item Number: C9202YH Yellow $389.33 $308.00 $297.50 $301.00 $311.70 $331.85 $297.70

Item Number: 12N0772 Color $228.35 $185.60 $176.45 $179.00 $188.84 $192.04 $175.45

Item Number: 12N0773 Black $66.16 $57.00 $52.26 $56.00 $56.45 $201.88 $51.85

Printer:  Lexmark E250dn # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: E250A11A $106.43 $92.80 $86.09 $88.00 $85.48 $88.35 $84.90

Printer:  Lexmark E321 # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A7405 $139.70 $196.60 $120.97 $123.00 $117.02 $124.99 $118.25

Printer:  Lexmark Optra R # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382150 $403.62 $332.00 $322.58 $329.00 $361.51 $335.95 $317.70

Printer:  Lexmark Optra s1620 # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382925 $258.60 $215.00 $203.93 $203.00 $154.68 $204.16 $201.70

Printer:  Lexmark T430dn # Of Printers = 35

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A8425 $229.29 $199.00 $187.72 $203.00 $208.88 $195.08 $183.90

Item Number: 56P2333 $450.00 $440.00 $355.67 $351.00 $371.28 $358.56 $377.30

Printer:  Lexmark T520n # Of Printers = 13

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A6835 $343.77 $305.00 $287.70 $291.00 $218.51 $294.96 $282.60

Printer:  Lexmark T630n # Of Printers = 7

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 12A7462 $359.65 $320.00 $298.22 $305.00 $229.15 $313.95 $295.45

Printer:  Lexmark T640n # Of Printers = 5

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 64015HA $359.40 $320.00 $297.15 $321.00 $270.72 $311.80 $295.35

Printer:  Lexmark T650n # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: T650A11A $149.85 $133.00 $125.90 $130.00 $137.39 $122.50 $125.50

Printer:  Lexmark 4039 10plus # Of Printers = 1

Toner   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Item Number: 1382150 $403.62 $332.00 $322.58 $332.00 $361.51 $335.95 $317.75

Printer:  Okidata Microline 390 Turbo # Of Printers = 3

Toner   Manufacturer:  NuKote

Item Number: BM249 $10.00 N/A NO BID $6.99 N/A NO BID $8.70

Printer:  Xerox DocuPrint N2825 # Of Printers = 2

Toner   Manufacturer:  Xerox

Item Number: 113R00443 $269.75 N/A $201.00 N/A $182.98 $182.01 $184.40

10% 5% 3% 3% 5%

10% 5% 3% 3% 5%

10% 5% 3% 3% 5%

10% 5% 3% 3% 5%

10% 5% 5% 3% 5%

10% 5% 5% 3% 5%

10% 5% 5% 3% 5%

10% 5% 5% 3% 5%

0% 2% 25% 23% 0% 35%

3 14-30 2 3 4 3

YES NO YES YES YES

8th Renewal Period (October 01, 2011 through December 31, 2011)

Minimum Discount For Cartridges Not Specified

Delivery After Receipt of Order (Days)

COOP

4th Renewal Period (October 01, 2010 through December 31, 2010)

5th Renewal Period (January 01, 2011 through March 31, 2011)

6th Renewal Period (April 01, 2011 through June 30, 2011)

7th Renewal Period (July 01, 2011 through September 30, 2011)

MAXIMUM PERCENTAGE INCREASE FOR EACH POTENTIAL RENEWAL PERIOD

1st Renewal Period (January 01, 2010 through March 31, 2010)

2nd Renewal Period (April 01, 2010 through June 30, 2010)

3rd Renewal Period (July 01, 2010 through September 30, 2010)

Photoconductor Kit   Manufacturer:  Lexmark

Maintenance Kit   Manufacturer:  Lexmark



System Resources 

Missouri Inc.

 CARTRIDGE/KIT

$43.60
$21.20

$7.09

$36.91
$38.11
$38.11
$38.11

$18.20

$21.78

$29.30

$61.44

$37.62

$38.42

$27.17

$27.17

$27.17

$71.99

$25.65

$28.63

$101.35

$101.35

$210.15

$79.80

$120.28

$110.06

$127.53

$127.53

UNIT PRICE PER



$127.53

$152.77

$106.56

$42.17

$162.81

$219.35

$311.06

$311.06

$311.06

$155.37

$385.00

$404.84

$344.03

$238.98

$201.78

$177.63

$958.51

$277.31

$632.10

$478.33

$478.33

$478.33

$383.68

$82.04

$263.82

$105.47



$186.50

$109.86

$123.23

$123.23

$123.23

$130.24

$166.45

$196.35

$196.35

$196.35

$127.49

$67.52

$79.11

$79.11

$79.11

$170.59

$135.11

$135.43

$135.43

$135.43

$170.59

$150.02

$221.57

$221.57

$221.57

$186.79

$238.22

$346.17

$346.17

$346.17

$210.34

$210.34

$97.81

.

$138.82

$383.98

$234.74

$216.71

$378.73



$330.18

$332.05

$334.30

$384.21

$383.98

$18.06

$211.06

0%

0%

0%

0%

2%

2%

2%

2%

15%

1

YES


