

4.10.2	Model #	No Bid	12	\$	No Bid	12	No Bid	\$9.50	12	\$114.00	\$12.74	12	\$152.88	\$7.69	12	\$92.28	\$14.00	12	\$168.00	\$16.90	12	\$202.80
4.10.3	Nylon Double Magazine Holders	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$6.99	10	\$69.90	\$12.12	10	\$121.20	\$16.27	10	\$162.70	\$8.65	10	\$86.50	\$19.00	10	\$190.00	\$16.23	10	\$162.30
4.10.4	Nylon Single Hand Model #	No Bid	20	No Bid	\$6.99	20	\$139.80	\$7.76	20	\$155.20	\$10.40	20	\$208.00	No Bid	20	No Bid	\$14.00	20	\$280.00	\$13.01	20	\$260.20
4.10.5	Safariland Nylon Glove Pouch 4600-4BL	No Bid	12	No Bid	No Bid	12	No Bid	No Bid	12	No Bid	\$8.72	12	\$104.64	\$6.50	12	\$78.00	\$11.00	12	\$132.00	\$8.34	12	\$100.08
4.10.6	Nylon Belt Keepers Model #	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$5.00	10	\$50.00	\$6.71	10	\$67.10	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$8.00	10	\$80.00	\$9.27	10	\$92.70
4.10.7	Nylon ASP Collapsible Baton Holder Model #	No Bid	12	No Bid	\$6.99	12	\$83.88	\$7.76	12	\$93.12	\$10.40	12	\$124.80	\$8.91	12	\$106.92	\$13.00	12	\$156.00	\$11.64	12	\$139.68
4.10.8	Sidebreak Asp Baton Scabbard Model #	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$21.89	10	\$218.90	\$22.00	10	\$220.00	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$23.00	10	\$230.00	No Bid	10	No Bid
4.11.9	Nylon Double Hand Cuff Case Model #	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$6.99	10	\$69.90	\$8.88	10	\$88.80	\$11.91	10	\$119.10	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$17.00	10	\$170.00	\$15.98	10	\$159.80
4.10.10	Nylon Holster for Stinger Flashlight Model #	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$4.62	10	\$46.20	\$10.40	10	\$104.00	\$19.99	10	\$199.90	\$8.00	10	\$80.00	\$10.78	10	\$107.80
4.10.11	Replacement Buckle for Nylon Belt Model #	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$4.50	10	\$45.00	\$4.02	10	\$40.20	No Bid	10	No Bid	\$5.00	10	\$50.00	\$1.38	10	\$13.80
													\$1,510.78						\$1,848.00			
4.11	VEHICLE ACCESSORIES - Any accessories in this section requiring mounting brackets and hardware must be bid to include these items.	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price	Unit Price	Qty	Extended Price
4.11.1	Prisoner Seat Product Number	\$489.00	1	\$489.00	No Bid	1	No Bid	\$429.00	1	\$429.00	\$70.92	1	\$570.92	\$379.33	1	\$379.33	\$562.00	1	\$562.00	\$547.03	1	\$547.03
4.11.2	Setima Security Partition - With full lower extension panels	\$459.00	5	\$2,295.00 \$2,784.00	No Bid	5	No Bid	\$430.00	5	\$2,150.00 \$2,579.00	\$90.22	5	\$2,451.10 \$3,022.02	\$492.31	5	\$2,461.55 \$2,840.88	See Bid	5	See Bid	\$404.04	5	\$2,020.20 \$2,567.25
	Maximum % Increase																					
	1st Renewal Period			3%			3%						5%									5%
	2nd Renewal Period			3%			3%						5%									5%
	COOP			Yes			Yes						No									Yes
	% Discount For Non-Catalog Items			20%			varies						10%									See Bid
	Delivery ARO			15-30 Days			1-4 weeks						30-40 days									30-45 Days

No Bid
 Bob Barker Company
 Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.