4.8.

PRICING

PRICING

PRICING

PRICING

PRICING

PRICING

Robinson Textiles, Inc.
INMATE JUMPSUITS (Institutional Black

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
INMATE JUMPSUITS (Institutional Black

OD Taragin-Bross LLC
INMATE JUMPSUITS (Institutional Black

Charm-Tex, Inc.

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
INMATE JUMPSUITS (Institutional Black

and White with Horizontal Stripes) and White with Horizontal Stripes) and White with Horizontal Stripes) and White with Horizontal Stripes) and White with Horizontal Stripes)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price
4.8.1. Medium $9.00 50 $450.00] Medium $10.89| 50 $544.50 ium $11.85| 50 $592.50 Medium $12.18| 50 $609.00[ Medium $12.00| 50 $600.00| Medium $11.22] 50 $561.00
4.8.2. Large $10.54] 50 $527.00| Large $11.20 50 $560.00 Large $11.85| 50 $592.50| Large $12.18 50 $609.00 Large $12.00| 50 $600.00| Large $11.22 50 $561.00
4.8.3. X-Large $10.82] 50 $541.00| X-Large $11.73 50 $586.50( X-Large $11.85| 50 $592.50| X-Large $12.18 50 $609.00( X-Large $12.00| 50 $600.00| X-Large $11.22 50 $561.00
4.8.4. 2X $11.00| 30 $330.00| 2X $12.10 30 $363.00 2X $11.85| 30 $355.50| 2X $12.18 30 $365.40 2X $14.00| 30 $420.00| 2X $11.22 30 $336.60
4.8.5. 3X $11.36| 20 $227.20| 3X $12.20 20 $244.00 3X $12.43] 20 $248.60| 3X $12.54 20 $250.80 3X $14.00| 20 $280.00| 3X $11.22 20 $224.40
4.8.6. 4X $11.80| 5 $59.00| 4X $12.76 5 $63.80| 4X $12.43] 5 $62.15| 4X $12.90 5 364.53 4X $14.00| 5 $70.00| 4X $11.22 5 $56.10|
4.8.7. 6X $12.30| 5 $61.50| 6X $13.91 5 369.5—5| 6X $13.00| 5 $65.00| 6X $14.90 5 $74.50| 6X $14.00| 5 $70.00| 6X No Bid| 5
4.8.8. 8X $14.00| 5 $70.00| 8X $14.88 5 $74.40| 8X $15.30| 5 $76.50| 8X $16.54 5 $82.70| 8X $18.00| 5 $90.00| 8X No Bid| 5
4.8.9. 9X $14.00| 5 $70.00| 9X $1 5.4€| 5 $77.2<S{ 9X $16.00| 5 $80.00| 9X $18.18 5 $90.90| 9X $18.00| 5 $90.00| 9X No Bid| 5
4.8.10. 10X $14.00| 5 $70.00 10X $16.00 5 $80.00( 10X $16.80| 5 $84.00 10X $18.18 5 $90.90( 10X $18.00| 5 $90.00] 10X No Bid| 5
[ |BLACKAND WHITE INMATE | BLACK AND WHITE INMATE BLACK AND WHITE INMATE BLACK AND WHITE INMATE W—WME
4.8.11.  [JUMPSUIT TOTAL $2,405.70|JUMPSUIT TOTAL $2,663.00JUMPSUIT TOTAL $2,749.25|JUMPSUIT TOTAL $2,846.70{JUMPSUIT TOTAL $2,910.00[JUMPSUIT TOTAL
INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional [INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional [INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Institutional
Black and White with Horizontal Black and White with Horizontal Black and White with Horizontal Black and White with Horizontal Black and White with Horizontal Black and White with Horizontal
Stripes) Stripes) Stripes) Stripes) Stripes) Stripes)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price
4.8.12. Medium $4.50} 20 $90.00[ Medium $5.29] 20 $105.80| Medium $6.52] 20 $130.40| Medium $6.00] 20 $120.00{ Medium $7.00} 20 $140.00| Medium $5.00 20 $100.00
4.8.13. Large $5.40} 20 $108.00| Large $5.60] 20 $112.00( Large $6.52] 20 $130.40| Large $6.00] 20 $120.00( Large $7.00} 20 $140.00| Large $5.00 20 $100.00]
4.8.14. X-Large $5.40} 40 $216.00| X-Large $5.60] 40 $224.00| X-Large $6.52] 40 $260.80| X-Large $6.00] 40 $240.00{ X-Large $7.00} 40 $280.00| X-Large $5.32 40 $212.80|
4.8.15. 2X $5.40| 20 $108.00| 2X $5.60] 20 $112.00| 2X $6.52] 20 $130.40| 2X $6.00] 20 $120.00] 2X $7.00} 20 $140.00| 2X $5.32 20 $106.40|
4.8.16. 3X $5.40} 10 $54.00 33X $5.60] 10 $56.00 3X $7.52] 10 $75.20 3X $6.54] 10 $65.40| 3X $7.00} 10 $70.00 33X $5.32 10 $53.20|
4.8.17. 4X $5.40} 5 $27.00 4X $6.88] 5 $34.40| 4X $7.92] 5 $39.60 4X $6.90] 5 $34.50 4X $9.00} 5 $45.00 4X $6.36 5 $31.80
4.8.18. 6X $5.40} 5 $27.00 6X $6.88] 5 $34.40| 6X $8.42] 5 $42.10 6X $7.36] 5 $36.80 6X $9.00} 5 $45.00 6X $6.36 5 $31.80|
4.8.19. 8X $6.90} 5 $34.50 8X $7.99] 5 $39.95| 8X $9.60| 5 $48.00 8X $7.90] 5 $39.50 8X $9.00} 5 $45.00 8X $7.12 5 $35.60
4.8.20. 9X $6.90} 5 $34.50 9X $7.99] 5 $39.95| 9X $9.94| 5 $49.70 9X $8.90] 5 $44.50 9X $9.00} 5 $45.00 9X No Bid| 5
4.8.21. 10X $6.90| 5 $34.50( 10X $8.50] 5 $42.50[ 10X $10.60| 5 $53.00[ 10X $8.90] 5 $44.50( 10X $9.00} 5 $45.00[ 10X No Bid| 5
[ |BLACKAND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE
INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS
4.8.22. |TOTAL $733.50| TOTAL $801.00| TOTAL $959.60| TOTAL $865.20| TOTAL $995.00|] TOTAL
INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS
(Institutional Black and White with (Institutional Black and White with (Institutional Black and White with (Institutional Black and White with (Institutional Black and White with (Institutional Black and White with
Horizontal Stripes) Horizontal Stripes) Horizontal Stripes) Horizontal Stripes) Horizontal Stripes) Horizontal Stripes)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price
4.8.23. Medium $3.50} 20 $70.00[ Medium $4.08| 20 $81.60[ Medium $6.20} 20 $124.00| Medium $5.54] 20 $110.80| Medium $6.00} 20 $120.00| Medium $3.79 20 $75.80|
4.8.24. Large $4.40| 20 $88.00( Large $4.38] 20 $87.60| Large $6.20} 20 $124.00| Large $5.54] 20 $110.80| Large $6.00} 20 $120.00| Large $4.42 20 $88.40|
4.8.25. X-Large $4.40| 40 $176.00| X-Large $4.70] 40 $188.00| X-Large $6.20} 40 $248.00| X-Large $5.54] 40 $221.60| X-Large $6.00| 40 $240.00| X-Large $4.42 40 $176.80|
4.8.26. 2X $4.40| 20 $88.00 2X $4.85] 20 $97.00 2X $6.20} 20 $124.00| 2X $5.54] 20 $110.80| 2X $6.00} 20 $120.00| 2X $4.42 20 $88.40|
4.8.27. 3X $4.40| 10 $44.00 33X $5.12] 10 $51.20] 3X $6.50} 10 $65.00 3X $5.54] 10 $55.40| 3X $6.00| 10 $60.00 3X $4.88 10 $48.80|
4.8.28. 4X $4.40| 5 $22.00 4X $5.50] 5 $27.50 4X $6.70] 5 $33.50 4X $6.54] 5 $32.70| 4X $8.00} 5 $40.00 4X $4.88 5 $24.40|
4.8.29. 6X $4.40| 5 $22.00 6X $6.10] 5 $30.50 6X $7.70] 5 $38.50 6X $7.00] 5 $35.00 6X $8.00} 5 $40.00 6X $6.00 5 $30.00
4.8.30. 8X $5.90} 5 $29.50 8X $6.40] 5 $32.00 8X $8.30} 5 $41.50 8X $7.54] 5 $37.70] 8X $8.00} 5 $40.00 8X $6.00 5 $30.00
4.8.31. 9X $5.90} 5 $29.50 9X $6.60] 5 $33.00 9X $9.10} 5 $45.50 9X $7.90] 5 $39.50| 9X $8.00} 5 $40.00 9X No Bid| 5
4.8.32. 10X $5.90} 5 $29.50[ 10X $6.60] 5 $33.00( 10X $9.20| 5 $46.00[ 10X $7.90] 5 $39.50( 10X $8.00} 5 $40.00[ 10X No Bid| 5
[ |BLACKAND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE |BLACK AND WHITE
INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK
4.8.33. |SHIRTS TOTAL $598.50| SHIRTS TOTAL $661.40|SHIRTS TOTAL $890.00|SHIRTS TOTAL $793.80|SHIRTS TOTAL $860.00|SHIRTS TOTAL
TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK &
WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED
4.8.34. |(4.8.11.+4.8.22. + 4.8.33) $3,737.70|(4.8.11. + 4.8.22. + 4.8.33.) $4,125.40((4.8.11. + 4.8.22. + 4.8.33.) $4,598.85|(4.8.11. + 4.8.22. + 4.8.33.) $4,505.70|(4.8.11. + 4.8.22. + 4.8.33.) $4,765.00|(4.8.11. + 4.8.22. + 4.8.33.)
INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White) INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White) INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White) INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White) INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White) INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (White)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price
4.8.35. Medium $4.50| 10 $45.00| Medium $4.38] 10 $43.80) Medium $6.10} 10 $61.00| Medium $6.00] 10 $60.00( Medium $7.00} 10 $70.00| Medium $5.00] 10 $50.00|
4.8.36. Large $4.95| 10 $49.50| Large $4.38] 10 $43.80( Large $6.10} 10 $61.00| Large $6.00] 10 $60.00( Large $7.00} 10 $70.00| Large $5.00] 10 $50.00|
4.8.37. X-Large $4.95| 10 $49.50| X-Large $4.38] 10 $43.80| X-Large $6.10} 10 $61.00| X-Large $6.00| 10 $60.00( X-Large $7.00} 10 $70.00| X-Large $5.32] 10 $53.20|
4.8.38. 2X $4.95| 10 $49.50| 2X $4.38] 10 $43.80| 2X $6.10} 10 $61.00| 2X $6.00] 10 $60.00| 2X $7.00} 10 $70.00| 2X $5.32] 10 $53.20|
4.8.39. 3X $4.95| 10 $49.50| 3X $4.60] 10 $46.00| 3X $6.48| 10 $64.80| 3X $6.54] 10 $65.40| 3X $7.00} 10 $70.00| 3X $5.32] 10 $53.20|
4.8.40. 4X $4.95| 10 $49.50| 4X $4.60] 10 $46.00| 4X $6.98| 10 $69.80| 4X $6.90] 10 $69.00| 4X $9.00} 10 $90.00| 4X $5.32] 10 $53.20|




4.8.41. 6X $4.95| 10 $49.50| 6X $4.80] 10 $48.00| 6X $7.10} 10 $71.00| 6X $7.36] 10 $73.60| 6X $9.00| 10 $90.00| 6X $6.36| 10 $63.60|
4.8.42. 8X $6.75| 10 $67.50| 8X $4.80] 10 $48.00| 8X $7.75| 10 $77.50| 8X $7.90] 10 $79.00| 8X $9.00| 10 $90.00| 8X $6.36| 10 $63.60|
4.8.43. 9X $6.75| 10 $67.50| 9X $5.30] 10 $53.00| 9X $8.10} 10 $81.00| 9X $8.90] 10 $89.00| 9X $9.00| 10 $90.00| 9X No Bid| 10
4.8.44. 10X $6.75| 10 $67.50 10X $5.60] 10 $56.00( 10X $8.30} 10 $83.00 10X $8.90] 10 $89.00( 10X $9.00| 10 $90.00 10X $7.42] 10 $74.20|
'WHITE INSTITUTIONAL WHITE INSTITUTIONAL 'WHITE INSTITUTIONAL WHITE INSTITUTIONAL 'WHITE INSTITUTIONAL WHITE INSTITUTIONAL
4.8.45. |TROUSERS TOTAL $544.50| TROUSERS TOTAL $472.20| TROUSERS TOTAL $691.10| TROUSERS TOTAL $705.00| TROUSERS TOTAL $800.00| TROUSERS TOTAL
INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White) |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White) |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White) |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White) |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White) [INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (White)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price
4.8.46. Medium $3.50} 10 $35.00| Medium $4.95) 10 $49.50( Medium $5.46| 10 $54.60| Medium $5.54] 10 $55.40( Medium $6.00} 10 $60.00| Medium $3.75] 10 $37.50
4.8.47. Large $4.20| 10 $42.00[ Large $4.95) 10 $49.50( Large $5.46| 10 $54.60 Large $5.54] 10 $55.40( Large $6.00} 10 $60.00[ Large $4.49) 10 $44.90|
4.8.48. X-Large $4.20| 10 $42.00 X-Large $4.95) 10 $49.50 X-Large $5.46| 10 $54.60| X-Large $5.54| 10 $55.40( X-Large $6.00} 10 $60.00 X-Large $4.49) 10 $44.90|
4.8.49. 2X $4.20| 10 $42.00 2X $4.95) 10 $49.50| 2X $5.46| 10 $54.60 2X $5.54| 10 $55.40| 2X $6.00} 10 $60.00 2X $4.49) 10 $44.90|
4.8.50. 3X $4.20| 10 $42.00 3X $5.20] 10 $52.00 3X $5.60 10 $56.00 3X $5.54| 10 $55.40| 3X $6.00} 10 $60.00 3X $4.49) 10 $44.90|
4.8.51. 4X $4.20| 10 $42.00 4X $5.20] 10 $52.00 4X $5.75| 10 $57.50 4X $6.54| 10 $65.40| 4X $8.00} 10 $80.00 4X $4.88] 10 $48.80|
4.8.52. 6X $4.20| 10 $42.00 6X $5.45] 10 $54.50 6X $6.75| 10 $67.50 6X $7.00] 10 $70.00| 6X $8.00} 10 $80.00 6X $4.88] 10 $48.80|
4.8.53. 8X $5.75| 10 $57.50 8X $5.60] 10 $56.00| 8X $7.25| 10 $72.50 8X $7.54] 10 $75.40| 8X $8.00} 10 $80.00 8X $6.22] 10 $62.20|
4.8.54. 9X $5.75| 10 $57.50 9X $5.60] 10 $56.00 9X $8.00} 10 $80.00 9X $7.90] 10 $79.00| 9X $8.00} 10 $80.00 9X No Bid| 10
4.8.55. 10X $5.75| 10 $57.50[ 10X $6.00| 10 $60.00[ 10X $8.00} 10 $80.00[ 10X $7.90] 10 $79.00[ 10X $8.00} 10 $80.00[ 10X $6.22] 10 $62.20|
WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V- WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V- WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V- WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V- WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V- WHITE INSTITUTIONAL V-
4.8.56. |NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $459.50|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $528.50|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $631.90|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $645.80|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $700.00|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL
TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS| TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS| TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS| TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS| TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS| TOTAL FOR ALL WHITE ITEMS|
4.8.57. |REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56) $1,004.00|REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56) $1,000.70| REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56) | $1,323.00|REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56) $1,350.80| REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56) $1,500.00|REQUESTED (4.8.45. + 4.8.56)
INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No (INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No |INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS (Green w/No
Lettering; Lettering) Lettering; Lettering) Lettering; Lettering)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze |Uni e| Quantity Price
4.8.58. Medium $4.50) 10 $45.00[ Medium $3.78 10 $37.80[ Medium $5.05) 10 $50.50| Medium $5.36 10 $53.60[ Medium $6.00| 10 $60.00[ Medium $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.59. Large $5.10) 10 $51.00( Large $3.78 10 $37.80[ Large $5.05) 10 $50.50 Large $5.36 10 $53.60( Large $6.00) 10 $60.00[ Large $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.60. X-Large $5.10) 10 $51.00 X-Large $3.78 10 $37.80( X-Large $5.05) 10 $50.50| X-Large $5.36 10 $53.60 X-Large $6.00| 10 $60.00 X-Large $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.61. 2X $5.10) 10 $51.00 2X $4.99 10 $49.90} 2X $5.05) 10 $50.50 2X $5.72 10 $57.20} 2X $6.00) 10 $60.00 2X $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.62. 3X $5.10) 10 $51.00 3X $4.99 10 $49.90} 3X $5.45) 10 $54.50 3X $5.90 10 $59.00} 3X $6.00| 10 $60.00 33X $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.63. 4X $5.10) 10 $51.00 4X $5.49 10 $54.90(  4X $5.95) 10 $59.50 4X $6.26 10 $62.60( 4X $8.00| 10 $80.00 4X $5.02 10 $50.20}
4.8.64. 6X $5.10) 10 $51.00 6X $5.49 10 $54.90} 6X $6.10) 10 $61.00 6X $6.90 10 $69.00} 6X $8.00| 10 $80.00 6X $6.22 10 $62.20}
4.8.65. 8X $6.75) 10 $67.50 8X $5.75 10 $57.50} 8X $6.70) 10 $67.00 8X $7.18 10 $71.80} 8X $8.00| 10 $80.00 8X $6.22 10 $62.20}
4.8.66. 9X $6.75) 10 $67.50 9X $5.75 10 $57.50} 9X $7.10) 10 $71.00 9X $8.18 10 $81.80} 9X $8.00| 10 $80.00 9X No Bid| 10
4.8.67. 10X $6.75) 10 $67.50[ 10X $6.00 10 $60.00[ 10X $7.30) 10 $73.00[ 10X $8.18 10 $81.80[ 10X $8.00| 10 $80.00[ 10X $7.30 10 $73.00}
GREEN INSTITUTIONAL GREEN INSTITUTIONAL GREEN INSTITUTIONAL GREEN INSTITUTIONAL GREEN INSTITUTIONAL GREEN INSTITUTIONAL
4.8.68. |TROUSERS TOTAL $553.50 TROUSERS TOTAL $498.00| TROUSERS TOTAL $588.00) TROUSERS TOTAL $644.00| TROUSERS TOTAL $700.00] TROUSERS TOTAL
[ [INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green [INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green [INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green  |INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS (Green
w/No Lettering) w/No Lettering) w/No Lettering) w/No Lettering) w/No Lettering) w/No Lettering)
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _ |Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze _|Unit Price| Quantity Price Slze | Unif Quantity Price
4.8.69. Medium $3.75) 10 $37.50| Medium $3.09 10 $30.90[ Medium $4.36| 10 $43.60[ Medium $5.00 10 $50.00[ Medium $5.50) 10 $55.00[ Medium $3.75 10 $37.50}
4.8.70. Large $4.10) 10 $41.00[ Large $3.09 10 $30.90( Large $4.36| 10 $43.60( Large $5.00 10 $50.00( Large $5.50) 10 $55.00( Large $3.75 10 $37.50}
4.8.71. X-Large $4.10) 10 $41.00 X-Large $3.09 10 $30.90( X-Large $4.36| 10 $43.60| X-Large $5.00 10 $50.00( X-Large $5.50) 10 $55.00( X-Large $3.75 10 $37.50}
4.8.72. 2X $4.10) 10 $41.00 2X $4.04 10 $40.40} 2X $4.36| 10 $43.60 2X $5.00 10 $50.00} 2X $5.50) 10 $55.00 2X $3.75 10 $37.50}
4.8.73. 3X $4.10) 10 $41.00 3X $4.04 10 $40.40} 3X $4.50) 10 $45.00 3X $5.18 10 $51.80} 3X $5.50) 10 $55.00 33X $3.75 10 $37.50}
4.8.74. 4X $4.10) 10 $41.00 4X $4.50 10 $45.00(  4X $4.70) 10 $47.00 4X $5.90 10 $59.00(  4X $7.50) 10 $75.00 4X $4.82 10 $48.20}
4.8.75. 6X $4.10) 10 $41.00 6X $4.50 10 $45.00} 6X $5.60) 10 $56.00 6X $6.36 10 $63.60} 6X $7.50) 10 $75.00 6X $5.08 10 $50.80}
4.8.76. 8X $5.75) 10 $57.50 8X $5.00 10 $50.00} 8X $6.00| 10 $60.00 8X $6.90 10 $69.00} 8X $7.50) 10 $75.00 8X $5.18 10 $51.80}
4.8.77. 9X $5.75) 10 $57.50 9X $5.25 10 $52.50} 9X $6.60) 10 $66.00 9X $7.36 10 $73.60} 9X $7.50) 10 $75.00 9X No Bid| 10
4.8.78. 10X $5.75) 10 $57.50[ 10X $5.75 10 $57.50[ 10X $7.00) 10 $70.00[ 10X $7.36 10 $73.60[ 10X $7.50) 10 $75.00[ 10X $6.30 10 $63.00}
GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V-
4.8.79. |NECK SHIRTS TOTAL |  $456.00|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL $423.50|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL | $518.40|NECKSHIRTSTOTAL | $590.60|/NECKSHIRTSTOTAL | $650.00|NECK SHIRTS TOTAL
TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN TOTAL FOR ALL GREEN

No Bids

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +

4.8.79)

$1,009.50

7-30 Days

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +

4.8.79)

$921.50}

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +
4.8.79)

$1,106.40

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +

3%

5%

3%

5%

5%

5%

45 Days

45-60 Days

Yes

Yes

4.8.79)

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +

10%
10%
10%

7-30 Days
Yes

4.8.79)

ITEMS REQUESTED (4.8.68. +

$1,350.00

30 Days

4.8.79)




