
Item #

4.7 Description

Hourly 

Shop Rate

Hourly 

Field Rate

Hourly 

Estimating 

Rate

Hourly 

Shop Rate

Hourly 

Field Rate

Hourly 

Estimating 

Rate

Hourly 

Shop Rate

Hourly 

Field Rate

Hourly 

Estimating 

Rate

4.7.1. Repairs $65.00 $65.00 $35.00 $54.00 $60.00 $54.00 $70.00 $70.00 $35.00

4.7.1.1 Emergency 

Repairs

$85.00 $95.00 $35.00 $81.00 $90.00 No Bid $84.00 $35.00 No Bid

4.7.1.2. Hours of 

Operation

North 

Facility

Sheriff’s South Facility North 

Facility

Sheriff’s South 

Facility

North 

Facility

Sheriff’s South 

Facility

$20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20/round 

trip

No Bid $30/round 

trip

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Flat Rate 

Item 

Description

Install 

Price

Remove 

Price

Transfer Price Install 

Price

Remove 

Price

Transfer 

Price

Install 

Price

Remove 

Price

Transfer 

Price

4.7.2. Two-Way 

Radio

$77.00 $35.00 $112.00 $120.00 $36.00 $156.00 $80.00 $20.00 $100.00

4.7.2.1. Two-Way 

Radio – 

remote head

$117.00 $35.00 $152.00 $144.00 $48.00 $192.00 $100.00 $25.00 $125.00

4.7.3. Two-Way 

Radio 

Antenna

$30.00 $0.00 $30.00 $48.00 $12.00 $60.00 $30.00 $0.00 $30.00

4.7.4. Light Bar $81.25 $32.50 $113.75 $144.00 $48.00 $192.00 $80.00 $20.00 $100.00

4.7.5. Siren 

Speaker

$60.00 $15.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $10.00 $40.00

4.7.6. Siren/Light 

Control Box

$95.00 $30.00 $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 $48.75 $178.75

4.7.7. Arrow Stick 

& Controller

$81.25 $32.50 $113.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.00 $20.00 $90.00

4.7.8. Prisoner 

Cage and 

Fittings

$80.00 $30.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $30.00 $110.00

4.7.9. Flashlight 

Charger

$15.00 $0.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $0.00 $15.00

4.7.10. Shotgun 

Mount & 

Lock

$45.00 $10.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $10.00 $55.00

4.7.11. Mobile Data 

System

$100.00 $30.00 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 $40.00 $170.00

4.7.12. Mobile 

Video 

System

$100.00 $30.00 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 $45.00 $230.00

4.7.13. K-9 System 

Electronics

$110.00 $38.00 $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 $45.00 $230.00

4.7.14. K-9 Unit 

Back Seat 

Kennel 

System

$65.00 $32.50 $97.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $32.50 $97.50

4.7.15. Police 

Equipment 

Tray

$65.00 $32.50 $97.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.50 $16.25 $48.75

4.7.16. Headlight 

Flasher (Wig-

Wag)

$48.75 $32.50 $81.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $10.00 $40.00

4.7.17. Two Head 

LED flasher 

inserts

$48.75 $16.25 $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $25.00 $100.00

4.7.17.

1.

Additional 

Heads (each)

$16.25 $0.00 $16.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.50 $0.00 $37.50

4.7.18. Two Head 

Strobe and 

controller

$48.75 $16.25 $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $25.00 $100.00

4.7.18.

1.

Additional 

Heads (each)

$16.25 $0.00 $16.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.50 $0.00 $37.50

4.7.19. Rear Plastic 

Prisoner Seat

$97.50 $32.50 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $20.00 $80.00

COOP? Yes Yes

Professional Sound & Lighting MO Comm Electronics Inc. Wireless USA

4.7.1.3. Flat Rate up-

charge (trip 

fee) for 

install/remov

e/transfer at 

locations:

Communications Associates

# Days to complete 

transfer/install 4No Bid2-3 Days

Bid Tabulation: 10-03MAR09 - Emergency Vehicle and Equipment Electronics/Accessories 

Service, Installation, Removal, and Transfers 

PRICING

No Bids

Ray O-Herron Co., Inc.

PRICING

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m., Monday - 

Friday, except holidays

PRICING

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m., Monday - 

Friday

Discount for complete 

Patrol Car Transfer

Number of workdays to 

complete a standard full 

patrol car transfer No Bid No Bid

2.5

Yes

9:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m., Monday - Friday

n/a $0.00 $0.00

0%

8%

2.5%

2.5%

1st Renewal - 7/01/10--

6/30/11

2nd Renewal - 7/01/11--

6/30/12

10%

10%


