

BID TABULATION

68-03DEC08 - Solid Block Asphalt Sealant Term & Supply

Item	Estimated Yearly Qty	Description	Vance Brothers		Missour Petroleum	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
	38,000	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant			\$ 0.563	\$ 21,394.00
	1/lb	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant Alternate 1	\$ 0.631	\$ 23,978.00		
	1/lb	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant Alternate 1	\$ 0.631	\$ 23,978.00		
	6	Long Handle "V" Squeegee w/ 12" red (high heat silicone) blade	\$ 42.00	\$ 252.00		
	12	12" Red (high heat silicone) replacement squeegee blades	\$ 9.95	\$ 119.40		
		GRAND TOTAL		\$ 24,349.40		
		Maximum % Increase for Renewals				
		% 2nd Year		No Bid		No Bid
		% 3rd Year		No Bid		No Bid
		Delivery After Receipt of Order		14 DAYS		15 Days
		Vendor Return Policy		10 % Restock Fee - Full Pallets Only		No Returns
		CO-OP?		NO		NO

Item	Estimated Yearly Qty	Description	PMSI			
			Unit Price	Extended Price		
	38,000	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant	\$ 0.370	\$ 14,060.00		
	1/lb	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant Alternate 1				
	1/lb	Solid Block Asphalt Sealant Alternate 1				
	6	Long Handle "V" Squeegee w/ 12" red (high heat silicone) blade	\$ 45.950	\$ 14,464.70		
	12	12" Red (high heat silicone) replacement squeegee blades	\$ 10.75	\$ 129.00		
		GRAND TOTAL		\$ 14,464.70		
		Maximum % Increase for Renewals				
		% 2nd Year		No Bid		
		% 3rd Year		No Bid		
		Delivery After Receipt of Order		7-10 Days		
		Vendor Return Policy		20- % Restocking Fee		
		CO-OP?		No Bid		