
BID TABULATION - 63-18NOV08 - Juror Accommodations - Term and Supply

Pricing Holiday Inn Select

Regency Hotel 

Downtown

Ramada Inn & 

Suites

Country Inn & 

Suites

Best Western 

Columbia Inn

Shrizi 

Hospitality 

Inc, dba Red 

Roof Inn

4.7.1

Single Occupancy Rooms 
Monday through Thursday $72.00 $49.00 $59.95 $72.00 $65.00 $45.00

4.7.2

Single Occupancy Rooms 
Friday through Saturday $72.00 $49.00 $59.95 $72.00 $75.00 $45.00

4.7.3

Single Occupancy Rooms 
Friday through Saturday on 

high event weekends $109.95 $79.00 $69.95 $119.00 $95.00 $85.00

4.7.4.

Number of rooms required 
to meet section 2.3.2. 18 18 18 No Bid 18 No Bid

4.7.5. Room Cancellations

Cancel by 6:00 p.m. the 
day prior to arrival to avoid 

cancellation fees

Cancel 24 hours 
before 6:00 p.m. of 

check-in date 24 hours 24 hours

If group cancels 
within 30 days, group 

agrees to pay as 
liquidated damages 
an amount = to 90% 

of group total 
revenue

6:00 p.m. day 
of arrival

4.7.6.

Room Cancellations - 
Different Policy apply to the 

County

Yes - we will allow 
cancellation without 

penalty if cancelled before 
noon the day of arrival

Yes - cancel at any 
time without penalty No No  

Yes - if group cancels 
within 15 days, group 

agrees to pay as 
liquidated damages 
an amount equal to 
50% of groups total 

revenue No Bid

4.7.7. Check-out Time 11:00 a.m. Noon 11:00 a.m. 1:00 p.m. 11:00 a.m. 12:00 p.m.

4.7.8.

Check-out Time: Different 
Policy apply to the County Yes - 2:00 p.m.

Yes - check-out time 
is noon, but will work 
with late checkouts 

on case by case 
basis No No No Yes - 1:00 p.m.

4.7.9. Additional Charges

City tax of 4%.  Standard 
hotel service fee of 

$1.95/room/night waived N/A Taxes No Bid No Bid None
4.8. 1st Renewal 5% 3% 5% 10% 2% 10%

2nd Renewal 8% 3% 5% 15% 2% 15%
3rd Renewal 12% 3% 5% 20% 2% 20%
4th Renewal 15% 3% 5% 20% 2% 20%

4.10. Coop? No Yes Yes Yes Yes    Yes   


