
BID TABULATION
19-08APR08- PATROL RIFLES

Item # Description Unit Price Quantity
Extended 

Total Unit Price Quantity
Extended 

Total Unit Price Quantity
Extended 

Total Unit Price Quantity
Extended 

Total Unit Price Quantity
Extended 

Total
4.8.1. Patrol Rifles per Section 2.2.1. $1,113.46 5 $5,567.30 $855.00 5 $4,275.00 $1,003.20 5 $5,016.00 $916.00 5 $4,580.00 $869.00 5 $4,345.00

4.8.1.1 Brand Name:

4.8.1.2. Model Number:

4.8.2.
Optional: Stock Mounted Single 
Magazine Holder $31.95 5 $159.75 $19.00 5 $95.00 $18.86 5 $94.30 $22.30 5 $111.50 $25.99 5 $129.95

4.8.2.1. Brand Name:

4.8.2.2. Model Number:

4.8.3.
Optional: Stock Mounted Double 
Magazine Holder No Bid 5 No Bid $10.00 5 $50.00 $11.45 5 $57.25 N/A 5 No Bid N/A 5 No Bid

4.8.3.1. Brand Name:

4.8.3.2. Model Number:

4.8.4.

Optional: Soft Sided Carrying Case 
w/ External Magazine Pouches & 
Separate Zippered Storage Pouch $85.95 5 $429.75 $29.00 5 $145.00 $20.56 5 $102.80 N/A 5 No Bid $24.00 5 $120.00

4.8.4.1. Brand Name:
4.8.4.2. Model Number:
4.8.5. Optional: Tactical Sling $39.95 5 $199.75 $31.00 5 $155.00 $15.95 5 $79.75 $66.00 5 $330.00 $38.95 5 $194.75
4.8.5.1. Brand Name:
4.8.5.2. Model Number:
4.9. Warranty Features:
4.10. Deviations
4.12. Co-op? Yes No Response No Yes Yes
4.13. Delivery ARO 30-60 Days No Response 60-90Days 60-75 Days 60 Days

No Bids PLBM
Gill Hebard Guns Inc.

GTSCARR1B
See ContractSee Contract

ARO737V7AC

Sabre

Blackhawk

52BS17BK

Sabre Defence
$10,117.00

Viking VTAV WildernessUncle Mike's
2699-3

See Contract

Kiesler Police Supply

Rickriver

AR2263

Rockriver

AR3610C

No Response

Lawman's & Shooters' Supply

Rock River Arms

AR2263

Blackhawk

52BS17BK

Uncle Mike's

8848-7

Uncle Mike's
5214-1

Wchael's
5214-1 (Black Only)

Blackhawk 
706504BK Coyote 3 pt sling

Bushmaster
100240101 Spec-ops Mamba Combat

! Year Manufacturer Warranty

Gulf States Distribution

Bushmaster
BCWA3F-14.5M4 W/Trijicon NS (3)mags 

Permanent Flash Suppressor

Blackhawk 

52Bsit

Command Arms

M16MC (Coupler only)

TTTS

RC - 36A
Bushmaster 

Proforce Marketing, Inc.

Bushmaster Trijicon Sights (cp25)

BCWA3F-14.5M4 (3)8448670-20R Magazines

Bushmaster 


