
4.7. Estimated 
Rounds 

4.7.1. CTS Super Sock 12 gauge 500          no bid no bid $5.35 2,675.00 no bid no bid

4.8.  
Estimated 
Rounds 

4.8.1.

13,000     
.1458 rd 

($145.80/M) $1,895.40
$0.15/rd 

($146.00/M) $1,898.00 no bid no bid

4.9.1. 1,000       no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
4.9.2. 1,000       no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
4.9.3.

20,000     
.3412/rd 

($170.60/500)
$6,824.00 $170.63/500 $6,825.20

no bid no bid
4.9.4.

2,000       
1.17/rd 

($234.00/200)
$2,340.00 $235 /200 $2,350.00

no bid no bid
4.9.5.

2,000       
1.17/rd 

($234.00/200)
$2,340.00 $235 /200 $2,350.00

no bid no bid
4.9.6.

3,000       
1.241/rd 

($248.20/200) $3,723.00
$249 /200 $3,735.00

no bid no bid
4.9.7. $15,227.00 $19,833.20

Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 
grain BJHP GSB45APB

Reminton Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, 
BJHP GSB9MMD

Sub-Total for factory loads
(4.9.1.-4.9.6.)

American Eagle .223 62 grain

Federal .223 62 grain tactical bonded

Federal .223 55 grain tactical bonded

.308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds 

TBTL

Gulf States Distributors Zero Ammunition

 
Estimated 

Less-Lethal Ammunition

American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ

Other Ammunition

Bid Tabulation - 94-27NOV07 - Ammunition Term and Supply
Gil Hebard

4.9. Factory Loads

1



Gulf States Distributors Zero Ammunition
Bid Tabulation - 94-27NOV07 - Ammunition Term and Supply

Gil Hebard

4.10.1.

10,000     

no bid no bid

$237.00 $2,370.00

$303.97 (Zero #718 - 
without brass) or 
$244.97 (Zero 719 - 
with brass 
exchange)

$3039.70 or 
$2449.70

4.10.2.
7,000       

no bid no bid
$154.00 $1,078.00

$199.97 (Zero #922) 
or $175.97 (Zero 
#923)

$1399.79 or 
$1231.79

4.10.3. no Bid $3,448.00

4.12.

4.12.

4.13.                                               

4.14.
4.15.

No Bids

Price firm for only 1 year 8%

Note: See bid for what substitutions were bid

Maximum % Increase for:
__________% 3rd Year

15 Days
Yes

10m/7m1caseMinimum Quantity for Order:

Price firm for only 1 year

See  bid

See Bid
Coop? Yes

8%No Bid

Yes

Not firm delivery days - see 
bid

See Bid

Delivery ARO

Maximum % Increase for:
__________% 2nd Year

.45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB45APB
9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington 

Golden Saber BJHP GSB9MMD
Sub-Total for Reloads

(4.10.1.-4.10.2.)

4.10. Reloads (to be used as practice 
ammunition)

 
Estimated 
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