

BID TABULATION - 85-11DEC07 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products

			Boone Quarries	Mid-Missouri Limestone	Quarries - Stadium	Capital Quarries - HWY 63 - On-Site Quantities Available Only
	Description	Unit of Measure Tons Approximate Quantity	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton
4.7.1.	RSB	75000.00	\$4.22	4.50	6.50	7.15
4.7.2.	SR1	75000.00	\$4.43	5.40	7.40	7.70
4.7.3.	SR1.5	95000.00	\$4.43	6.00	6.50	No Bid
4.7.4.	SR2.5	25000.00	\$4.43	5.40	6.50	No Bid
4.7.5.	CR.5	200.00	\$7.25	7.00	8.25	No Bid
4.7.6.	CR.75	200.00	\$6.87	7.00	8.25	No Bid
4.7.7.	CR1	25000.00	\$6.33	7.00	8.25	No Bid
4.7.8.	CR 2	500.00	\$5.70	6.00	7.15	No Bid
4.7.9.	CR3	5500.00	\$5.70	6.25	7.15	No Bid
4.7.10.	MS	8500.00	\$3.50	7.50	No Bid	No Bid
4.7.11.	QR	4500.00	\$5.27	4.75	5.50	5.50
4.7.12.	GQR	500.00	\$7.00	7.00	11.00	No Bid
4.7.13.	SP	500.00	\$7.00	6.50	No Bid	No Bid
4.7.14.	WR	3000.00	\$2.62	2.75	5.75	6.05
4.7.15.	GQR6x9	2500.00	\$7.00	7.50	11.00	No Bid
4.7.16.	GQR6x12	1000.00	\$7.00	7.50	11.00	No Bid
4.7.17.	SC.375	2500.00	\$7.25	\$14.00, Riggs Only	9.10	No Bid
4.7.18.	SC.5	1500.00	\$7.25	\$12.00, Riggs Only	9.10	No Bid
4.7.19.	SP=Spalls	1000.00	\$7.00	6.50	No Bid	No Bid
4.7.20.	Fill Material	1000.00	\$2.62	2.50	5.75	6.05
4.7.21.	Plugged Rock	1000.00	..54	0.25	0.60	No Bid

4.8. Chip Seal Pricing - FOB Plant Only						
			Boone Quarries	Mid-Missouri Limestone	Capital Quarries	Capital Quarries - HWY 63 - On-Site Quantities Available Only
4.8.1.	Descriptions	Measure Tons Approximate Quantity	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton	Unit Price Per Ton
	SC.375	2500.00	\$7.25	\$14.00 *1996 Spec, Riggs Only	9.10	No Bid
	SC.5	15000.00	\$7.25	\$12.00 *1996 Spec, Riggs Only	9.10	No Bid
4.9.	Maximum Percentage Increase					
	Percentage increase for 1st		10%	5%	0%	0%
	Percentage increase for 2nd		10%	5%	0%	0%

Boone Quarries

Schedule	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
Fuel Price	<\$2.75	\$2.75 - <3.00	\$3.00 - <3.25	\$3.25 - <3.50	\$3.50 - <3.75	\$3.75 - <4.00	\$4.00- <4.25	\$4.25 - <4.50
Distance (Miles)	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton
4.10.1. 0 - <5	2.06	2.20	2.33	2.45	2.47	2.50	2.52	2.54
4.10.2. 5 - <10	2.86	2.95	3.04	3.20	3.23	3.26	3.29	3.32
4.10.3. 10 - <15	3.35	3.43	3.52	3.70	3.74	3.77	3.81	3.84
4.10.4. 15 - <20	4.02	4.18	4.32	4.54	4.58	4.63	4.67	4.71
4.10.5. 20 - < 25	4.73	4.92	5.06	5.32	5.37	5.42	5.47	5.52
4.10.6. 25 - <30	5.21	5.36	5.50	5.78	5.83	5.89	5.94	6.00
4.10.7. 30 - <35	6.09	6.24	6.39	6.71	6.78	6.84	6.91	6.97

Riggs Quarry

Schedule	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
Fuel Price	<\$2.75	\$2.75 - <3.00	\$3.00 - <3.25	\$3.25 - <3.50	\$3.50 - <3.75	\$3.75 - <4.00	\$4.00- <4.25	\$4.25 - <4.50
Distance (Miles)	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton
4.10.1. 0 - <5								
4.10.2. 5 - <10								
4.10.3. 10 - <15								
4.10.4. 15 - <20								
4.10.5. 20 - < 25								
4.10.6. 25 - <30								
4.10.7. 30 - <35								
4.11. Maximum % Increase for 2nd Year			10%					
Maximum % Increase for 3rd Year			10%					

Mid-Missouri Limestone

Schedule	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
Fuel Price	<\$2.75	\$2.75 - <3.00	\$3.00 - <3.25	\$3.25 - <3.50	\$3.50 - <3.75	\$3.75 - <4.00	\$4.00- <4.25	\$4.25 - <4.50
Distance (Miles)	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton
4.10.1. 0 - <5	2.00	2.10	2.23	2.36	2.49	2.62	2.75	2.88
4.10.2. 5 - <10	2.90	3.00	3.13	3.26	3.39	3.52	3.65	3.78
4.10.3. 10 - <15	3.75	3.85	3.98	4.11	4.24	4.37	4.50	4.63
4.10.4. 15 - <20	4.25	4.35	4.48	4.61	4.74	4.87	5.00	5.13
4.10.5. 20 - < 25	4.75	4.85	4.98	5.11	5.24	5.37	5.50	5.63
4.10.6. 25 - <30	5.25	5.35	5.48	5.61	5.74	5.87	6.00	6.13
4.10.7. 30 - <35	5.75	5.85	5.98	6.11	6.24	6.37	6.50	6.63
4.11. Maximum % Increase for 2nd Year			4%					
Maximum % Increase for 3rd Year			4%					

Capital Quarries - Stadium

Schedule	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
Fuel Price	<\$2.75	\$2.75 - <3.00	\$3.00 - <3.25	\$3.25 - <3.50	\$3.50 - <3.75	\$3.75 - <4.00	\$4.00- <4.25	\$4.25 - <4.50
Distance (Miles)	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton
4.10.1. 0 - <5	1.70	1.95	2.20	2.45	2.70	2.95	3.20	3.45
4.10.2. 5 - <10	2.50	2.75	3.00	3.25	3.50	3.75	4.00	4.25
4.10.3. 10 - <15	3.10	3.35	3.60	3.85	4.10	4.35	4.60	4.85
4.10.4. 15 - <20	3.80	4.05	4.30	4.55	4.80	5.05	5.30	5.55
4.10.5. 20 - < 25	4.70	4.95	5.20	5.75	5.70	5.95	6.20	6.45
4.10.6. 25 - <30	5.50	5.8	6.05	6.30	6.55	6.80	7.05	7.30
4.10.7. 30 - <35	6.50	6.75	7.00	7.25	7.50	7.75	8.00	8.25
4.11. Maximum % Increase for 2nd Year			6%					
Maximum % Increase for 3rd Year			6%					

Capital Quarries - HWY 63 - On-Site Quantities Available Only

Schedule	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
Fuel Price	<\$2.75	\$2.75 - <3.00	\$3.00 - <3.25	\$3.25 - <3.50	\$3.50 - <3.75	\$3.75 - <4.00	\$4.00- <4.25	\$4.25 - <4.50
Distance (Miles)	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton	\$ / Ton
4.10.1. 0 - <5	1.48	1.73	1.98	2.23	2.48	2.73	2.98	3.23
4.10.2. 5 - <10	2.20	2.45	2.70	2.95	3.20	3.45	3.20	3.95
4.10.3. 10 - <15	2.80	3.05	3.30	3.55	3.80	4.05	4.30	4.55
4.10.4. 15 - <20	3.41	3.66	3.91	4.16	4.41	4.66	4.91	5.16
4.10.5. 20 - < 25	4.23	4.48	4.73	4.98	5.23	5.48	5.73	5.98
4.10.6. 25 - <30	5.00	5.25	5.50	5.75	6.00	6.25	6.50	6.75
4.10.7. 30 - <35	5.83	6.08	6.33	6.58	6.83	7.08	7.33	7.58

