
BID TABULATION

4.8 Pricing Qty Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total
MOTOR GRADER BLADES
4.8.1 7' Grader Blades 150 75.07$          $  11,260.50 No Bid 70.07$          $  10,510.50 No Bid
4.8.2 TOTAL  $  11,260.50 
TIGER TRB50 MOWER 
BLADES AND PARTS
4.8.3 Suction Blade (Tiger part 
#34688) 180 16.80$          $    3,024.00 16.91$          $    3,043.80 No Bid No Bid
4.8.4 Standard Blade (Tiger part 
#34687) 120 16.63$          $    1,995.60 16.91$          $    2,029.20 
4.8.5 Blade Bolt (Tiger part 
#34497) 300 8.45$            $    2,535.00 7.51$            $    2,253.00 
4.8.6 Blade Spacer (Tiger part 
#34878) 25 11.88$          $       297.00 10.27$          $       256.75 

4.8.7 Nut (Tiger part #6T1023R) 300 2.24$            $       672.00 1.68$            $       504.00 
4.8.8 TOTAL  $    8,523.60  $    8,086.75 
CARBIDE TIP SNOWPLOW 
BLADES
4.8.9 4' Blade Section 28 No Bid 215.20$        $    6,025.60 No Bid 225.00$        $    6,300.00 
4.8.10 3' Blade Section 56 161.40$        $    9,038.40 150.00$        $    8,400.00 
4.8.11 TOTAL  $  15,064.00  $  14,700.00 
SANDVIK MOTOR GRADER 
BLADE MILLING INSERTS
4.8.12 Sandvik Milling Bits (part 
#K1LS-2244-0169 or equal) 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.8.13 TOTAL

4.9 Warranty?

4.10 Deviations?

4.12  COOP

4.13 DELIVERY ARO

 None Noted 

 None 

 Same as OEM  OEM Warranty 

 None 

 1 Year 

 None 

68-09OCT07-Motor Grader, Mower, and 
Snow Plow Blades

Roland Machinery Lacal Equipment Co. Valk Manufacturing Knapheide

 None 

Yes

5-7 Days

Yes

??

Yes

No Delivery Noted

None

45-60 Days



BID TABULATION

4.8 Pricing Qty
MOTOR GRADER BLADES
4.8.1 7' Grader Blades 150
4.8.2 TOTAL
TIGER TRB50 MOWER 
BLADES AND PARTS
4.8.3 Suction Blade (Tiger part 
#34688) 180
4.8.4 Standard Blade (Tiger part 
#34687) 120
4.8.5 Blade Bolt (Tiger part 
#34497) 300
4.8.6 Blade Spacer (Tiger part 
#34878) 25

4.8.7 Nut (Tiger part #6T1023R) 300
4.8.8 TOTAL
CARBIDE TIP SNOWPLOW 
BLADES
4.8.9 4' Blade Section 28
4.8.10 3' Blade Section 56
4.8.11 TOTAL
SANDVIK MOTOR GRADER 
BLADE MILLING INSERTS
4.8.12 Sandvik Milling Bits (part 
#K1LS-2244-0169 or equal) 1000
4.8.13 TOTAL

4.9 Warranty?

4.10 Deviations?

4.12  COOP

4.13 DELIVERY ARO

68-09OCT07-Motor Grader, Mower, and 
Snow Plow Blades

Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total Unit Price
Extended 

Total

No Bid 71.00$          $  10,650.00 66.54$          $    9,981.00 59.00$          $    8,850.00 
 $  10,650.00  $    9,981.00  $    8,850.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 185.25$        $    5,187.00 No Bid No Bid
138.95$        $    7,781.20 

 $  12,968.20 

No Bid 6.55$            $    6,550.00 No Bid 7.75$            $    7,750.00 
 $    6,550.00  $    7,750.00 

 1 Year 
 Milling Inserts will be 
Kennametal Part No. 

C855DS 

 Warranty against breakage 

 None 

Monroe Truck Equipment GM Supply Co

Yes

4 Weeks

Winter Equipment Co.

Yes

3-4 Weeks

Tri-State Construction 
Equipment Co.

Yes

5 Days

 Grader Blades are Deere 
T71979 Dura-Max and 

Guaranteed against 
breakage 

 Deere TY16186 Stinger 
Teeth substituted for 

Sandvik Milling Inserts 


