
BID TABULATION
41-12JUN07 PRINTER TONER CARTRIDGES TERM & SUPPLY

Smart Business 
Products

Global Associates 
Computers

GovConnection, 
Inc.

Corporate Express 
Imaging

Missouri Office 
Systems & Supplies Alpha Laser Services

Corporate Express US, 
Inc.

R&T Microcenters of 
Ohio Discover Group NY

4.8.1. Renewals
4.8.1.1. ____% 1st Year 2% 2% No Response 3% 7% 1% 3% 0% 3%-5%
4.8.1.2. ____% 2nd Year 2% 2% No Response 3% 7% 1% 3% 2% No Response
4.8.1.3. ____% 3rd Year 3% 2% No Response 3% 7% 2% 3% 2% No Response
4.8.1.4. ____% 4th Year 3% 2% No Response 3% 7% 3% 3% 2% No Response
4.10. Co-op? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
4.11. Online Ordering Capabilities? Yes E-Mail/Fax See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid Via email only See Bid
4.12. ____% Discount off other items 15% 6% No Response 10% 10% 10% 45% �25% 0%

4.13. ____ARO 1-2 Days 2 Days
3-7 Days-Next Day 

Delivery addl. 2-3 Days 1-2 Days 2 Days Next Day 2 Days No Response
4.14. Vendor Return Policy See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid
4.15. Vendor Recycle Program See Bid N/A See Bid N/A See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid

4.16.
Agreement that toner cartridges are 
not refurbished or recycled Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

4.17.1 Printer: Canon Inkjet BJ230
Toner BC-02
Manufacturer: Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon
Item #: CNMBC02 CNM0881A003 0881A003 0881A003 0881A003 0881A003 0881A003 BC-02 BC-02
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 500 500 No Response N/A 350 500 P4 30,000 No Response High Yield

4.17.2 Printer: Canon Inkjet BJ30
Toner BCI-10 3Pack
Manufacturer: Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon Canon
Item #: CNMBC10 CNM0905A003 0956A003 0956A003 BCI10 0956A003 0956A003 BCI-10 BCI-10BK
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,000 3,000 No Response N/A No Response N/A 9,000 No Response 170

4.17.3 Printer: Epson TMU950
Toner
Manufacturer: Epson N/A Epson Curtis Young Epson Epson Epson Discontinued EPSON
Item #: EPS-ERC38B ERC-31B EC846 ERC31 ERC31 ERC31B ERC-31
Yield (copies)/cartridge: Printer Ribbon No Response N/A No Response N/A 12000

4.17.4 Printer: HP 2000CXI Pro
Toner Black H:10
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 1,750 1,750 No Response 1,400 1,750 1,750 1,430 1,430 1,430

4.17.5 Printer: HP Inkjet 2300N
Toner Black H:10
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4844A C4844A See Bid Q2610A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4844A C4810A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 1,750 1,750 No Response 6,000 1,750 1750 P4 1,430 1,430 16,000

4.17.6 Printer: HP Inkjet 6122
Toner Black #45 Color H78
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEW51645A 51645A See Bid 51645A 51645A 51645A Color=C6578DN 51645A 51645A 51645A 
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 830 1,120 No Response 833 830 B=830  C=450 833 833 High Yield

4.17.7 Printer: HP Inkjet 970CXI
Toner Black #:45 Color H:78
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEW51645A 51645A See Bid 51645A 51645A B=51645A C=C6578DN 51645A 51645A 51645A 
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 830 1,120 No Response 833 830 B=830  C=450 833 833 High Yield

4.17.8 Printer: HP LaserJet 1012
Toner #12A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWQ2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A Q2612A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 2,000 2,000 No Response 2,000 2,000 2,000 2,000 2,000 2,000

4.17.9 Printer: HP LaserJet 2100M
Toner #96A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 5,000 5,000 No Response 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000

4.17.10 Printer: HP LaserJet 2100TN
Toner #96A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 5,000 5,000 No Response 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000
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4.17.11 Printer: HP LaserJet 2200DN
Toner #96A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A C4096A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 5,000 5,000 No Response 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000 5,000

4.17.12 Printer: HP LaserJet 2200DN MICR
Toner MICR
Manufacturer: Troy Systems Elite Image Printing Technology Printuition MSE HP-Troy HP Troy HP
Item #: 02-81038-001 75083 C4096A/2100 AMR-5 PM2100R 2/21/9616 C4096A New MICR Q2610A 02-81038-001 C4096A MICR
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 5,000 5,000 No Response 3,600 7,000 8,000 6,000 5,000 5,000

4.17.13 Printer: HP LaserJet 2300DN
Toner #10A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: Q2610A Q2610A Q2610A Q2610A Q2610A Q2610A 92298X Q2610A Q2610A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,000 6,000 No Response 6,000 6,000 6,000 8,800 6,000 6,000

4.17.14 Printer: HP LaserJet 4
Toner #98A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: 92298X 92298X 92298A 92298X 92298A 92298A C4127A 92298A 92298A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 8,800 8,800 No Response 8,800 6,800 6,800 6,000 6,800 8,800

4.17.15 Printer: HP LaserJet 4050N
Toner #27X
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: C4127X C4127X C4127A C4127X C4127A C4127X C4127X C4127X C4127X/C4127A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 10,000 No Response 10,000 6,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 High Yield

4.17.16 Printer: HP LaserJet 4050TN
Toner #27X
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: C4127X C4127X C4127A C4127X C4127A C4127X C4127X C4127X C4127X/C4127A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 10,000 No Response 10,000 6,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 High Yield

4.17.17 Printer: HP LaserJet 4200DTN
Toner #38A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A Q1338A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 12,000 12,000 No Response 12,000 12,000 12,000 12,000 12,000 12,000

4.17.18 Printer: HP LaserJet 4P
Toner #74A
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: 92274A 92298X 92298A 92274A 92274A 92274A 92274A 92274A 92274A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,350 8,800 No Response 3,300 3,350 3,350 3,350 3,350 3,350

4.17.19 Printer: HP LaserJet 4SI
Toner #91A
Manufacturer: Elite Image Discontinued HP Inkjet Warehouse Discontinued Lexmark HP HP HP Discontinued HP
Item #: EL170305 92291A 140191A 92291A 92291A 92291A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,250 No Response 10,250 10,250 10,250 High Yield

4.17.20 Printer: HP LaserJet 5000N
Toner #29X
Manufacturer: HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Item #: HEWC4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X C4129X
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 10,000 No Response 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000

4.17.21 Printer: IBM Infoprint 1140
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 28P2010 28P2008 28P2009 28P2010 28P2008 28P2010 / 28P2008 28P2009 28P2010 28P2009
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 30,000 30,000 No Response 30,000 10,000 30,000 10,000 30,000 10,000
Usage Kit
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 28P2012 28P2625 28P2625 28P2012 28P2625 28P2625 28P2625 28P2625 28P1883
Yield (copies) per kit: 300,000 No Response No Response 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000

4.17.22 Printer: IBM Infoprint 1332
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 75P4301 75P4303 75P4303 75P4303 75P4301 75P4303 75P4301 75P4302 75P4303/75P4301
Yield (copies)/cartridge: No Response 21,000 21,000 21,000 5,000 21,000 5,000 21,000 High Yield

4.17.23 Printer: IBM Infoprint 1332/MICR 35
Toner
Manufacturer: MICROM N/A MicroMicr Source Tech MSE IBM-Troy IBM STI IBM
Item #: MICRTBN303 MICRTSN916 STI-204527 02-24-1317 75P4303 New MICR SUEST120428 204527 MICR 75P4303 MICR
Yield (copies)/cartridge: No Response No Response 14,000 15,000 30,000 300,000 14,000 High Yield
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4.17.24 Printer: IBM Infoprint 1585N
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM Lenovo IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877 75P6877
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 30,000 30,000 No Response 30,000 30,000 30,000 21,000 30,000 30,000
Photoconductor Kit
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878 75P6878
Yield (copies)/kit: No Response 60,000 No Response 60,000 60,000 60,000 N/A 60,000 60,000
Maintenance Kit
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956 40X0956
Yield (copies)/kit: No Response 300,000 No Response 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000 300,000

4.17.25 Printer: IBM Infoprint 40
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM West Point Products IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 90H3566 90H3566 See Bid 90H3566 90H3566 90H3566 90H3566 90H3566 90H3566
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 23,000 23,000 No Response 23,000 23,000 23,000 32,000 23,000 23,000
Usage Kit
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 90H3567 90H3567 90H3567 90H3567 90H3567 90H3567 90H3567 90X3567 90H3567
Yield (copies) per kit: 300,000 300,000 No Response 300,000 300,000 300,000 120,000 300,000 300,000

4.17.26 Printer: IBM Laser 4317-001
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM West Point Products IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 63H2401 63H2401 See Bid 63H2401 63H2401 63H2401 63H2401 63H2401 63H2401
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 10,000 No Response 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000

4.17.27 Printer: IBM Laser 4317-001 MICR
Toner Item Not Available N/A MICR
Manufacturer: West Point Products Troy HP IBM-Troy IBM TROY IBM
Item #: See Bid 02-81017-001 Q5942X 63H2401 New MICR 63H2401 02-81017-001 63H2401 MICR
Yield (copies)/cartridge: No Response 10,000 20,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000

4.17.28 Printer: IBM Laser 4324-001
Toner
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 63H3005 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903 75P5903
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,000 15,000 No Response 15,000 15,000 15,000 10,000 15,000 15,000
Usage Kit
Manufacturer: IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM IBM
Item #: 63H3111 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718 63H5718
Yield (copies) per kit: 150,000 35,000 No Response 35,000 350,000 350,000 350,000 350,000 350,000

4.17.29
Printer: Konica Minolta Magicolor 
2400W
Toner Black Black Yellow Black Yellow Black (High Yield) Black
Manufacturer: Konica Minolta QMS Konica Minolta Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta
Item #: 1710587-004 1710587-004 1710587-001 1710587-004 1710587-001 1710587-004 1710587-004 1710587-004 1710587-004
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 4,500 4,500 No Response 4,500 1,500 4,500 11,250 4,500 High Yield
Toner Cyan Cyan Magenta Yellow Magenta Cyan (High Yield Cyan
Manufacturer: Konica Minolta QMS Konica Minolta Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta
Item #: 1710587-007 1710587-007 1710587-002 1710587-005 1710587-002 1710587-007 1710587007 1710587-005
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 4,500 4,500 No Response 4,500 1,500 4,500 4,500 High Yield
Toner Magenta Magenta Cyan Magenta Cyan Magenta (High Yield) Yellow
Manufacturer: Konica Minolta QMS Konica Minolta Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta
Item #: 1710587-006 1710587-006 1710587-003 1710587-006 1710587-003 1710587-006 1710587005 1710587-006
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 4,500 4,500 No Response 4,500 1,500 4,500 4,500 High Yield
Toner Yellow Yellow Black Cyan Black Yellow (High Yield0 Magenta
Manufacturer: Konica Minolta QMS Konica Minolta Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta
Item #: 1710587-005 1710587-005 1710587-004 1710587-007 1710587-004 1710587-005 1710587006 1710587007
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 4,500 4,500 No Response 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500 High Yield
Drum Cartridge
Manufacturer: Konica Minolta QMS Konica Minolta Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta Konica Minolta
Item #: 1710591-001 1710591-001 1710591-001 1710591-001 1710591-001 1710591-001 1710597001 1710597-001
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 11,250 250 No Response 45,000 45,000 B=45000 C=11250 4,500 45,000

4.17.30 Printer: Lexmark C510N
Toner Cyan Black Black Black Cyan Black Black
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 20K1400 20K1403 20K0503 20K1403 20K0500 20K1403 20K1403 20K1403 20K1403
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,600 10,000 No Response 10,000 3,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 High Yield
Toner Magenta Cyan Cyan Yellow Magenta Cyan (High Yield) Cyan Cyan (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 20K1401 20K1400 20K0500 20K1402 12K0501 12K1400 12K1400 12K1400 12K1402
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Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,600 6,600 No Response 6,600 3,000 6,600 6,600 6,000 High Yield



Smart Business 
Products

Global Associates 
Computers

GovConnection, 
Inc.

Corporate Express 
Imaging

Missouri Office 
Systems & Supplies Alpha Laser Services

Corporate Express US, 
Inc.

R&T Microcenters of 
Ohio Discover Group NY

Toner Yellow Magenta Magenta Magenta Yellow Magenta (High Yield) Magenta Magenta
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 20K1402 20K1401 20K0501 20K1401 20K0502 20K1401 20K1401 20K1401 20K1401
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,600 6,600 No Response 6,600 3,000 6,600 6,600 6,000 High Yield
Toner Black Yellow Yellow Cyan Black Yellow (High Yield) Magenta Yellow
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 20K1403 20K1402 20K0502 20K1400 20K0503 20K1402 20K1401 20K1402 20K1400
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 6,600 No Response 6,600 5,000 6,600 6,600 6,000 High Yield

4.17.31 Printer: Lexmark C720N
Toner Cyan Black Black Black Cyan Black Black Black
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 15W0900 15W0903 15W0903 15W0903 15W0900 15W0903 15W0903 15W0903 15W0900
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 7,200 12,000 No Response 12,000 7,200 12,000 12,000 12,000 7,200
Toner Magenta Cyan Cyan Yellow Magenta Cyan Cyan Cyan
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 15W0901 15W0900 15W0900 15W0902 15W0901 15W0900 15W0900 15W0900 15W0901
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 7,200 7,200 No Response 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200
Toner Yellow Magenta Magenta Magenta Yellow Magenta Magenta Magenta
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 15W0902 15W0901 15W0901 15W0901 15W0902 15W0901 15W0901 15W0901 15W0902
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 7,200 7,200 No Response 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200 7,200
Toner Black Yellow Yellow Cyan Black Yellow Yellow Yellow
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 15W0903 15W0902 15W0902 15W0900 15W0903 15W0902 15W0902 15W0902 15W0903
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 12,000 7,200 No Response 7,200 12,000 7,200 7,200 7,200 12,000
Photo Developer Kit
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904 15W0904
Yield (copies)/kit: 40,000 40,000 No Response 40,000 40,000 40,000 30,000 40,000 40,000

4.17.32 Printer: Lexmark C750N
Toner Cyan Black Black Black Cyan Black Black Black
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 10B032C 10B32K 10B041K 10B042K 10B041C 10B042K 10B042K 10B032K 10B042K
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 15,000 15,000 No Response 15,000 6,000 15,000 15,000 15,000 High Yield
Toner Magenta Cyan Magenta Cyan Magenta Cyan (High Yield) Cyan Cyan
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 10B032M 10B032C 10B041M 10B042C 10B041M 10B042C 10B042C 10B032C 10B042M
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 15,000 15,000 No Response 15,000 6,000 15,000 15,000 15,000 High Yield
Toner Yellow Magenta Yellow Magenta Yellow Magenta (High Yield) Magenta Magenta
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 10B032Y 10B032M 10B041Y 10B042M 10B041Y 10B042M 10B042M 10B032M 10B042Y
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 15,000 15,000 No Response 15,000 6,000 15,000 15,000 15,000 High Yield
Toner Black Yellow Cyan Yellow Black Yellow (High Yield) Yellow Yellow
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 10B032K 10B032Y 10B041C 10B042Y 10B041K 10B042Y 10B042Y 10B032Y 10B042C
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 15,000 15,000 No Response 15,000 6,000 15,000 15,000 15,000 High Yield

4.17.33 Printer: Lexmark C920DTN
Toner Cyan Black Magenta Black Cyan Black Black Black
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: C9202CH C9202KH C9202MH C9202KH C9202CH C9202KH C9202KH C9202KH C9202KH
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 14,000 No Response No Response 15,000 14,000 15,000 7,500 15,000 15,000
Toner Black Cyan Yellow Cyan Magenta Cyan Cyan Cyan
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: C9202KH C9202CH C9202YH C9202CH C9202MH C9202CH C9202CH C9202CH C9202CH
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 15,000 14,000 No Response 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000
Toner Magenta Magenta Cyan Magenta Yellow Magenta Magenta Magenta
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: C9202MH C9202MH C9202CH C9202MH C9202YH C9202MH C9202MH C9202MH C9202MH
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 14,000 14,000 No Response 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000
Toner Yellow Yellow Black Yellow Black Yellow Magenta Yellow
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: C9202YH C9202YM C9202KH C9202YH C9202KH C9202YH C9202MH C9202YH C9202YH
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 14,000 14,000 No Response 14,000 15,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000

4.17.34 Printer: Lexmark E250DN
Toner
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: E250AIIA E250A114 E250A21A E250A11A E250A11A E250A11A E250A11A E250A11A E250A21A
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,500 No Response No Response 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500

4.17.35 Printer: Lexmark E321
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
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Item #: 12A7305 12A7305 12A7406 12A7305 12A7400 12A7405 12A7305 12A7405 12A7405/12A7400
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,000 6,000 No Response 6,000 3,000 6,000 6,000 No Response High Yield
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4.17.36 Printer: Lexmark Optra R
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1382150 1382150 1382100 1382150 1382100 1382150 1382150 1382150 1382150
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 14,000 14,000 No Response 14,000 7,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000

4.17.37 Printer: Lexmark Optra S 1620
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1382625 1382625 1382920 1382925 1382920 1382925 1382625 1382625 1382925
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 17,600 17,600 No Response 17,600 7,500 17,600 17,600 17,600 High Yield

4.17.38 Printer: Lexmark Optra SC1275N
Toner Black Black Magenta Black Black Black Black Black
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1361751 1361751 1361753 1361751 1361751 1361751 1361751 1361751 1361751
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 4,500 4,500 No Response 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500
Toner Cyan Cyan Black Cyan Cyan Cyan Cyan Cyan
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1361752 1361752 1361751 1361752 1361752 1361752 1361752 1361752 1361752
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,500 3,500 No Response 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500
Toner Magenta Magenta Cyan Magenta Magenta Magenta Magenta Magenta
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1361753 1361753 1361752 1361753 1361753 1361753 1361753 1361753 1361753
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,500 3,500 No Response 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500
Toner Yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754 1361754
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 3,500 3,500 No Response 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500 3,500
Photoconductor Kit
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 1361750 1361750 1361750 12C0575 1361750 1361750 1361750 1361750 1361750
Yield (copies)/kit: 20,000 20,000 No Response N/A 5,000 B=5000 C=20000 20,000 20,000 20,000
Maintenance Kit Fuser w/transfer N/A No Bid N/A
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark No Response Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 12C0575 11C0152 11C0152 11C0152 12C0575
Yield (copies)/kit: 10,000 N/A N/A 20,000 100,000

4.17.39 Printer: Lexmark Optra T
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 12A5840 12A6735 12A5740 12A5140 12A5845 12A5845 12A5745 12A5745 12A5845/ 12A5840
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 10,000 20,000 No Response 25,000 25,000 25,000 25,000 25,000 High Yield

4.17.40 Printer: Lexmark T430DN
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 12A8420 12A8325 12A8325 12A8425 12A8325 12A8425 12A8425 12A8325 12A8325
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 6,000 12,000 No Response 12,000 12,000 12,000 12,000 12,000 High Yield
Maintenance Kit N/A
Manufacturer: Lexmark N/A No Bid Lexmark Lexmark No Response Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 56P2333 56P2333 56P2333 56P2333 568233
Yield (copies)/kit: No Response N/A 200,000 150,000 High Yield

4.17.41 Printer: Lexmark T520N
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 12A6830 12A6735 12A6830 12A6835 12A6830 12A6835 12A6735 12A6735 12A6835/ 12A6830
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 7,500 20,000 No Response 20,000 7,500 20,000 20,000 20,000 High Yield

4.17.42 Printer: Lexmark T630N
Toner Black (High Yield)
Manufacturer: Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Item #: 12A7460 12A7362 12A7460 12A7462 12A7460 12A7462 12A7362 12A7362 12A7460/ 12A7462
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 5,000 21,000 No Response 21,000 5,000 21,000 21,000 21,000 High Yield

4.17.43 Printer: Magic Card Rio ID Card
Toner Need more Info N/A Color
Manufacturer: Ultra Electronics Magic Magiccard Magiccard No Bid No Bid
Item #: M9006-566 M9005-751 M9005-751 M9005-753 ZEBRA
Yield (copies)/cartridge: No Response N/A 350 1000 Images

4.17.44 Printer: Okidata Microline 390 Turbo
Toner Ribbon
Manufacturer: Okidata Okidata Okidata Okidata Okidata Okidata NuKote Okidata Okidata
Item #: 52104001 52104001 52104001 52104001 52104001 52104001 NUKM249 52104001 52104001
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 2 mil characters 2 million No Response 2000 2,000,000 2,000,000 N/A No Response
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4.17.45 Printer: Panasonic Dot Matrix
Toner Need more Info N/A
Manufacturer: Panasonic Panasonic Panasonic No Response NuKote No Bid Panasonic
Item #: KX-P170 KX-P180 KXP115 NUKBM189 KX-P180
Yield (copies)/cartridge: No Response N/A N/A N/A

4.17.46 Printer: Xerox Docuprint N2825
Toner
Manufacturer: Xerox Xerox West Point Products Xerox Xerox Xerox Xerox Xerox Xerox
Item #: 113K00443 113R00443 See Bid 113R443 113R00443 113R00443 113R443 113R00443 113R00443
Yield (copies)/cartridge: 17,000 17,000 No Response 17,000 17,000 17,000 10,000 17,000 17,000
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Qty Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner Unit Price/Toner
Item 4.17.1. 1 $21.87 $21.98 $25.84 $23.14 $24.00 $23.99 $22.07 $25.00 $17.45
Item 4.17.2. 1 $37.30 $34.61 $16.99 $15.36 $20.00 $15.49 $11.67 $19.00 $14.25
Item 4.17.3. 0 $1.36 N/A $2.29 $1.97 $6.00 $5.99 $1.76 No Bid $3.25
Item 4.17.4. 1 $25.13 $25.91 $29.12 $28.35 $28.00 $26.99 $24.95 $33.00 $26.25
Item 4.17.5. 1 $25.13 $25.91 $29.13 $101.82 $28.00 $26.99 $24.95 $33.00 $25.99
Item 4.17.6. 1 $24.57 $23.89 $28.05 $26.17 $25.50 $23.99 $23.03 $30.00 $23.25
Item 4.17.7. 1 $24.57 $23.89 $28.05 $26.17 $25.50 $23.99 $23.03 $30.00 $23.25
Item 4.17.8. 1 $57.30 $57.10 $61.92 $59.29 $59.00 $59.99 $63.38 $65.00 $54.25
Item 4.17.9. 12 $82.33 $79.97 $92.99 $85.07 $84.00 $81.99 $74.52 $89.00 $79.00
Item 4.17.10. 1 $82.33 $79.97 $92.99 $85.07 $84.00 $81.99 $74.52 $89.00 $79.00
Item 4.17.11. 12 $82.33 $86.39 $92.99 $85.07 $84.00 $81.99 $74.52 $89.00 $79.00
Item 4.17.12. 0 $178.54 N/A $80.39 $63.90 $73.00 $129.99 $108.86 $125.00 $99.00
Item 4.17.13. 1 $98.43 $102.44 $106.88 $101.82 $101.00 $99.99 $85.06 $115.00 $94.50
Item 4.17.14. 6 $93.53 $87.49 $93.88 $76.56 $88.00 $79.99 $90.19 $95.00 $82.50
Item 4.17.15. 7 $104.66 $102.65 $92.34 $108.27 $84.00 $96.99 $95.71 $115.00 $99.00
Item 4.17.16. 2 $104.66 $102.65 $92.34 $108.27 $84.00 $96.99 $95.71 $115.00 $99.00
Item 4.17.17. 1 $82.00 $122.39 $126.08 $124.39 $129.00 $124.99 $129.92 $139.00 $120.00
Item 4.17.18. 1 $83.38 $84.75 $93.88 $86.26 $85.00 $74.99 $92.22 $98.00 $79.25
Item 4.17.19. 0 $33.10 Discontinued $52.12 Discontinued $92.00 $69.99 $91.54 No Bid $105.00
Item 4.17.20. 2 $134.35 $129.93 $151.93 $133.03 $138.00 $134.99 $121.49 $148.00 $127.75
Item 4.17.21. 1 $322.73 $202.88 $190.51 $320.07 $179.00 $309.99 $124.80 $330.00 $159.50
Usage Kit 1 $383.24 $397.69 $442.09 $369.80 $414.00 $479.99 $305.50 $499.00 $760.00
Item 4.17.22. 1 $103.77 $129.90 $330.48 $292.03 $110.00 $309.99 $78.65 $295.00 $260.00
Item 4.17.23. 0 $510.69 N/A $532.04 $297.87 $179.00 $449.99 $259.35 $385.00 $299.00
Item 4.17.24. 1 $168.64 $166.49 $190.36 $162.70 $172.00 $179.99 $119.60 $220.00 $175.00
Photoconductor Kit $154.60 $155.20 $168.82 $149.15 $158.00 $169.99 $109.20 $205.00 $169.00
Maintenance Kit $807.10 $957.95 $948.53 $946.93 $805.00 $899.99 $694.85 $1,194.00 $850.00
Item 4.17.25. 4 $250.25 $258.00 $119.41 $242.89 $255.00 $239.99 $206.05 $259.00 $229.00
Usage Kit $565.49 $552.00 $613.82 $545.65 $565.00 $579.99 $425.75 $710.00 $540.00
Item 4.17.26. 1 $178.10 $182.00 $77.12 $172.37 $183.00 $189.99 $141.05 $170.00 $165.00
Item 4.17.27. 0 Item N/A N/A $113.46 $224.83 $210.00 $229.99 $141.05 $290.00 $189.00
Item 4.17.28. 1 $99.87 $143.00 $153.20 $133.90 $141.00 $139.99 $133.25 $165.00 $129.00
Usage Kit $218.15 $394.00 $382.30 $385.96 $405.00 $449.99 $336.95 $485.00 $425.00
Item 4.17.29.-Black 2 $84.36 $77.89 $88.73 $83.72 $85.00 $81.99 $55.24 $90.00 $69.00
Item 4.17.29.-Cyan $129.01 $114.00 $72.59 $117.45 $71.00 $124.99 No Response $130.00 $109.00
Item 4.17.29.-Magenta $129.01 $114.00 $72.59 $117.45 $71.00 $124.99 No Response $130.00 $109.00
Item 4.17.29.-Yellow $129.01 $114.00 $72.59 $117.45 $71.00 $124.99 No Response $130.00 $109.00
Drum Cartridge $147.88 $114.00 $150.26 $135.11 $150.00 $139.99 No Response $160.00 $120.00
Item 4.17.30.-Cyan $202.19 $104.00 $105.40 $193.09 $104.00 $204.99 $175.50 $215.00 $198.00
Item 4.17.30.-Magenta $202.19 $104.00 $105.40 $193.09 $104.00 $204.99 $175.50 $215.00 $198.00
Item 4.17.30.-Yellow $202.19 $104.00 $105.40 $193.09 $104.00 $204.99 $175.50 $215.00 $198.00
Item 4.17.30.-Black 1 $149.27 $93.00 $94.44 $142.55 $92.00 $154.99 $129.35 $159.00 $140.00
Item 4.17.31.-Cyan $168.68 $173.80 $186.50 $167.02 $180.00 $164.99 $152.75 $195.00 $156.00
Item 4.17.31.-Magenta $168.68 $173.80 $183.05 $167.02 $180.00 $164.99 $152.75 $195.00 $156.00
Item 4.17.31.-Yellow $168.68 $173.80 $186.50 $167.02 $180.00 $164.99 $152.75 $195.00 $156.00
Item 4.17.31.-Black 2 $118.17 $124.69 $129.14 $111.70 $120.00 $109.99 $101.59 $140.00 $106.00
Photo Developer Kit $159.03 $159.00 $156.80 $140.43 $167.00 $149.99 $128.05 $169.00 $129.00
Item 4.17.32.-Cyan $420.64 $218.00 $229.96 $342.55 $213.00 $369.99 $305.82 $449.00 $335.00
Item 4.17.32.-Magenta $420.64 $218.00 $229.96 $342.55 $213.00 $369.99 $305.82 $449.00 $335.00
Item 4.17.32.-Yellow $420.64 $218.00 $228.60 $342.55 $213.00 $369.99 $305.82 $449.00 $335.00
Item 4.17.32.-Black 1 $193.66 $218.00 $127.89 $165.96 $120.00 $184.99 $143.65 $219.00 $145.00
Item 4.17.33.-Cyan $286.78 $192.39 $308.06 $272.34 $293.00 $294.99 $248.30 $310.00 $296.00
Item 4.17.33.-Black 1 $196.05 $192.39 $210.60 $186.17 $200.00 $204.99 $170.30 $219.00 $199.00
Item 4.17.33.-Magenta $286.78 $192.39 $308.06 $272.34 $293.00 $294.99 $248.30 $310.00 $296.00
Item 4.17.33.-Yellow $286.78 $192.39 $308.06 $272.34 $293.00 $294.99 $248.30 $310.00 $296.00
Item 4.17.34. 1 $85.48 $83.15 $124.58 $84.78 $87.00 $89.99 $85.80 $105.00 $120.00
Item 4.17.35. 1 $136.89 $83.15 $90.15 $130.00 $86.00 $99.99 $127.29 $130.00 $104.50
Item 4.17.36. 2 $281.37 $279.00 $255.79 $292.55 $238.00 $229.99 $293.80 $310.00 $295.00
Item 4.17.37. 2 $229.09 $182.00 $193.69 $183.51 $180.00 $179.99 $213.20 $250.00 $185.00
Item 4.17.38.-Black 4 $78.36 $84.79 $91.01 $82.22 $85.00 $59.99 $68.51 $97.00 $65.00
Item 4.17.38.-Cyan $69.99 $79.70 $83.64 $75.56 $78.00 $54.99 $63.70 $91.00 $62.00
Item 4.17.38.-Magenta $69.99 $79.70 $83.64 $75.56 $78.00 $54.99 $63.70 $91.00 $62.00
Item 4.17.38.-Yellow $69.99 $79.70 $83.64 $75.56 $78.00 $54.99 $63.70 $91.00 $62.00
Photoconductor Kit $131.01 $141.00 $157.41 $503.15 $154.00 $119.99 $118.95 $150.00 $99.00
Maintenance Kit $508.46 N/A No Bid $520.48 N/A $509.99 No Bid $690.00 $365.00
Item 4.17.39. 1 $182.03 $193.00 $281.08 $196.81 $280.00 $239.99 $297.70 $349.00 $275.00
Item 4.17.40. 35 $111.75 $118.35 $233.47 $168.98 $215.00 $179.99 $177.45 $226.00 $190.00
Maintenance Kit $552.82 N/A N/A $328.72 N/A $389.99 No Bid $430.00 $410.00
Item 4.17.41. 13 $150.43 $146.55 $150.04 $259.57 $153.00 $249.99 $304.85 $340.00 $256.00
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Item 4.17.42. 8 $101.94 $122.49 $101.89 $272.55 $104.00 $269.99 $319.80 $365.00 $262.00
Item 4.17.43. 0 Need More Info N/A 82.64 104.22 $74.00 12.99 No Bid No Bid 15.95
Item 4.17.44. 3 $8.28 $9.89 $8.69 $8.41 $10.00 $7.99 $5.83 $14.00 $10.25
Item 4.17.45. 0 Need More Info N/A 13.38 15.34 $10.00 No Bid 6.72 No Bid 15.8
Item 4.17.46. 2 $214.71 $198.95 $151.58 $175.53 $220.00 $209.99 $192.40 $220.00 $206.50

TOTAL (Minus 4.17.3, 4.17.12, 4.17.19, 
4.17.23, 4.17.27, 4.17.29-Cyan, 4.17.29-
Magenta, 4.17.29-Yellow, 4.17.29-Drum 
Cartridge, 4.17.38-Maintenance Kit, 4.17.40-
Maintenance Kit, 4.17.43, and 4.17.45) $10,472.53 $9,541.99 $10,254.89 $11,335.83 $9,758.00 $11,200.89 $9,574.56 $13,191.00 $10,982.44

No Bids
American Toner Products, Inc.
CDW
Global Government Solutions
Quill


