
Passenger Vehicle Tires

Tire Size Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only)

1 P195/60 R15
Lemans 
Champion HR 42288 $50.00 $40.00

Firestone 
Affinity LH30 107530 $69.73 $55.67

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-41 $63.16 $53.39

2 P195/70 R14
Firestone 
FR380 148138 $51.00 $41.00

Firestone 
FR380 418138 $58.34 $44.23

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-25 $55.87 $46.10

3 P205/65 R15
Firestone 
FR380 98019 $58.00 $48.00

FirestoneFR71
0 48102 $78.00 $64.00

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-30 $62.53 $52.76

4 P205/70 R15
Firestone 
FR380 98035 $55.00 $45.00

FirestoneFR71
0 47150 $72.00 $58.00

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-29 $61.68 $51.91

5 P215/60 R16
Firestone 
FR380 61991 $65.00 $55.00

Firestone 
FR710 85961 $90.00 $76.00

Handbook 
Radialmax 250-48 $69.07 $59.30

6 P215/70 R14
Firestone 
FR380 98078 $57.00 $47.00

Firestone Indy 
500 119520 $87.00 $73.00

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-46 $64.51 $54.74

7 P215/70 R15
Firestone 
FR380 98116 $58.00 $48.00

Firestone 
FR710 47167 $74.00 $60.00

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-33 $62.80 $53.03

8 P225/60 R16
Firestone 
FR380 62008 $68.00 $58.00

Firestone 
Firehawk Pv41 67911 $82.65 $68.50

Handbook 
Radialmax 520-52 $70.72 $60.95

9 P225/70 R14

Firestone 
Firehawk Indy 
500 118664 $65.00 $55.00

Firestone Indy 
500 118664 $90.93 $76.83 Big O SXP 122-34 $78.17 $68.40

10 P225/70 R15

Firestone 
Firehawk Indy 
500 119679 $66.00 $56.00

Firestone 
Firehawk Pv41 67938 $78.23 $64.12 Big O SXP 122-36 $80.20 $70.43

11 P235/55 R17
Firestone 
FR710 84890 $132.00 $122.00

Firestone 
Firehawk GTZ 77325 $105.00 $91.00 Falken 2E329 2B321701 $115.21 $105.44

12 P235/60 R16
Firestone 
FR710 70372 $85.00 $75.00

Firestone 
FR710 70372 $95.66 $81.55 Falken S/T204 28-261-601 $82.51 $72.74

13 P235/70 R16

Firestone 
Firehawk Indy 
500 123889 $72.00 $62.00

Firestone 
Destination LE 54375 $86.31 $72.20

Big O Sport 
Touring 114-08 $95.51 $85.74

14 P235/75 R15
Firestone 
FR380 98361 $60.00 $50.00

Firestone 
Destination LE 146965 $78.00 $64.00

Hankook Radial 
Max 520-64 $65.27 $55.30
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15 P245/65 R17
Firestone 
Destination LE 40928 $106.00 $96.00

Firestone 
Destination LE 40928 $102.98 $88.87

Big O Sport 
Touring 114-46 $122.20 $112.44

Pickup Truck / SUV / Van Tires
Tire Size Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only)

1 LT 235/70 R16 Destination Le 54375 $86.31 $72.20 Sigma Als cw-53 $92.60 $82.83

2 LT 235/75 R15
Firestone 
Desatione LE 158438 $85.00 $75.00 TransForce HT 189837 $99.11 $85.00 Sigma Als cw-12 $90.50 $77.73

3 LT 235/75 R16 destination LE 54358 $85.76 $71.65 Big I AlT 059-30 $89.60 $79.90
4 LT 235/75 R16
5 LT 235/75 R16

6 LT 235/85 R16
Firestone 
Transforce 189718 $106.00 $96.00 Transforce HT 189718 $112.11 $98.00 Sigma AlLS cw-17 $99.41 $86.64

7 LT 245/65 R16 Destination LE 40928 $102.98 $88.87
8 LT 245/75 R16 Destination LE 147016 $85.78 $71.67 Big O AIT 006-38 $89.12 $79.35
9 LT 245/75 R16

10 LT 245/85 R16
Firestone 
Transforce 189769 $106.00 $96.00 Transforce HT 189769 $112.11 $98.00 Sigma ALS cw-38 $109.56 $99.79

11 LT 265/70 R17 Destination LE 147067 $103.41 $89.30 Big O Sporttour 006-42 $129.22 $116.45
12 LT 265/70 R17

13 LT 265/75 R17
Firestone 
Transforce 200156 $124.00 $114.00 TransForce HT 200156 $137.11 $123.00 Sigma ALS 114-52 $156.47 $143.70

14 LT 265/75 R16
Firestone 
Desatione LE 158710 $107.00 $97.00 Destination LE 158710 $104.92 $90.81 Big O AIT cw-32 $104.76 $91.99

15 LT 265/75 R16 006-57 $117.44 $104.67

16 LT 265/75 R16
Firestone 
Transforce 189786 $110.00 $100.00 TransForce HT 189786 $118.11 $104.00 Big O AIT 074-44 $132.52 $119.75

Aggressive Tread Patern
Tire Size Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only)

17 LT 235/70 R16 Destination AT 90.24 $76.13 $76.13

18 LT 235/75 R15
Firestone 
Desatione A/T 184278 $94.00 $84.00 Transforce AT 108.11 $94.00 $94.00 Mesa c/t mct-12 $104.34 $91.87

19 LT 235/75 R16 Destination AT 89.64 $75.53 $75.53
20 LT 235/75 R16
21 LT 235/75 R16

22 LT 235/85 R17
Firestone 
Transforce 189633 $116.00 $106.00 Transforce AT 122.11 $108.00 $108.00 Mesa c/t mct-17 $116.82 $104.05

23 LT 245/65 R16 Destination AT 110.87 $96.76 $96.76 Yokohama ATS 1252 $125.09 $112.32

24 LT 245/75 R16
Firestone 
Desatione A/T 184295 $113.00 $103.00 Destination XT 109.11 $95.00 $95.00

25 LT 245/75 R16
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26 LT 245/70 R16
Firestone 
Transforce 189582 $116.00 $106.00 Transforce AT 122.11 $108.00 $108.00 Mesa C/T mct-38 $126.32 $113.55

27 LT 265/70 R17
Firestone 
Desatione A/T 192285 $118.00 $108.00 Destination AT 111.54 $97.43 $97.43

28 LT 265/70 R17

29 LT 265/75 R17
Firestone 
Desatione A/T 200190 $147.00 $137.00 Transforce AT 160.11 $146.00 $146.00 Yokohama ATS 1234 $158.30 $145.53

30 LT 265/75 R16
Firestone 
Desatione A/T 184329 $119.00 $109.00 Destination AT 113.11 $99.00 $99.00

31 LT 265/75 R16
Bridgestone 
A/T 153486 $126.00 $116.00 Yokohama ATS 1226 $125.09 $112.32

32 LT 265/75 R16
Firestone 
Transforce 189786 $110.00 $100.00 Transforce AT 130.11 $116.00 $116.00 Yokohama ATS 1254 $140.74 $127.97

33 LT 235/70 R16
Pursuit Tires

Tire Size Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only) Type & Brand Stock No Price Tire (Only)

1 P225/60 R16
Firestone 
Firehawk PV41 67911 $77.00 $67.00

Firestone Fire 
hawk PV41 67911 $82.61 $68.50

Yokohama 
AS430 31407 $92.75 $82.98

2 P235/55/ R17
Fireshone 
Firehawk GTZ 77325 $100.00 $90.00

Firestone Fire 
hawk GTZ 77325 $105.11 $91.00 No Bid

Tire Related Services

1
Tire Repair-In Shop 
(each)

2 Tire Rotation

3
Alignment-Front End 
(each)

4
Alignment-Front and 
rear (each)

5
Computer Balancing of 
Tire (each)

6 Mount Tires

7
Service Call in County 
per hour

8
Sercice Call in County 
per mile

9 Flat Shop Rate per hour

10
Road Hazard Coverage 
per tire $4.00

$5.00

No Bid

No Bid

$65.00

$12.00

$45.00

$45.00

$6.50

Nobid

$55.00

Nobid
$10.00

6% $4

$50.00 $60.00

12%

$8.00
$6.00

Nobid

Nobid

$12.00
$12.00

$45.95

$65.9565.95+parts

45.95+parts

Cost Cost

$15.00$12.00

Cost
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11

Mounting and 
Dismounting Tires (per 
cross section inch)

12
Tire Disposal Fee per 
tire

13
Tire Fee Per Senate Bill 
225

14 Valve Stem

15

List any other Fees or 
Charges not covered by 
aforementioned 
services in Category 4

4.8.
Cooperative 
Purchasing

4.10.
1st Renewal Period 
Maximum % Increase
2nd Renewal Period 
Maximum % Increase

4.11.
Minimum discount off 
retail list

4.12. Additional Warranty

4.13.
Current tires for 
warranty work

4.14.
Road Hazard Coverage 
per tire

Free Replacement for road hazard or 
workmanship and material defect for 
3 years from purchase. Repairable 
tires fixed at no charge. Mounting & 
Balancing charged on replacement 

tire.

Yes

n/a

n/a

n/a
Yes: Repair purchased tires at 

no charge, Pro-rate tires for 
Road Hazared

no bid

Yes

5%

5%

0%

24 Hour road Service

Yes

Prorated(covering all tire 
dammage)

Yes

10%

10%

5%

$1.00

No Bid

No Bid

$2.00

$0.50

$2.00

$6.00

$0.50/tire
No Charge

None$251.51

No bid
$0.50

Nobid

$2.5/ passenger or light truck


