Bid Tabulation
87-14DECO06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

Gil Hebard Guns, Inc.

Gulf States Distributors

Precision Delta Corp

OMB Express

4.7. Less-Lethal Ammunition Estimated| Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended
Rounds Price Price Price Price
4.7.1. |CTS Super Sock 12 gauge 500 No Bid $5.35 2,675.00 No Bid $4.78 $2,390.00
I
4.8. Other Ammunition Estimated
Rounds
4.8.1. No Bid No Bid
American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ 13000 $129.70 $1,686.10 $119.50 $1,553.50
4.8.2. |American Eagle 223, 55 grain, FMJ 20000 $121.45 $4,858.00 $122.00 $4,880.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.3. |Federal F127 RS 12 Gauge 2 3/4” slugs 1000 $86.55 $346.20 $79.00 $316.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.4. [Federal F127 00 12 Gauge 2 3/4” buck 2000 $86.75 $694.00 $79.00 $632.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.5. |7%2" or 8" Birdshot: 12 gauge 2 3/4" 3000 $44.25 $531.00 $36.00 $432.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.6. Sub-Total for Other Ammunition
(4.8.1-4.8.5) $8,115.30 $7,813.50
I I
4.9. Factory Loads Estimated| Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended
Rounds Price Price Price Price
4.9.1. Remington Golden Saber, .40 Caliber 180 . . . .
grain BJHP GSB40SWB 6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9.2. Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 . . . .
grain BJHP GSB45APB 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9.3. Reminton Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, . ] ] ]
BJHP GSBIMMD 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
494, American Eagle .223 62 grain 20000 $124.20 $4,968.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4.9.5. Federal .223 62 grain tactical bonded 2000 $198.14 $1,981.40 $199.00 $1,990.00 No Bid No Bid
4.9.6. Federal .223 55 grain tactical bonded 2000 $198.14 $1,981.40 $199.00 $1,990.00 No Bid No Bid
4.9.7. .308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds . .
TBTL 1000 $210.90 $1.054.50 $217.00 $1,085.00 No Bid No Bid
4.9.8. Sub-Total for factory loads $9.985.30 $10,065.00

(4.9.1.-4.9.7.)




Bid Tabulation
87-14DECO06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

Gil Hebard Guns, Inc.

Gulf States Distributors

Precision Delta Corp

OMB Express

4.10. |Reloads (to be used as practice Estimated| Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended
ammunition) Rounds Price Price Price Price
4.10.1. .40 Caliber 180 Grain. Equivalent to
Remington Golden Saber BJHP 40000 No Bid No Bid $143.00 $5,720.00 No Bid
GSB40SWB
4.10.2. .45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to
Remington Golden Saber BJHP 10000 No Bid No Bid $194.00 $1,940.00 No Bid
GSB45APB
4.10.3. | 9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington
7000 No Bid No Bid $119.00 $833.00 No Bid
Golden Saber BJHP GSBOMMD
4.104. S”"(;T_:’g_’: _f_‘;;%‘_e;‘_’)ads No Bid No Bid $8,493.00 No Bid
4.11. Grand Total for Ammunition
(4.7.1.44.8.6.+4.9.8.+44.10.4.) $18,100.60 $17,878.50 $8,493.00 $2,390.00
4.12. Maximum % Increase for:
% 2nd Year See Bid 8% 2nd Year 10% 2nd Year 5% 2nd Year
8% 3rd Year 10% 3rd Year 10% 3rd Year
% 3rd Year
4.13.  |Minimum Quantity for Order: 1 Case 3 Cases 10,000 Rounds 50 Rounds
4.14. |Delivery ARO See Bid See Bid 30 Days 30 Days
4.15. |Coop? Yes Yes Yes Yes

Note: See bid for what substitutions were bid

No Bids

Zero Ammunition Co
Streicher's

Kiesler Police Supply

Opened By: Heather Turner
Recorded By: Heather Turner

Date: 12/14/2006




