
BID TABULATION 69-14SEP06 TIMING AND SIGNAL CONTROL EQUIPMENT

Item Description Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

4.8.1.

Spectracom 8195B Master Time 
Base Oscillators and all 
Associated Equipment 5 $5,045.00 $25,225.00 No Bid $4,900.00 $24,500.00

4.8.2.
Spectracom 8143 Distribution 
Amplifiers 5 $2,375.00 $11,875.00 No Bid $2,300.00 $11,500.00

4.8.3.
Spectracom 1118-B CTCSS 
Interface Boards 10 $680.00 $6,800.00 No Bid $663.00 $6,630.00

4.8.4. Convex DLP-19 Mounting Panels 10 No Bid $60.00 $600.00 $58.90 $589.00

4.8.5.
Convex VDL-RS-12 Variable 
Delay Line Boards 10 No Bid $705.00 $7,050.00 $700.00 $7,000.00

4.8.6. Convex DAC-12 Power Adapters 10 No Bid $25.00 $250.00 $24.25 $242.50
4.8.7. TOTAL $43,900.00 $7,900.00 $50,461.50

4.9. Warranty?
4.11. COOP?
4.12. Delivery ARO

No Bids
Communications Associates
Columbia Integrated Technologies
Walker & Associates, Inc.
Talley Communications
Central Communications Service Co.
A & W Communications, Inc.
Q Security Solutions
Diebold, Inc.
Mo. Comm. Electronics
Tessco Incorporated

8 Weeks Maximum 6 Weeks
Yes Yes

5 Year Limited Warranty 1 Year Warranty

Midwest Radio Systems

Spectracom-5 Year Factory
Convex-1 Year Factory

No
6-8 Weeks

Spectracom Convex Corporation


