
4.7. Estimated 
Rounds

Unit Price
Extended Price

Unit Price
Extended Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

4.7.1. CTS Super Sock 12 gauge 500 26.75/5 $2,675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00

4.8. Estimated 
Rounds

4.8.1.
13000 $93.06/1000 $1,209.78 $102.68/M $1,334.84 $7.92 $5,148.00

4.8.2. 20000 $63.07/500 $2,522.80 $69.90/500 $2,796.00 $4.56 $4,560.00
4.8.3. 1000 $59.39/250 $237.56 $68.2/250 $272.80 $3.07 $614.00
4.8.4. 2000 $65.21/250 $521.68 $74.40/250 $595.20 $2.69 $1,076.00
4.8.5. 3000 $33.97/250 $407.64 $42.85/250 $514.20 $4.44 $532.80
4.8.6.

$4,899.46 $5,513.04
$11,930.80

4.9.1. 6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.97 $2,872.80

4.9.2. 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.97 $478.80

4.9.3. 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.97 $358.80

4.9.4. 20000 $80.34/500 $3,213.60 $87.27/500 $3,490.80 $5.48 $5,480.00
4.9.5. 2000 141.15/200 $1,411.50 $146.96/200 $1,469.60 No Bid No Bid
4.9.6. 2000 141.15/200 $1,411.50 $146.96/200 $1,469.60 No Bid No Bid
4.9.7. 1000 185.45/200 $927.25 $192.49/200 $962.45 No Bid No Bid

4.9.8. $6,963.85 $7,392.45 $9,190.40

Remington Golden Saber, .40 Caliber 180 
grain BJHP GSB40SWB

Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 
grain BJHP GSB45APB

Reminton Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, 
BJHP GSB9MMD

Sub-Total for factory loads
(4.9.1.-4.9.7.)

American Eagle .223 62 grain
Federal .223 62 grain tactical bonded
Federal .223 55 grain tactical bonded
.308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds 

TBTL

Gil Hebard Guns, Inc. Cheaper Than Dirt

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price  Extended Price 

Gulf States Distributors

4.9.

7½” or 8” Birdshot: 12 gauge 2 3/4"
Sub-Total for Other Ammunition

(4.8.1-4.8.5)

Extended PriceFactory Loads Unit Price Estimated 
Rounds 

Federal F127 00 12 Gauge 2 3/4” buck

American Eagle 223, 55 grain, FMJ
Federal F127 RS 12 Gauge 2 3/4” slugs

Less-Lethal Ammunition

Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ

Other Ammunition
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Gil Hebard Guns, Inc. Cheaper Than DirtGulf States Distributors

Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

4.10.1.

40000 No Bid No Bid $127.40/M $5,096.00 $11.97 $19,152.00

4.10.2.

10000 No Bid No Bid $147.80/M $1,478.00 $11.97 $4,788.00

4.10.3.

7000 No Bid No Bid $102.87/M $720.09 $8.97 $2,511.60

4.10.4.

$7,294.09 $26,451.60

4.12.

4.13.
4.14.
4.15.

NO Bids Opened By: Melinda Bobbitt
Kiesler Polic Supply Recorded By: Tyson Boldan
Streicher's Date: 3/11/06

Note: See bid for what substitutions were bid

5% & 5%

Delivery ARO

.40 Caliber 180 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB40SWB

Maximum % Increase for:
__________% 2nd Year
__________% 3rd Year

Minimum Quantity for Order:
5-60 Days

Coop? Yes No Bid
7-10 Days

No Bid0%

Per Box

$47,572.80

Extended 
Price

$20,199.58

Unit Price

Yes

$14,538.31

20-40 Days/All 223 cal 60-90 Days
1 CaseOne Case

Unit Price

4.11. Grand Total for Ammunition 

(4.7.1.+4.8.6.+4.9.8.+4.10.4.)

Extended PriceUnit Price

.45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB45APB
9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington 

Golden Saber BJHP GSB9MMD
Sub-Total for Reloads

(4.10.1.-4.10.3.)

 Extended Price 4.10. Reloads (to be used as practice 
ammunition)

Estimated 
Rounds
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4.7. Estimated 
Rounds

4.7.1. CTS Super Sock 12 gauge 500

4.8. Estimated 
Rounds

4.8.1.
13000

4.8.2. 20000
4.8.3. 1000
4.8.4. 2000
4.8.5. 3000
4.8.6.

4.9.1. 6000

4.9.2. 1000

4.9.3. 1000

4.9.4. 20000
4.9.5. 2000
4.9.6. 2000
4.9.7. 1000

4.9.8.

Remington Golden Saber, .40 Caliber 180 
grain BJHP GSB40SWB

Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 
grain BJHP GSB45APB

Reminton Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, 
BJHP GSB9MMD

Sub-Total for factory loads
(4.9.1.-4.9.7.)

American Eagle .223 62 grain
Federal .223 62 grain tactical bonded
Federal .223 55 grain tactical bonded
.308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds 

TBTL

4.9.

7½” or 8” Birdshot: 12 gauge 2 3/4"
Sub-Total for Other Ammunition

(4.8.1-4.8.5)

Factory Loads Estimated 
Rounds 

Federal F127 00 12 Gauge 2 3/4” buck

American Eagle 223, 55 grain, FMJ
Federal F127 RS 12 Gauge 2 3/4” slugs

Less-Lethal Ammunition

Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ

Other Ammunition

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price
Extended Price

Unit Price
Extended Price

3.75 ea $1,875.00 5.40 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

The Hunting Shack

Extended PriceUnit Price 

Precision Delta Corp.

Unit Price Extended PriceUnit Price Extended 
Price

ALS Technologies 
Inc.
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Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

4.10.1.

40000

4.10.2.

10000

4.10.3.

7000

4.10.4.

4.12.

4.13.
4.14.
4.15.

NO Bids Opened By: 
Kiesler Polic Supply Recorded By: 
Streicher's

Note: See bid for what substitutions were bid

Delivery ARO

.40 Caliber 180 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB40SWB

Maximum % Increase for:
__________% 2nd Year
__________% 3rd Year

Minimum Quantity for Order:

Coop?

4.11. Grand Total for Ammunition 

(4.7.1.+4.8.6.+4.9.8.+4.10.4.)

.45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB45APB
9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington 

Golden Saber BJHP GSB9MMD
Sub-Total for Reloads

(4.10.1.-4.10.3.)

4.10. Reloads (to be used as practice 
ammunition)

Estimated 
Rounds

The Hunting ShackPrecision Delta Corp.
ALS Technologies 

Inc.

No Bid No Bid $.124 W/Brass $.13 W/No Brass
With brass 

Exchange/without brass 
$4960.00/$5200.00

$169.99/M ($10/m 
for brass credit)

$6,799.60

No Bid No Bid $.149 W/Brass $.178 W/No Bass
 With brass 

Exchange/without brass 
$1490.00/$1780.00

$199.99/M ($20/m 
for brass credit)

$1,999.90

No Bid No Bid $.11 W/Brass $.1155 W/No Brass
 With brass 

Exchange/without brass    
$770.00/$808.50

$145.99/M ($10/m 
for brass credit)

$1,021.93

No Bid No Bid
With brass 

Exchange/without brass 
$7220.00/$7788.50 $9,821.43

$9,821.43

Extended PriceUnit Price

No Bid

30 Days
Yes

250 Rounds

6% & 6%

10000-total (Remanufactured)
15-30 Days

Yes

With brass 
Exchange/without brass 

$9920.00/$10488.50

Unit Price Extended PriceUnit Price Extended 
Price

5% / 7%

1000
30

Yes
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4.7. Estimated 
Rounds

4.7.1. CTS Super Sock 12 gauge 500

4.8. Estimated 
Rounds

4.8.1.
13000

4.8.2. 20000
4.8.3. 1000
4.8.4. 2000
4.8.5. 3000
4.8.6.

4.9.1. 6000

4.9.2. 1000

4.9.3. 1000

4.9.4. 20000
4.9.5. 2000
4.9.6. 2000
4.9.7. 1000

4.9.8.

Remington Golden Saber, .40 Caliber 180 
grain BJHP GSB40SWB

Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 
grain BJHP GSB45APB

Reminton Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, 
BJHP GSB9MMD

Sub-Total for factory loads
(4.9.1.-4.9.7.)

American Eagle .223 62 grain
Federal .223 62 grain tactical bonded
Federal .223 55 grain tactical bonded
.308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds 

TBTL

4.9.

7½” or 8” Birdshot: 12 gauge 2 3/4"
Sub-Total for Other Ammunition

(4.8.1-4.8.5)

Factory Loads Estimated 
Rounds 

Federal F127 00 12 Gauge 2 3/4” buck

American Eagle 223, 55 grain, FMJ
Federal F127 RS 12 Gauge 2 3/4” slugs

Less-Lethal Ammunition

Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ

Other Ammunition

Unit Price
Extended Price

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Unit Price Extended Price

Black Hills Ammunition
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Bid Tabulation
39-11MAY06 - Ammunition Term & Supply

4.10.1.

40000

4.10.2.

10000

4.10.3.

7000

4.10.4.

4.12.

4.13.
4.14.
4.15.

NO Bids Opened By: 
Kiesler Polic Supply Recorded By: 
Streicher's

Note: See bid for what substitutions were bid

Delivery ARO

.40 Caliber 180 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB40SWB

Maximum % Increase for:
__________% 2nd Year
__________% 3rd Year

Minimum Quantity for Order:

Coop?

4.11. Grand Total for Ammunition 

(4.7.1.+4.8.6.+4.9.8.+4.10.4.)

.45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to 

Remington Golden Saber BJHP 

GSB45APB
9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington 

Golden Saber BJHP GSB9MMD
Sub-Total for Reloads

(4.10.1.-4.10.3.)

4.10. Reloads (to be used as practice 
ammunition)

Estimated 
Rounds

Black Hills Ammunition

$89.50/500 $7,160.00

$109.50/500 $2,190.00

$149.50/1000 $1,046.50

$10,396.50

No Bid

1000 Rounds
0-45 Days

Yes

$10,396.50

Unit Price Extended Price
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