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Huber & Associates KS Engineering, LLC Southern Computer Warehouse SDF Professional Computers
4.8. PRICING Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total
Powerware Model 9355
4.8.1. |Part# KA1521100000010 1 $11,358.00 $11,358.00 $10,932.00 $10,932.00 $8,535.00 $8,535.00 $8,519.62 $8,519.62
Powerware Can Bridge Card
4.8.2. |Part#103004336 2 $215.00 $430.00 $324.00 $648.00 $284.00 $568.00 $275.12 $550.24
Powerware Ethernet Card
4.8.3. |Part# 103002974-5501 2 $227.00 $454.00 $207.00 $414.00 $168.80 $337.60 $168.01 $336.02
4.8.4. |Shipping Charge $200.00 $170.00 $250.00 $0.00
4.8.5. |Grand Total (4.8.1-4.8.4) $12,442.00 $12,164.00 $9,690.60 $9,405.88
Year 1: $0.00 Year 1: Included Year 1: $2,273.20 Year 1: No Bid
Powerware Extended Year 2: $0.00 Year 2: $2,648.00 Year 2: $2,273.20 Year 2: No Bid
4.9. Maintenance Part #PT82N- Year 3: $0.00 Year 3: $2,648.00 Year 3: $2,273.20 Year 3: No Bid
933515 (or equivalent) Year 4: $0.00 Year 4: $2,648.00 Year 4: $2,273.20 Year 4: No Bid
Year 5: $0.00 Year 5: $2,648.00 Year 5: $2,273.20 Year 5: No Bid
4.9.1. |Total for all years $0.00 $10,592.00 $11,366.00 No Bid
4.13. |CO-OP Yes No Yes Yes
4.14. |ARO 3 Weeks 3 Weeks 10-15 Days 7-10 Days
CDW Government, Inc. Aprisa Technology Howard Computers DC Group, Inc.
4.8. PRICING Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total
Powerware Model 9355
4.8.1. |Part# KA1521100000010 1 $8,649.00 $8,649.00 $8,488.00 $8,488.00 $10,220.00 $10,220.00 $9,933.00 $9,933.00
Powerware Can Bridge Card
4.8.2. |Part#103004336 2 $278.00 $556.00 $288.00 $576.00 $326.00 $652.00 $301.00 $602.00
Powerware Ethernet Card
4.8.3. |Part# 103002974-5501 2 $172.00 $344.00 $178.00 $356.00 $196.00 $392.00 $181.00 $362.00
4.8.4. |Shipping Charge $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $630.00
4.8.5. |Grand Total (4.8.1-4.8.4) $9,549.00 $9,420.00 $11,264.00 $11,527.00
Year 1: $2,399.00 Year 1: $2,288.00 Year 1: $2,519.00 Year 1: $2,344.00
Powerware Extended Year 2: $2,399.00 Year 2: $2,288.00 Year 2: $2,519.00 Year 2: $2,344.00
4.9.  |Maintenance Part #PT82N- Year 3: $2,399.00 Year 3: $2,288.00 Year 3: $2,519.00 Year 3: $2,344.00
933515 (or equivalent) Year 4: $2,399.00 Year 4: $2,288.00 Year 4: $2,519.00 Year 4: $2,344.00
Year 5: $2,399.00 Year 5: $2,288.00 Year 5: $2,519.00 Year 5: $2,344.00
4.9.1. |Total for all years $11,995.00 $11,440.00 $12,595.00 $11,720.00
4.13. |CO-OP No Yes Yes Yes
4.14. |ARO 2-10 Days 15 Days 14 Days 45 Days
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CDS Office Technologies Tech Depot Critical Systems Services Micro League, Inc.
4.8. PRICING Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total
Powerware Model 9355
4.8.1. |Part# KA1521100000010 1 $8,691.00 $8,691.00 $8,569.00 $8,569.00 $12,130.00 $12,130.00 $8,775.20 $8,775.20
Powerware Can Bridge Card
4.8.2. |Part#103004336 2 $283.00 $566.00 $272.00 $544.00 $329.00 $658.00 $283.60 $567.20
Powerware Ethernet Card
4.8.3. |Part# 103002974-5501 2 $165.00 $330.00 $162.00 $324.00 $329.00 $658.00 $331.52 $663.04
4.8.4. [Shipping Charge $150.00 $300.00 $325.00 $300.00
4.8.5. |Grand Total (4.8.1-4.8.4) $9,737.00 $9,737.00 $13,771.00 $10,305.44
Year 1: $2,332.00 Year 1: No Bid Year 1: $3,861.00 Year 1: $2,333.81
Powerware Extended Year 2: $2,332.00 Year 2: No Bid Year 2: $3,751.00 Year 2: $2,333.81
4.9.  |Maintenance Part #PT82N- Year 3: $2,332.00 Year 3: No Bid Year 3: $3,641.00 Year 3: $2,333.81
933515 (or equivalent) Year 4: $2,332.00 Year 4: No Bid Year 4: $3,531.00 Year 4: $2,333.81
Year 5: $2,332.00 Year 5: No Bid Year 5: $3,361.00 Year 5: $2,333.81
4.9.1. |Total for all years $11,660.00 No Bid $18,145.00 $11,669.05
4.13. |CO-OP Yes Yes Yes Yes
4.14. |ARO 2 Weeks No Response 7 Days 10 Days

En Pointe Technologies Sales

4.8. PRICING Qty Unit Price Extended Total
Powerware Model 9355
4.8.1. |Part# KA1521100000010 1 $8,455.86 $8,455.86
Powerware Can Bridge Card
4.8.2. |Part#103004336 2 $267.04 $534.08
Powerware Ethernet Card
4.8.3. |Part# 103002974-5501 2 $160.02 $320.04
4.8.4. |Shipping Charge $0.00
4.8.5. |Grand Total (4.8.1-4.8.4) $9,309.98
Year 1: $0.00
Powerware Extended Year 2: $2,249.75
4.9. Maintenance Part #PT82N- Year 3: $4,499.50
933515 (or equivalent) Year 4: $6.749.25
Year 5: $8,999.00
4.9.1. |Total for all years $22,497.50
4.13. |CO-OP Yes
4.14. |ARO 10 Days




