
BID TABULATION
21-16MAR06 LAW ENFORCEMENT PURSUIT TIRES

Cross-Midwest Tire McKnight Tire & Auto Ewers Tires & Service Firestone
4.7. Pricing
4.7.1. Size: P225/60-R16

Type & Brand Firestone PV-41
Firestone PV-41 & 

Firestone PVS Goodyear Eagle RSA Firestone PV-41

Stock No. 67911
PV-41-067-911
PVS-098-388 732354148 067-911

Tire Only Price $63.50
PV-41-$68.11
PVS-$74.93 $74.18 $65.21

Additional Tire Related 
Services

4.7.2. Tire Repair-In Shop (Ea) $13.00 $14.95 $15.00 $14.99
4.7.3. Tire Rotation N/C $10.00 Not Included $20.00
4.7.4. Alignment-Front End (Ea) $45.95 + parts $36.95 + parts $44.95 $45.00
4.7.5. Computer Balancing of Tire (Ea) $8.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.99
4.7.6. Alignment-Front and Rear (Ea) $65.95 + parts $60.00 + parts $59.95 $45.00
4.7.7. Service Call in County (Per Hour) $55.00

$45.00, after hours-
$65.00 No Bid No Bid

4.7.8. Service Call in County (Per Mile) N/C N/C No Bid No Bid

4.7.9. Flat Shop Rate (Per Hour) $55.00 $55.00 $70.00 $68.00

4.7.10. Road Hazard Coverage (Per Tire) 6% or $3.81/tire $15.50 No Bid 10%

4.7.11.
Mounting & Dismounting (per 
cross section inch) $4.00 $5.50 $8.00 No Bid

4.7.12. Tire Disposal (per tire) $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00

4.7.13. Tire Fee Per Senate Bill 225 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50

4.7.14. Valve Stem N/C $1.50 $3.00 $1.00

4.7.15. TOTAL

4.8.

Minimum % Discount for all 
products introduced after contract 
inception

Current government 
price 0% No Other Products 0%
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4.9. 1st Renewal % 5% 5%
Not Interested in 

Renewing 10%
4.10. References Included? Yes Yes No No

4.11. Addl. Services & Warranties?
24 hour road service, 

365 days/year See Bid None Full service shop

4.11.1.
Current Tires Accepted for 
Warranty Work? Yes See Bid No No

4.12.
Road Hazard Coverage 
Information See Bid See Bid No Road Hazard

Free flat repair, pro-
rate tire if not 

repairable

4.14. Co-op? Yes Yes No Yes


