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4.7
Pricing

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

4.7.1.
Self Propelled Single 

Smooth Drum 
Vibratory Roller $141.74 $4,090.00 2 $602.00 $5,100.00 1-5 Days

Make 
Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.2.
Self Propelled Single 

Drum Padfoot 
Vibratory Roller $141.74 $4,090.00 2 $602.00 $5,780.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $2,250.00 7

Make Hamm

Model 2210 SSD

Year 1997

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.3.
Self Propelled 

Pneumatic Roller 
Compactor $73.01 $2,970.00 3 $602.00 $5,270.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $1,950.00 7

Make 
Model
Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.4. Crawler Dozer $304.29 $7,450.00 2 $500.00 $12,325.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $3,750.00 7 None $7,000.00 30

Make 
Model
Year

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.5. Trackhoe/Excavator $206.66 $5,200.00 2 $550.00 $5,900.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $4,500.00 Not Included None $4,500.00 30
Make 
Model

Year
Current Hr. Reading

Hamm
3410

2005

Cooke Sales & Service Crown Power & EquipmentRoland Machinery Co. Fabick CAT

65

Hamm

3410

2005

80

Rosco
Tru Pac 915

2005
96

Komatsu
065PX-15

2005
303

Komatsu
Pc200LG7

2006
2

 Cat
CS563

2005

171

Cat

CP563

2005

63

Cat
PS360
2001
1043

Cat
D7R
2006
18

Cat
320

2004
2177

Not Included

Ferguson
46-A
1965

Not Included

Not Included

Cat
D5 or D6

1983

John Deere
690

1995
Not Included

Not Included

1850 K Case
1850K
2004

Case
CX210

2006
Not Included

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Cooke Sales & Service Crown Power & EquipmentRoland Machinery Co. Fabick CAT

4.7.5.1. Hydraulic Quick 
Coupler N/A N/C 1-5 Days None $300.00 60

Make 

Model

Year
4.7.5.2. Hydraulic Breaker $100.00 $5,355.00 2 N/A $5,900.00 1-5 Days None $4,500.00 30

Make 

Model
Year

4.7.5.3. 36" Severe Duty 
Bucket N/A $225.00 1-5 Days None $300.00 30

Make 
Model
Year

4.7.5.4. 60" Ditching Bucket $0.00 $300.00 2 N/A $225.00 1-5 Days None $300.00 30
Make 
Model
Year

4.7.6. Backhoe 4WD $404.30 $1,700.00 2 $450.00 $2,775.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $2,250.00 7 None $1,800.00 10

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading

Included w/cost of Excavator

Not Included

Not Included

2005

Tramac

V32 5000FT LB
2005

Included w/cost of Excavator

Not Included
Not Included

2005

Bsco
60" Ditch

2005

Komatsu

WB140

2004

Not Included

Not Included

Not Included

Not Included

Cat

H130
N/A

Cat-Machine comes with 1 bucket
HD36
N/A

Cat-Machine comes with 1 bucket
72"
N/A

Cat

420

2004

213

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

JCB

214

2005

Not Included

C&P

Not Included

2006

Allied

Not Included

Case

580SM

2006

2005

Case
Not Included

2006

E66N
2005

Case
Not Included
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Cooke Sales & Service Crown Power & EquipmentRoland Machinery Co. Fabick CAT

4.7.7.
Self Propelled Water 

Tanker Distributor N/A N/A 1-5 Days

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.8. Finishing Dozer $135.46 $3,000.00 2 $500.00 $3,300.00 1-5 Days $65/hour $2,250.00 7 None $2,700.00 30

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.9. Total

4.8. Field Service

4.8.1. Hourly Labor Charge

4.8.2. Trip Setup or Trip Fee
4.8.3. Mileage Fee Per Mile

4.9. Renewal %
Max increase 2nd 2% 0% 0% 1%
Max increase 3nd 2% 0% 0% 1%
Max increase 4nd 2% 0% 0% 1%

4.11. Coop Yes Yes Yes Yes

Sydenstricker 

4.9.1.

No Bids

No Bid

Komatsu

D37EX

2005

103

$88.00

$0.00
$2.25

(Price cost per field service includes 
parts, labor, and travel time within 20 mile 

radius)

Not Included

Not Included

Not Included

Not Included

Cat

D3G

2005

269

Komatsu

D21A

1997

No Bid

Not Included

$65.00

None
$1.00

$72.00

$0.00
$3.75

Case

750K

2005

Not Included

No Bid
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4.7
Pricing

4.7.1.
Self Propelled Single 

Smooth Drum 
Vibratory Roller

Make 
Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.2.
Self Propelled Single 

Drum Padfoot 
Vibratory Roller

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.3.
Self Propelled 

Pneumatic Roller 
Compactor

Make 
Model
Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.4. Crawler Dozer

Make 
Model
Year

Current Hr. Reading

4.7.5. Trackhoe/Excavator
Make 
Model

Year
Current Hr. Reading

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

Parts Cost 
Per Field 
Service

Monthly 
Lease Cost

Delivery Date 
ARO

N/C $3,832.00 4

N/C $3,832.00 4 $250.00 $6,500.00 10

$250.00 $4,000.00 10

$250.00 $7,000.00 10

N/C $4,500.00 4 $250.00 $5,500.00 10

Tri-State Construction Equipment Co.Hertz Equipment Rental

Not Included

John Deere
200 L-LL

2005

SD100D

2003 or newer

Upon Request

No Bid

C530AH

John Deere
850S
2006

Not Included

No Bid

IR

SD100 D

2003 or newer

Upon Request

IR

John Deere
200CLC

2003 or newer
Upon Request

No Bid

Bomag

BW213PDH3

Not Included

Not Included

Not Included
Not Included

Hypac
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4.7.5.1. Hydraulic Quick 
Coupler

Make 

Model

Year
4.7.5.2. Hydraulic Breaker

Make 

Model
Year

4.7.5.3. 36" Severe Duty 
Bucket

Make 
Model
Year

4.7.5.4. 60" Ditching Bucket
Make 
Model
Year

4.7.6. Backhoe 4WD

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading

Tri-State Construction Equipment Co.Hertz Equipment Rental

N/A $200.00 10

N/A $5,200.00 10

$250.00 $500.00 10

N/A $500.00 10

N/C $1,650.00 4 $250.00 $2,600.00 10

John Deere

310SG

2005-2006

250

Not Included
Not Included

Not Included
Not Included

John Deere

NPK

E210
2005

John Deere

Not Included

Not Included

JRBNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Case/John Deere

580L or 580M/ 310E or 310G

2003 or newer

Upon Request
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4.7.7.
Self Propelled Water 

Tanker Distributor

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.8. Finishing Dozer

Make 

Model

Year

Current Hr. Reading
4.7.9. Total

4.8. Field Service

4.8.1. Hourly Labor Charge

4.8.2. Trip Setup or Trip Fee
4.8.3. Mileage Fee Per Mile

4.9. Renewal %
Max increase 2nd
Max increase 3nd
Max increase 4nd

4.11. Coop

4.9.1.

Tri-State Construction Equipment Co.Hertz Equipment Rental

N/C $3,850.00 4

N/C $2,600.00 4 $250.00 $3,500.00 10

5% 5 5%
5% 5%
5% 5%
Yes Yes

All equipment will be 2005-2006 models 
with 750 hours or less

$80.00

$150.00
$1.50

John Deere

450J

2005

250

No Bid

Delivery Charge of $75/truckload if 
needed

IH/ Freightliner

4900-01/FL80

2003 or newer

Upon Request

John Deere

550G or 550H

2003 or newer

Upon Request

N/C

N/C
N/C


