
BID TABULATION
15-14MAR06 SHERIFF DEPARTMENT SECURITY CAMERAS TERM SUPPLY

North American Video Primary Systems Bio Met Access Will Electronics
Northern Video 
Systems, Inc. Security Resource

Cam-Dex Security 
Corp.

Columbia Integrated 
Technologies

4.8.
 Qty Per 

Order
4.8.1. 1 to 5  $                      126.00  $                      137.28  $                        111.00  $                      149.00  $                       115.00  $                      146.00  $                      144.00  $                      129.44 

6 to 10  $                      124.00  $                      136.32  $                        111.00  $                      149.00  $                       115.00  $                      146.00  $                      144.00  $                      129.44 
11 to 16  $                      119.00  $                      135.36  $                        111.00  $                      149.00  $                       115.00  $                      146.00  $                      144.00  $                      129.44 

Maufacturer: Sanyo Samsung Ganz Sanyo ARM Sanyo Sanyo Sanyo
Model: VCB SCC-331A FCH-62 VCB-3384 B600 (specs att.) VCB3384 VCB-3384 VCB-3384

4.8.1.1.

Add Alternate: Audio 
for use with camera 
in section 4.8.1. 165.00 each No Bid 50.00$                          N/A No Bid 236.00$                       No Bid No Bid

4.8.2. 1 to 5  $                      112.00  $                      154.44  $                        148.00  $                      129.00  $                       105.00  $                      146.00  No Bid  $                      336.60 
6 to 10  $                      110.00  $                      153.36  $                        148.00  $                      129.00  $                       105.00  $                      146.00  No Bid  $                      336.60 

11 to 16  $                      108.00  $                      152.28  $                        148.00  $                      129.00  $                       105.00  $                      146.00  No Bid  $                      336.60 
Maufacturer: Everfocus Samsung Ganz Everfocus KTL (specs att.) Everfocus Sanyo

Model: EQ350 SCC-131B VCH-02A EQ350 CPC 4008AC EQ 350 VCC-ZM300

4.8.2.1.

Add Alternate: Audio 
for use with camera 
in section 4.8.2. 165.00 Each No Bid 50.00$                          N/A No Bid 236.00$                       No Bid No Bid

4.8.3 1-5 Lens 38.00$                         61.49$                         59.00$                          73.00$                         69.00$                          68.00$                         67.50$                         100.98$                       
6-10 Lens 37.00$                         61.06$                         59.00$                          73.00$                         69.00$                          68.00$                         67.50$                         100.98$                       
11-16 Lens 36.00$                         60.63$                         59.00$                          73.00$                         69.00$                          68.00$                         67.50$                         100.98$                       

Maufacturer: NAV Fujinon Computar Panasonic ARM (specs att.) ARM Panasonic Computar

Model: NAV 2.7-13.5mm YV5X27R4B-SA2L TG4Z2813FCS PLZ27/5DN VL2811AI (2.8-12MM) VL2812AI PLZ27/5DN TG4Z2813AFCS

4.8.4 1-5 Lens 53.00$                                   100.1 98 109.00$                       89 111 100.00$                       143.82$                       
6-10 Lens 52.00$                                   99.4 98 109.00$                       89 111 100.00$                       143.82$                       
11-16 Lens 51.00$                                   98.7 98 109.00$                       89 111 100.00$                       143.82$                       

Maufacturer: NAV Fujinon Computar Panasonic KTL ARM Panasonic Computar

Model: 5-50mm YV10XSR4A-SA2L TG1020513FCS PLZ5/10 LNS055DAI-specs att. VL550AI PLZ5/10 TG10Z0513AFCS

4.8.5 1-5 Lens 46.00$                                   51.48 49 48.00$                         64 61 47.00$                         45.90$                         
6-10 Lens 45.00$                                   51.12 49 48.00$                         64 61 47.00$                         45.90$                         
11-16 Lens 44.00$                                   50.76 49 48.00$                         64 61 47.00$                         45.90$                         

Maufacturer: NAV Fujinon Computar Computar KTL (specs att.) North American Computar Computar

Model: 2.9-8mm YF8A-SA2LB TG0812FCS TG0812FCS LNS008AI TG0812FCS TG0812FCS TG0812FCS

4.9.
% Discount off other 
products 40% 0% 0% N/A 0% 3% 0% 0%

4.10. Renewal Option
2nd Year 4% 1% 0% 0% 0% 0% 2% Market Cost
3rd Year 6% 2% 0% 0% 0% 0% 2% Market Cost

4.11. Co-op Purchasing Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

4.12. Warranty

Lenses have lifetime 
warranty

Camera has 3 yr 
warranty 1 Year Parts Warranty 1 Year

One year DEPOT 
warranty, parts & labor 

included 1 Year
Manufacturer's 
Warranty

One Year from 
manufacturer

Full Manufacturer's 
Warranty

4.13. ARO 7-10 Days 7-10 Days 15 Days 14 Days 5 Days 10 Days 21 Days 14-21 Days
No Bids

Security Camers: 
Black & White - per 
section 2.2.1.

Security Camera: 
Color-per section 
2.2.3.

Lens: North 
American # NAV2.7 - 
13.5MM

Lens: North 
American # NAV5 - 
50MM DC Auto Iris 
Day/Night Lens

Lens:  North 
American 
#TG0812FCS - 8mm 
Auto Iris Lens

Central Security Systems
DSSI Corporation
Q Security Solutions
Digatron 


