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August Session of the July Adjourned

27th

3ll -zo2o

Tcm.2A20

dry of August 2020In thc Cornþ Conml¡¡lon of cdd county' on thc

thc foltorlng, rnong olhcr pltccedln8¡' wcre h¡d' vlz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby certiff that we
have examined the attached statement of the surplus from sale of delinquent lands held the 24th

day of August 2020 and approve the same.

Done this 2Tthday of August 2020.

2a.rtU K. &far"U
Daniel K. Atwill

ng
ATTEST:

L. Lennon
Clerk <lf the County Commission

M. Thompson
II Commissioner

I



2O2O BOONE COUNTY I-AND SALE SURPLUS

Brian N4cooltum, Collector of Revenue, Boone County, M¡ssouri, declares the sum of $45,673.62 (Forry-Flve Thousand Slx Hundred Sevenv-Three Dollars and SlxV-Two

Cents) to þe the surplus amount from the sale held August 24, 2020, for the purpose of satisfying taxes, special assessmerìts, interest and costs on lots and lands having

morethanoneyeardelinquencyonrealestâtetaxesandspecialassessments. Sa¡dsumshallþeturnedovertotheBooneCountyTreasurertobeheldforbenefitofschool
fund unless claimed by owner prior to three years from date of sale. 5140.230, RSN4o

Owner: Miller Erectors lnc

Parcel: 03-107-05-01-001.00
Purchaser: Alex lvlaginness

Owner: Rebecca E Henley

Parcel: 03-600-23-00-008.00
Purchaser: Kâranbir Singh Sandhu

owner: Fred Bradley

Parcel: 12-100-08-00-002.00

Purchaser: Eleazar Gonzalez

owner: Bonnie J McBride

Parcel: 12-703-00-03-027.00
Purchaser: Karanbir S¡ngh Sândhu

Owner: Landmark Builders lnc

Parcel: 12-804-00-09-064.00
Purchaser: Offered - No Bid

Owner: Ralph & Diana Hennerich
Pârcel: 16-211-00-03-002.00

Purchaser: Offered - No Bid

Owner: Maria Syllâ

Parcel: 16-306-00-02-146.00
Purchaser: Karanbir Singh Sandhu

owner: Harriet lvlurline Levings & Kevin Proctor

il

Parcel: 17-509-16-01-015.00

Purchaser: Offered - No Bid

owner: Raven Nichols

Parceli L7 -5t3-2L-01-113.00
Purchaser: Offered - No Bid

owner: Glen D McBride Jr

Pârcel: 17-701-00-10-010.00
Purchaser: Karanb¡r S¡ngh Sandhu

owner: Blâke Investments of Columþia LLC

Parcel: 21-900-00-02-005.00
Purchaser: Karanbir S¡ngh Sandhu

A portion of the swy+ NWY+ sec 23 T51N R12W as shown in Sur Book/Page surplus
4881-18

Sec 08 T49 R12 Sold

3O2O E KETTERER RD TAXES & COSTS

Calculated 1.7 Acres Beg at a point on the W line of the NEy4 of Sec 8 shown Surplus

by sur rec Booly'Page 723-305, said pt þeing shown ¡n Ketterer Rd; thence

alongsâid sur, N49"39'E,31.46'; thence S88'57'E, 768.45'; thence

S40"39'E, 102.99'to S line of Ny2 SWy4 NEy4 Sec 8; thence leaving said

Ketterer Rd & followingsaid s line, s89'06'w,859.19'to a point on the y4

sec l¡ne of Sec 8; thence along said y4 sec line, N 00'12'W, 85.35'to PoB

as rec QTCL Deed BoolvPage 813/880

Sec 05 T51 R12
2655 E BENSON ST

Lts 10 & 11 of Robinson-Spene and Brice's Northwest SD as shown in Plat

BooVPaÉe 10/160 as rec WD Boot/Page 3589/83

Sec 23 T51 R12

2O4OO N BARNES RD

Sec 31 ï49 R12

4OO1 CITATION DR

127 BelmontVillage Plat No.2 as shown by PlalBoovPage2T/tg

Sec 34 T49 R12

CREVE COEUR DR

164, notfor development, of Maryland Heights SD as shown in Plat

BooVPage 39/60

Sec 03 T48 R13

GARDEN DR

1205 Rosecliff Gardens Plat 2 as shown ¡n Plat Book/Page 30/85

Sec 02 T48 R13
913 WINGHAM DR

1169 Parkade North Plat 7 as shown by PlalBook/Pa4e 20/2L

Sec 16 T48 R12

1310 S EL CHAPARRAL AVE

188 El Chaparal SD Plât #3 as shown in PlalBook/Pagè !L/4

Sec2LT48 Rt2
2131 S ALAMOS PL

1211 El Chaparral Plat #5 as shown ¡n Plat BoolvPage 1!/30

Sec 30 T48 R12

3805 CHURCHILL DR

L10B The Villages SD Plat 2 as shown on Plat BooVPaée 23/2!

Sec 35 T47 R12

ASHLAND INDUSTRIAL PARK

Deeded 2,73 Acres L5A ofAshland lndustr¡al Park Plat 1-A as shown ¡n Plat

Bool<,lPage 42/53

Sold

Tâxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

So¡d

Taxes & Costs

Special Assessment

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

Sold

Taxes & Costs

Surplus

1,533.99
1,533.99

6,28r.92
6,28L.92

1,700.00

656.67

1,043.33

$ 14,000.00
$ 4,469.29
$ 9,530.71

279.43

644.93

$ 14,000.00
$ 4,663.49
$ 9,336.51

5,581.31

5,t47.L7
1,000.00

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$
$

$ 26,000.00
$ 4,888.50

$ 21,111.50

$ 5,5oo.oo
$ 848.43
$ 4,651.57

7 012



ln witness whereof I have hereunto set my hand 
^no ""rr,rn " 

Kday of August 2o2o

{

Subscribed and sworn to before t" tfr¡s á5 day of August 2o2o

Collector of Revenue, Boone County, Missouri

nna L. Len

County Clerk of Boone County, Missouri

2 ol2
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Conty of Boonc

August Session of the July Adjourned

27th
)

G¡.

GERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER
318-zo2o

Ibrm.2020

dry of August n20In lhc Cunty Comnl¡¡lon olreld county' on thc

thr follolln¡n¡nong othor prcccodlng!' wcrc hrd' vlz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
request to hire above the authorized hansfer salary for position number 76, Civil Process Officer,
Boone County Sheriff s Department, and does hereby authorize an applopriation of $50,544 for
the salary of said position.

It is further ordered the Boone County Commissioners are hereby authorized to sign the attached
Request to Transfer Above the Authorized Transfer Salary Form.

Done this 27th day of August 2020.

Da)//)/ K. ,çAt"//
Daniel K. Atwill

ATTEST:

tsrianna L. Lennon
Clerk of the County Commission

M. Thompson
II Commissioner

J



REQUEST TO TRANSFER ABOVI .¡ATS" (Authorized Transfer Salary)
nûünìE Conrr¡ris¡¡ion ûrtler 1,16-200ú

aboyt (tß1 t/]/tt hê¡l trantt r, ilëry],

compl

0t00)
ôtss lhê form anrJ preplres a sc}cdr¡lc thar demonstntÉs ths( flnding is av¡il¡blc withitr thrr

salary and wago opproprirtion (occounl fl ¡ndcalcul¡tc¡lhc¡mountfor¡budgelrêvision,¡fnùeded. Th¿Adnrinir(råtlvcAuthoriry
subm¡ls lhc fotm, thÊ schedulë. rnd the budgal ævirion (íf necdcd) to rho Auditor for ccrtificurion of funtls ovailabitiry.

2 The Aurlilor c¿rtific¡ funrls åv¡i¡eb¡lily, aÞprovôi budgêt fDvirion {ifrpplicôbl¿), retürns origi¡ûl fcr¡t tó rhc Administrrtivê AurhÒrity ¡nd
fonlards a copy lo llun¡n Rcsot¡¡cc Dircclor,

3. Thu Humân Rosourcc Ðirccto¡ r¿views lho rcquclt and providcs rcco¡¡mcndrtirn to ¡hc Âdminisroriyc Authority.
4. 'Iht Adminisl¡ativc Authority rvill schedulc tha roqucsr for rpprovrl by rhc Çonunlssion ond providc the Comniision with thê lln Dl¡cctor'r

rccom¡lenr!alion,
5. ThÊ Cor¡nly Conmlsslon will rcvlcw ¡ll rcquests for

approvrl/denial. thc L-ounty Commi¡sion will rcrunr
¡ ¡(arting salafy abovc lhe "AT.ì" ¡nd will eilhcr npprovc or deny thr rÊgu¿sl. i\firt
thir lorm to thc Admin¡¡tråtivê 

^uthoriry,ó, 'fhc Admirìiilrolivc Àutho¡ìtr witl dnðch r r¿¡sy ofthir ¡pp¡r¡vgd lorm to tho Personnel Âction Form,

Nanrc of prospcctivç Ërnploycûjo!É{ rlavclgg!- 
Dcponmsnr s"dT: _ _

Positior'l C¡vl PßcôB¡ ÐoFiill l'ositron No 7ô

Proposcd Storling Salary (complcrc onc only) Annual;
OR Hourlyt

No. of
Jusrification
)evel) ol

wilh ¿t} öl üffiër. lhnr

in this job classific¡tion within your Departmenr?3_*.._
lhc prospcctivo s cducåtiôn Ànd/or work

'lí of Mid-Point

'ã of Mitj"l'oirt.Lojjl--,----- *^ *
crperiËni:c which su¡pi:rt* this proposed c0mpons¡¡ion
h¡ lrþrrf ìhô rflt ül i,leior !ñd ftôåt rlc.ûily Forlcr CñÌ.1, h; r!|tü, fromuhira

F rrd lh! Esl! to *¡lh 2'l

ll proposcrl trlary cxctcds lçh¡t
c.{ccr:tls odlgrs

lVhar cffcct, if will
I dô tþa

hcve on with in your ofli* rrnd/or positions in otþr office$?
ir* ürlorcarËñl

Arltli tìona! r:r)m m¿¡t,{: *

Adñi nislrûtivê Aurhoríty's

A0ditor's

A

Hum¡n Resource Dtrector's Signåtürðt

Cqunty

Date:

Fund¡ sro lùe uxklhg rehty nlrd rvrge rpproprlallori (#I0lm),
. . , Funde ¡r€ nof ¡vålþlrlê $ilhln lhr sÍlsllng d¿p{tl¡n¿nttl iqlery and rvrge opptoprlatlon (flt}1.00)¡

1o provlde fundln8 ls ¡tl¡ched.

- Àpprove
Commenl(s);

Prerlding Commi¡¡loncrts Sl gnature;

Þlstrict I Co mmissioner's Slgnrture:

Dlrlrict Il Commlssloner'c

ilal*l

lÌtiln iey ;tnd lìirmrri

Dufu 7¡j¡.n:



srartoFMlñisouRt I 
"".CountyofBoonc t

CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER
:-

August Session of the July Adjourned

27th

31q-2020

ftrm.2ú0

dry of August 2î20In thc C.ounty Commldon of reld county, on thc

thr followlng rnong othcr procccdlnp' lworo h¡dr vlz¡

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
attached Contract Amendment Number One to Contract 022217-CAW - Fleet Management and
Related Technology Solutions - Term & Supply.

Terms of the amendment are stipulated in the attached Amendment. It is further ordered the
Presiding Commissioner is hereby authorized to sign said Contract Amendment One.

Done this 27thday of August 2020

2alrtU K. /îfØ,t4/
K. Atwill

ATTEST:

Parry
Brianna L District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission

II Commissioner



Boone County Purchasing
LtzPalazzolo
Senior Buyer

613 E. Ash, Room 109
Columbia, MO 65201

Phone: (573)886-4392
Fax: (573) 886-4390

TO:
FROM:
DATE:
RE:

MEMORANDUM

Boone County Commission
Liz P alazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M.
August 11,2020
Amendment #l to Contract\222l7-CAvl - Fleet Management and
Related Technology Solutions - Term & Supply

Amendment #1 to contract0222|7-CAW for Fleet Management and Related Technology
Solutions that was awarded }day 07,2020 (Commission Order 210-2020) is being
amended to add a provision about the numbers of vehicles changing through the duration
of the contract. The contract identified 62 vehicles, but this number will change as

vehicles are added to or taken out ofservice.

All other terms, conditions and prices of the original agreement remain unchanged.

This is a Countywide Term and Supply contract.

Contract File

llp

cc:



Commission Order: 

CONTRACT AMENDMENT NUMBER ONE 
FOR 

~-------

FLEET MANAGEMENT AND RELATED TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS-TERM AND SUPPLY 

The Agreement 022217-CA W dated the 7th day of May 2020 made by and between Boone County, 
Missouri and CalAmp Wireless Networks Corporation is amended as follows: 

The Contract Amendment Number One ("Amendment") is made and effective as of effective this date 
August ___ , 2020 by and between Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the state of 
Missouri, through the Boone County Commission ("County") and CalAmp Wireless Networks 
Corporation, a Delaware corporation with its headquarters located at 15635 Alton Parkway, Suite 250, 
Irvine, California 92618 ("Vendor or "Contractor'). 

RECITALS 

WHEREAS, the parties executed the Purchase Agreement for Fleet Management and Related Technology 
Solutions (NJPA) "Contract Number Agreement 022217-CA W" dated the 71" day of May 2020; 

WHEREAS, all capitalized terms referenced in this Amendment, but not otherwise defined herein shall 
have the same meaning given to them as in the "Contract Number 022217-CA W"; and 

WHEREAS, the parties wish to amend the "Contract Number 022217-CAW". 

NOW THEREFORE, made by and between Boone County, Missouri and CalArnp Wireless Networks 
Corporation for and in consideration of the performance of the respective obligations of the parties set 
forth herein, is amended as follows: 

1. Contract Number 022217-CA W is hereby amended by ADDING the following prov1s1on to the 
contract: 

As Needed, If Needed Service: The contractor shall understand and agree that contract services shal I be 
ordered and delivered on an as- needed, if needed basis. The number of vehicles outfitted for the 
contractor's service may vary throughout the contract duration. The County Department using the 
contractor's service will provide an accurate count of the specific number of vehicles requiring contract 
service to initiate service and will update the contractor about additions or deletions to the initial count as 
changes may occur specific to that Department. 

2. Except as modified by this Amendment, all other terms, conditions, and pricing of the original contract 
as amended by previous amendments, if any, shall remain the same and apply hereto. 

3. This Amendment may be executed in counterparts, each of which will be deemed an original, but both 
of which together will constitute one and the same instrument. A signature delivered by facsimile, e-mail, 
or other means of electronic transmission (including pdfand DocuSign®), is deemed to have the same legal 
effect as delivery of an original signed copy of this Amendment. 

Signatures to follow 

DocuSign Envelope ID: FEA726DC-E2E2-4BDF-A120-2FDC72F08D7D

379-2020

27



Commission Order: --------

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year first above written. 

CALAMP WIRELESS NETWORKS 
CORPORATION 

By:-------------

Title: ---------------

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

County Counselor 

BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI 

By: Boone County Commission 

Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: 

County Clerk 

AUDITOR CERTIFICATION: In accordance with §RSMo 50.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient 
unencumbered appropriation balance exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this 
contract. (Note: Certification of this contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not create a 
measurable county obligation at this time.) 

Countywide - Term & Supply 

Signature Date Appropriation Account 

DocuSign Envelope ID: FEA726DC-E2E2-4BDF-A120-2FDC72F08D7D

Chief Revenue Officer

8/21/2020

379-2020



STATEOFMISSOURT 
I 

"".Conty of Boone t

CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

--

August Session of the July Adjourned

27th

38o -2020

trrn.2o20

day of August n20In thc Cornty Courml¡rlon of dd curnty' on the

tb¡ followln* rnong othcr procccdln¡r' wo¡u h¡d' vlz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
attached Road & Bridge ImprovemenlRepair Cooperative Agreement between Boone County and
the Village of Hartsburg.

Terms of the agreement are stipulated in the attached Agreement. It is further ordered the
Presiding Commissioner is hereby authorized to sign said Agreement.

Done this 27th day of August 2020.

Daru¿ K. ,4ü4,"U
K. Atwill

ATTEST:

.Parry
Brianna L. District I
Clerk of the County Commission

M. Thompson
II Commissioner



BOONE COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE IMPROVEMENT/REPAIR
COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT

APPROVED APPLICATION.BASED PROJECT
APPLICATION

2020,is

made and entered into by and between Boone County, a first non-charter county and

political subdivision of the State of Missouri by and through its County Commission, herein

"County" and the Village of Hartsburg, a municipal corporation, herein "City".

WHEREAS, County has, in Commission Order 249-2011, adopted updated policies

regarding the distribution of certain road sales tax and property tax revenues, the terms and

conditions of which are incorporated herein by reference; and

V/HEREAS, City is an "Application Entity" as described in the aforementioned

Commission Order; and

V/HEREAS, City has been classified as an application entity that will receive an annual

amount as described in Commission Order 609-2012, the terms and conditions of which are

incorporated herein by reference; and

WHEREAS, County is willing to enter into a cooperative agreement with the City for the

improvement and/or repair of City's road system under certain terms and conditions; and

WHEREAS, the parties are empowered to enter into cooperative agreement(s) for the

purposes herein stated pursuant to section 70.220 and section 229.040 RSMo.

NOV/, THEREFORE,IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual undertakings and

agreements herein contained, the parties agree as follows:

1. PURPOSE. The purpose of this Agreement is to effectuate the Application-Based

Funding from the County to the City as contemplated in County's policies on distributing

road sales tax revenue and road property tax revenues. The terms and conditions of

Commission Order 249-2011&,609-2012 arc incorporated into this agreement by

reference.

2. COUNTYAGREEMENTS:

a. County will pay to the City the sum of Nine Thousand Four Hundred Thirty-

Six Dollars and Sixteen Cents ($9,436.16) as determined by the formula for

Year 2 of the 6-year cycle as described in the aforementioned Commission Order

THIS AGREEMENT, dated tr,i, ?fi'"y "r

t Application entities are: Harrisburg, Hartsburg, Huntsdale, McBaine, Pierpont, Rocheport and Sturgeon.



609-2012, for use solely in the completion of road improvement and/or repair

projects.

3. CITY AGREEMENTS.

a. City agrees to use the funds that it receives from County pursuant to this

Agreement solely for improving and maintaining its roads and bridges in

accordance with its Boone County Road & Bridge Improvement/Repair

Cooperative Agreement General Agreement for funding, certified by Commission

Order 464-2011 which is incorporated herein by reference.

b. City agrees that it shall submit to an audit by the County or its designated auditor

upon request for purposes of determining whether the funds received by the City

from the County under this agreement have been expended in compliance with

this agreement.

c. City agrees that it shall reimburse the County for any funds paid to it under this

agreement which are expended in violation of this agreement or applicable law,

rule or regulation, within ninety (90) days of notification of such a finding by

County.

d. City agrees to timely provide any documentation or information reasonably

requested by County which relates in any way to this Agreement.

e. City agrees that it will be liable for, and agrees to be liable for, and shall

indemniS, defend and hold the County of Boone harmless from all claims, suits,

judgments or damages, including court costs and attorney's fees, arising out of or

in the course of the operation of this agreement. Notwithstanding the foregoing,

nothing herein is intended to waive either the City's or the County's sovereign

immunity as to any third party.

f. City agrees that, for any work not performed by the City's own employees, City

will comply with any and all applicable competitive bidding statutes or

ordinances, the state Prevailing V/age law, domestic products purchase laws and

such other laws, rules and regulations which are applicable to the City in letting

and carrying out contracts for "public works" as that term is defined in applicable

statutes, rules, regulations, and ordinances.

4. PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF LEGAL OBLIGATIONS. City represents that the

payments from County to City contemplated herein are in excess of any legal obligations



imposed on County by virtue of applicable Missouri law, including RSMo $137.556 and

the ballot language presented to voters authorizing the current Road & Bridge Sales Tax

Levy under RSMo 567.547.

5. TIMING OF PAYMENTS. The payments from County to City contemplated herein

will occur one time per year, near the beginning of the fourth quarter of the calendar year,

and after receipt of the fully executed annual agreement.

6. REPORTING. City shall file a written report with County, at least annually, detailing

the road and bridge improvement projects funded in whole or in part with the funding

received herein, as well as provide a summary of any planned, future projects that are

anticipated to be funded with current or future funding from the County. Said reports

shall be in suffrcient detail so as to allow County to document what specific portions of

any City project were funded or are contemplated to be funded with funds received from

the County.

7. ASSIGNMENT. Neither party may assign or transfer any of its rights or obligations

under this Agreement to any other person or entity without the prior, written consent of

the other party.

8. SOLE BENEFIT OF PARTIES. This Agreement is for the sole benefit of City and

County. Nothing in this Agreement is intended to confer any rights or remedies on any

third party.

9. RELATIONSHIP OF PARTIES. Nothing herein shall be deemed or construed by the

parties hereto, nor by any third party, as creating the relationship of principal and agent,

or of partnership, or ofjoint venture, between the parties hereto.

10. TERM. This Agreement shall be in effect from its execution until January 1 of the

following calendar year.

11. TERMINATION. Either party may terminate this Agreement upon thirty (30) days

written notice directed to the other party.

12. NONAPPROPRIATION. The payments from County contemplated herein are

conditioned upon there being a sufficient, unencumbered fund balance budgeted for that

pufpose. The County's obligations hereunder shall not in anyway be construed to be a

debt of the County in contravention of any applicable constitutional or statutory

limitation or requirement concerning the creation of indebtedness by the County, nor

shall anything contained herein constitute a pledge of the general credit, tax revenues,



funds or moneys of the County beyond that which is specifically required by state law.

Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement, the decision whether or not to budget

or appropriate funds, or to extend this Agreement for any subsequent fiscal year, is solely

within the discretion of the then-current governing body of the County, it being

understood that adjustments to an appropriation may be made by the County in

accordance with its Economic Development Adjustment policies adopted as part of its

policies relating to the distribution of road sales taxes and road property taxes.

13. GOVERNING LA\il AND VENUE. This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of

the State of Missouri, and any action relating to the same shall be brought in the Circuit

Court of Boone County, Missouri.

14. BINDING ON SUCCESSORS. The covenants, agreements, and obligations herein

contained shall extend to, bind, and inure to the benefit of the parties hereto and their

respective successors and approved assigns.

15. COUNTERPARTS. This Agreement may be executed by the parties in several

counterparts, each of which shall be deemed an original instrument.

16. COMPLETE AGREEMENT. All negotiations, considerations, representations, and

understandings between the parties are incorporated herein, shall supersede any prior

agreements, and may be modified or altered only in writing signed by the parties hereto.

17. AUTHORITY OF SIGNATORIES. Each of the persons signing this Agreement on

behalf of either party represent that he/she has been duly authoÅzed and empowered, by

order, ordinance or otherwise, to execute this Agreement and that all necessary action on

behalf of said party to effectuate said authorization has been taken and done.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed

by their duly-authorized officers on day and year indicated by their signature below.



BOONE COUNTY

By:

,au¿ K. &üo,r%

Date R,â1. âo

VILLAGE OF HARTSBURG

By:

City

Date: 6 7 z02i
A T:

TO FORM:

City Attorney

Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST:

County Clerk

APPROVED FORM:

Boone County Auditor Certification:
I hereþ certifr that a suffrcient, unencumbered
appropriation balance exists and is available to
satisf, the obligation æising from this contract.
(Note: Certification of this contract is not required
if the terms of this contract do not create a

obligation at this time.)

Auditor 7 Joffi -7t4ç-
Date




