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STATE OF MISSOURI } 
ea. 

County of Boone 

August Session of the July Adjourned Term. 20 17 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31st day of August 20 17 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby honor and 
recognize the contributions by Wendy S. Noren for her years of service to Boone County. 

Done this 31st day of August, 201 7. 

~r: 

~- f a~&l) /i~ / 
Ta~r W. BurksQ 
Clerk of the County Commission 

( Jane M. Thompson 
\,-Bistrict II Commissioner 



WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

THEREFORE, 

PROCLAMATION HONORING 

WENDY 5. NOREN, COUNTY CLERK 
BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI 

the County of Boone has been privileged to receive the good work and 
services of Wendy S. Noren as County Clerk since she was sworn into office 
on January 1, 1983, and in recognition of her years of service and outstanding 
work; and 

in addition to four years as Deputy County Clerk, Wendy continued to serve 
the citizens of Boone County for 35 more years as County Clerk, having 
been re-elected eight times, only one of those times facing opposition; and 

Wendy's passionate dedication to democracy in elections and public service 
showed through her tireless work to provide fair and free elections to the 
citizens of Boone County; and 

Wendy emerged as a leading elections expert on a state, national and 
international level, and served as a resource to countless jurisdictions with 
information, guidance and innovative insights; and 

Wendy worked with Congress to craft the Help America Vote Act (HA VA), 
devoting countless hours to work with congressional staff in Washington, 
D.C. to protect elections officials from Congressional mandates for which 
they did not have the funding to implement on schedule; and 

Wendy served as the legislative chair of the Missouri Association of County 
Clerks and Election Authorities and was the National Association of 
Counties representative on the U.S. Election Assistance Commission 
advisory board, contributing to many state and national election law reforms; 
and 

Wendy made every effort to equip Boone County with the most advanced 
elections technology, often through innovative use of grant funding, focusing 
on always providing citizens with the ability to register to vote, to be an 
informed voter and to cast their ballot in a secure way; and 

with our best wishes for the future let it be known that Wendy S. Noren is 
hereby recognized for her outstanding dedication and integrity during her 
years of service as County Clerk of Boone County, Missouri, for which all 
Boone Countians have benefited. 

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, this 31 st day of August, 2017. 

Daniel K. Atwill, Presiding Commissioner 

Fred J. Parry, District I Commissioner 

Janet M. Thompson, District II Commissioner 

ATrEST: 

Taylor Burks, County Clerk 
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STATE OF MISSOURI } 
August Session of the July Adjourned Term. 20 17 

ea. 
County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31st day of August 20 17 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby certify that we have 
examined the attached statement of the surplus from sale of delinquent lands held the 28th day of 
August, 201 7, and approve the same. 

Done this 31st day of August, 2017. 

ATTEST: 

&ur~, /3J.{5 
istric - Commissioner 

Clerk of the County Commission 

~~~~~---
l~~rict II Commissioner 



OFFICE OF THE BOONE COUNTY COLLECTOR 
BRIAN MCCOLLUM, COLLECTOR OF REVENUE 

801 E. WALNUT, ROOM 1 18 COLUMBIA, MO 65201-4890 
PHONE: 573-886-4285 FAX: 573-886-4294 WWW.SHOWMEBOONE.COM/COLLECTOR 

2017 BOONE COUNTY LAND SALE SURPLUS 

Brian Mccollum, Collector of Revenue, Boone County, Missouri, declares the sum of $291,091.73 (Two Hundred Ninety-One Thousand Ninety-One Dollars and Seventy­
Three Cents) to be the surplus amount from the sale held August 28, 2017, for the purpose of satisfying taxes, special assessments, interest and costs on lots and lands 

having more than one year delinquency on real estate taxes and special assessments. Said sum shall be turned over to the Boone County Treasurer to be held for benefit 

of school fund unless claimed by owner prior to three years from date of sale. §140.230, RS Mo 

Owner: Corine Gladys Hayes, Dorothy Mae 

Hayes, Schooling Tinder, Helen Irene Tinder 
Parcel: 03-209-00-01-037.00 
Purchaser: Offered - No Bid 

Sec 04 T51 R12 

E McDowell St 

Lts 1 & 2 B14 in City of Sturgeon as shown in Plat Book/Page Z/95 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 

Surplus 

Owner: Robert Jackson, Mary L Freye, Cassie Sec 04 T51 R12 Sold 

Reeves, Rueben Jackson, Alice Kelley, Robert L S Hicks St Taxes & Costs 

Surplus Graves Jr Lts 2 & 3 B3 & part of vacated McDowell St In Original Town of Sturgeon as 

Parcel: 03-209-00-01-039.00 rec Book/Page 497 /560 

Purchaser: Offered No Bid 

Owner: John G Brickman 

Parcel: 11-318-11-01-116.00 

Purchaser: Offered - No Bid 

Owner: Carl Murphy 

Parcel: 11-400-19-00-005.06 

Purchaser: Offered - No Bid 

Owner: R & L Investments Holdings LLC 

Parcel: 12-415-20-02-018.00 

Purchaser: Offered - No Bid 

Owner: James E Noel 

Parcel: 12-717-00-07-015.00 
Purchaser: Just Waved LLC 

Owner: Scott Schulte & Hardeep Bhullar 

Parcel: 12-718-00-00-013.00 

Purchaser: Market Ready LLC 

Owner: Bobby Prince Jr, Mary Evelyn White, 

Sec 11 T49 R13 

Baylor Ln 

L12 B104 Lake Caroline SD #1 as shown in Plat Book/Page 10/132 

Sec 19 T49 R13 

W Hatton Chapel Rd 

A tract of land containing .27 acres located in Sec 19, T49, R13 more 

particularly desc as Tract 5C of Sur Book/Page 984/590 (rec as Tract C in 

QTCL Book/Page 4563/7 4 ) 

Sec 20 T49 R12 

2510 E Oakbrook Dr A+B 

L22 Morris SD #2 as shown by Sur Book/Page 388-7 40 

Sec 31 T49 R12 

1601 Tundra Ct 
L15 Northland Acres Estates as shown by Plat Book/Page 28/25 

Sec 31 T49 R12 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 

Surplus 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 

Surplus 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 

Special Assmt 

Surplus 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 

Surplus 

Sold 

Parker St Taxes & Costs 

A tract of land located in the S½ of Sec 31, T49N, R12W, Boone County, MO Surplus 
and being desc: Beg at the SE cor of L33 of Northland Acres rec Plat 

Book/Page 4/25; thence Nly along E line of said lot, 76.8' to the NW cor of 

said L33; thence leaving said L33 and running SEly along S ROW line of 

Northland Dr to W ROW line of Parker St; thence Sly along said ROW line to 

the N line of L82 of Kitty Hawk Manor Plat 2 rec Plat Book/Page 12/66; 

thence leaving said ROW and running Wly along said N line of L82, 126.5' to 

the POB 

Sec 11 T48 R13 Sold 

David Ricardo Carter, Bryan Keith Curtis Carter, 604 Hunt Ave Taxes & Costs 

Surplus Thomas O Carter Ill, Randy Demarco Carter L6 Alamo Place SD as shown in Plat Book/Page 3/34 
Parcel: 16-313-00-02-077.00 
Purchaser: McCollum Rental Properties LLC 

Owner: Kenneth Ching-Tien Kuo 

Parcel: 16-405-18-01-013.00 

Purchaser: Michael Tompkins 

Owner: Sheila M Griffin 

Parcel: 17-207-00-01-024.00 

Purchaser: Wayne King 

Owner: Mohammad Y & Amal A Alroomi 

Parcel: 18-700-30-00-005.00 

Purchaser: Karanbir Sandhu 

Sec 18 T48 R13 

7 S Cardinal Ct 
L4 Sugartree Hill as shown in Plat Book/Page 10/96 

Sold 

Taxes & Costs 
Specia I Ass mt 

Surplus 

Sec 03 T48 R12 Sold 

113 Mohawk Ave Taxes & Costs 

L16 of a Retracement Sur of portions of Indian Hills SD B1 as shown by Sur Surplus 
Book/Page 1408/218 

Sec 30 T48 R11 Sold 

8691 E New Haven Rd Taxes & Costs 

Tract 3 as shown in Sur Book/Page 522-140 Special Assmt 

Surplus 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 
$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 
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669.21 

971.48 

173.30 

218.40 

309.70 

1,283.89 

10,000.00 

4,333.66 

5,666.34 

453.46 

453.46 

5,250.00 
2,148.58 

3,101.42 

18,000.00 
2,406.57 

658.45 

14,934.98 

4,000.00 

1,348.49 

2,651.51 

275,000.00 

9,873.57 

388.95 

264,737.48 
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In witness whereof I have hereunto set my hand and seal, this ~ day of A~ .Sf 2017 

Collector of Revenue, Boone County, Missouri 

·sr ~ 
Subscribed and sworn to before me this~/ .;;.--day of '~~ 2017 

0 

Jir013~ 
Taylor W urks ~ CountyCerk:::: County, Missouri 
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STATE OF MISSOURI } 
August Session of the July Adjourned Term. 20 17 

ea. 
County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31st day of August 20 17 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby authorize a closed 
meeting on Friday, September 1, 2017, at 1 :30 p.m. The meeting will be held in the Conference 
Room 338 of the Roger B. Wilson Boone County Government Center at 801 E. Walnut, 
Columbia, Missouri, as authorized by RSMo 610.021(12), sealed bids and related documents, 
until the bids are opened; and sealed proposals and related documents or any documents related to 
a negotiated contract until a contract is executed, or all proposals are rejected. 

Done this 31st day of August, 2017. 

' 7 --\-__ ,,,Fred J. Parry 
W. Burks District I Commissioner 

of the County Commission " / .u,-0 )JCZ~/-"---~/·-" 
I, l Jane M. Thompson 

" 1strict II Commissioner 


