(S -2007
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 ()7
ea
County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 16" day of January 20 07

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby adopt the Boone
County Building Code, including: the International Building Code/2006; the International
Residential Code/2006; the International Plumbing Code/2006; the International Mechanical
Code/2006; the International Fuel Gas Code/2006; and, the National Electrical Code/2005.

All codes are adopted as amended, including appendixes and referenced standards, as
recommended by the Boone County Building Code Commission. All previous versions of the
Boone County Building Code are considered to be repealed on the effective date of the code.

This order to take effect April 2, 2007.

Done this 16" day of January, 2007.

Ke&n Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

!
A’TTEST: 7\ e m ﬂ M ),

Kareh M. Miller
Wendy S¢/Noren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission

Skip Elkin
District [ Commissioner



IRC - 2006

|5 2007

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER

A COMMISSION ORDER ADOPTING AND GOVERNING THE FABRICATION,
ERECTION, CONSTRUCTION, ENLARGEMENT, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION
AND USE OF DETACHED ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS, THEIR
APPURTENANCES AND ACCESSORY STRUCTURES IN THE JURISDICTION OF
BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI: AND PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS
THEREFORE PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR THE VIOLATION THEREOF, AND
REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT

THEREWITH.

Be it ordained by the Boone County Commission of the jurisdiction of Boone County, Missouri
as follows:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE
AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND

CHANGES.

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of
the Boone County Department of Planning and Building Inspection and are being marked and
designated as "International Residential Code For One and Two Family Dwellings — 20067, as
published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted as the Residential Building Code
of Boone County, Missouri for the control of residential structures as provided herein; and each
and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of "International
Residential Code For One and Two Family Dwellings — 2006", are hereby referred to, adopted
and made part hereof, including all listed appendices, as is more fully set out in this Ordinance,
with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as hereinafter prescribed.

The following sections of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings of 2006 are hereby repealed, amended or modified as follows:

100.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appears in this code, it shall read "County of Boone,
Missouri" ; _ o v e _ _
100.1.1 Wherever "Department of Building Inspection”" appears in this code, it shall read

"Department of Planning and Building Inspection of Boone County, Missouri".

100.1.2 Wherever "Chief Appointing Authority of the jurisdiction" appears in this Code, it shall
read "Boone County Commission of Boone County, Missouri".

R101.1 Title: These provisions shall be known as the “Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings of The County of Boone” and shall be cited as such and will be referred to

herein as “this code.”




2 IRC 2006

R101.2 Scope: The provisions of the International Residential Code for One and Two Family
Dwellings shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement,
repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location and removal of detached one and two family
dwellings and multiple single family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories in
height with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures.

Note: the provisions of this code do not apply to agricultural buildings or structures. Where the
construction of agricultural buildings or structures requires a building permit, such structures
shall be designed and built in accordance with the provisions of the International Building Code
or other standards approved by the Building Official.

SECTION R103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY. Delete.
SECTION R 103 DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND BUILDING INSPECTION

R103.1 Enforcement Agency. The department of Planning and Building Inspection previously
created by the Boone County Commission will continue as the enforcement agency for this code.
The Director of Planning and Building Inspection shall be known as the building official. The
building official is hereby authorized and directed to administer and enforce all provisions of this

code.

R103.2 Appointment. The Director of Planning and Building Inspection shall be appointed by
the Boone County Commission.

R103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the
concurrence of the Boone County Commission, the Director of Planning and Building Inspection
shall have the authority to appoint a deputy building official, the related technical officers,
inspectors, plan examiners and other employees. Such employees shall have the powers as

delegated by the building official.

R104.10.1 Areas prone to flooding. The building official shall not grant modifications to any
provisions related to areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2 (1) without the
granting of a variance to such provisions by the Zoning Board of Adjustment.

R105.2(1) One story detached accessory structures, provided the floor area does not exceed 160
square feet. Such buildings must comply with all setback requirements found in the zoning
regulations. Such buildings used to house hazardous materials (paint, gasoline, etc.) must be
placed at least 10 feet from any property line and have a door that can be secured by a lock.

R105.2(2) Fences not over twelve (12) feet high.

R106.1 Submittal documents. Construction documents, special inspection and structural
observation programs, and other data may be required to be submitted in one or more sets with
each application for a permit. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered
design professions where required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be



3 IRC 2006

constructed. Where special conditions exist, the building official is authorized to require
additional construction documents to be prepared by a registered design professional.

R112.2.1 Determination of substantial improvements in areas prone to flood: (Delete)

R112.2.2 Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding: (Delete)

R112.3 Qualifications: (Delete)

R113.4 Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a
building or structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the building official or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor,
punishable as provided by law. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate

offense.

R202 DEFINITIONS

ACCESSORY STRUCTURE (Delete)

Add: ACCESSORY STRRUCTURE., In one- and two-family dwellings not more than
three stories high with separate means of egress, a building, the use of which is incidental to
that of the main building and which is located on the same lot.

Table R301.2(1) — The following values shall be inserted into Table R301.2(1):

Roof Snow Load — 20 Ibs/sq. ft.

Wind - 90

Seismic Design Category — B

Weathering - Severe;

Frost Line Depth - 30 inches

Termite — Moderate to Heavy

Decay - Slight to Moderate

Winter Design Temp - + 4° Fahrenheit

Ice Shield Underlayment Required — No — 27.8° Fahrenheit
Flood Hazards — 6/2/1983 — date of adoption of flood regulations

6/15/1983 — date of Flood Insurance Rate Map

Air Freezing Index — 1000 ' '
Mean Annual Temperature — 55° Fahrenheit

R309.2 Separation required: The garage shall be corhpletely separated from the residence and its
attic area by means of 5/8-inch gypsum board or equivalent applied to the garage side.

R311.5.3.1 Riser Height. The maximum riser height shall be 8 % inches. The riser shall be
measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch.

R311.5.3.2 Tread Depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches. The tread depth shall be



4 IRC 2006

measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads
and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight of
stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch. Winder treads shall have a minimum
tread depth of 9 inches measured as above at a point 12 inches from the side where the treads are
narrower. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 6 inches at any point. Within any
flight of stairs, the greatest winder tread depth at the 12 inch walk line shall not exceed the

smallest by more than 3/8 inch.

R311.5.8.3 Circular stairways. Circular stairways shall have a minimum tread depth and a
maximum riser height in accordance with Section 311.5.3, including winders. The radius of the
narrower end of treads shall not be less than twice the width of the stairway.

R313.3 Power source: In new construction, required smoke detectors shall receive their primary
power from the building wiring when such wiring is served from a commercial source. In
addition to the required primary power source, required smoke detectors shall receive power
from a battery when the primary power source is interrupted. Smoke detectors may be battery
operated when installed in existing buildings, or in buildings without commercial power, or in
buildings which undergo alterations, repairs or additions as regulated by Section R313.1.1.

R403.3 Frost protected shallow foundations. Delete.

R404.1 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Add the following:

Provisions 2 and 3 above shall be considered satisfied by any of the following alternatives
provided the joists are toe nailed to the top plate in accordance with fastener schedule table
R602.3(1) and the anchor bolt spacing does not exceed 6 feet:

Alternative #1. Configurations where thrust from the joists is transferred to the foundation by
direct bearing on the foundation. A graphic example of Alternative #1 may be obtained from the

Department of Planning and Building Inspection.

Alternative #2. A steel angle attached to the bottom of each joist. A graphic example of
Alternative #2 may be obtained from the Department of Planning and Building Inspection.

Alternative #3. A Type C connection to one joist at least every four feet maximum is acceptable
for 8 and 9 foot walls with not more than 8 %; feet of unbalanced backfill. A graphic example of
Alternative #3 may be obtained from the Department of Planning and Building Inspection.

Alternative #4. Corners, perpendicular concrete walls and foundation offsets of at least 6 feet in
plan length provide lateral support at those points. If such support is provided at least every 15
feet along the length of the wall in plan, soil pressure from unbalanced backfill can be transferred
to those supports by providing adequate horizontal reinforcement in the foundation wall. For up
to 7 ¥ feet of unbalanced backfill on an 8 inch thick wall, horizontal reinforcement must consist
of at least 2 #4 grade 60 bars every 2 feet of wall height. For up to 9 feet of unbalanced fill on an
8 inch thick wall, horizontal reinforcement must consist of at least 3, #4 grade 60 bars every 2
feet of wall height. A graphic example of Alternative #4 may be obtained from the Department

of Planning and Building Inspection.



IRC 2006

R404.1.3 Design required: A design in accordance with accepted engineering practice may be
required for concrete or masonry foundation walls when any of the following conditions occur:

1. Walls are subject to hydrostatic pressure from groundwater.
2. Walls supporting more than 48 inches of unbalanced backfill that do not have permanent

lateral support at the top and bottom.

R502.11.4 Truss design drawings. Truss design drawings, prepared in compliance with Section
R502.11.1 shall be available on-site at the time of inspection and shall be provide to the building
official at that time. Truss design drawings shall be provided with the shipment of trusses
delivered to the job site. Truss design drawings shall include, at a minimum, the information

specified below: (remainder of section unchanged).

R602.6.1 Drilling and notching of top plate. Exception 2: An angled 20 gauge galvanized metal
tie may be used provided it provides a minimum 1 inch flange and extends down at least 3
inches. The metal tie shall span the distance between the adjacent studs.

R613.2 Window sills. Delete.

R802.3.1 Ceiling joist and rafter connections. Add: Rafter ties shall be spaced not more than 4
feet on center. -

R806.3 Vent and insulation clearance. Where eave or cornice vents are installed, insulation shall
not block the free flow of air. A minimum of a 1 ~ inch (25 mm) space shall be provided
between the insulation and the roof sheathing at the location of the vent.

N1101.2.1 Detached one and two family dwellings: Compliance shall be demonstrated by
either:

1. Meeting the requirements of this chapter for buildings with a glazing area that does not exceed
15 percent of the gross area of exterior walls; or

2. All buildings shall be insulated in accordance with the following: ceiling or roof -- R-38;
exterior wall -- R-15 (in assembly); floor above unheated area or crawl space and ducts shall
have a value of R-19 for the assembly; finished exterior basement walls and interior garage walls
shall have insulating batts, blankets, fills or similar types of materials with a value of R-13.

e Joints in the building conditioned envelope that are sources of air leakage, such as around
window and door frames, between wall cavities and window or door frames, between
wall assemblies or their sill plates and foundations, between utility service penetrations
through the building envelope, shall be properly sealed with compatible and durable
caulking, gasketing, weather-stripping or other materials in an approved manner.

e All exterior walls shall have a vapor barrier or equivalent, capable of reducing vapor
transmission to less than 1 perm, installed on the inside or the warm surface side of the



6 IRC 2006

insulated wall or ceiling. Only those ceilings that are attached directly to the underside of
the roof rafters, such as flat roofs or cathedral ceilings, are required to install the vapor
barrier.

o Ducts in heated areas do not require insulation.

e Ducts in unheated areas and not exposed to outside ventilation, such as a garage, shall
have an insulation value of R-4.

o All windows shall have a maximum Thermal Transmittance (U) value of 0.55.

M1308.2 Change thickness of protective shields from a minimum of 0.062 inch thick steel to 20
gauge thick. A thicker gauge (up to 16 gauge) may be required when necessary to protect gas or
refrigerant lines.

M1401.3 Sizing — Heating and cooling equipment shall be sized based on building loads
calculated in accordance with ACCA Manual J (Residential Load Calculation — Seventh Edition)
or other approved heating and cooling calculation methodologies. Equipment shall be sized at a
maximum of 700 sq. ft. of habitable floor space per ton of equipment capacity. Unfinished
basement areas shall be provided with a minimum of % ton of equipment capacity for the every
2000 sq. ft. of unfinished area.

M1501.1 Outdoor discharge. Delete.

M1502.6 Duct length: The maximum developed length of a clothes dryer exhaust duct generally
shall not exceed 25 feet from the dryer location to the wall or roof termination. The maximum
length of the duct shall be reduced 2.5 feet for each 45-degree bend and 5 feet for each 90-degree
bend. The maximum developed length of the exhaust duct does not include the transition duct.

Section M1506 EXHAUST DUCTS — re-number subsection to M1506.1 Ducts.

Section M1507 MECHANICAL VENTILATION - re-number subsection “M1506.2” to
M1507.2 Recirculation of air. Exhaust air from bathrooms and toilet rooms shall not be
recirculated within a residence or to another dwelling unit and shall be exhausted directly to the

outdoors or the soffit.

M2005.2 Prohibited locations: Fuel-fired water heaters shall not be installed in a room used as a
storage closet. Water heaters located in a bedroom or bathroom shall be installed in a sealed
enclosure with a self-closing door so that combustion air will not be taken from the living space.
Direct-vent water heaters are not required to be installed within an enclosure.

(G2414.5.2 Copper tubing: Copper tubing shall comply with standard Type K or L of ASTM B
88 or ASTM B 280.

Copper and brass tubing shall not be used if the gas contains more than an average of 0.3 grains
of hydrogen sulfide per 100 standard cubic feet of gas (0.7 milligrams per 100 liters). Natural



7 IRC 2006

gas supplied by Ameren UE in Boone County exceeds this level therefore copper or brass shall
not be used with natural gas.

(G2415.1 Prohibited locations. Piping shall not be installed in or through a circulating air duct,
clothes chute, chimney or gas vent, ventilating duct, dumbwaiter or elevator shaft.

(G2415.5 Protection against physical damage. (Piping systems) Shield plates shall be a minimum
of 20 gauge steel.

(G2426.7 Protection against physical damage. (Vents) Shield plats shall be a minimum of 20
gauge steel.

(G2439.5.1 Maximum Length. The maximum developed length of a clothes dryer exhaust duct
generally shall not exceed 25 feet from the dryer location to the wall or roof termination. The
maximum length of the duct shall be reduced 2.5 feet for each 45-degree bend and S feet for each
90-degree bend. Then maximum developed length of the exhaust duct does not include the

transition duct.

P2503.5 DWYV system testing. Rough and finished plumbing installations may be tested in
accordance with Sections P2503.5.1 and P2503.5.2.

P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing. DWYV systems may be required to be tested on completion of the
rough piping installation by water or air with no evidence of leakage. FEither test shall be applied
to the drainage system in its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as

follows: (remainder of text as per code).

P2503.5.2 Finished Plumbing. After the plumbing fixtures have been set and their traps filled
with water, their connections may be required to be tested and proved gas tight and/or water

tight as follows: (remainder of text as per code).

P2602.1.1 Public water supply. A public water supply is considered available if a lot is within
300 feet of a public water main to which connection is practical and is permitted by the

governmental agency or utility responsible for the water main.

P2602.1.2 Public sewer system. A public sewer system is considered to be available if a lot is
within 225 feet of a sanitary sewer system to which connection is practical and is permitted by
the governmental agency or utility responsible for the sanitary sewer.

P2603.6.1 Sewer depth: Building sewers that conneét to private sewage disposal systems shall
be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank
connection. Building sewers shall be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches below grade.

P2903.4 Thermal Expansion. In addition to the required pressure relief valve, an approved
device for thermal expansion control shall be installed on any water supply system utilizing
storage water heating equipment whenever the building supply pressure exceeds the pressure-
reducing valve setting or when any device, such as a pressure reducing valve, backflow preventer



g IRC 2006

or check valve, is installed that prevents pressure relief through the building supply. The thermal
expansion control device shall be sized in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation

instructions.

P2903.4.1 Pressure reducing valve: An approved pressure-reducing valve conforming to ASSE
1003 shall be installed on the domestic water branch main or riser at the connection to the water-

service pipe.

P2904.5.1 Under concrete slabs: Inaccessible water distribution piping under slabs shall be
copper water tube minimum Type M, brass, ductile iron pressure pipe, cross linked
polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked polyethylene (PEX-AL-PEX) pressure pipe, chlormated
polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) or polybutylene (PB) or cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic pipe
or tubing — all to be installed with approved fittings or bends. Polyethylene (PE) may be allowed
provided it is installed without fittings and completely sleeved by a suitable material. The
minimum pressure rating for plastic pipe or tubing installed under slabs shall be 100 psi at 180°F

(689 kPA at 82°C)

P3103.1 Roof extension: All open vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be terminated at
least 12 inches above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than
weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof.

E3301.3 Not covered: Chapters 33 through 42 do not cover the following:

1. Installations, including associatcd lighting, under the exclusive control of
communications utilities and electric utilities.

2. Services over 400 amperes.

3. [Installations in agricultural buildings. Such installations shall conform to the
requirements of 2005 NEC (National Electric Code).

E3306.2 Conductor material. Conductors used to conduct current shall be of copper except as
otherwise provided in Chapters 33 through 42. Where conductors material is not specified, the
material and the sizes given in these chapters shall apply to copper conductors. Where other
materials are used, the conductor sizes shall be changed accordingly. In no case shall any
aluminum current carrying conductor be smaller than #2.

E3503.3.3 Location: The service over current device shall be an integral part of the service .
disconnecting means or shall be located no further away than the next full stud space.

E3504.5 Service masts as supports: Where a service mast is used for the support of service-drop
conductors, it shall be installed as allowed by the utility service provider.

E3505.5 Protection of service cables against damage. Change “Schedule 80 rigid non-metallic
conduit” to “Schedule 40 rigid non-metallic conduit.”



9 IRC 2006

E3601.6 Circuit limits: load calculations shall be provided to the Building Official prior to
installation. Alternatively, installation can proceed without providing load calculations provided
that no more than 8 duplex receptacle outlets and / or light fixtures are installed per 14/2 wiring
circuit or no more than 10 duplex receptacle outlets and / or light fixtures are installed per 12/2

wiring circuit.

E3702.3.2 Protection from physical damage. Where subject to physical damage, cables shall be
protected by rigid metal conduit, intermediate metal conduit, electrical metallic tubing, Schedule
40 PVC rigid nonmetallic conduit, or other approved means. Where passing through a floor, the
cable shall be enclosed in rigid metal conduit, intermediate metal conduit, electrical metallic
tubing, Schedule 40 PVC rigid nonmetallic conduit or other approved means extending not less

than 6 inches above the floor.

Exception: When subject to severe physical damage Schedule 80 PVC rigid nonmetallic conduit
may be required.

E3801.3 Small appliance receptacles: In the kitchen, dining room, pantry, breakfast room and
similar areas, two or more small appliance branch circuits shall serve all wall and floor
receptacle outlets, all countertop receptacle outlets and receptacle outlets for refrigeration
equipment. One or both of the required small appliance branch circuits shall be permitted to
serve other receptacle outlets in the same kitchen and in the other rooms previously specified.
Additional small appliance circuits shall be permitted. Small appliance circuits are not permitted
to serve outlets outside of these rooms or areas, and shall not serve more than one kitchen.

Small appliance branch circuits are intended to serve kitchen appliances and utilization
equipment. No more than three outlets or openings shall be allowed on a small appliance branch
circuit, except that all dining room receptacles may be served by a small appliance branch
circuit. Small appliance branch circuits are not allowed to serve room lighting, except or unless

the lighting is a manufactured part of equipment served by these circuits.
A refrigerator may be served by a dedicated 15 amp circuit.
A microwave oven shall be served by a dedicated 20 amp circuit.

In no case shall the load exceed the rating of a branch circuit.

E3801.4.2 Island counter spaces. At least one receptacle outlet shall be installed at each island
counter space with a long dimension of 24 inches or greater and a short dimensions of 12 inches

or greater.

E3801.11 HVAC outlet. A 125-volt, single phase, 15 or 20 ampere-rated convenience
receptacle outlet shall be installed for the servicing of heating, air-conditioning and refrigeration
equipment located in attics and crawl spaces. The receptacle shall be accessible and shall be
located on the same level and within 25 feet of the heating, air-conditioning and refrigeration
equipment. The receptacle outlet shall not be connected to the load side of the HVAC equipment
disconnecting means and shall be protected in accordance with Section E3802.4.



10 IRC 2006

Exception: A receptacle shall not be required for the servicing of evaporative coolers.

E3802.12 Arc-fault protection of bedroom outlets. Delete.

APPENDIX G SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

AG105.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design of barriers for
residential swimming pools, spas and hot tubs. These design controls are intended to provide
protection against potential drowning and near-drowning by restricting access to swimming
pools, spas and hot tubs. Barriers are to be constructed of metal chain link fence, wood, stone or

masonry or other material approved by the building official.

AG105.2 11 All swimming pool excavation sites are required to be enclosed by a temporary
construction barrier during installation. Any temporary construction barrier shall comply with
the design standards of AG105.2. A permanent barrier shall be installed upon completion of the

pool structure.



IBC-2006

1 e
COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER _ [ D ~H00 |

Effective date:

A COMMISSION ORDER ADOPTING AND GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION,
ALTERATION, ENLARGEMENT, EQUIPMENT REPAIR, DEMOLITION, REMOVAL,
CONVERSION, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF ALL BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; AND
FURTHER PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUE OF SAID PERMITS, COLLECTING OF FEES, MAKING
OF INSPECTIONS, AND PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR THE VIOLATION THEREOF.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNTY COMMISSION OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE BUILDING CODE: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS
AND CHANGES.

Commission Order Number , known as the "Building Code of Boone County, Missouri", that a
certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of the Boone

County Department of Planning and Building Inspection and are being marked and designated as "The
International Building Code — 2006 Edition”, as published by the International Code Council, be and is
hereby adopted as the Building Code of Boone County, Missouri for the control of buildings and
structures as provided herein; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of " The International Building Code — 2006 Edition”, are hereby referred to, adopted and made
part hereof, as is more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and

changes as hereinafter prescribed.

SECTION 2. JURISDICTIONAL TITLE.

0.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appears in this code, it shall read "County of Boone, Missouri".

0.1.1 Wherever "Department of Building Safety" appears in this code, it shall read "Department of
Planning and Building Inspection of Boone County, Missouri".

0.1.2 Wherever "Chief Appointing Authority of the Jurisdiction" appears in this Code, it shall read
"Boone County Commission of Boone County, Missouri".

0.2.1 Farm structure exemption: The provisions of this Code shall not be exercised so as to impose
regulations or to require permits with respect to the erection, maintenance, repair, alteration or extension
of farm buildings or farm structures further than seventy-five feet ( 75') from a dwelling provided that
such buildings or structures are located on tracts of 20 acres or more and such buildings or structures are
used exclusively for agricultural purposes. Farm dwellings shall conform to the provisions of this code

as herein provided.

0.2.2 Manufactured home exemption: Manufactured homes, recreational vehicles or modular units
which carry a seal as provided in Section 700.010 to 700.115 RSMo. shall be exempt from these
provisions, provided that no alteration of the unit takes place once it has been placed upon a tract of

land.

0.2.3 Portable building exemption: Portable buildings as defined by Section 202.0 shall be exempt
from these provisions. Portable buildings must comply with all setback requirements found in the
zoning regulations. Portable buildings used to house hazardous materials (paint, gasoline, etc.) must be
placed at least 10 feet from any property line and have a door that can be secured by a lock.



IBC-2006
2
SECTION 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE - 2006.

The International Building Code - 2006 is amended by additions, deletions and changes including the
changing of Articles, Sections, Sub-section titles and the addition of new sections and new sub-sections

as follows:

SECTION 101.2 Exception 2: Existing buildings undergoing repair, alterations, or additions and change
of occupancy shall be permitted to comply with the requirements of Chapter 34.

SECTION 101.4.5 Property maintenance. Delete

SECTION 104.6 Right of entry: The code official shall have the authority to enter at any reasonable
time any structure or premises for which a permit has been issued but has not received a certificate of
occupancy in accordance with Section 110.0. Permit holders are required to provide means of access to
all parts of structures subject to inspection, including the provision of ladders where required.

For all other structures or premises, when the code official has reasonable cause to believe that a code
violation exists, the code official is authorized to enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to
inspect subject to constitutional restrictions on unreasonable searches and seizures. If entry is refused or
not obtained, the code official is authorized to pursue recourse as provided by law.

SECTION 106.1 Submitted documents: Construction documents, special inspection and structural
observation programs, and other data shall be submitted in one or more sets with each application for a
permit. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered design professional where

required by the Chapter 327 RSMo. Where special conditions exist, the building official is authorized to

require additional construction documents to be prepared by a registered design professional. Vs
Buildings or structures exempt from these requirements are:

(a) A dwelling house; or
(b) A multiple family dwelling house, flat or apartment containing not more than two families; or

(c) A commercial or industrial building or structure buildings having less than 1200 square feet of floor
area which provides for the employment, assembly, housing, sleeping or eating of not more than nine
persons; or

(d) Any one structure containing less than twenty thousand cubic feet, except as provided in (b) and (c)
above, and which is not a part or a portion of a project which contains more than one structure; or

Add: ;
SECTION 106.6 Compliance with other Regulatory Agency Fire and Life Safety Codes: No permit

shall be issued unless the plans and specifications or other required documentation for permit issuance
has been approved by other Boone County regulatory agencies having jurisdiction for compliance with
applicable fire and life safety codes. These provisions shall not apply to one and two family dwellings

or residences.

Add:
SECTION 106.7 Compliance with other Regulatory Agency Fire and Life Safety Codes: No final

inspection or periodic inspection made at the conclusion of a building phase shall be passed or approved
unless similar inspections for compliance with applicable fire and life safety codes have been made and



IBC-2006

3
approved or passed by other Boone County regulatory agencies having jurisdiction. These provisions

shall not apply to one and two family dwellings or residences.

SECTION 108.6 Delete in its entirety. Add: Refunds: In the case of a revocation of a permit or
abandonment or discontinuance of a building project, the portion of the work actually completed shall be
computed and any excess fee for the incomplete work shall be returned to the permit holder upon written
request. All plan examination and permit processing fees and all penalties that have been imposed on
the permit holder under the requirements of this code shall first be collected. The code official shall
authorize the refunding of fees according to Boone County policies under the following additional

circumstances:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected.
2. When no work has been done, the permit fee, less a processing fee of $20.00 may be refunded to the

original permittee.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon written application filed
by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the fee was paid.

Add:
SECTION 112.4 Court review: Any party before the board of appeals who is aggrieved by a decision

of the board of appeals may seek redress or relief before the court of competent jurisdiction as permitted

by law.

SECTION 113.4 Delete in its entirety. Insert: Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
construct, alter or repair a building or structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the
building official or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a

separate offense.

SECTION 114.3 Delete in its entirety. Insert: Unlawful continuance: Any person who shall continue
any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be guilty of a

misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law.

SECTION 202.0 Add:
Portable building - a structure constructed off-site and transported to the property by means of a truck or

trailer; or one built from a pre-manufactured kit and placed on skids. Portable buildings may enclose no
more than 160 sq. ft. of floor space, do not have interior finish, electrical service or plumbing fixtures.
Portable buildings must comply with all setback requirements found in the zoning regulations. Portable
buildings used to house hazardous materials (paint, gasoline, etc.) must be placed at least 10 feet from
any property line and have a door that can be secured by a lock.

SECTION 903.2.1.2 Change Item 2. The fire area has an occupant load of 200 or more; or

1301.1.2:  Use group R-1, R-2 and R-4 shall comply with this section or the requirements of
International Energy Conservation Code. All buildings of Use Group R-1, R-2 and R-4 shall be
insulated in accordance with the following:
e Ceiling or roof -- R-38; exterior wall-- R-15 (in assembly); floor above unheated area or crawl
space and ducts shall have a value of R-19 for the assembly; finished exterior basement walls



IBC-2006
4
and interior garage walls shall have insulating batts, blankets, fills or similar types of materials

with a value of R-13.

¢ Joints in the building conditioned envelope that are sources of air leakage, such as around
window and door frames, between wall cavities and window or door frames, between wall
assemblies or their sill plates and foundations, between utility service penetrations through the
building envelope, shall be properly sealed with compatible and durable caulking, gasketing,
weather-stripping or other materials in an approved manner.

o All exterior walls shall have a vapor barrier or equivalent, capable of reducing vapor
transmission to less than 1 perm, installed on the inside or the warm surface side of the insulated
wall or ceiling. Only those ceilings that are attached directly to the underside of the roof rafters,
such as flat roofs or cathedral ceilings, are required to install the vapor barrier.

¢ Ducts in heated areas do not require insulation.

¢ Ducts in unheated areas and not exposed to outside ventilation, such as a garage, shall have an
insulation value of R-4.

e All windows shall have a maximum Thermal Transmittance (U) value of 0.55.

3109.4 Residential swimming pools. Residential swimming pools shall comply with Sections 3109.4.1
through 3109.4.3. Residential swimming pools shall be enclosed by a barrier consisting of metal chain
link fence, wood, stone or masonry or other material approved by the building official. All swimming
pool excavation sites are required to be enclosed by a temporary construction barrier during installation. -~
A permanent barrier shall be installed upon completion of the pool structure.



NEC 2005

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER

A COMMISSION ORDER ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING
THE DESIGN, INSTALLATION AND CONSTRUCTION OF ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS, BY
PROVIDING REASONABLE SAFEGUARDS TO PROTECT THE PUBLIC HEALTH
AGAINST THE HAZARDS OF INADEQUATE, DEFECTIVE OR UNSAFE ELECTRICAL
INSTALLATIONS; KNOWN AS THE ELECTRICAL CODE OF BOONE COUNTY,

MISSOURL

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNTY COMMISSION OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE ELECTRICAL CODE:

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of
the Boone County Department of Planning and Building Inspection being marked and designated as
“The National Electrical Code 2005", as published by the National Fire Protection Association, be
and is hereby adopted as the Electrical Code of Boone County, Missouri for the control of buildings
and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties,
conditions and terms of "The National Electrical Code 2005", are hereby referred to, adopted and
made part hereof, as is more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions

and changes as hereinafter prescribed.
SECTION 2. AMENDMENTS TO THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 2005:

The National Electrical Code 2005 is amended by additions, deletions and changes, including the
changing of Articles, Sections, Sub-sections and Subsection titles, and the addition of new Sections

and new Sub-Sections reads as follows:

ADD:
90.10. Plans and specifications: Plans and specifications shall be required for all work involving

commercial, industrial, multiple family and buildings used for purposes of public assembly, or as
determined by the building official.

90.11. Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall install, alter or repair electrical wiring in
violation of this Code or without a proper permit shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and punishable
by fine, or by imprisonment, or by both as directed by a court of law. Each day that a violation

continues shall be deemed a separate offense,

90-12. Means of appeal: The owner of a building or structure or any other person may appeal a
decision of the building official. Application for appeal may be filed in the office of the Department

of Planning and Building Inspection.



NEC 2005

90.13. Membership of the Board of Appeals: For the purposes of the Electrical Code, the board of
appeals appointed under Section 112 of the ICC International Building Code/2006 (Boone
County Building Code) as adopted, shall serve as the board of appeals for matters referred to
it for consideration under the Electrical Code.

Article 100

Add: '
Agriculture or Farming Activity: An agricultural activity shall be defined as the cultivating of the

soil, producing of crops and the raising of animals for food or fiber and including horticulture,
beekeeping, aquaculture, silviculture and forestry. Concentrated animal feeding operations must
conform to the Missouri department of Natural Resource’s regulations pertaining to waste water
management and odor control. The raising and keeping of horses for any purpose other than the
production of food and fiber is not considered agricultural activity.

Switch, Transfer: Change to read — An automatic or non-automatic device for transferring one or
more load conductor connections from one power source to another. The transfer switch on
activation shall disconnect all current carrying conductors to include the neutral to prevent back-

feed to the utility.

110.5. Delete in its entirety. Insert: Conductors. Conductors normally used to carry current shall be

of copper unless otherwise provided for in this code. Where the conductor material is not specified,

the sizes given in this code shall apply to copper conductors. Where other materials are used, the

size shall be changed accordingly. Aluminum and copper aluminum will be approved only as o
designed and recommended by a Registered Professional Engineer or a Registered Architect or the e
enforcing authority. In no case shall any aluminum current carrying conductor be smaller than #2.

210.8 (A) (7) Add:
Exception. Dedicated circuits installed for specific appliances such as clothes washers, refrigerators
and microwaves shall not be required to be GFCI-protected where located within 6 feet of laundry,

utility or wet bar sinks in a dwelling.
210.12 Arc-Fault Circuit Interrupter Protection. Delete.

210.52 (B)(1). This section shall read as follows; In the kitchen, dining room, pantry, breakfast
room and similar areas, two or more small appliance branch circuits shall serve all wall and floor
receptacle outlets, all countertop receptacle outlets and receptacle outlets for refrigeration
equipment. One or both of the required small appliance branch circuits shall be permitted to
serve other receptacle outlets in the same kitchen and in the other rooms previously specified.
Additional small appliance circuits shall be permitted. Small appliance circuits are not permitted
to serve outlets outside of these rooms or areas, and shall not serve more than one kitchen.

Small appliance branch circuits are intended to serve kitchen appliances and utilization
equipment. No more than three outlets or openings shall be allowed on a small appliance branch
circuit, except that all dining room receptacles may be served by a small appliance branch
circuit. Small appliance branch circuits are not allowed to serve room lighting, except or unless
the lighting is a manufactured part of equipment served by these circuits.

A refrigerator may be served by a dedicated 15 amp circuit.



NEC 2005

A microwave oven shall be served by a dedicated 20 amp circuit.
In no case shall the load exceed the rating of a branch circuit.”

210.52 (B)(3). This section shall read as follows; Receptacles installed in the kitchen to serve
countertop surfaces shall be supplied by not less than two small appliance branch circuits, except
that these circuits shall also be permitted to serve electric clock receptacles and electric loads
associated with gas-fired appliances.

230.70(A)(1). Add: Inside the nearest point of entrance is defined as the first full stud space inside
structure.

250.50 Grounding Electrode System. All grounding electrodes as described in 250.52(A)(1)
through (A)(6) that are present at each building or structure served shall be bonded together to form
the grounding electrode system. Where none of these grounding electrodes exist, one or more of the
grounding electrodes specified in 250.52(A)(4) through (A)(7) shall be installed and used, except
where there exists a metal water pipe in contact with earth for 10 feet or more, for one- and two-
family dwellings, a single grounding electrode as required by the serving electrical utility shall be
permitted to fill the requirements of Article 250.50.

410.14 (B) Access to Boxes. Delete.

Article 545. Manufactured Building.

ADD:
545.14. Release from liability: Due to the fact that the Boone County Planning and Building

Inspection Department is unable to properly inspect wiring, outlets, junction boxes, etc., in
manufactured buildings, the owner is responsible for insuring that all electrical components are in
compliance with this code.

Article 550. Mobile Homes and Mobile Home Parks.

ADD:
550.34. Release from liability: Due to the fact that the Boone County Planning and Building

Inspection Department is unable to properly inspect wiring, outlets, junction boxes, etc. in
manufactured buildings, the owner is responsible for insuring that all electrical components are in

compliance with this code.



1 IPC-2006

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER

A COMMISSION ORDER ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
DESIGN, INSTALLATION AND CONSTRUCTION OF PLUMBING SYSTEMS, BY PROVIDING
REASONABLE SAFEGUARDS FOR SANITATION TO PROTECT THE PUBLIC HEALTH
AGAINST THE HAZARDS OF INADEQUATE, DEFECTIVE OR UNSANITARY PLUMBING
INSTALLATIONS; KNOWN AS THE PLUMBING CODE OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURL

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNTY COMMISSION OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE PLUMBING CODE:

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of the
Boone County Department of Planning and Building Inspection being marked and designated as the
"International Plumbing Code/2006", as published by the International Code Council, Inc., be and is
hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of Boone County, Missouri for the control of buildings and
structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of "International Plumbing Code/2006", are hereby referred to, adopted and made part hereof, as
is more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as

hereinafter prescribed.
SECTION 2. JURISDICTIONAL TITLE.

100.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appears in this code, it shall read "County of Boone, Missouri".

100.1.1 Wherever "Department of Plumbing Inspection" appears in this code, it shall read "Department
of Planning and Building Inspection of Boone County, Missouri".

100.1.2 Wherever "Chief Appointing Authority of the Jurisdiction" appears in this Code, it shall read
"Boone County Commission of Boone County, Missouri".

SECTION 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE/2006:

The International Plumbing Code/2006, is amended by additions, deletions and changes, including the
changing of Articles, Sections, Sub-sections and Subsection titles, and the addition of new Sections and

new Sub-Sections reads as follows:
101.2.1 Appendices. Appendices B, C, D, E, F and G are adopted as part of this code.

106.6.3 Fee Refunds: The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.
2. Not more than 75% of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in

accordance with this code.



2 IPC-2006

3. Not more than 75% of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan
review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has been

expended.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written application filed
by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

108.4 Delete in its entirety.

Add:

108.4 Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply
with any of the requirements thereof or who shall install plumbing work in violation of an approved plan
or directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code,
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each day that a violation continues

shall be deemed a separate offense.

108.5 Stop work orders: Delete last sentence. Insert: Any person who shall continue any work in or
about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor,

punishable as provided by law.

109.2 Delete in its entirety.

Add:

109.2- Membership of the board: The board of appeals as established in Section 112 of the International
Building Code / 2006 shall serve as the board of appeals for the International Plumbing Code.

305.6 Delete.

Add:
305.6 Freezing: Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside of a building, in attics or

crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subjected to freezing temperature unless
adequate provision is made to protect such pipes from freezing by insulation or heat or both.
Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed not less than 6 inches below the frost line (frost

line is 30”") and not less than 12 inches below grade

305.6.1 Delete.

Add:
305.6.1 Sewer Depth: Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a

minimum of eighteen (18) inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building
sewers shall be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches below grade.

Add:
602.3 Individual water supply. Where a potable public water supply is not available, individual sources

of potable water supply shall be utilized. A potable public supply system shall be considered available
to a lot if the lot is located within 300 feet of the public water main.

701.2 Delete in its entirety.

Add:
701.2 Sewer required: Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and every premises

having drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or where a public sewer is
not available, a private sewage disposal system in accordance with the requirements of the
Columbia/Boone County Health Department or the Missouri Department of Natural Resources.



3 IPC-2006

Add:
701.2.1 A public sewer system shall be considered available if a lot is within 225 feet of a sanitary

sewer system to which connection is practical and is permitted by the governmental agency or utility
responsible for the sanitary sewer.

Add:
904.1 Roof extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at least 12

inches above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather
protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 feet above the roof.



IMC - 2006
1
COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER:

A COMMISSION ORDER ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
DESIGN, INSTALLATION AND CONSTRUCTION OF MECHANICAL SYSTEMS, BY
PROVIDING REASONABLE SAFEGUARDS TO PROTECT THE PUBLIC HEALTH AND
SAFETY AGAINST THE HAZARDS OF INADEQUATE, DEFECTIVE OR UNSAFE
MECHANICAL SYSTEMS AND INSTALLATIONS; KNOWN AS THE MECHANICAL CODE OF

BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURL

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNTY COMMISSION OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE MECHANICAL CODE:

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of the
Boone County Department of Planning and Building Inspection being marked and designated as
"International Mechanical Code/2006", as published by the International Code Council, Inc., be and is
hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of Boone County, Missouri for the control of buildings and
structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of "The International Mechanical Code/2006", are hereby referred to, adopted and made part
hereof, as is more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as

hereinafter prescribed.
SECTION 2. JURISDICTIONAL TITLE.

100.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appears in this code, it shall read "County of Boone, Missouri".

100.1.1 Wherever "Department of Mechanical Inspection” appears in this code, it shall read
"Department of Planning and Building Inspection of Boone County, Missouri".

100.1.2 Wherever "Chief Appointing Authority of the Jurisdiction" appears in this Code, it shall read
"Boone County Commission of Boone County, Missouri".

SECTION 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE/2006:
The International Mechanical Code/2006 is amended by additions, deletions and changes, including the
changing of Articles, Sections, Sub-sections and Subsection titles, and the addition of new Sections and

new Sub-Sections reads as follows:

101.2 Scope Exception 2: Mechanical systems in existing buildings undergoing repair, alterations
or additions and change of occupancy shall be permitted to comply with the International

Building Code or other applicable codes.

101.2.1 Appendices. Appendix A is adopted as part of this code.



IMC - 2006
2
106.3.1 Construction Documents. Add to exception: Buildings or structures exempt from these

requirements are as follows:
a. One-Family dwellings.
b. Two family dwellings.
c. Commercial or industrial buildings having less than 1200 square feet of floor space, or
which provide for the employment, sleeping, assembly, housing or eating of not more

than nine (9) persons.
d. Any structure containing less than twenty-thousand cubic feet, except as provided above.

e. Any building or structure used exclusively for farm purposes.

106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as approved by the Boone County
Commission.

106.5.3 Delete in its entirety.

Add:
106.5.3 Fee Refunds: The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.
2. When no work has been done, the permit fee, less a processing fee of 25% of the original fee

may be refunded to the original permittee.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon written application
filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the fee was paid.

108.4 Delete in its entirety. Insert: Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter
or repair mechanical equipment or systems in violation of an approved plan or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a

separate offense.

108.5 Delete last sentence. Insert: Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each
day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

109.2 Delete in its entirety. Insert:

109.2 Membership of the board: The board of appeals as established in Section 112 of the International
Building Code / 2006 shall serve as the board of appeals for the International Mechanical Code.

109.2.1 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.2 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.3 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.4 Delete in its entirety.

109.2.5 Delete in its entirety.



IMC - 2006

3

109.2.6 Delete in its entirety.
109.3 Delete in its entirety.
109.4 Delete in its entirety.
109.4.1 Delete in its entirety.
109.5 Delete in its entirety.
109.6 Delete in its entirety.
109.6.1 Delete in its entirety.

109.6.2 Delete in its entirety.

109.7 Delete in its entirety.



IFGC - 2006
1
COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER:

A COMMISSION ORDER ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
DESIGN, INSTALLATION AND CONSTRUCTION OF FUEL GAS SYSTEMS AND GAS FIRED-
APPLIANCES, BY PROVIDING REASONABLE SAFEGUARDS TO PROTECT THE PUBLIC
HEALTH AND SAFETY AGAINST THE HAZARDS OF INADEQUATE, DEFECTIVE OR
UNSAFE FUEL GAS SYSTEMS AND GAS FIRED APPLIANCES; KNOWN AS THE FUEL GAS

CODE OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURL

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNTY COMMISSION OF BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF THE FUEL GAS CODE:

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of Building Official of the
Boone County Department of Planning and Building Inspection being marked and designated as
"International Fuel Gas Code/2006", as published by the International Code Council, Inc., be and is
hereby adopted as the Fuel Gas Code of Boone County, Missouri for the control of buildings and
structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of "The International Fuel Gas Code/2006", are hereby referred to, adopted and made part hereof,
as is more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as

hereinafter prescribed.
SECTION 2. JURISDICTIONAL TITLE.

100.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appears in this code, it shall read "County of Boone, Missouri".

100.1.1 Wherever "Department of Inspection” appears in this code, it shall read "Department of
Planning and Building Inspection of Boone County, Missouri".

100.1.2 Wherever "Chief Appointing Authority of the Jurisdiction" appears in this Code, it shall read
"Boone County Commission of Boone County, Missouri".

SECTION 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE/2006:
The International Fuel Gas Code/2006 is amended by additions, deletions and changes, including the
changing of Articles, Sections, Sub-sections and Subsection titles, and the addition of new Sections and

new Sub-Sections reads as follows:

101.2 Scope Exception 2: As an alternative to the provisions of this code, fuel-gas piping systems,
fuel-gas utilization equipment and related accessories in existing buildings that are undergoing
repairs, alterations, changes in occupancy or construction of additions shall be permitted to
comply with the International Building Code or other applicable codes.

101.3 Appendices. Appendices A, B and C are adopted as part of this code.



IFGC - 2006
2
106.3.1 Construction Documents. Add to exception: Buildings or structures exempt from these
requirements are as follows:
a. One-Family dwellings.
b. Two family dwellings.
c. Commercial or industrial buildings having less than 1200 square feet of floor space, or

which provide for the employment, sleeping, assembly, housing or eating of not more

than nine (9) persons.
d. Any structure containing less than twenty-thousand cubic feet, except as provided above.

e. Any building or structure used exclusively for farm purposes.

106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as approved by the Boone county
Commission.

106.5.3 Delete in its entirety.

Add:
106.5.3 Fee Refunds: The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.
2. When no work has been done, the permit fee, less a processing fee of 25% of the original fee

may be refunded to the original permittee.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon written application
filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the fee was paid.

108.4 Delete in its entirety. Insert: Violation penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter
or repair mechanical equipment or systems in violation of an approved plan or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a

separate offense.

108.5 Delete last sentence. Insert: Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable as provided by law. Each
day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

109.2 Delete in its entirety. Insert:

109.2 Membership of the board: The board of appeals as established in Section 112 of the International
Building Code / 2006 shall serve as the board of appeals for the International Fuel Gas Code Code.

109.2.1 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.2 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.3 Delete in its entirety.
109.2.4 Delete in its entirety.

109.2.5 Delete in its entirety.



IFGC - 2006
3
109.2.6 Delete in its entirety.

109.3 Delete in its entirety.

109.4 Delete in its entirety.

109.4.1 Delete in its entirety.

109.5 Delete in its entirety.

109.6 Delete in its entirety.

109.6.1 Delete in its entirety.

109.6.2 Delete in its eﬁtirety.

403.4.3 Copper and brass. Copper and brass pipe shall not be used if the gas contains more than an
average of 0.3 grains of hydrogen sulfide per 100 standard cubic feet of gas (0.7 milligrams per 100
liters). Natural gas supplied by Ameren UE in Boone County exceeds this level therefore copper

or brass shall not be used with natural gas. Threaded copper, brass and aluminum-alloy pipe shall
not be used with gases corrosive to such metals.

403.5.2 Copper and brass tubing. Copper tubing shall comply with standard Type K or L of ASTM B
88 or ASTM B 280.

Copper and brass tubing shall not be used if the gas contains more than an average of 0.3 grains of
hydrogen sulfide per 100 standard cubic feet of gas (0.7 milligrams per 100 liters). Natural gas
supplied by Ameren UE in Boone County exceeds this level therefore copper or brass shall not be

used with natural gas.



[ b6 2007
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

- . STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 ()7
ea
County of Boone
In the County Commission of said county, on the 16th day of January 20 (7

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
disposal of the attached surplus items by auction on Gov Deals.

Done this 16" day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: — , 2
Ad Dbl
ﬁaretn M. Miller
Wendy S./Noren District [ Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission
Skip Elkini

District I[I Commissioner




Boone County Purchasing

Tyson Boldan
Office Specialist

Commission Order:

| (o-20067

601 E.Walnut, Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201

Phone: (573) 886-4394.

SiNsTn !
MEMORANDUM RECEIVED
TO: Boone County Commission .
FROM: Tyson Boldan JAN 15 2007
RE: Miscellaneous Equipment BOONE COUNTY A
DATE: January 5, 2007 UDITOR

The following items have been identified as surplus. The Purchasing Department is requesting approval for
disposal by auction on Gov Deals for items 1 — 59. Items 60-78 will transfer within Boone County except for
item #73 - light bar. The Sheriff Department is requesting to donate that item to the police museum..

Asset Description | Make Model Condition of Asset | Serial #
#
Computer Equipment Requested for Auction
1. | 7306 Exide 5 Working - Fair
PowerWare
Plus 5 UPS
2. 112866 |PC Compagq Deskpro EX Hard Drive Removed
3. [ 10444 | Monitor Samsung 6NE | 17 inch Poor
4, | 12246 | PC Good
5. | 12088 | Microprinter 60 | Canon 60 Poor - Unreliable AQ301411
6. {NoTag |3 Com Office Poor 0200/7H4F034410
Connect 4 Port
7. 112760 |3 Com Office Poor
Connect 56K
8. [ 12716 |3 Com Office Poor
Connect 56K
9. |NoTag |3 Com Office Poor 0200/7H4F034405
Connect 4 port
10.] 12691 | PC Compaq Armada E500 Poor - hard drive
removed
11. | 8909 Printer Lexmark OptraR Poor
12. | 13451 | Monitor Gateway EV700 17" Poor
13.|NoTag | PC IBM Cloan PC Non-Working
14.|NoTag | PC IBM Cloan PC Non-Working
15. | 8628 Laser LaserJet 4 HP Very Poor
16. | No Tag | KDS Monitor Poor 0495622959
17.112770 | PC Compaq lpag P733 Hard Drive Removed
18.] 12835 | PC Compagq Ipaq P733 Hard Drive Removed
19.112831 | PC Compag lpag P733 Hard Drive Removed




Commission Order:

20.112513 | PC Compaq Ipag P733 Hard Drive Removed

21.112803 | PC Compaq Ipag P733 Hard Drive Removed

22.112816 | PC Compaq Ipaq P733 Hard Drive Removed

23.112818 | PC Compagq Ipaq P733 Hard Drive Removed

24112509 | PC Compaq Ipaq Hard Drive Removed

25.112837 | PC Compagq Ipaq Hard Drive Removed

26. 12793 | PC Compaq Ipag Hard Drive Removed

27.112839 | PC Compaq Ipaq Hard Drive Removed

28.112795 | PC Compaq lpaq Hard Drive Removed

29.] 12833 | PC Compaq Ipag Hard Drive Removed

30. | 12555 | Desk Pro Compaq Hard Drive Removed

31. | 12517 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

32. | 12928 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

33. | 12925 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

34. 12922 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

35. | 12924 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

36. | 11425 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

37. 112923 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

38. | 13352 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

39. 12926 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

40. | 12324 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

41.1 12929 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

42.| 12927 | Monitor 17" Compaq S710 Very Poor

43.| 12561 | Monitor 17" Compagq S710 Very Poor

44.| 12868 | DeskPro Compaq EX Hard Drive Removed

45. | 14197 | 10 CORP 4465 Non- Working

X

46.| 7313 | Printer IBM 4019-001 Non- Working 11-0018748

47.1 13717 |PC Gateway 450SX4 Hard Drive Removed
Non-Working

48.| No Tag | Printer Brother Laser Non-Working U60065J2J971252

Items Requested for Auction

49. | No Tag | Cash Register | Royal Non-Working 164588

50. | 2707 Typewriter Selectric Il Non-Working

51.1 13248 | Video Cassette | Samsung Non-Working

Recorder




Commission Order:

52.109221 | Cell Phone Hard Wire Hands Free Poor
53.| 15109 | Clothes Washer | Magic Chef Drum Gear Broken CAV2004AWW
54.| 2707 | Typewriter Selectric Il Broken
55. | No Tag | Typewriter Brother Non- Working
56. | 09658 | Metal (gray) Good
Coat Closet
57.1 07804 | Revolving File Fair (Assembly Rqrd)
& 9073 | cabinets
58.1 9996, | Three sets of Fair
9997, & | shelves-metal
9998
59.1 14233 | HP Non-Working
VS80Autoloade
r Sure Store
Transfer Requests
60. | 09087 | Phone Meridian Working To Purchasing
61. | 9906 Couch Teal Blue Excellent To Barbra Morris
Child Services
Office
62. | 12727 | Wood Desk To Public
Administrator's
Office
63. | 08257 | Credenza To Public
Administrator's
Office
64.| 10216 | Wood Chair To Public
Administrator’s
Office
65.| 10217 | Wood Chair To Public
Administrator's
Office
66. | 2378 Wood Chair To Public
Administrator’s
Office
67. | 2378 Printer Table To Circuit Clerk’s
Office




Commission Order:

68. | 08262 | Wood Desk To Public
Administrator's
Office
69. | 08255 | Wood Desk To Public
Administrator's
Office
70.| 2179 Wood Table To Public
Administrator's
office
71.1 06371 | Wood Table To Public
Administrator's
Office
72.) 09430 | Bookshelf-Dark Excellent To Juvenile Office
Wood
73.1 10618 | Code 3 Light LP600 Poor Donated to Police
Bar Museum
74.| 04060 | Safe and Safe Good To Public
&- Cover Administration
04061
75. | No Tag | Book Professional To Purchasing
Secretary
76.| No Tag | Book Word for To Purchasing
Windows for
Dummies
77.| No Tag | Spiral To Purchasing for
Telephone Parts
Cord
78.| No Tag | Spiral To Purchasing for
Telephone Parts
Cord
cc. Auditor

Surplus File




[ -2007
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 (7
€a

County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 1 6'h day of January 20 (7

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid
01-04JANO7 Road Sweeper to G.W. Van Keppel. It is further ordered that the Presiding
Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said contracts.

Done this 16™ day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: ‘ / /
Ade 3 Pl

%ﬁ% Karen M. Miller

Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission %

Skip E1kin\
District II Commissioner




Commission Order # ‘ 7 - 3007

PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR
ROAD SWEEPER

THIS AGREEMENT dated the llp  dayof  U¥hiig s . 2007 is made
between Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of @» tate of Mjssouri through the

Boone County Commission, herein “County” and G. W. Van Keppel, herein “Contractor.”

IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations
contained herein, the parties agree as follows:

1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for the
Road Sweeper, bid number 01-04JAN07 including Introduction and General Conditions of
Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the unexecuted Response
Form, Standard Terms & Conditions, any applicable addenda, as well as the Contractor’s bid
response dated January 3, 2007 and executed by David Bolerjack, on behalf of the Contractor.
All such documents shall constitute the contract documents which are attached hereto and
incorporated herein by reference. Service or product data, specification and literature submitted
with bid response may be permanently maintained in the County Purchasing Office bid file for
this bid if not attached. In the event of conflict between any of the foregoing documents, the
terms, conditions, provisions and requirements contained in the bid specifications including
Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response Presentation
and Review, the unexecuted Response Form, Standard Terms & Conditions, and any applicable
addenda shall prevail and control over the Contractor’s bid response.

2. Purchase - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor agrees
to supply the County with the following:

e Jtem 4.8.1. — Broce Broom Model RJ350 with 200 Hours $28,250.00
3. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver the equipment per the bid specifications.

4, Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to Boone County Public Work’s
Department and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor’s bid response. No
additional fees for delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional charges in
excess of the charges in the Contractor’s bid response to the specifications. The County agrees to
pay all invoices within thirty days of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any cash or prompt
payment discounts offered in its bid response if county makes payment as provided therein. In
the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the right to withhold payment on the disputed
amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of the Contractor, the County agrees
to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld commencing from the
last date that payment was due.

5. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their
successors and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect.



6. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties
and supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or
contractual agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with
the same formality as this agreement.

7. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance
written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances:

a. County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or
condition of this agreement, or

b. County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or

c. Ifappropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have
executed this agreement on the day and year first above written.

G.W. VAN KEPPEL BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI

] < §Z—R by: Boone County Commissign
title  Exec. V. /9/265, W

Kenneth Pearson, Presiding Commissioner

APPROVEPMAS TO FORM: ATTEST:
J MMé w 0/1.0/-———! 7
County Caunselor Wendy S. Nor@ County Clerk

AUDITOR CERTIFICATION

In accordance with RSMo 55.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance exists and is

available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this contract. (Note: Certification of this contract is not required if
e terms of the contract do not create in a measurable county obligation at this time.)

:fbke % 4 C/kﬁé/vi/ '/4/07
Signature , Date Appropriation Account
EER

2040/91300 — $28,250.00




County of Boone Purchasing Department
4, Response Form

4.1. Company Name:
G W_VAN KEPPEL

42. Address:
1801 NORTH 9TH STREET

43. City/Zip:
KANSAS ETTY, KS 66101
4.4. Phone Number:

913 281-4800

45. Fax Number:
913 281-4815

4.6. E-Mail Address:
DBOLERJACK@VANKEPPEL.COM

47. Federal Tax ID:

44-0513694
4.71. &) Corporation
() Partnership - Name
() Individual/Proprietorship - Individual Name
() Other (Specify)
4.8. PRICING
Unit Price Qty Extended Price
4.8.1. Road Sweeper Per Section 2 $_28,250.00 1 $_28,250.00
Make: BRQCE BROOM
Model: __RJ350
Hours on Machine: __200
4.8.2. Extra Brush Discs (Price Per Each) $_6.72
4.9. Cash Discount $ net days
4.10. GRAND TOTAL (4.8.1. -4.10.) $_ 28,250.00
4.11. Hourly Labor/Repair Rate per section 2.3.18. $__100.00 /hr
4.12. Percentage discount off list price of OEM parts 3 %

NOTE: INCLUDE ALL BID SUBMISSION ITEMS LISTED IN SECTION 2.5. WITH THE BID
4.13. RESPONSE

4.14. Describe Warranty Features:

- PLEASE SEE ATTACHED WARRANTY FORM.

4.15. Describe Any Deviations

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 6



4.16.

4.16.1.

4.16.2.

4.17.

4.18.

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SHEET

The undersigned offers to furnish and deliver the articles or services as specified at the prices and terms stated and in
strict accordance with all requirements contained in the Request for Bid which have been read and understood, and all
of which are made part of this order. By submission of this bid, the vendor certifies that they are in compliance with
Section 34.353 and, if applicable, Section 34.359 (“Missouri Domestic Products Procurement Act”) of the Revised
Statutes of Missouri.

Authorized Re esentative ign By Ha@
Mgﬂ 2 ‘ Date: 3077

Print Name and Title of Authoriz#d Representative

DAVID BOLERJACK SALES

Will you honor the submitted prices for purchase by other entities in Boone County who participate in cooperative

purchasing with Boone County, Missouri?
_ X Yes _ No

Delivery ARO:

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 7



THE G. W. VAN KEPPEL COMPANY

1801 North 9th Street, Kansas City, KS 66101  (913) 281-4800
P.O. Box 2923, Kansas City, KS 66110 Fax (913)281-4815

an

SINCE 1926

01-02-2007

Boone County Purchasing
601 E. Walnut, Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201

Heather Turner, Senior Buyer
Phone: 573.886.4392
Fax: 573.886.4390

BID SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS

.5.1.1) 2006 BROCE BROOM RJ350

.5.1.2) 200 HOURS

.5.1.3) MACHINE IS IN (LIKE NEW CONDITION)

.5.1.4) NO SERVICE HISTORY ON RECORD

.5.1.5) ALL STANDARD EQUIPMENT SPECS ON BACK OF BROCHURE WITH OPTOINS MARK *

.5.1.6) SERVICE -~ VAN KEPPEL, KANSAS CITY KS, PARTS - VAN KEPPEL, COLUMBIA MO
MIKE RAY, 573.474.0182

[SS 2N SIN SN S I SN N

[ M)

1 DEALER LAST YEAR
2.5.1.8) 1 YEAR/1000 HOURS
2.5.1.9) PLEASE SEE ATTACHED WARRANTY SPECS
2.5.1.10) EXTENDED 12 MONTH OR 1000 HOUR WARRANTY FOR A COST OF $575.00.

RESPONSE FORM DEVIATIONS
2.3.20) STANDARD FACTORY WARRANTY IS 1 YEAR OR 1000 HOURS WHICHEVER COMES FIRST.

.5.1.7) VAN KEPPEL HAS 25 YEARS OF SERVICE WORK ON THE BROCE BOOMS AND WAS THE NUMBER



CONTRACT DOCUMENTS
BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI
BID #01-04JANG7 Road Sweeper

ADDENDUM #1
(Issued December 14, 2006)

This addendum is issued in accordance with the Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding and is hereby
incorporated into and made a part of the Contract Documents. Bidders are reminded that receipt of this addendum
should be acknowledged and submitted with bidder's Response Form.

Specifications for the above noted Request for Bid and the work covered thereby are herein modified as follows, and
except as set forth herein, otherwise remain unchanged and in full force and effect:

BID DOCUMENTS:
1. Revise Section 2.3.9. as follows:

Brakes: Rear brake shall be self adjusting hydraulic with dual master cylinder for backup safety. A
mechanical type parking brake with indicator light shall be furnished. Front brakes shall be disc type.

. ’-—-_—_——
By:
eather Turner, CPPB

Senior Buyer

BIDDER has examined copy of Addendum #1 to Request for Bid #01-04JANO7 Road Sweeper, receipt of which is hereby
acknowledged:

Company Name: G W VAN KEPPEL
1801 NORTH 9TH STREET

KANSAS CITY, KS 66101
913 281-4800 v 913 281-4815

Phone Number: — Q_W Fax Number:
Authorized Representative Signature: 3 Date: 1-02-2007

Address:




——mre—

et R

BROCE MANUFACTURING COMPANY

BROCE BROOM LIMITED TWELVE MONTH WARRANTY

For a period of twelve (12) months or 1,000 hours whichever comes first, from the date
of delivery of product to the original user, Broce Manufacturing of Dodge City, Kansas
warrants each product to be free from manufacturing defects, subject to the limitations
contained in this policy. This limited warranty covers parts and labor.

This warranty does not apply to defect caused, in whole or in part, by unreasonable use
while in the possession of the user, including, but not limited to, failure to properly set
up product, failure to provide reasonable and necessary maintenance, normal wear,
routine tune ups or adjustments, improper handling, accidents, operation at speed or
load conditions contrary to published specifications, improper or insufficient lubrication,
or improper storage. This warranty is not a guarantee that the performance of each
product will meet the expectations of the purchaser.

Broce Manufacturing shall not be liable for consequential damage of any kind, including,
but not limited to: consequential labor costs or transportation charges in connection
with the replacement or repair of defective parts, lost time or expense which may have
accrued because of said defects. In no event shall Broce Manufacturing’s total liability
hereunder exceed the product purchase price.

Many components used by Broce Manufacturing are subject to the warranties of their
respective manufacturers. These warranties will be considered void if the product is
maodified or repaired in any way not expressly authorized, or if closed components are
disassembled prior to return. Closed components include, but are not limited to
gearboxes, hydraulic pumps, motors, cylinders and actuators.

Our obligation under the warranty is expressly limited, at our option, to the replacement
or repair at Broce Manufacturing of Dodge City, KS or at a service facility designated by
us. We are not responsible for unauthorized repairs or replacements. Any implied or
statutory warranties, including any warranty of merchantability or fitness for a particular
purpose, are expressly limited to duration of this written warranty. We make no other
express warranty. This warranty cannot be extended, broadened, or changed except in
writing by an authorized officer of Broce Manufacturing.



CONTRACT DOCUMENTS
BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI
BID #01-04JANO7 Road Sweeper

ADDENDUM #1
(Issued December 14, 2006)

This addendum is issued in accordance with the Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding and is hereby
incorporated into and made a part of the Contract Documents. Bidders are remninded that receipt of this addendum
should be acknowledged and submitted with bidder’s Response Form.

Specifications for the above noted Request for Bid and the work covered thereby are herein modified as follows, and
except as set forth herein, otherwise remain unchanged and in futl force and effect:

BID DOCUMENTS:
1. Revise Section 2.3.9. as follows:

Brakes: Rear brake shall be self adjusting hydraulic with dual master cylinder for backup safety. A
mechanical type parking brake with indicator light shall be furnished. Front brakes shall be disc type.

By:
Heather Turner, CPPB
Senior Buyer

BIDDER has examined copy of Addendum #1 to Request for Bid #01-04JANO7 Road Sweeper, receipt of which is hereby
acknowledged:

Company Name:

Address:

Phone Number: Fax Number:

Authorized Representative Signature: Date:




Boone County Purchasing
601 E. Walnut, Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201

Request For Bid (RFB)
Heather Turner, Senior Buyer
573/886-4392 - FAX 573/886-4390
Email: hturner@boonecountymo.org
Bid Data

Bid Nurnber: 01-04JANO7
Commodity Title: Road Sweeper

DIRECT BID FORMAT OR SUBMISSION QUESTIONS TO THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Bid Submission Address and Deadline
Day / Date:  THURSDAY, JANUARY 4, 2007
Time: 10:30 AM (Bids received after this time will be returned unopened)
Location / Mail Address: Boone County Purchasing Department
Boone County Johnson Building
601 E. Walnut, Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201

Directions: The Johnson Building is located on the Northeast corner at 6" St.
and Walnut St. Enter the building from the East Side. Wheel chair
accessible entrance is available on the West side of the building.

Bid Opening
Day / Date: THURSDAY, JANUARY 4, 2007
Time: 10:30 AM
Location / Address: Boone County Johnson Building Conference Room
601 E. Walnut, Room 213
Columbia, MO 65201

Bid Contents
1.0: Introduction and General Terms and Conditions of
Bidding
2.0: Primary Specifications
3.0: Response Presentation and Review
4.0: Response Form
Standard Terms and Conditions
“No Bid” Form

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 1



County of Boone Purchasing Department
1. _Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding

1.1. INVITATION - The County of Boone, through its Purchasing Department, invites responses, which offer to provide
the goods and/or services identified on the title page, and described in greater detail in Section 2.

1.2. DEFINITIONS

1.2.1. County - This term refers to the County of Boone, a duly organized public entity. 1t may also be used as a pronoun
for various subsets of the County organization, including, as the context will indicate:

Purchasing - The Purchasing Department, including its Purchasing Director and staff.

Department/s or Office/s - The County Department/s or Office/s for which this Bid is prepared, and which will be the
end user/s of the goods and/or services sought.

Designee - The County employee/s assigned as your primary contact/s for interaction regarding Contract
performance.

1.2.2. Bidder/ Contractor / Supplier - These terms refer generally to businesses having some sort of relationship to or
with us, The term may apply differently to different classes of entities, as the context will indicate.

Bidder - Any business entity submitting a response to this Bid. Suppliers, which may be invited to respond, or which
express interest in this bid, but which do not submit a response, have no obligations with respect to the bid
requirements.

Contractor - The Bidder whose response to this bid is found by Purchasing to meet the best interests of the County.
The Contractor will be selected for award, and will enter into a Contract for provision of the goods and/or services
described in the Bid.

Supplier - All business/s entities which may provide the supject goods and/or services.

1.2.3. Bid - This entire document, including attachments. A Bid may be used to solicit various kinds of information. The
kind of information this Bid seeks is indicated by the title appearing at the top of the first page. An “Invitation For Bid”
is used when the need is well defined. An “Invitation For Proposal” is used when the County will consider solutions,
which may vary significantly from each other or from the County’s initial expectations.

1.2.4. Response - The written, sealed document submitted according to the Bid instructions.

1.3. BID CLARIFICATION - Questions regarding this Bid should be directed in writing, preferably by fax, to the
Purchasing Department. Answers, citing the question asked but not identifying the questioner, will be distributed
simultaneously to all known prospective Bidders. Note: written requirements in the Bid or its Amendments are
binding, but any oral communications between County and Bidder are not.

1.3.1. Bidder Responsibility - The Bidder is expected to be thoroughly familiar with all specifications and requirements of
this Bid. Bidders failure or omission to examine any relevant form, article, site or document will not relieve them from
any obligation regarding this Bid. By submitting a Response, Bidder is presumed to concur with all terms, conditions
and specifications of this Bid.

1.3.2. Bid Amendment - If it becomes evident that this Bid must be amended, the Purchasing Department will issue a
formal written Amendment to all known prospective Bidders. If necessary, a new due date will be established.

14. AWARD - Award will be made to the Bidder(s) whose offer(s) provide the greatest value to the County from the
standpoint of suitability to purpose, quality, service, previous experience, price, lifecycle cost, ability to deliver, or for
any other reason deemed by Purchasing to be in the best interest of the County. Thus, the result will not be
determined by price alone. The County will be seeking the least costly outcome that meets the County needs as
interpreted by the County. The County reserves the right to compare the lowest bid received with the current State
contract pricing, and award in the best interest of the County.

1.5. CONTRACT EXECUTION - This Bid and the Contractor's Response will be made part of any resultant Contract and
will be incorporated in the Contract as set forth, verbatim.

1.5.1.  Precedence - In the event of contradictions or corflicts between the provisions of the documents comprising this
Contract, they will be resolved by giving precedence in the following order:

1) the provisions of the Contract (as it may be amended);
2) the provisions of the Bid,;
3) the provisions of the Bidder's Response.

1.6. COMPLIANCE WITH STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS - Bidder agrees to be bound by the County’s

standard “boilerplate” terms and conditions for Contracts, a sample of which is attached to this Bid.

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 2



County of Boone Purchasing Department

2.
21.

2.2.
221.
2.3.
23.1.

23.2.

233.

234,

235.

2.36.

237.
238.

239

2.3.10.

2311
2.312.

2.3.13.

2.3.14.

2.3.15.

Primary Specifications

ITEMS TO BE PROVIDED - Boone County, hereafter referred to as “County”, proposes to contract with an
individual(s) or organization(s), hereinafter referred to as “Contractor” for a contract for the furnishing and delivery of
a Self Propelled Road Sweeper with all manufacturer's standard equipment and those features as outlined below.
Note: Low hour (500 hours or less) demonstration or rental units may also be considered.

ACCEPTABLE MODELS - Walden Sweepmaster 250, Broce Broom RJ 350, or ather comparable machines.
Quantity — 1 Note: Vendor will be bidding on one (1) Road Sweeper.

MINIMUM TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

Operating Weight: A minimum of 4,500 Ib. and heaviest configuration shall not exceed 6,000 Ibs. including
ROPS/FOPS enclosed cab.

Engine: Rear mounted for better visibility. Minimum 276 cubic inch (4.5 liter), 80 HP diesel at 2500 RPM. Diesel
engine to be equipped with replaceable wet-type forged steel cylinder liners and forged dynamicalty balanced
crankshaft constructed of heat-treated high carbon steel. Air cleaner to be dual element dry-type with pre-cleaner at
cab height, 12-volt system, 95 amp. And 750 CCA battery. Alternator, ignition key start and variable speed
governor. Fuel tank to be 20 gallon minimum and have interior rust-inhibiting coating. Engine shall be completely
covered with hinged, solid metal, lockable cover.

Transmission: Shall be fully hydrostatic, with speeds infinitely variable to 30 MPH. A 10-micron suction filter will
provide oil to the hydrostatic pump. Hydrostatic transmission shall be a closed loop, variable speed direct engine
pump, with a fixed displacement motor coupled with a two-speed manual transmission, to provide gradability up to
45 degrees and neutral position for towing. Closed loop cooling by a hot oil shuttle built into the motor and the case
drain in the hydrostatic pump, returned to the tank through the oil cooler. Foot control shall be used for forward and
reverse, as well as dynamic braking. Hydrostatic control to be spring loaded to return to positive neutral position
when foot is removed. This prevents inadvertent movement when sitting stationary, with the engine running.
Instruments: All gauges to be assembled on a common dash with easy visibility from operator's seat. To include
hour meter, tachometer, oil, water temperature, and fuel gauge. Traffic horn with horn button inside steering wheel
and reverse alarm, with a minimum of 90 decibels.

Frame and Cab: All material shall be solid weld, heavy structural steel, minimum 6" channel front and rear
burnpers. Certified OSHA approved rollover protection structure (ROPS) and cab with heavy duty tinted safety
glass, right and left full view doors, door locks, windshield wiper, padded insulation, floor mat, heater and defroster
fan, windshield washer, west coast mirrors.

Air conditioning. Air conditioning shall consist of a pressurized system with condenser mounted in the rear with
the radiator and oil cooler condenser. Blower fan shall be of sufficient CFM to adequately cool the cab.

Steering: Shall be open center orbital type power steering unit, with power beyond and dead steering capabilities.
Tires: P235 or P225/75R15 radials on 5 bolt steel automotive grade wheels. All wheels must interchange front and
rear.

Brakes: Rear brake shall be self adjusting hydraulic with dual master cylinder for backup safety. A mechanical
type parking brake with indicator light shall be furnished. Brakes shall be disc type.

Brush Core: Shall be steel constructed for use with minimum 32" diameter wafer type brush segments. Shall be
10" diameter by 8' in length with capacity for 7'-6” of polypropylene wafers. Brush to be powered by hydraulic motor
independent of travel speed, with direct drive motor located inside the brush core. A heavy duty shock absorber to
be utilized on core support frame to maintain core balance. Full length rubber shield shall be provided to deflect
flying debris from damaging other parts of the sweeper. Brush assembly shall have a wrap-around type, 16 gauge
metal shield the length of the brush core and covering 140 degrees at a minimum. Brush shall be outfitted with
electronic variable speed brush control for varied speeds in different applications.

Sweeping Angle: Unit shall be capable of sweeping 45 degrees left to 45 degrees right.

Brush Mounting: Brush shall be mounted in such @ manner that it is “pulled” permitting it to “float” through a range
of at least 12" to follow the contour of the pavement plus the ability to be locked in any position, for extra heavy
sweeping.
Lighting Systems: Machine shall include two headiamps, stop, tail and turn signals with controller and flashe
(including 4-way flashers). Optional equipment shall include 4 led strobes — two visible from the front and two from
the rear with separate switch mounted in the cab.

Overall Operating Specification/Dimensions: Minimum wheelbase of 11 ft. 1 in. Unit shall have a maximum
overall transport length of 16 ft.

Manuals/Videos: Operator's manual, safety and operation video, parts book(s) and service/repair manual(s) shall

Bid #01-04JANG7 Page 3



2.3.16.

2.317.

2.3.18.

2.3.19.

2.3.20.
2.3.21.

2.3.22.
2.3.23.

2.3.24.
2.3.25.

24.
24.1.
24.2.
24.3.

2.5.
25.1.
25.1.1.
251.2.
2513
2514
25.15.
2.5.1.6.

2.5.17.
25.138.
2519
2.5.1.10.

be furnished with each machine upon delivery. Manual(s) may be in the form of CD’s or DVD's,

Equipment Training: The successful vendor agrees to provide an appropriate on-site machine operation and
preventative maintenance training program for a maximum of two (2) county operators and two (2) county
equipment technicians in sufficient scope as to assure efficient and economical performances and maintenance of
the equipment as purchased.

Vendor Service/Repair Facilities. Because the maintenance and repair of this type equipment is complex and due
to the critical nature of our operation, repair parts and service must be adequately and readily available. The vendor
shall certify that he/she maintains an adequate stock of repair parts and service items within the area and employs
qualified service and repair technicians within the area, available within 12 hours. The vendor should state in the
returned bid response the location of the service and repair facility, parts depot, and credentials of the service and
repair person(s).

Labor and Part Rates: The County is interested in contracting repair labor and original equipment manufacture
parts with awarded contractor for a minimum of 5 years. Bidder will be asked to provide a fixed hourly labor rate
and a percentage discount on OEM parts. Any additional charges must be identified in the bidder's response.
Deviation(s): Any deviation(s) to the above specification(s) shall be listed on a separate sheet(s} of paper and
attached to the response form stating section number, component(s) with deviation(s) and a clearly defined
explanation for deviation(s). Failure to properly identify deviations may render the bidder's proposal non-responsive
and not capable of consideration for award. Bidders should note that a descriptive brochure of the model bid may not
be acceptable as proper identification of deviations from the written specifications.

Warranty: A full machine, 1 year / unlimited hour warranty shall be applied to the machine.

Demonstration: Prior to awarding the bid, vendor(s) may be requested to demonstrate equipment on-site at the
Boone County Public Works Department to determine the most feasible and suitable machine for the operation.
Evaluation will be based upon engine power and performance, loader hydraulic system performance and
production, fuel consumption, loader breakout force and lift capacity, operator cab configuration, comfort,
conveniences, operator visibility 360 degrees, and ease of maintenance and repair, as well as, scheduled
preventative maintenance costs.

Designee — Boone County Public Works 5551 Hwy 63 South Columbia, MO 65201

Contact - Heather Turner, Boone County Purchasing Department 601 E. Walnut, Room 209, Columbia, MO 65201.
Telephone: 573-886-4392 Facsimile: 573-886-4390 Email: hturner@boonecountymo.org

Delivery: Units shall be delivered with Bill of Sale and Manufacturer's Statement of Origin. The unit shall be
assigned to Boone County Public Works, 601 E. Walnut, Room 208, Columbia, MO 65201.

Delivery Terms: FOB Boone County Public Works Department, Maintenance Operations, 5551 Highway 63 South,
Columbia, MO 65201

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Equipment shall be properly serviced, including grease and oil to the proper levels.

Vendor to include product literature for each proposed piece of equipment.

Bid evaluation will be based on quality, reliability, delivery time ARO, and cost. Quality and reliability may be
determined by using information contained in product reviews from established publications and demonstration of
machine.

BID SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS

The bidder should include the following with their bid submittal:

Year, make, and model of proposed unit,

Hours on the unit,

General condition (engine, tires-% wear, body, etc.),

Service history on proposed unit,

Detailed brochures with specifications on the proposed unit,

Describe the nearest authorized service and repair facility as well as the nearest parts depot and supply a contact
name, location, and telephone number,

Credentials of the repair personnel,

State details for any factory/dealer warranty for the proposed unit,

Describe warranty on parts and labor, and

Describe any extended warranty available after original warranty has expired. Include terms and pricing in the bid
response. :

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 4



County of Boone Purchasing Department

3. _Response Presentation and Review

3.1

3.2,

3.2.1.

33.

3.3.1.

34.

34.1.

35.

35.1.
35.2.

3.5.3.

RESPONSE CONTENT - In order to enable direct comparison of competing Responses, Bidder must submit
Response in strict conformity to the requirements stated herein. Failure to adhere to all requirements may result in
Bidder's Response being disqualified as non-responsive. All Responses must be submitted using the provided
Response Sheet. Every question must be answered and if not applicable, the section must contain “N/A.”
Manufacturer's published specifications for the items requested shall be included with the response.

SUBMITTAL OF RESPONSES - Responses MUST be received by the date and time noted on the title page under
“Bid Submission Information and Deadline”. NO EXCEPTIONS. The County is not responsible for late or incorrect
deliveries from the US Postal Service or any other mail carrier.

Advice of Award - If you wish to be advised of the outcome of this Bid, the results may also be viewed on our web
page www.showmeboone.com.

BID OPENING - On the date and time and at the location specified on the title page, all Responses will be opened in
public. Brief summary information from each will be read aloud, and any person present will be allowed, under
supervision, to scan any Response.

Removal from Vendor Database - If any prospective Bidder currently in our Vendor Database to whom the Bid was
sent elects not to submit a Response and fails to reply in writing stating reasons for not bidding, that Bidder's name
may be removed from our database. Other reasons for removal include unwillingness or inability to show financial
responsibility, reported poor performance, unsatisfactory service, or repeated inability to meet delivery requirements.
RESPONSE CLARIFICATION - The County reserves the right to request additional written or oral information from
Bidders in order to obtain clarification of their Responses. '
Rejection or Correction of Responses - The County reserves the right to reject any or all Responses. Minor
irregularities or informalities in any Response which are immaterial or inconsequential in nature, and are neither
affected by law nor at substantial variance with Bid conditions, may be waived at our discretion whenever it is
determined to be in the County’s best interest.

EVALUATION PROCESS - The County's sole purpose in the evaluation process is to determine from among the
Responses received which one is best suited to meet the County’s needs at the lowest possible cost. Any final
analysis or weighted point score does not imply that one Bidder is superior to anather, but simply that in our judgment
the Contractor selected appears to offer the best overall solution for our current and anticipated needs at the lowest
possible cost.

Method of Evaluation - The County will evaluate submitted Responses in relation to all aspects of this Bid.
Acceptability — The County reserves the sole right to determine whether goods and/or services offered are
acceptable for County use.

Endurance of Pricing - Bidder's pricing must be held until contract execution or 60 days, whichever comes first.

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 5



County of Boone

Purchasing Department

4,
41.

4.2.

43.

44,

45.

46.

47.

471.

4.8.

4.8.1.

4.8.2.

4.9.

4.10.

4.11.

4.12.

4.13.

4.14.

4.15.

Response Form

Company Name:

Address:

City/Zip:

Phone Number:

Fax Number;

E-Mail Address:

Federal Tax ID:

Corporation

Partnership - Name
Individual/Proprietorship - Individual Name

(
(
(
(

Other (Specify)

PRICING
Unit Price

Road Sweeper Per Section 2 $

Make:

Model:

Hours on Machine:

Extra Brush Discs (Price Per Each)

Cash Discount $

net

Extended Price

$

days

GRAND TOTAL (4.8.1. — 4.10.)
Hourly Labor/Repair Rate per section 2.3.18.

Percentage discount off list price of OEM parts

/hr

%

NOTE: INCLUDE ALL BID SUBMISSION ITEMS LISTED IN SECTION 2.5. WITH THE BID

RESPONSE

Describe Warranty Features:

Describe Any Deviations

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 6



4.16. The undersigned offers to furnish and deliver the articles or services as specified at the prices and terms stated and in
strict accordance with all requirements contained in the Request for Bid which have been read and understood, and all
of which are made part of this order. By submission of this bid, the vendor certifies that they are in compliance with
Section 34.353 and, if applicable, Section 34.359 (“Missouri Domestic Products Procurement Act”) of the Revised

Statutes of Missouri.
4.16.1. Authorized Representative (Sign By Hand):

Date;

4.16.2. Print Name and Title of Authorized Representative

4.17. Wil you honor the submitted prices for purchase by other entities in Boone County who participate in cooperative
purchasing with Boone County, Missouri?
Yes No

4.18. Delivery ARO:

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 7



Boone County Purchasing
601 E. Walnut, Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201

Standard Terms and Conditions

Heather Turner, Senior Buyer
573/886-4392 - FAX 573/886-4390

1. Responses shall include all charges for packing, delivery, installation, etc., (unless otherwise
specified) to the Boone County Department identified in the Request for Quotation and/or
Proposal.

2. The Boone County Commission has the right to accept or reject any part or parts of all bids, to

waive technicalities, and to accept the offer the County Commission considers the most
advantageous to the County. Boone County reserves the right to award this bid on an item-by-
item basis, or an “all or none” basis, whichever is in the best interest of the County.

3. Bidders must use the bid forms provided for the purpose of submitting bids, must return the
guotation and bid sheets comprised in this bid, give the unit price, extended totals, and sign
the bid.

4, When products or materials of any particular producer or manufacturer are mentioned in our

specifications, such products or materials are intended to be descriptive of type or quality and
not restricted to those mentioned.

5. Do not include Federal Excise Tax or Sales and Use Taxes in bid process, as law exempts the
County from them.

6. The delivery date shall be stated in definite terms, as it will be taken into consideration in
awarding the bid.

7. The County Commission reserves the right to cancel all or any part of orders if delivery is not
made or work is not started as guaranteed. In case of delay, the Contractor must notify the
Purchasing Department.

8. In case of default by the Contractor, the County of Boone will procure the articles or services
from other sources and hold the Bidder responsible for any excess cost occasioned thereby.

9. Failure to deliver as guaranteed shall disqualify Bidder from future bidding.

10. Prices must be as stated in units of quantity specified, and must be firm. Bids qualified by
escalator clauses may not be considered unless specified in the bid specifications.

11. No bid transmitted by fax machine will be accepted.

12. The County of Boone, Missouri expressly denies responsibility for, or ownership of any item
purchased until same is delivered to the County and is accepted by the County.

13. The County reserves the right to award to one or multiple respondents. The County also

reserves the right to not award any item or group of items if the services can be obtained from
a state or other governmental entities contract under more favorable terms.

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 8



Boone County Purchasing
Heather Turner
Senior Buyer

601 E.Walnut-Room 209
Columbia, MO 65201
Phone: (573) 886-4392
Fax: (573) 886-4390

“NO BID” RESPONSE FORM

NOTE: COMPLETE AND RETURN THIS FORM ONLY IF YOU DO NOT WISH TO SUBMIT A
BID

If you do not wish to respond to this bid request, but would like to remain on the Boone County vendor

list for this service/commodity. please remove form and return to the Purchasing Department. The
reverse side of the form is pre-addressed, so that it can be folded in thirds, sealed with tape, and mailed.

If you would like to FAX this “No Bid” Response Form to our office, the FAX number is (573) 886-
4390.

If you have questions, please call the Purchasing Office at (573) 886-4392. Thank you for your cooperation.

Bid Number 01-04JANO7

(Business Name) (Date)
(Address/P.O. Box) (Telephone)
(City, State, Zip) (Contact)

REASON(S) FOR NOT SUBMITTING A BID:

Bid #01-04JANO7 Page 9



18 -2007

CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

. STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 07
ea

County of Boone

th
In the County Commission of said county, on the 16 day of January 20 07

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby agree to
utilize the Western States Contracting Alliance (WSCA) cooperative contract 13-00115 —
Wireless Communication Services and Equipment. This master agreement is a multi-vendor
award with Sprint, Cingular, T-Mobile, and Verizon and the contract extends through October 9,
2010. It is further ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said
contracts.

Done this 16™ day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: %ﬁ% ﬁ'&/t[zé{,j

<§ Karen M. Miller
Wendy S. Koren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission E%
Skip Elkin N

District II Commissioner



| & -a007

PARTICIPATING ADDENDUM

WESTERN STATES CONTRACTING ALLIANCE
WIRELESS COMMUNICATION SERVICES AND EQUIPMENT
MASTER PRICE AGREEMENT
13-00115

1. Scope: (Replace these instructions with a brief description of the jurisdiction of
the governmental entity signing this addendum. For example, the jurisdiction of a state may
include all state agencies, universities, public schools and political subdivisions of the state.
The jurisdiction of a political subdivision such as a county generally includes all
governmental entities within the county.)

2. Changes: (Replace this with specific changes or a statement that no changes are required)

3. Primary Contact: The primary government contact individual for this participating addendum is
as follows:

Bopne County Purchasing

AI:Iizrrlless 601 E. Walnut, Room 208, Columbia, MO 65201
 Telephone: (573) 886-4391
Fax: (573) 886-4390

E-mail: Moobbitt@boonecouritymo.ory

4. Subcontractors: The following subcontractor(s) are authorized to perform services.
(Discuss this with the Sprint PCS representative
Insert subcontractor name(s) or the word "NONE")

5. Price Agreement Number: All purchase orders issued by purchasing entities within the
jurisdiction of this participating addendum shall include price agreement number: 13-00115

This Addendum and the Price Agreement together with its exhibits, set forth the entire agreement
between the parties with respect to the subject matter of all previous communications,
representations or agreements, whether oral or written, with respect to the subject matter hereof.
Terms and conditions inconsistent with, contrary or in addition to the terms and conditions of this
Addendum and the Price Agreement, together with its exhibits, shall not be added to or
incorporated into this Addendum or the Price Agreement and its exhibits, by any subsequent
purchase order or otherwise, and any such attemapts to add or incorporate such terms and
conditions are hereby rejected. The terms and conditions of this Addendum and the Price
Agreement and its exhibits shall prevail and govern in the case of any such inconsistent or

additional terms.

IN WITNESS WHEREQOF, the parties have executed this Addendum as of the date of
execution by both parties below.

Gove by ot Boem MM Contractor: Sprint PCS
By: » By:
Name: Bal A 3 Name:

Title: 72 0uatd. Loabae 15600552 Title:
Date: s/ Lg/,?. Date:

[ 4 rcova e o AASPERD IO
Mm“’m AS 'm CERTIFICATION:
» (RGAL FORIR | certify that this contract Is within the
\ purpose of the appropriation to which it is
\ to be charged and there is an unencumbered
balance of such appropriation sufficient

] . U \ - to pay the costs arising from this contract,

i an i <4 ) %‘,
l m-_.ﬁ,'..:,ﬂ. 'QJ_QWLM Auditor h? Qa&%%ﬂate . /o7
‘@DM o~ <7, A .o/(—b.




iq4 -2007
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 07
€ea
County of Boone }
th
In the County Commission of said county, on the 6 day of January 20 07

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby agree to
utilize the State of Nebraska cooperative contract 11182 OC with Motorola Communications for
Two-Way Radio Communications Equipment and Related Accessories. It is further ordered that
the Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said contracts.

Done this 16" day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: ﬂwﬂ?%[&\)

Kareh M. Miller
Wendy S./Noren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission %

Skip ElkinY|

District II Commissioner



Commission Order #: ‘4 - 200 7

Boone County Purchasing

601 E. Walnut, Room 208
Columbia, MO 65201

Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB — Phone: (573) 886-4391
Director Fax: (573) 886-4390

E-mail: mbobbitt@boonecountymo.org

January 16, 2007

Motorola, Inc.
" Attn: Peter Albera

1129 S.W. Sunflower Drive
Lee’s Summit, MO 64081

RE: Letter of Agreement to Purchase from the State of Nebraska Cooperative Contract #11182 OC -
Two-Way Radio Communications Equipment & Accessories

Dear Mr. Albera:

I am writing to notify you that the County of Boone — Missouri will be a participant in the above referenced
Nebraska Cooperative Contract. All terms and pricing of the Contract will apply to purchases by the
County of Boone — Missouri. This procedure does not imply an exclusive contract, nor does it preclude the
County from bidding or purchasing items from other sources. The Contract pricing is effective from
December 1, 2004 through December 31, 2007.

The Sheriff Department will contact you to place orders and must give you a Purchase Order Number.
Please send all invoices and the monthly statement to the Boone County Sheriff Department, 2121 County
Drive, Columbia, MO 65201.

Please sign Exhibit C and return by fax to (573) 886-4390.

Should you have any questions pertaining to County orders, contact Captain Beverly Braun, Boone County
Sheriff Department at (573) 876-6101. Contract questions may be addressed to the Purchasing Department
at (573) 886-4391.

Sincerely, BOONE COUNTY MISSO

M ,4/_——” By:B Co mmissi‘ n
Melinda Bobbitt, CFPB
Director of Purchasing Ken Péarson, Presiding Commissioner

APPRO AS TO FORM: GEIEES Q: ! 2
John| atton,|County Counselor Wendy Noten, County Clerkﬂ7

AUDINOR LERTIFICATION

In accordar€e with RSMo 50.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance exists and is
available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this contract. (Note: Certification of this contract is not required if
the terms of this contract do not create a measurable county obligation at this time.)

0 Svitumdhancs ?@u/&u\ﬂ & " 1/1o/e7 2901/92301; 1251/91300 Term and Supply
Signature v Date Appropriation Account




20 -2007
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 ()7
ea

County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 16“‘ day of January 20 (7

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
renewal of the attached list of sole source vendors for another year, ending on December 31, 2007.

Done this 16™ day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: < ..
\ / ) g

Yy Karen M. Miller

Wendy SONoren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission

“STip BN,

District I Commissioner



LO-007]

Vender Name Originating Office Product Description Expiration Date | Date signed by Commission | Purchase Price Approved Y/N Sole Source #
- 22-123102)
Structural Preservation Carbon Fiber Strengthening of (renewed through
Systems Public Works Bridges On-Going 6/3/02 - Karen Miller $91,025.00 Yes 12/31/06)
Annual Maintenance and Support
Renewal - Sympro Treasury Mgt
Sympro Inc. Treasurer Software On-Going 5/23/06 - Skip Elkin $6,400.00 No 66-123106SS]
03-123102
(renewed through|
Tech Electronics Court of Administrator Courtroom Sound System ©On-Going 6/29/2001 $0.00 Yes - C.0. 47-2003 12/31/06
Tech Electronics of Columbia Maintenance for Jail Intercomm
Inc. Facilities Maintenance System On-Going 4/13/06 - Keith Schnarre $4,700.00 Yes 64-123106SS
08-123102
(renewed through
Tri-State Construction Public Works Parts for Motorgrader On-Going 12/18/2001 $0.00 Yes 12/31/06),
31-123104;
Repair parts for Vermeer Wood (renewed through
Vermeer Sales & Service Public Works Chipper On-Going 2/21/03 - Karen Miller On-going Yes 12/31/06)
09-010902
(Renewed through
West Group Boone County Counselor Online Legal Services On-Going 1/9/2002 $280.00 Yes 12/31/06)
01-043002
Optika eMedia Upgrade and COLD (renewed through
Ward-Tech Business Sys. Assessor software maintenance On-Going 4/19/2001 $5,527.50 Yes 12/31/06)
04-123102
World Wide Web & other (Renewed through
state contracts Information Technology Computers & Peripherals On-Going 11/15/2001 $0.00 Yes 523-2001 12/31/06

Blue: Last number used

Blue color signifies last number used.




2007 SOLE SOURCE APPROVAL

Commission Order #

Vender Name Originating Office Product Description Expiration Date | Date signed by Commission | Purchase Price Approved Y/N Sole Source #
|I-STAT (Portable Biosensor On-Going on
Abbott Point of Care Sheriff's Department Technology) Critical Blood Analysis | Maintenance 11/9/06 - Skip Elkin $7,500.00 Yes 72-123106385
Service Contract on alarm system
for various locatons throughout the
County. Covers maintenance and 11-123102
ACC Alarm Communication parts for existing equipment and (renewed through|
Cener Facilities Maintenance upgrades as needed. On-Going 1/24/02 - Karen Miller $1,680.00 Yes - C.0. 47-2003 12/31/06)
20-071502
On-Going on (renewed through
Accutime Corporation Public Works Time Clock with Software Maintenance 4/18/02 - Karen Miller $2,150.00 Yes 12/31/06)
06-123102
(renewed through
Al Scheppers Motors, Inc Public Works International Engine and Body Parts On-Going 12/18/2001 - Karen Miller $0.00 Yes 12/31/06)
Auto/Heavy Truck Engine
andTransmission Service and 30-123103,
Repair for Specialized Evacuation (Renewed through
Bar G Ozark Inc. Public Works and Flushing Equipment On-Going 12/30/03 - Karen Miller Term & Supply Yes 12/31/06)
Maintenance on Mobile Data
BIO-Key Sheriff's Department Terminals On-Going 4/11/06 - Skip Elkin $9,448.20 Yes 63-123106SS
Relocation of power lines for
Boone Electric Public Works construction projects On-Going 7/6/06 - Keith Schnarre $38,000.00 Yes 69-123106SS
Temperature control system Service
Agreement for HVAC located at the
: Boone County Court House to 18-123102
C&C Group {(used to be monitor existing Invensy's (renewed through
Invensys Building Ssytems) Facilities Maintenance equipment. On-Going 4/18/02 - Karen Miller $4,327.00 Yes 12/31/06)
One-time on
initial purchase 12-123102
and on-going on (renewed through|
CarteGraph Public Works Upgrade to existing PW software maintenance 1/23/02 - Karen Miller $21,210.00 Yes 12/31/06)




Vender Name

Originating Office Product Description Expiration Date | Date signed by Commission | Purchase Price Approved Y/N Sole Source #
E-911 CML Sentinel software
upgrade - to upgrade existing
equpment to make surrent with new
Centurytel Joint Communication updates 10/31/2006 4/19/06 - Skip Elkin $18,067.50 Yes 65-123106SS
Centurytel Purchasing Dept Local Telephone Service On-Going 14/21/2001 $0.00{ Yes - 526-2001 05-083103
10-123102
(renewed through
City of Columbia Non-Departmental (Auditor) |Parking @ Armory & Washbash On-Going 1/14/2002 $0.00 Yes - C.0. 47-2003 12/31/06)
$14,731.50
(Purchase) 51-123105
City of Columbia Water and Fiber Optic Cable Installation and ‘ $1,949/month on- (renewed through
Light Information Technology Lease On-going 12/20/04 - Skip Elkin going Yes 12/31/06),
57-123105,
Cooke Sales and Service (renewed through|
Company Public Works Tiger Boom Mower and JCB Parts On-Going 2/22/05 - Keith Schnarre Term & Supply Yes 12/31/06),
PLC Processor - Jail Locking
Corsair Controls Sheriff's Department System On-Going 8/1/06 - Skip Elkin $7,642.78 Yes 70-123106SS
27-123102
Crown Power & Equipment OEM Parts for Case Backhoes and (renewed through|
Company Public Works Wheel Loaders On-Going 10/1/02 - Skip Elkin Term & Supply Yes 12/31/06)
50-123104
On-Going on (renewed through
Cybernetics Information Technology LTO Tape Library Maintenance 12/8/04 - Skip Elkin $7,295.00 Yes 12/31/06),
$18,285, then
$1,935 for 55-123105
On-Going on maintenance after 2 (renewed through
Cybernetics Information Technology Virtual Tape Disk Backup (D2D2T) Maintenance 1/28/05 - Karen Miller yrs. Yes 12/31/06)
$36,035 hardware;
$6,400 pre-paid 2- 58-123105
On-Going on yr main upgrade; (renewed through
Cybernetics Information Technology miSAN (Storage Area Network) Maintenance 3/18/05 - Karen Miller $7,980 main/yr Yes 12/31/06)
On-Going - but 54-123105,
review yearly for Units: $21,000; (renewed through
Ed Roehr Sheriff's Department Taser Units and Cartridges new competition 1/13/05 - Skip Elkin Cartridges: $6,990 Yes 12/31/06)




Vender Name Originating Office Product Description Expiration Date | Date signed by Commission | Purchase Price Approved Y/N Sole Source #

$.09/sheet - varies 21-123102

Election Systems & Software, ) by election - over (renewed through

Inc. Clerk Election Ballot Stock On-Going Don Stamper - 5/7/02 $10,000 Yes 12/31/06),

9128.37(purchase) | Original purchase 19-123102

State Contract #C202051001 for $4,900 from State Contract| (renewed through

ESRI - Kansas City Assessor ESRI Software for GIS System On-Going maintenance -exp. 2/29/04 {maintenance) C800664001 12/31/06),

Intoximeter FST Portable Breath

Garon Marketing Sheriff's Department Testing Device On-Going 4/20/06 - Skip Elkin $4,500.00 Yes 67-123106SS

07-123102

Repair and parts for Chip/Seal (renewed through

GW Van Keppel Public Works Spreader and oil distributor On-Going 12/18/2001 $0.00 Yes 12/31/06

28-123103

Hallsville Market and Deli Diesel Fuet in northern Boone (Renewed through

(Jump Oil} Public Works County On-Going Karen Miller - 10/24/02 Term & Supply Yes 12/31/06)

Software support for Public Safety 60-123105

Information Technologies, Software Series in Court Marshal's (renewed throught

Inc. Court Administration office. On-Going 4/29/05 - Skip Elkin $850.00 Yes 12/31/06)

42-123104

Signage for Boone County (renewed through

Innerface Sign Systems, Inc. | 13th Judicial Circuit Court Courthouse On-Going 12/5/03 - Skip Elkin $775.00 Yes 12/31/06),

40-123103|

(Renewed through

Integrated Solutions Group | Information Technology Network Core Switch On-Going 11/14/03 - Skip Elkin $31,666.97 Yes 12/31/06)

41-123103

Network Security Hardware and (Renewed through

Integrated Solutions Group | Information Technology Software Maintenance On-Going 11/14/03 - Skip Elkin $5,663.19 Yes 12/31/06)
Hardware/Software maintenance for

the router connecting fiber optic 53-123105

cable to our network for Public $7,655 + $288/year (renewed through

Integrated Solutions Group | Information Technology Works location On-Going 12/20/04 - Skip Elkin maintenance Yes 12/31/06)




Vender Name Originating Office Product Description Expiration Date ] Date signed by Commission | Purchase Price Approved Y/N Sole Source #
T 46-123104
On-Going on (renewed through
Integrated Solutions Group | Information Technology Fiber Optic Equipment Routers Maintenance Skip Elkin - 4/8/04 $10,315.44 Yes 12/31/06),
61-123105|
GuardianSave Software - AS400 On-Going on $9,000 and $1,800 (renewed through
iTera Information Technology Backup Software Maintenance 10/21/05 - Karen Miller on maintenance No 12/31/06)
29-123103
I/TX information Technology SI1-3000 System - (Mugshot) 11/21/02 - Don Stamper - (Renewed through
Solutions, Inc. Information Technology Software Maintenance Agreement On-Going Commission Order 489-2002 $6,700.00 Yes - CO 488-2002 12/31/06)
On-Going on
SE-3000 Pro Enterprise Manager |Maintenance or to
ITX Information Technology | Information Technology / Module (add-on capability to our add additional
Solutions, Inc. Sheriff Department existing program) Users 8/21/06 - Skip Etkin $10,050.00 Yes 71-123106SS
13-123102
Knapheide Truck Equipment Hydraulic Parts and Repairs for (renewed through|
Company Public Works Heavy Trucks On-Going 2/5/02 - Karen Miller Term & Supply Yes 12/31/06)
Midwest Mailing Service Information Technology Mail Processing On-Going 6/16/06 - Karen Miller $6,207.00 Yes 68-123106SS
$10,760 equipment
Computerized Voice Stress & $4,320 training 47-123104
National Institute for Truth Analyzer including training and On-Going on and cerfication for (renewed through
Verification (NITV) Sheriff's Department certification for four operators Training 8/25/04 - Skip Elkin four operators Yes 12/31/06
02-073102
Novell MLA - World Wide Software Upgrade Assurance and $14,395 & State Contract (Renewed through
Technology Information Technology Maintenance On-Going 4/18/01 - Karen Miller $14,540.60 C800664001 12/31/06)
’ Life Safely Service Agreement far
alarms at jail. (Has Contract that Yes - agreement
needs to be signed by wivendor terms & 16-123102
Commission); $9,057 in 2006; . conditions - C.0. 47| (renewed through
Simplex/Grinnell Facilities Maintenance $11,897 through 10/16/07 On-Going 3/11/02 - Karen Miller $9,057.00 2003 12/31/06)
17-123102
Upgrade to exisiting software for (renewed through
Snap-On Diagnostics Public Works Snap-On Shop Keys Diagnostics On-Going 3/15/02 - Karen Miller $2,905.00 Yes - C.0. 47-2003 12/31/06)
Software Support of Stenograph $475/machine, 3 59-123105
software for court reporter steno machines for a tfotal (Renewed through
Stenograph, LLC Court Administration maachines On-Going 3/24/06 - Skip Elkin of $1,425 Yes 12/31/06)




2| -2007

CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the January Adjourned Term. 20 ()7
' €a

County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 16" day of January 20 (7

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid
88-12DEC06 Law Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply to Red the Uniform Tailor. It is
further ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said contracts.

Done this 16™ day of January, 2007.

Ken Pearson
Presiding Commissioner

ATTEST: . , ) /z/)
7‘%,/ VYV

MZZ%&%QA%, Karen M. Miller

Wendy S./Noren District | Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission
Skip Elkine -

District IT Commissioner




Commission Order #2 ( .)-0 o 7

PURCHASE AGREEMENT
FOR
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS TERM AND SUPPLY

THIS AGREEMENT dated the | (a day of OA&MM, 2007 is made between

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the Stataf)Missouﬂlrough the Boone County
Commission, herein “County” and Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc., herein “Contractor”.

IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained
herein, the parties agree as follows:

1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Law
Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid, bid number 88-
12DEC06, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response
Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard Terms and Conditions, any
applicable addenda, as well as the Contractor’s bid response dated December 6, 2006 and executed by
Patricia Klein, on behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute the contract documents,
which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or product data, specification
and literature submitted with bid response may be permanently maintained in the County Purchasing
Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event of conflict between any of the foregoing
documents, the Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response
Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard Terms and Conditions, and any
applicable addenda shall prevail and control over the Contractor’s bid response.

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on date of award and extend through
December 31, 2007 subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement may be
extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for two (2) additional one year periods
subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor’s bid response and thereafter on a month to month basis in
the event the County is unable to re-bid and/or award a new contract prior to the expiration date after
exercising diligent efforts to do so or not.

3. Purchase - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor agrees to
supply the County all items per the bid specifications and responded to in section 4.13., and in
conformity with the contract documents for the prices set forth in the Contractor’s bid response, as
needed and as ordered by County.

4. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver products per the bid specifications and within 30 to 45
days after receipt of an order.

5. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Sheriff’s Department
and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor’s bid response. No additional fees for
delivery or extra services not included in the bid response or taxes shall be included as additional charges
in excess of the charges in the Contractor’s bid response to the specifications. The County agrees to pay
all invoices within thirty days of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any cash or prompt payment
discounts offered in its bid response if county makes payment as provided therein. In the event of a
billing dispute, the County reserves the right to withhold payment on the disputed amount; in the event
the billing dispute is resolved in favor of the Contractor, the County agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9%
per annum on disputed amounts withheld commencing from the last date that payment was due.

6. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect.

An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution



Commission Order #

7. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual
agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality

as this agreement.
8. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance

written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances:
a. County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or
condition of this agreement, or
b. County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or
c. If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this
agreement on the day and year first above written.

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc. BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI

by “Pﬂ'g (LA K by: Boone County Commission
title _ Chief ¢ 29@@ g% W\cer'
Kenntth Pearson, Presiding Commissioner

address 478§ ()bgr["ﬂ Ayenuegouy\
Z_akemaggf NI 0870\-6%904

APPROVEDMS TO FORM: ATTEST:

Wendy S. @en County Clerk

exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this contract. (Note: Certification of this
contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not create a measurable county obligation at this

time.)

1251/2901-23300 Term/Supply

/\A) MM?/M 7% //ro/azeo7

Signature "0 N Date Appropriation Account

An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution



1

County of Boone Purchasing Department
4. Response Form

4.1. Company Name: - .
Red tvre (Uniform Tailor Tnec.

4.2. Address:

U3 Overlin Ave S,

4.3. City/Zip:
Laleldond , NJ ORI

4.4. Phone Number:
O0- >F2 - F33F
00O - FOL\- 50|

4.5, Fax Number:

4.6. E-Mail Address:
YN r (O™

A2 Y by

4.7. Federal Tax ID:

4.7.1. %Corporation

() Partnership - Name
( ) Individual/Proprietorship - Individval Name
( ) Other (Specify)

4.8. Delivery After Receipt of Order: 20 « US das 3

4.9. The undersigned offers to furnish and deliver the articles or services as specified at the prices and terms stated and in
strict accordance with all requirements contained in the Invitation for Bid which have been read and understood, and
all of which are made part of this order. By submission of this bid, the vendor certifies that they are in compliance with
Section 34.353 and, if applicable, Section 34.359 (“Missouri Domestic Products Procurement Act”) of the Revised Statutes
of Missouri.

4.91.  Authorized Representative (Sign By Hand):
%@M, o o — Date: /2] b/é’é
4.9.2. Print Name and Title of Authorized Representative

Qdﬁda Wiean -~ C.0.0. Date:l_al_u.lﬁl(.&

4.10. Will you honor the submitted prices for purchase by other entities in Boone Coungy who participate
in cooperative purchasing with Boone County, Missouri? No

Yes
/ Y
4.11. Maximum Percentage Increase for l ( ) % 2nd Year 8 % 3rd Year

4.12.  Submit three (3) complete copies of your Response in a single sealed envelope, clearly marked
on the outside, left corner with your company name and return address, the bid number and

the due date and time.

H b on sp@a}ﬁ‘ed Jdems  Ahere fore, no
fobiic swatth Samplo e Sent

Bid #88-12DEC06 Page November 18, 2006



PRICING-NO SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ALLOWED UNLESS NOTED

Item Unit Price Qty | Extended Price
4.13. : CLOTHING ,
4.13.1. | Long Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus, Material
content to be 65% dacron polyester and 35% rayon, | MEN’S SIZES
10 ounce one ply tropical weave. Must furnish 60
shirts in full and half sizes (e.g. 17 and 17 %2). $ g |. gé $ 2 5( Db
¢ Color Silver Tan
e 2 front & 3 back permanent military creases
¢ Front of shirt with center facing 1 12" wide WOMEN'S SIZES
from collar to bottom of shirt. 20
e 6 center vertical buttons, button side shall $ Hl s ?’5 $ 3 b} 00O
be lined
e 2 breast pockets with mitered corners, 5
5/8” to 6” long with box stitching on top and | STANDARD
bottom OVERSIZE
o Left pocket shall have a pencil opening. CHARGE. COST
o Badge tab to be included and reinforced on . PER
inside of shirt. INCREMENTAL
¢ Shoulder straps pointed at the end toward SIZE OVER XXL
the neck fastened with one button. The
shoulder end sewn into the sleeve head
seam. $ Lk } % 5
e Patches and chevrons to be attached by
successful vendor.
e Fabric sample MUST be attached.
o NOSUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED
4.13.2. | Short Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus, Material
content to be 65% dacron polyester and 35% rayon, : MEN’S SIZES
10 ounce one ply tropical weave. Must furnish 60
shirts in full and half sizes (e.g. 17 and 17 1%). $ 3 3 3 5 $ 2 ;)(!S .00
e Color Silver Tan
o 2 front & 3 back permanent military creases
¢ Front of shirt with center facing 1 4” wide WOMEN'S SIZES 20

from collar to bottom of shirt.

6 center vertical buttons, button side shall
be lined

2 breast pockets with mitered corners, 5
5/8" to 6" long with box stitching on top and
bottom '

Left pocket shall have a pencil opening.
Badge tab to be included and reinforced on
inside of shirt.

Shoulder straps pointed at the end toward
the neck fastened with one button. The
shoulder end sewn into the sleeve head
seam.

Patches and chevrons to be attached by
successful vendor.

Fabric sample MUST be attached.

NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXL

Bid #88-12DEC06

Page

November 18, 2006



Clip on Ties
e Color-Brown
e 2 Lengths-18 inches and 22 inches
o Button hole feature to hold tie in place
o Tie width at widest point shall be 3”

REGULAR SIZE

s H4.50

EXTRA LONG

s 5.50

80

20

4.13.4.

Regulation Elbeco ELB 8601 Turtieneck Shirt-
Pullover type mock turtleneck with side seams, full
neck heights, and long sleeves.

Color-Dark Brown

Must be pre-shrunk 100% combed-cotton
jersey knit 7.25 ounce

Neck and cuffs Lycra Spandex

Body material to 1 x 1 jersey knit consisting
of 100% combed cotton.

Body, collar, and neck material shall be
properly finished to resist pilling.

Sleeves to be set-in type with rib knit cuffs.
All stitches, seams, and stitching shall
conform to FED-STD-751.

Fabric sample MUST be attached.

NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

s 42 00

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXI1.

s K, OO

90

4.13.5.

Trousers Made to Measure (Male/Female) - Battle
Uniform Made to measure

Snug-tex waistband.

55% Dacron polyester and 45% woo! blend
16 %2 0z

Modified Military Dress cut from up to date
men'’s trouser patterns. Plain front. 2 inch
waistband to be finished in an open manner
for ease in alteration. No raw edges or
serging on curtain edges and finish with a
min. 2 ¥z inch outlet.

Heavy duty zipper with memory lick. French
fly to be separate pieces finishing 2 %" x 2
%" including button hole.

4 pockets — 2- 7 top pockets and 2-hijp
pockets with a button on left hip pocket.

7 Keystone belt loops. Each loop to be 1 %%”
wide x 2" long.

1/8" gold striping sewn into the outer seam
of pant running from bottom of front pocket
down with no visible stitches. A top stitched
strip will not be acceptable.

Color-Brown

Vendor must come to department and
measure officers.

NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

MEN’S SIZES

s 7. 00

WOMEN’S SIZES

53 3. 0O

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXIL.

. F 00

109 |

s . U83.00

Bid #88-12DEC06

Page

November 18, 2006



4.13.6.

Weather-Tech and Waterproof Duty Jacket I.
Spiewax Style #1775 or Better.

Waist length with split waistband to allow for
side vent zippers, a 2 way zipper under a
double fly front.

Permanent epaulets and 2 inverted pleated
pockets.

Sleeves shall be 3 pieces to form a box
armhole.

Shell shall be waterproof and breathable.
Liner shall be fully removable with a non-
piling fleece body with nylon sleeves.

Liner shall attach with 2 front zippers and
snaps at the neck and cuffs.

Shell fabric shall be treated with Teflon rain
and stain finish.

Department supplied emblems (patches) to
be attached (sewn on sleeve shouiders ) by
successful vendor

Fabric sample MUST be attached.

s NO_(hd

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXL

sND il

20

4.13.7.

Correction Officer Short Field Jacket to be
Summit Duty Jacket.

Windproof and Waterproof.

360 degree Telescopic Sleeve System
provides full arm extension and action
without sleeve or body “pull up.”

Genuine leather-trimmed adjustable cuffs
with convertible Scotchlite reflective trim.
Fully machine washable.

Hidden sleeve access zipper for emblem
attachment.

26" waist length styling.

Zip-out full liner with Thinsulate Insulation,
bi-swing for warmth without bulk and
freedom of movement.

Double storm front with concealed snaps
and two-way Delrin zipper for added
protection.

Detachable military-style epaulets.

Multiple inner pockets for additional security
storage.

Snap attachment holds liner sleeves in
place.

Separate elastic shirred waistband.

Size range X-small to 3X Large.
Department supplied emblems (patches) to
be attached (sewn on sleeve shoulders ) by
successful vendor

Fabric sample MUST be attached.

NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

s 193 %=

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXL

20

33 9L0.O0

4.13.8.

Stratton Winter Felt Uniform Hat

Construction must be equal to or better than
the Stratton S68 Special also listed as the F-
40 Campaign Style Felt Hat.

2 piece behind the head strap and 1 piece
around the top leather swivel hat strap to be
included with each.

Color Brown — for both hat and leather

$7q . ©0

20

$ l,ﬂ(g().'OD

Bid #88-12DEC06

Page

November 18, 2006



Stratton Summer Straw Uniform Hat

Construction must be equal to or better than
the Stratton S-40DB hat also known as the
Campaign Style or Montana Peak Summer
Straw Hat.

2 piece behind the head strap and 1 piece
around the top leather swivel hat strap to be
included with each.

Color Brown — for both hat and leather

20

$ ll 3[5.(@

4.13.10.
L]

Reversible Raincoat — Pro-Tuff RW167

Construction must the Pro-Tuff RW167.
Features include a brass zipper, storm flap
on both sides, badge eyelets and splash
pockets.

Color black/orange

NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

s ND (b

STANDARD
OVERSIZE
CHARGE. COST
PER
INCREMENTAL
SIZE OVER XXL

s No p)‘ck

20

s. NO QDIO(

4.13.11.

Trouser: Elbeco E615 — No substitutions
: Sizes - 28-44

s 5. F0

10

s 522.00

4.13.12.

Trouser: Elbeco E