
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 


STATE OF MISSOURI 

County of Boone 
) ea. 

. December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05 

In the County Commission of said county, on the gth day of December 20 05 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid 
73-29NOV05 for Carpet Cleaning Services Term and Supply to Sappington's Carpet Care. It is 
further ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said contract. 

Done this 8t" day of December, 2005. 

/ 
Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: I 

I(areh M. Miller 

District I Commissioner 


Skip ~ l k i n \  

District I1 Commissioner 




Boone County Purchasing 

Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 60 1 E.Walnut, Room 208 
Director Columbia, MO 65201 

Phone: (573) 886-4391 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: Boone County Commission 
FROM: Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 
DATE: November 30,2005 
RE: 73-29NOV05 -Carpet Cleaning Services Term and Supply 

The Bid for Carpet Cleaning Services -Term and Supply closed on November 29,2005. 
Three bids were received. Purchasing and Facilities Maintenance recommend award to 
Sappington's Carpet Care for offering the best and lowest bid for Boone County. 

This term and supply contract will be paid out of department 6 10 1 Housekeeping, 
account 60125 Custodial/Janitorial Service. Total cost of contract is $16,084 and a 
Purchase Order will be cut after the first of the year by the Facilities Maintenance 
Department. They have budgeted $16,900 for this service for 2006. 

Please find attached a copy of the bid tabulation for your review. 

ATT: 	 Bid Tabulation 

cc: 	 Ken Roberts, Facilities Maintenance 
Bid File 

An Affirmative ActionIEqual Opportunity Institution 



Bid 73-29NOV05 

Total for All Boone 

BG Service Solutions 
Columbia Carpet Cleaning - undeliverable 



PURCHASE AGREEMENT 43Q -2
FOR 

CARPET CLEANING SERVICES TERM AND SUPPLY 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the 8 day of 2005 is made between 

Boone county, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and Sappington's Carpet Care, herein "Contractor." 


I N  CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Carpet 
Cleaning Services Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid, bid number 73-29NOV05, 
Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and 
Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard Terms and Conditions, Addendum Number One as 
well as the Contractor's bid response dated November 28, 2005 and executed by Eric Sappington on 
behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute the contract documents, which are attached 
hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or product data, specification and literature 
submitted with bid response may be permanently maintained in the County Purchasing Office bid file for 
this bid if not attached. In the event of conflict between any of the foregoing documents, the Introduction 
and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un- 
executed Response Form, Standard Terms and Conditions and Addendum #1 shall prevail and control 
over the Contractor's bid response. 

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on January 1,2006 and extend through 
December 31,2006, subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement may be 
extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for four (4) additional one-year periods 
subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor's bid response and thereafter on a month to month basis in 
the event the County is unable to re-bid andlor award a new contract prior to the expiration date after 
exercising diligent efforts to do so or not. 

3. Purchase - The County agrees to purchase fiom the Contractor and the Contractor agrees to 
supply the County Carpet Cleaning Services as identified and responded to in the Contractor's Response 
Form. Only line items 4.7.1. #1 - #5 are being awarded from the bid. Items will be provided as 
required in the bid specifications and in conformity with the contract documents for the prices set forth in 
the Contractor's bid response, as needed and as ordered by the County. 

4. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Facilities 
Maintenance Department, and may only include the prices as identified in the Contractor's bid response. 
No additional fees for delivery or extra services not included in the bid response or taxes shall be 
included as additional charges in excess of the charges in the Contractor's bid response to the 
specifications. The County agrees to pay all invoices within thnty days of receipt; Contractor agrees to 
honor any cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if county makes payment as 
provided therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the right to withhold payment on 
the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of the Contractor, the County 
agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld commencing fiom the last 
date that payment was due. 

An A f f i t i v e  ActionlEqual Opportunity Institution 



5. Binding ESfect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 

and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 


6. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 

supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 

agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 

as this agreement. 


7 .  Termination- This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance 

written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 


a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 

agreement on the day and year first above written. 


SAPPINGTON'S CARPET GARE 	 B O m E  COUNTY, MISSOURI 

ATTEST: 

\< 	 . I7ik.. 
ren, County Clerk W'-

,I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance exists and is 
s) arising fiom this contract. (Note: Certification of this contract is not required if 

the terms of this contract do not create a measurable county obligation at this time.) 

Facilities Maintenance 
6101-60125 - $16,084.00 

Appropriation Account 

An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution 



CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 


STATE OF MISSOURI } December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05 
ea. 

County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 8th day of December 20 05 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid 
5 1-09AUG05 for Internet Service Provider to Tranquility Internet Services, Inc. It is further 
ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said contract. 

Done this 8''' day of December, 2005. 

pr&rbing Commissioner 

ATTEST: 

~ a r e d ~ .Miller 
~ i s t r i c t-I Commissioner 

Clerk of thk County Commission 

\ 

Skip ~ l k i d  
District I1 Commissioner 



Boone County Purchasing 

Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 	 60 1 E.Walnut, Room 208 
Director Columbia, MO 6520 1 

Phone: (573) 886-439 1 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: Boone County Commission 
FROM: Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 
DATE: November 29,2005 
RE: 5 1-09AUG05 - Internet Service Provider 

The Request for Proposal for an Internet Service Provider closed on August 9,2005. Eight 
proposal responses were received. 

The evaluation committee consisted of the following: 
Michael Mallicoat, IT Director 
Aron Gish, Supervisor of Systems Analysis 
Ryan Irish, Network Administrator 

The evaluation committee recommends award to Tranquility Internet Services, Inc. per their 
attached evaluation report. Also attached is a spreadsheet of a breakdown of the pricing offered 
and the Evaluation Report Form listing the points assigned by the evaluation team. Tranquility 
did offer the most competitive pricing. 

This is a term and supply contract that will be paid from department 1170 - Information 
Technology, account 71 100 - Outside Services. $12,000 has been budgeted for this service for 
2006. 

ATT: 	 Evaluation Reports 
Pricing Spreadsheet 

cc: 	 Proposal File 
Evaluation Team Members 



Evaluation Report for Proposal 
51-09AUG05 -Internet Services Provider 

OFFEROR #1: Missouri Network Alliance, LLC 

X It has been determined that Missouri Network Alliance, LLC has submitted a- -
responsive proposal meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for 
Proposal. (Responsive only if we can verify detailed references and financial 
stability). 

It has been determined that Missouri Network Alliance, LLC has submitted a 
non-responsiveproposal. 

Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Customer notified five working days in advance of any planned maintenance 
activity (2.1.4.) 
County staff has capability of real time reports (2.1.5.) 
Offeror can provide up to 10Mbps of bandwidth (2.1.7.) 

Concerns: 
RFP response does not address 3.2.j. and 3.2.k. of our proposal (page 2 of 
Offeror's response) 
Methods used for determining cost of ISP services not provided (2.3.10. of 
Offeror's proposal response and 3.4.5. of our proposal). 
Offeror took exception and did not provide any proof of financial responsibility 
(5.4.1. of Offeror's response and 3.5.5.d. of our proposal). 
This Offeror does not have a physical presence in Columbia, which is ok, but 
during the clarification presentation, they clarified that there would be no one on 
site during the installation. 

Experience/Expertise of Offeror: 

Strengths: 
Performed work for the City of Columbia - similar government entity experience 
Mike Brigrnan and Mike Hanson have detailed and extensive experience in 
telecomm and large networks. 
Established business for past six years. 

Concerns: 



Most of the references included were "confidential & proprietary" so it was 
difficult to tell what type of work they did for these companies. (Exhibit A of 
Offeror's response). 

Summary of Missouri Network Alliance, LLC's Proposal Response: 
Missouri Network Alliance did meet the basic requirements of the proposal, but 
references would have to be checked since it was difficult to tell exactly what type of 
work was performed for the businesses provided as references. In addition, it is difficult 
to verify the financial stability of this company. Following the evaluation committee 
meeting on September 16 at 10:OOa.m., the committeedecided to short-list and request a 
presentation to answer clarificationquestions. Mike Brigman presented to the evaluation 
committee on October 24, 12:15p.m. Following the evaluation meeting on November 4, 
10:OO a.m., the committee decided to not consider Missouri Network Alliance any 
further. 

OFFEROR #2: Wiltel Communications 

X It has been determined that Wiltel Communications has submitted a responsive- -
proposal meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for Proposal. 

It has been determined that Wiltel Communications has submitted a non-
responsive proposal. 

Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Offeror can meet county's bandwidth growth. 

Concerns: 
Response does not address specific detail as related to Boone County. 

ExperienceIExpertise of Offeror: 

Strengths: 
Largest "fully lit" fiber optic network in the United States 
More than 20 Years in business 

Concerns: 
No Personnel information. 



Summary of Wiltel Communication's Proposal Response: 
Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OO a.m., the 
committee decided to NOT short-list this vendor. 

OFFEROR #3: e3-Group, Inc. 

It has been determined that e-3Group, Inc. has submitted a responsive proposal 
meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for Proposal. 

X It has been determined that e-3Group, Inc has submitted a non-responsive- -

proposal. 

Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 

Concerns: 
Wireless technology 

Experience/Expertise of Offeror: 

Strengths: 

Concerns: 
Wireless technology 

Summary of e-3Group, Inc's Proposal Response: 
The committee determined that this bidder was non-responsive since they bid wireless 
technology. Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OO a.m., 
the committee decided to NOT short-list this vendor. 

OFFEROR #4: Tranquilitv Internet Services 

X It has been determined that Tranquility Internet Service has submitted a- -
responsive proposal meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for 
Proposal. 

It has been determined that Tranquility Internet Servicehas submitted a non-
responsive proposal. 



Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Detailed work plan with timeline. 
Detailed equipment description including cost. 
Good understanding of county's needs. 
Details of billing included. 
Offeror can meet county's bandwidth growth. 
30 minute response time on after-hours. 
Real time access to network monitoring. 

Concerns: 

None identified 

Experience/Expertiseof Offeror: 

Strengths: 
Established business for past eight years. 
Leon Schurnacherand William Moore have experience with multiple 
platforms relevant to the County's current environment. 

Concerns: 
Router Training / Certifications 

Summary of Tranquility Internet Service's Proposal Response: 
Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OO a.m., the 
committeedecided to short-list and request a presentation fkom Tranquility. Leon and 
Travis Schumacherpresented on October 24, 10:45a.m. and answered some clarification 
questions. Following the review of the presentations on October 24, the evaluation 
committee offered a Best and Final Offer to this vendor. The committee met again on 
November 8,3:00 p.m. and decided that Ryan Irish would prepare a work plan to help the 
committeedeterminethe costs of switching from ISG to Tranquility. It was determined 
that 22 hours of Boone County IT staff time would be required to prepare for ISP switch. 
Tranquility offered the most competitive pricing with the most detailed and 
comprehensive conversion plan for Boone County. 

OFFEROR #5: Centurvtel of Missouri 

X It has been determined that Centurytel of Missouri has submitted a responsive- -
proposal meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for Proposal. 



It has been determined that Centurytel of Missouri has submitted a non-
responsive proposal. 

Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Offeror can meet county's bandwidth growth. 

Concerns: 
Did not provide network utilization reports. (3.4.4.c) 
Did not describe backuplfail-overprocedures (3.4.4.a) 
Did not identify the method used to determine cost. (3.4.4.d) 
Did not address in any detail how new circuit would implemented in 
relation to the county's current environment. (3.5.1 and 3.5.2) 
Did not provide a detailed time line. 

ExperienceIExpertiseof Offeror: 

Strengths: 
In business for 30 years. 

Concerns: 
No Personnel information included. 

Summary of Centurytel of Missouri's Proposal Response: 
Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OO a.m., the 
committee decided to short-list and request a presentation fiom Centurytel to address 
some clarification questions. Mike March presented to the County on October 24, 11:30 
a.m. One concern by the committee was that a detailed time line was still not provided 
for the County. Following the review of the presentation, the committee decided to offer 
a Best and Final Offer to this vendor. Following committee evaluation meeting on 
November 8,3:00 p.m., the committee decided to not consider Centurytel any further for 
possibility of award. Centurytel's EtherNet proposal requires a five year commitment 
which the committee is not willing to make at this time. Without the five year 
commitment, Centurytel's pricing is not competitive. 

OFFEROR #6: Marcel 

X It has been determined that Marcel has submitted a responsiveproposal meeting- -
the requirements set forth in the original Request for Proposal. 

It has been determined that Marcel has submitted a non-responsiveproposal. 



Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Cost explanation provided. 
Offeror can meet county's bandwidth growth. 

Concerns: 
Do not address related downtime. 
Play "middle man" with Services providers for Technical support, offering 
the service on another vendor's behalf. (3.5) 
Detailed timeline, not specific to county's environment. 

Experience/Expertiseof Offeror: 

Strengths: 
Established business for ten years. 

Concerns: 
Lack of large networks experience. 

Summary of Marcel's Proposal Response: 
Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OOa.m., the 
committee decided to NOT short-list this vendor. 

OFFEROR #7: Integrated Solutions Group 

X- It has been determined that Integrated SolutionsGroup has submitted a-
responsiveproposal meeting the requirements set forth in the original Request for 
Proposal. 

It has been determined that Integrated SolutionsGroup has submitted a non-
responsiveproposal. 

Method of Performance: 

Strengths: 
Hardened underground datacenter with redundant power, and 
environmental controls. 
Offeror can meet county's bandwidth growth. 
ISG is Boone County's current IPS 

No down time required 
No implementation needed 



Bandwidth Report currently supplied. 
Complete understanding of county's environment. 

Concerns: 
None identified 

ExperienceJExpertiseof Offeror: 

Strengths: 
John Maier and Todd Salazar have Cisco Certification, A+ Certification, 
and experience in multiple technologies that are relevant to Boone 
County's current environment. 
Current ISP since 1998. 
In business since 1992. 

Concerns: 
None identified 

Summary of Integrated Solutions Group's Proposal Response: 
Following the evaluation committee meeting on September 16 at 10:OO a.m., the 
committee decided to short-list this vendor. The committee decided that a presentation 
was not necessary since ISG is currently the County's ISP. A Best and Final Offer was 
sent to ISG. The committee met again on November 8,3:00 p.m. to evaluate the Best 
and Final Offers and decided that Ryan Irish would prepare a work plan to help the 
committee determine the costs of switchmg from ISG to Tranquility. After evaluating the 
work plan, the committee decided to recommend award to Tranquilitydue to the 
competitive pricing at our current service level and on anticipated continued growth. 

SUMMARY: 
This evaluation report represents our subjective opinion of each offeror's strengths and 
concerns and is based upon our analysis of the relevant facts, as contained in each 
offeror's proposal. We have assigned points to each offeror for the evaluation category 
of Method of Performance and Experience~Expertiseof the Offeror, as documented on 
the Evaluation Report Form. 

We recommend that the County of Boone -Missouri award contract(s) to 
Tranquility Internet Services, Inc. for the services of RFP 51-09AUG05 - Internet 
Services Provider. 

r 

flL/ d / & ~
Mike Mallicoat, Director of Information Technology bat& 

//hkf
&alu tor' Signature-

w 

Aron Gish, Supervisor of Systems Analysisa on ate 

11-3-0.3-
~valuatbr'sSignature-Ryan Irish, Network Administrator Date 





EVALUATION REPORT FORM 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT- BOONE COUNTY - MISSOURI 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NUMBER - 51-09AUG05 - Internet Services Provider 
Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 
Director of Purchasing 

Method of Performance ExperienceIExperUse of  

(35 points) 

We hereby attest that the subjective points assigned to each offeror above were scored pursuant to the established evaluation criteria and 
represent our best Judgement of the subjective areas of the offemrs' pmposals. We have attached a brief narrative which highlights some, but not 
necessarily all, of the reasons for our evaluation of the proposals as indicated by the scores above. Our comments represent our opinions 
only and do not represent the position of the Purchasing Department of Boone County, Missouri, or any other parly. 

Supervisor af 
SystemsAnalysis Information Technology 

Printed Name Title Department 

Network 
Administrator Information Technology 



EVALUATIONREPORT FORM 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT- BOONE COUNTY - MISSOURI 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NUMBER- 51-09AUG05- InternetServices Provider 
MelindaBobbin, CPPB 
Director of Purchasing 

Method of Performance 
(35 polnts) 

Appropriately Qualified B 
ExperiencedPersonnel; 

sectlon 3.5.5 

The evaluation committee decided to short-list for further evaluation Missouri Network Alliance, Tranquility Internet Services, Centurytel of Missouri and 
Integratedsolutions group following the committee evaluation meeting on September 16,2005. 

. . 
Services 

Centurytel of Missouri 

Marcel- Sprint 

integrated solutions group 
Marcel- ATT 
We hereby attest that the subjective points assigned to each offeror above were scored pursuantto the establishedevaluationcriteria and 
represent our best judgement of the subjectiveareas of the offerors' proposals. We have attached a brief narrativewhich highlightssome, bvt not 
necessarily all. of the reasons for our evaluationof the proposals as indicated by the scores above. Our comments represent our opinions 
only and do not representthe positionof the Purchasing Department of Boone County, Missouri, or any other party. 
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Commission Order # 433 - 7 (3 05 

PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR 

INTERNET SERVICE PROVIDER 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the B day of ~ E C  2005 is made between 

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and Tranquility Internet Services, Inc., herein "Contractor." 


IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for an 
Internet Service Provider, County of Boone Request for Proposal for an Internet Service Provider, 
proposal number 51-09AUG05 including Instructions and General Conditions, Introduction and General 
Information, Scope of Services, Proposal Submission Information, the unexecuted Response Page, 
Exhibit A, Addendum Number One, Best and Final Offer Number One, Clarification Questions in Memo 
dated October 14,2005, as well as the Contractor's proposal response dated August 9,2005, executed by 
Leon Schumacher, President, on behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute the 
contract documents, which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or product 
data, specification and literature submitted with proposal response may be permanently maintained in the 
County Purchasing Office proposal file for this proposal if not attached. In the event of conflict between 
any of the foregoing documents, the terms, conditions, provisions and requirements contained in the 
proposal specifications including Instructions and General Conditions, Introduction and General 
Information, Scope of Services, Proposal Submission Information, Exhibit A, Addendum Numbers One, 
Best and Final Offer Number One, Clarification Questions dated October 14, and the unexecuted 
Response Page shall prevail and control over the Contractor's proposal response. 

2. Purchase - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor agrees to 
furnish and deliver services to provide an Internet Service Provider for the period from date of 
installation completion through December 31,2006 with four one-year renewal option periods for 
the pricing detailed in Best and Final Offer Number One. All Internet Service Provider service shall be 
provided in conformity with the proposal specifications and as set forth in the Contractor's proposal 
response. 

3. Delively - Contractor agrees to work with Boone County Information Technology staff on a 
timeline for switching from the current provider to Tranquility as the Internet Service Provider, with the 
completion date no later than April 1,2006. 

4.  Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Information 
Technology Department. Billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor's proposal 
response. No additional fees for delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional 
charges in excess of the charges in the Contractor's proposal response to the specifications. The County 
agrees to pay all invoices within thirty days of receipt of a correct invoice; Contractor agrees to honor 
any cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if County makes payment as provided 
therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the right to withhold payment on the 
disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of the Contractor, the County agrees 
to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld commencing from the last date 
that payment was due. 

5. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 



6. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 
agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 
as this agreement. 

7. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance 

written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 


a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year first above written. 

T SERVICES, INC. 

Title: PCP; &d 

ATTEST: 

Wendy S. N+, County Clerk -w' 

AUDITO-
In accordance with RSMo 50.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance 
exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this contract. (Note: Certification of this 
contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not create a measurable county obligation at this 
time.) 

1 170-7 1 100 -Term and Supply 
A/v_~A + ~ ~ A L ~ ~ c ~ - ~ - A - ~ ~  

Signature 	 Appropriation Account 

An M i t i v e  ActionEqual Opportunity Employer 
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CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 


STATE OF MISSOURI } December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05 
ea. 

County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 8tll day of December 20 05 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid 
& 5-180CT05 for Law Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply as follows and authorize the 
Presiding Commissioner to sign said contracts: 

Galls: 4.11.6; 4.11.10; 4.11.12;4.11.14; 4.11.15; 4.11.16 
Safety & Security International: 4.1 1.1; 4.1 1.2; 4.1 1.1 1; 4.1 1.13 
Leon Uniform: 4.11.3, 4.11.4,4.11.7,4.11.8,4.11.9, MockTurtlenecks 
J.B. Battle: 4.11.5. 

Done this 8'" day of December, 2005. 

Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: 
h I 

LJuL SJU- ~ a r $ nM. Miller 
Wendy S. $oren District I Commissioner 
Clerk of thl County Commission 

District I1 ~dmmissioner 



Boone County Purchasing 

Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 60 1 E. Walnut, Room 208 
Director Columbia, MO 65201 

Phone: (573) 886-4391 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: Boone County Commission 
FROM: Melinda Bobbitt, CPPB 
DATE: December 5,2005 
RE: 65-1 80CT05 -Law Enforcement Uniforms -Term and Supply 

The Bid for the Law Enforcement Uniforms closed on October 18,2005. Four bids were 
received. Purchasing and the Sheriffs department recommend award by line item low 
bid as follows: 

Galls: 4.11.6; 4.11.10; 4.11.12; 4.11.14; 4.11.15; 4.11.16 

Safety & Security International: 4.1 1.1 ;4.1 1.2; 4.1 1.1 1 ;4.1 1.13 

LeonUniform: 4.11.3,4.11.4,4.11.7, 4.11.8,4.11.9, MockTurtlenecks 

J.B. Battle: 4.1 1.5. 

This Term & Supply contract will be paid out of departments 1255 Corrections, 125 1 
Sheriff, 2901 Sheriff Operations - LE Sales Tax, 2902 Corrections -LE Sales Tax, 
account number 23300 Uniforms. This is a term and supply contract, so purchase 
requisitions will be processed throughout the contract term. 

Please ficd .ttzchzd a copy of the bid tabulation for yoi-K review. 

ATT: 	 Bid Tabulation 

cc: 	 Captain Braun, Sheriff 
Bid File 





-- 

REGULAR SIZE 
UNIT 1 OTY I EXT 

UNIT I QTY 1 EXT I UNlT  I T Y I -
PRICE I I PRICE 1 1 

UNIT I QTY I EXT I UNIT I OTY I EXT-

PRICE I PRICE 
No Bid 90 No Bid No Bid 90 No Bid 

icrementalSize Over XXL I 

-- pEFE QTY EXT-

No Bid [- 109- ~ i d  No Bid $109.00 No Bid 
Measure (Male/Female I 

I I I 

-- WOMEN'S SIZES I WOMEN'S SIZES WOMEN'S SIZES 
UNIT I QTY I EXT QTY 1 EXT UNIT I OTY I EXT 

PRICE I 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
:OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE :OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 

$5.00 $0.00 No Bid 
UNIT QTY EXT UNIT QTY EXT 

PRICE PRICE PRICE 



-- 

Weather-Tech and 
Waterproof Duty 

Jacket I. 

.onz Sleeve Correctio~ 
officer 100% cotton 

Pique Polo Shirt 
Seapalms#800/#8200 

or Better. 

Short Sleeve 
Correction Officer 
100% Cotton Pique 
Polo Shirt Seapalms 

#800/#8200 or Better. 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. COST 
'ER INCREMENTAL SIZE OVER XXL 

I I 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. COST 
'ER INCREMENTAL SIZE OVER XXL 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
IVER ZML 

LL
TANDARD OVERSIZECHARGE, 
:OST PER INCREMENTAL SUE 
IVER XXL 

rANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
lVER XXL 

!OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
IVER XXL 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
lOST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
IVER XXL 

TANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
:OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
)VER XXL 



STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. COST STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. FANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
PER INCREMENTAL SIZE OVER XXL COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 

OVER XXL OVER XXL IVER XXL 

tyle B.D.U. Combat 

STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. COST STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. TANDARD OVERSIZE CEMRGE. 
PER INCREMENTAL SIZE OVER XXL COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE :OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 

OVER XXL )VERXXL 

I Short Field Jacket to b~ 
SummitDuty Jacket or 

I Better. 

-- 
STANDARD OVERSIZECHARGE. COST STANDARD OVERSIZE CFIARGE. STANDARD OVERSA CHARGE FTANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
PER INCREMENTAL SIZE OVER XXL COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE :OST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 

OVER XXL OVER XXL lVER XXL 



I INational Emblem, Inc. I 






Commission Order # 4f B-2005 

PURCHASE AGREEMENT 

FOR 


LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS TERM AND SUPPLY 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the day of >&C 2005 is made between 

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and Leon Uniform Company, herein "Contractor." 


IN CONSIDERATIONof the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Law 
Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid for Law Enforcement 
Uniforms Term and Supply, bid number 65-180CT05, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard 
Terms and Conditions, Addendum Number One, Quote dated November 16,2005, the Contractor's bid 
response dated October 29,2005 and executed by Howard Roper on behalf of the Contractor. All such 
documents shall constitute the contract documents which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by 
reference. Service or product data, specification and literature submitted with bid response may be 
permanently maintained in the County Purchasing Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event 
of conflict between any of the foregoing documents, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Addendum 
Number One, Quote, and Standard Terms and Conditions shall prevail and control over the Contractor's 
bid response. 

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on January 1,2006 and extend 
through December 31,2006 subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement 
may be extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for twp (2) additional one-year 
periods subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor's bid response and thereafter on a month to month 
basis in the event the County is unable to re-bid andlor award a new contract prior to the expiration date 
after exercising diligent efforts to do so or not. 

3. Purchase/Sewice - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor 
agrees to supply the County items 4.11.3 -Clip on Ties, 4.11.4 -Regulation Turtleneck Shirt, 4.11.7 
-Long Sleeve Correction Officer Polo Shirt, 4.11.8 -Short Sleeve Correction Officer Polo Shirt, 
4.11.9 -Correction Officer Trousers, Mock Turtleneck Shirts from quote. These items shall be 
supplied as listed in the bid specifications and in conformity with the contract documents for the prices 
set forth in the Contractor's bid response, as needed and as ordered by County. 

4. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver items described above in compliance with the bid 
specifications and Contractor's bid response. 

5. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Sheriffs Department 
and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor's bid response. No additional fees for 
delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional charges in excess of the charges in the 
Contractor's bid response to the specifications. The County agrees to pay all invoices within thirty days 
of receipt; Cofikactor agrees to hcncr cash er prexpt pap-ent disc~lmtsoffered in its bid response if 
county makes payment as provided therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the 
right to withhold payment on the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of 
the Contractor, the County agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld 
commencing fiom the last date that payment was due. 

6. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 

7. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 

An Affimative ActionEqual Opportunity Institution 



agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 
as this agreement. 

8. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance 

written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 


a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year first above written. 

BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI 

title f P 
address [L/Z w&"r bp 

ST. W f S ,  /tCo 431'4Y 

ATTEST: c LLld4,s, ,LI--
County Co selor Wendy S. Nor n, County Clerk 

AUDITOR RT ICATION 
In accordance w RSMo 50.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance q
exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising fiom this contract. (Note: Certification of this 
contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not result in a measurable county obligation at this 
time.) 

125 1/1255/2901/2902-23300 TedSupply -<& --*, 	 &fyApd~a-&A/&'< 
signaturer 	 0Date Appropriation Account 



Commission Order # 438- z0(15 
PURCHASE AGREEMENT 


FOR 

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS TERM AND SUPPLY 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the 0 day of $FC 2005 is made between 

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and J.B. Battle Uniform, herein "Contractor." 


IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Law 
Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid for Law Enforcement 
Uniforms Term and Supply, bid number 65-180CT05, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard 
Terms and Conditions, Addendum Number One, the Contractor's bid response dated October 24,2005 
and executed by Dick R Battle on behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute the 
contract documents which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or product 
data, specification and literature submitted with bid response may be permanently maintained in the 
County Purchasing Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event of conflict between any of the 
foregoing documents, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response 
Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Addendum Number One, and Standard Terms 
and Conditions shall prevail and control over the Contractor's bid response. 

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on January 1,2006 and extend 
through December 31,2006 subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement 
may be extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for twp (2) additional one-year 
periods subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor's bid response and thereafter on a month to month 
basis in the event the County is unable to re-bid andfor award a new contract prior to the expiration date 
after exercising diligent efforts to do so or not. 

3. Purchase/Service - The County agrees to purchase fiom the Contractor and the Contractor 
agrees to supply the County items 4.11.5 -Trousers. These items shall be supplied as listed in the bid 
specifications and in conformity with the contract documents for the prices set forth in the Contractor's 
bid response, as needed and as ordered by County. 

4. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver items described above in compliance with the bid 
specifications and Contractor's bid response. 

5.  Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Sheriffs Department 
and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor's bid response. No additional fees for 
delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional charges in excess of the charges in the 
Contractor's bid response to'the specifications. The County agrees to pay all invoices within thirty days 
of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if 
county makes payment as provided therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the 
right to withhold payment on the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of 
the Contractor, the County agees to pay interest 2t 2 r2te c?f9% pm mslm en dispted &m,olmts witbhe!d 
commencing fiom the last date that payment was due. 

6. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 

7 .  Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 
agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 
as this agreement. 

8. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thu?y days advance 
written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 

An Affwmative ActionlEqual Opportunity Institution 



a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year fust above written. 

BOON$ COUNTY, MISSOZTRT 

address /'aY/ 3,h/a/kpe 

ATTEST: 

County Co selorc 

I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance 

exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising fi-om this contract. (Note: Certification of this 
contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not result in a measurable county obligation at this 
time.) 

125 1112551290 112902-23300 Tendsupply 
& /2/7]&~ 

Appropriation Account 



Commission Order # 438 -100.5 
PURCHASE AGREEMENT 


FOR 

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS TERM AND SUPPLY 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the day of b (C 2005 is made between 

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and Safety & Security International, herein "Contractor." 


IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Law 
Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid for Law Enforcement 
Uniforms Tern and Supply, bid number 65-180CT05, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard 
Terms and Conditions, Addendum Number One, Quote dated November 16,2005, the Contractor's bid 
response dated October 9,2005 and executed by Jenny Doan on behalfpf the Contractor. All such 
documents shall constitute the contract documents which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by 
reference. Service or product data, specification and literature submitted with bid response may be 
permanently maintained in the County Purchasing Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event 
of conflict between any of the foregoing documents, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Addendum 
Number One, quote and Standard Terms and Conditions shall prevail and control over the Contractor's 
bid response. 

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on January 1,2006 and extend 
through December 31,2006 subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement 
may be extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for twp (2) additional one-year 
periods subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor's bid response and thereafter on a month to month 
basis in the event the County is unable to re-bid and/or award a new contract prior to the expiration date 
after exercising diligent efforts to do so or not. 

3. Purchase/Sewice - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor 
agrees to supply the County items 4.11.1 -Long Sleeve Shirt, 4.11.2 -Short Sleeve Shirt, 4.11.11 -
Stratton Winter Felt Uniform Hat (from quote), 4.11.13 -Reversible Raincoat. These items shall be 
supplied as listed in the bid specifications and in conformity with the contract documents for the prices 
set forth in the Contractor's bid response, as needed and as ordered by County. 

4. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver items described above in compliance with the bid 
specifications and Contractor's bid response. 

5. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Sheriffs Department 
and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor's bid response. No additional fees for 
delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional charges in excess of the charges in the 
Contractor's bid response to the specifications. The County agrees to pay all invoices within thirty days 
of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if 
county makes payment as provided therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the 
right to withhold payment on the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of 
the Contractor, the County agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld 
commencing from the last date that payment was due. 

6. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 

7 .  Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 
agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 
as this agreement. 

An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution 



8. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance 
written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 

a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year first above written. 

CURITY INT 	 OUNTY, MISSOURI 

APPROVE A OFORM: 	 ATTEST: I 

\\ 	,~UKUA1
Wendy S. ~or/sn, County Clerk W 

ICATION 
In accordance with RSMo 50.660, I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance 
exists and is available to satisfy the obligation(s) arising from this contract. (Note: Certification of this 
contract is not required if the terms of this contract do not result in a measurable county obligation at this 
time.) 

125 1/1255/2901/2902-23300 TedSupply 
N,f i 4 ~ m . h r n ~  

Date 	 Appropriation Account 



Commission Order # 438'7005 

PURCHASE AGREEMENT 

FOR 


LAW ENFORCEMENTUNIFORMS TERM AND SUPPLY 


THIS AGREEMENT dated the 8 day of bgc 2005 is made between 

Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State of Missouri through the Boone County 

Commission, herein "County" and Galls an Aramark Company, herein "Contractor." 


IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations contained 

herein, the parties agree as follows: 


1. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for Law 
Enforcement Uniforms Term and Supply, County of Boone Request for Bid for Law Enforcement 
Uniforms Term and Supply, bid number 65-180CT05, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, 
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Standard 
Terms and Conditions, Addendum Number One, the Contractor's bid response dated September 20, 
2005 and executed by Beth Hegeman on behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute 
the contract documents which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or 
product data, specification and literature submitted with bid response may be permanently maintained in 
the County Purchasing Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event of conflict between any of 
the foregoing documents, Introduction and General Conditions of Bidding, Primary Specifications, 
Response Presentation and Review, the un-executed Response Form, Addendum Number One and 
Standard Terms and Conditions shall prevail and control over the Contractor's bid response. 

2. Contract Duration - This agreement shall commence on January 1,2006 and extend 
through December 31,2006 subject to the provisions for termination specified below. This agreement 
may be extended beyond the expiration date by order of the County for twp (2) additional one-year 
periods subject to the pricing clauses in the Contractor's bid response and thereafter on a month to month 
basis in the event the County is unable to re-bid andlor award a new contract prior to the expiration date 
after exercising diligent efforts to do so or not. 

3. Purchase/Service - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor 
agrees to supply the County items 4.11.6 -Weather-Tech and Waterproof Duty Jacket I, 4.11.10 -
Correction Officer Short Field jacket, 4.11.12 -Stratton Summer Straw Uniform Hat, 4.11.14 -
Trouser Elbeco 28-24,4.11.15 -Trouser Elbeco 44-50,4.11.16 -Trouser Elbeco 52-54. These items 
shall be supplied as listed in the bid specifications and in conformity with the contract documents for the 
prices set forth in the Contractor's bid response, as needed and as ordered by County. 

4. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver items described above in compliance with the bid 
specifications and Contractor's bid response. 

5. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Sheriffs Department 
and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor's bid response. No additional fees for 
delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional charges in excess of the charges in the 
Contractor's bid response to the specifications. The County agrees to pay all invoices within h t ydays 
of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if 
county makes payment as provided therein. in the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the 
right to withhold payment on the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of 
the Contractor, the County agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts withheld 
commencing from the last date that payment was due. 

6. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their successors 
and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect. 

7 .  Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and 
supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid specification or contractual 
agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed writing executed with the same formality 
as this agreement. 

An Affnmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution 



8. Termination- This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days advance 
written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following circumstances: 

a. 	 County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or 
condition of this agreement, or 

b. 	 County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County 
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not 
in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or 

c. 	 If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have executed this 
agreement on the day and year fust above written. 

MISSOURIGALLS an ARAMARK COMPANY 	 B O ~ N J ~ C O ~ Y ,  

ATTEST: 

Wendy S. Nor n, County Clerk 7%'t 
I hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance 
obligation(s) arising fi-om this contract. (Note: Certification of this 
of this contract do not result in a measurable county obligation at this 

time.) 

1251112551290112902-23300 TedSupply 
- ATn E*? u ~ ~ ~ A ~ u ~ ..e@p~414/'aac

Date 	 Appropriation Account 

Beth Hegeman Territory Sales Representative 
2680 Palumbo Drive 
Lexington, KY 40509- 1000 
voice: 800876-4242 x 2 158 
f a :  877-9 142557 
email: hegeman-beth@ga~~s.com 
www.galls. com 

The Authority in Public Safety Equipment and ~~~~~~l 



. . 
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 

STATE OF MISSOURI } December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05 
ea. 

County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 8th day of December 20 05 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby reconsider the 
action of November 29,2005, Commission Order 461-2005, by which the petition to vacate and 
re-plat Inscore Subdivision Lot 2 was denied. 

Done this 8thday of December, 2005. 

7&L]Keith Sc arre &wJw 
Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: 
I 

~ a r e dM. Miller 

District I Commissioner 


Skip Elkin \ 

District I1 Commissioner 




CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 

STATE OF MISSOURI December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05) ea. 
County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the 8tll day of December 20 05 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the petition 
submitted by Jerry Swartz to vacate and re-plat Lot 2 of Inscore Subdivision (located on Robinson 
Road south of Highway 124). Said vacation is not to take place until the re-plat is approved. 

This order shall supersede Commission Order 46 1-2005. 

Done this 8 I h  day of December, 2005. 

Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: 
7 I 

Lsdw den M. Miller 
Wendy S. boren w District I Commissioner 
Clerk of the County Commission 

Skip Elkin 
District I1 Commissioner 



CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER 


STATE OF MISSOURI December Session of the October Adjourned Term. 20 05) ea. 
County of Boone 

In the County Commission of said county, on the day of December 

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz: 

Now on this day the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the 

following appointments: 


Name (Township) Board/Commission Term Expiration 

Paul W. Zullo (Rock Bridge) Planning and Zoning March 3 1,2007 (Interim) 


Commission 

Elaine S . Larson (Columbia) Mental Health Board November 30,2008 


L L I (re-appointment) 


Done this 8t11 day of December, 2005. 

* 
Keith Schnarre 
Presiding Commissioner 

ATTEST: 

&en M. Miller 

Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner 

Clerk of the' County Commission 


- I I 

DistrictSkip I1 ommissioner 

.. 


i 



" donastamper,PresidingCommissioner Boone County.%overnmentCenter 
Iler, District I Commissioner 801 E. Walnut, Room 245 

I1C ~ m m - ~  g Columbia, MO 65201 
041PC L  573886-4305 FAX 573-886-4311 

E-mall: commisslon@boonecountymo.org 
544 - Z o o r  

Commission 

BOONE COUNTY BOARD OR COMMISSION 
APPLICATION FORM 

Board or Commission: NE~TAL,dgjq~m 6&-& Term: 3vm 

Current Township: 8 ~ 0 ~ 6~ L C D Y  /LO ur/?&/A Today's Date: 

Name: ,&LA/IJ~ 5- U o d , 7 s y . %  

Home Address: 3 ~ 1 9c;. SuGpg -/nEg/r/,Gb P O  ZipCode: 65201-6567 
fo~- rar '  SlME A e 1 7 , 4 ~b e 0  E,T ST 

~usiness~ddress:PJ.i / o o  : F u c ~ d d, 6 ~ 5 1  Zip Code: d 5 2 5  

Home Phone: -5-7 3 - 886 -0/5 Work Phone: 5 7 3  .5cjJ '27*@ 

Fax: 5 7 3 - 5 7 2 - a S 6 3  E-mail: ,51firre @ m ~ ; ~ , d m h . . d & - m o , ~ ~ s .  

Qualifications:' -sr f - ! A * l ~  8 *cra,cp~g //J CL/A,CAC ?s YLHoLOG \/; ,-, Y Z ~ O ~ F , ,,+AS 

References: Admad y  P. mL,da,*,, ? c ~  .>; ~?US=L >E 7&&pe- L e  : 3 a - s ~ ~ ~  
/ 

pl,4JG/J', LCSU. 

Ihave no objections to the information in this application being made public. To the best of my 
knowledge at this time Ican serve a full term if appointed. Ido hereby certify that the above 
information is true and accurate. 

Py-n. 
Return Application To: Boone County Commission Of3ce 

Boone County Government Center 
801 East Walnut, Room 245 
Columbia, MO 65201 
Fax: 573-886-4311 

An Affirmative ActionlEqual Opportunity lnstltution 



KeithSchnarre,PresidingCommissioner 
Karen, M. Miller, District I Commissioner 
Skip Elkin, District IICommissioner 

Boone County Government Center 
801 E.Walnut, Room 245 

Columbia, MO 65201 
573-886-4305 FAX 573-886-4311 

E-mail: commission@boonecountymo.org 

Boone m u  ion 
~ / + ? ~ ~ ~ , i 7&G;m -L. / 

ade& 
BOONE COUNTY BOARD OR COMMISSIONwh2qm" APPLICATION FORM 

a-Y@a-
Board or Commission: Planning & Zoning Commission Term: 111312005 

Current towns hi^: Rock Bridge Todavs's Date: 111312005 

Name: Paul W. Zullo 

Home Address: 8451 south stanley poe road Zip Code: 65203 

BusinessAddress: Sam€! Zip Code: 

Home Phone: 4460154 Work Phone: same 
Fax: 5734465096 E-mail: zds05@msn.corn 

Qualifications: a. . -+,, 
a 

Past Community Service: childrens sports ,coaching .class dad rockbridge elementry 

References: Don Stamper ,Gene Basinger, Tom Elliott DDS.,Brad 
RussellDDS. 

I have no objections to the information in this application being made public. To the best of my 
knowledge at this time I can serve a full term if appointed. Ido hereby certify that the above 
information is true and accurate. 

Applicant Signature /...;.t' 
Return Application To: Boone County Commission Office 

Boone County Government Center /.'W Hww 
801 East Walnut, Room 245 //:id J,/ 
Columbia, MO 65201 
Fax: 573-886-4311 

/: $0 d 5  


