Al 2002

CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 20 02
€a

County of Boone
In the County Commission of said county, on the 31 day of January 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby award bid
74-26DECO01 for three tandem axle dump trucks to Al Scheppers Motor Company. The County
Commission of the County of Boone further orders the disposal of three dump trucks with dry
material spreaders and snow plows. It is further ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be
hereby authorized to sign said contracts and disposal request forms.

//
Don Stamper W

Presiding Commissioner

Done this 31* day of January, 2002.

ATTEST: gt -
/) firtn / /)) /)Zx ;’AZ/ L/)

wQ Qdé! A ) L olon ‘Karen M. Miller
Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission %@

Skip Elkin,
District IT Commissioner




A|-2p0T

Boone County Purchasing

Marlene Ridgway 601 E.Walnut, 2nd Flr
Buyer Columbia, MO 65201
(573) 886-4392
MEMORANDUM

TO: Boone County Commlssuan 7

FROM: Marlene Ridgway —{/\ MC~

RE: 74-26DEC01 — Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump Trucks

DATE: January 28, 2002

The Boone County Public Works department and | have reviewed the above
referenced bid responses and have determined that Al Scheppers Motor
Company submitted the lowest and best bid meeting our minimum bid
specifications. We are recommending award for three (3) 2002 International
7400 Series 6x4 Tandem Axle Dump Trucks each equipped with Dump Bodies,
Central Hydraulic/Controller Systems, V-Box Material Spreaders, GPS systems
and snow plows. Unit price per truck is $117,612.00 before trade-ins.

We are requesting at this time the approval of disposal through trade in three (3)
1995 International 2554 Series Trucks with Henderson 14’ Dump Body's
equipped with Dry Material Spreaders and Snow Plows. The disposal forms are
attached to this memo.

The total contract price is $316,606.40. We had originally budgeted $330,600.00

for these purchases.

The bid tabulation is attached for your review.

An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Institution



BID TABULATION
74-26ECO01 - TANDEM AXLE 6X4 DUMP TRUCKS

Midway Truck Center Al Scheppers Knapheide Columbia Freightliner
4.7.|Pricing QTY| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
4.7.1.]2001 Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump Truck | 3 $54,995.00| $164,985.00 $56,300.00 $168,900.00 No Bid No Bid $58,279.00 $174,837.00
4.7.2.|Dump Truck Body 3 $16,483.00 $49,449.00 $16,483.00 $49,449.00| $16,483.00f $49,449.00( $16,483.00 $49,449.00
4.7.3.|Central Hydraulic/Controller System | 3 $21,245.00 $63,735.00 $21,245.00 $63,735.00] $21,245.00] $63,735.00| $21,245.00 $63,735.00
4.7.4.|V-Box Material Spreader 3 $12,199.00 $36,597.00 $12,199.00 $36,597.00| $12,199.00| $36,597.00f $12,199.00 $36,597.00
4.7.5.|Global Positioning System &) $6,770.00 $20,310.00 $6,770.00 $20,310.00| $27,080.00| $81,240.00| $6,770.00 $20,310.00
4.7.6.|Snow Plow 3 $4,615.00 $13,845.00 $4,615.00 $13,845.00 $4.615.00) $13,845.00f $4,615.00 $13,845.00
4.7.7.|TOTAL $116,307.00] $348,921.00] $117,612.00 $352,836.00f $81,622.00| $244,866.00|$119,591.00 $358,773.00
4.8.[Trade-In Vehicle A
4.8.1 1995 International 2554 Series
| Truck with 14" dump body $25,000.00 $8,500.00
1994 Larson L513 Dry Material
4.8.2.|Spreader $500.00 No Bid $500.00
1988 Good Roads 10 reversible
4.8.3.|snow plow $500.00 $500.00
4.8.4.|Total Trade-In Vehicie A $13,500.00 $26,000.00 $9,500.00
4.9.|Trade-In Vehicle B
4.9.1 1995 International 2554 Series
7 Truck with 14' dump body $19,000.00 $8,500.00
1989 Fontaine SC13 Dry Material
4.9.2.|Spreader $500.00 No Bid $500.00
1990 Good Roads 10' reversible
4.9.3.|snow plow $500.00 $500.00
4.9.4.|Total Trade-In Vehicle B $13,500.00 $20,000.00 $9,500.00
4.10.|Trade-In Vehicle C
1995 International 2554 Series
4.10.1.| Truck with 14' dump body $19,000.00 $8,500.00
1994 Larson L513 Dry Material
4.10.2.|Spreader $500.00 . $500.00
1990 Good Roads 10’ reversible No Bid
4.10.3.|snow plow $500.00 $500.00
4.10.4.| Total Trade-In Vehicle C $13,500.00 $20,000.00 $9,500.00
4.11.|TRADE-IN GRAND TOTAL (A,B,C) $40,500.00 $66,000.00 $28,500.00
_ _ _ _
GRANN TOTAL less tradeins
4.12.|(inc 4. $342,271.00 $316,606.00 $244,866.00 $3¢ 3.00




,

4th Global Positioning System

4.13.|installed in 2002 International 4400 $6,770.00 $6,770.00 $6,770.00 $6,770.00
Computer $27,080.00 $23,000.00 Included in4.7.5 $23,000.00
_ | _ |
4.16.|Cooperative Purchasing Yes Yes Yes Yes
4.17.|Delivery ARO 90-120 days from order date | 90-120 days from order date 90 ARO 90 to 120 Days
_ _ _ _
Addendem One Yes Yes
Addendem Two Yes Yes
No Bids

Henke Manuf.. Cor

Tom Boland Ford. Hannibal. MO




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /2//0/0/ FIXED ASSET TAGNUMBER ¥ %15
DESCRIPTION  Sa/ow Proww o * Redeas s 8/e

| VA4 3ora Jer F 20558
REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: 772405~ Zw

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /%~

REASON FOR DISPOSITION  Z&/% Aet5m 5w/ 7 /e an o

DEPARTMENT /%8/i¢ Ldaeles SIGNATURE s/, D,
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE 12| e fay

ORIGINAL COST +1, 33> _JeoH

ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE 294 /[ — 9o p

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD: =

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE AUCTION SEALED BIDS

~_ OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER & \, - 2007

[—3)-0—

DATE APPROVED p o =t ——

SIGNATURE i _- ﬁ?’%jﬁ)




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

=
DATE /2 /ves /o FIXED ASSET TAGNUMBER ~ ©0 15"

DESCRIPTION Jawww A g 707 Lewens, j/e

Ve & 30r0 Ser & 20 54 p

REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: Zeso< ~Z .

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET ~ /$#/#2

REASON FOR DISPOSITION ~ AZ&P4 2cr5m 2 )/ terdmtns o7

DEPARTMENT A2ed/oc CJ 0ales SIGNATURE %;,,,., At
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE /1‘ 30 ) aQy

ORIGINAL COST ) 4. 33 = oyt

ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE Y | — Rd A

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD:

m

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE __AUCTION SEALED BIDS

OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER Ar I- A0 AW
DATE APPROVED

SIGNATURE




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /) s/ 0 FIXED ASSET TAG NUMBER g 34
DESCRIPTION  Swocs e dd /07 Lewanss 5

Veh s 30,3  JerZ gy 94 ¢
REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL:  772#0& —Zn

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /%2

REASON FOR DISPOSITION LEPLACEmEnT / LISRN 7

DEPARTMENT #&é//c CJonds s SIGNATURE %w oo
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE J”L) 30 lq o B

ORIGINAL COST _ ) i i 0
ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE  R1d ( — R o

) —_—

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD: 3

_ TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE AUCTION SEALED BIDS

__ _OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER 4 1-2DDZ
DATE APPROVEDYY | ﬁ / -3/ ~J~
SIGNATURE M"\) m}\




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /2 /o SO/ FIXED ASSET TAG NUMBER ORs;5F

DE'SCRIPTION Theeod,  Zivondl > Xﬂa»?y
VB & )70y Sevtl /576 CAIRK S 675255
REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: Zoetos - Ly

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /22,2

REASON FOR DISPOSITION AZg/ e Actmisor / Bvcess, /& />7r7e-a7e /‘)45.— S

DEPARTMENT /%uky /oo & avides SIGNATURE o s S,

AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE 2lolas
ORIGINAL COST 456, 7S50 1605
ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE <24 /— A4 5

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD: :

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME ~ NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL )

TRADE B AUCTION ~ SEALED BIDS

OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER &-| -2007
h / A0l

DATE APPROVED ,

/|
SIGNATURE 71

L—'/tf/




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /L /re>/0r FIXED ASSET TAGNUMBER O 7 2/7
DESCRIPTION ~ 72wcd 7anlem ezl e

| Yol & 173y Sect Jup7&C AR eS 7 E 75352
REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: 7K #0& —F 4

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /#x

REASON FOR DISPOSITION ﬂ/}’/z/?z&mﬁw/ Gocessive Mesge T ’6/“"““

DEPARTMENT /ALeb/vc tooutls SIGNATURE _ 45{5,,, Ao
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE = LL‘/ g5 _

ORIGINAL COST + Sley7s 0o j60ST
ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE 29U | — 4.6

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD:

mii

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME ~ NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE __AUCTION SEALED BIDS

OTHER EXPLAIN

SIGNATURE




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /4//9/ 5/ FIXED ASSET TAGNUMBER ~ © 22/
DESCRIPTION — Zceate . Z2niborr il Aoty

Vit & 1235 Ser# S C RIS S TS TS
REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: 7405 —Z

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /%4

REASON FOR DISPOSITION LE&4tesmsnr/ Fucesssis otesye ¥ Kepiiee

DEPARTMENT /2é/c & opedos SIGNATURE {{.,, A.:é
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE 6/ 14 / 95"

ORIGINAL COST 456,75 0 ol S
ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE 4| — Fdo

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD:

™

~ TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT _

INDIVIDUAL

~__TRADE AUCTION SEALED BIDS

OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER 4—,] = 2007

DATE APPROVED Y

o

SIGNATURE , L/,%)




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /2L for FIXED ASSET TAG NUMBER O & f. 24~
DESCRIPTION  Spesalen |, gy alliveil) | S, op
/Z’/’g Sy ._,Q/ué SO FD

REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: 72205,

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET /A4

REASON FOR DISPOSITION  £&5%. tesm s/ o en. veel®

DEPARTMENT AZ6Lr< cod ks, SIGNATURE AZ? DA
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE ' /.30 /f) of

ORIGINAL COST 4+ 6,646 6ot}

ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE K| — K45

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD:

il

_ TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE __AUCTION SEALED BIDS

~ OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER 4| -Z2.00y 7
DATE APPROVED [~ 0! * L -

SIGNATURE




BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE /L o /o FIXED ASSET TAG NUMBER oI 756
Vol # I/ & S2. & SC 29422

REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: TRANE 7y,

OTHER INFORMATION:
CONDITION OF ASSET ﬂ o2

REASON FOR DISPOSITION  ££ 7% Ao 50T / L) O O ceT™

DEPARTMENT /Aub/ic (uotee . SIGNATURE A%,, 44.33(__ 3
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE ”-1/ 229 7

ORIGINAL COST ta 17263 o
ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE 24 (— L4 A

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD:

)

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE ~ AUCTION 'SEALED BIDS

OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBER Ar \ -720607

DATE APPROVED /3~

SIGNATURE



BOONE COUNTY

REQUEST FOR DISPOSAL OF COUNTY PROPERTY

DATE LYY, FIXED ASSET TAG NUMBER oEF2y
DESCRIPTION £t an ol J<7 9% Heciill | St
Vet # 3,06 Lo & Jos 557

REQUESTED MEANS OF DISPOSAL: Zwzrns —&

OTHER INFORMATION:

CONDITION OF ASSET A4/«

REASON FOR DISPOSITION A&7 % Aferom&Ens S iiveod —ie?™

DEPARTMENT  /Zefte. Conidee. SIGNATURE 4,/,, e,
AUDITOR

ORIGINAL PURCHASE DATE i /5 o /_‘7 4

ORIGINAL COST < by Wil Jeol

ORIGINAL FUNDING SOURCE ___ 'Y | — [24 /A

COUNTY COMMISSION / COUNTY CLERK

APPROVED DISPOSAL METHOD: ;

TRANSFER DEPARTMENT NAME NUMBER

LOCATION WITHIN DEPARTMENT

INDIVIDUAL

TRADE __AUCTION _ SEALED BIDS

___OTHER EXPLAIN

COMMISSION ORDER NUMBE

DATE APPROVED fJ /|
SIGNATURE A7\

R'};fuio oL




JRN-29-2882 ©96:45 coL S73 886 4402 P.92

1/28/02 PURCHASE REQUISITION A1-200T gy

~ DATE BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI N

— S—

'ENDOR NO. )

Bid Documentation
(Check One)
Al Scheppers Motor Co.

Vendor Name: Sole Source:
Address: Oral Bids (attached):

Written Bids (attached):

74-26DECO1
City, State, Zip: Bid or Co. Order Number:
2040 — Public Works
Bill To Dept. No. Not Required:
2040 — Public Works

Ship To Dept. No.

! [ ltem Description Unit J
|__Department l Account (or managerial code) Qty Price Amount
2(0(410 ' 512140 ]|0 | Tandem Axlc 6x4 Dump Truck 3 | 88.721.33 | 266,164.00
2/0{4 (0] [9][2[3[08]06 | V-Box Spreader 3 | 1219900 | 36,597.00
2101410 9123|060 | Snow Plows 3 4615.00 13,845.00

| $316,606.00

CLERK'S OFFICE

*DO NOT UNSTAPLE THESE PAGES

"THE ONLY ACTION NEEDED IS TO WRITE THE

COMM ORDER # ON THE FORM AND RETURN TO
AUDITOR'S OFFICE.

All deliverics shall be made FOB
Destination with freight charges fully
included and prepaid. The seller pays
and bears the freight charges.

nE

I certify that the goods, services or charges 2bove specified arc nccessary for the use of this department, and are solely for the

benefit of the county.
géﬂc/w //28/22
/}\J “Requesting Official ’
o Ll

Coumty-Gommissish-Approva; ~ Auditor Approval

TO0TAL P.B2



Court Order # érl’ ZDD_Z_,

PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR
TANDEM AXLE 6X4 DUMP URUCKS

THIS AGREEMENT dated the _?)/i day (&r p/n UJMOZ is made

between Boone County, Missouri, a political subdivision of the State q‘ﬂMissouri through the
Boone County Commission, herein “County” and Al Scheppers Motor Company, herein
“Contractor.”

IN CONSIDERATION of the parties performance of the respective obligations
contained herein, the parties agree as follows:
L. Contract Documents - This agreement shall consist of this Purchase Agreement for
Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump Trucks, County of Boone Request for Bid for Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump
Trucks, bid number 74-26DECO1 including Instructions and General Conditions of Bidding,
Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, and the unexecuted Response Form,
Addendum One and Two as well as the Contractor’s bid response dated January 10, 2002,
executed by A. H. Wagner, on behalf of the Contractor. All such documents shall constitute the
contract documents, which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. Service or
product data, specification and literature submitted with bid response may be permanently
maintained in the County Purchasing Office bid file for this bid if not attached. In the event of
conflict between any of the foregoing documents, the terms, conditions, provisions and
requirements contained in the bid specifications including Instructions and General Conditions of
Bidding, Primary Specifications, Response Presentation and Review, the unexecuted Response
Form and Addendum One and Two shall prevail and control over the Contractor’s bid response.

2. Purchase - The County agrees to purchase from the Contractor and the Contractor agrees
to supply the County a quantity of three (3) Year 2002 Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump Trucks, three (3)
Dump Truck Body, three (3) Central Hydraulic/Controller System, three (3) V-Box Material
Spreader, four (4) Global Positioning System plus computer and three (3) Snow Plow .
Contractor further agrees to accept the following trade-in truck and equipment for the following
trade-in values: three (3) 1995 International 2554 Series Truck with Heil 14’ dump body, three
(3) Dry Material Spreaders, three (3) Reversible Snow Plows, with a trade in value of $66,000,
The final price of the contract to Contractor is $316,606.00. All new Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump
Trucks and Equipment will be provided in conformity with the bid specifications and as set forth
in the Contractor’s bid response. All trade in Truck and Equipment will be accepted as is, where
is for the values proposed in the bid response.

3. Delivery - Contractor agrees to deliver the Tandem Axle 6x4 Dump Trucks and
Equipment per the bid specifications and within 120 days after receipt of order.

4. Billing and Payment - All billing shall be invoiced to the Boone County Public
Works Department and billings may only include the prices listed in the Contractor’s bid
response. No additional fees for delivery or extra services or taxes shall be included as additional
charges in excess of the charges in the Contractor’s bid response to the specifications. The
County agrees to pay all invoices within thirty days of receipt; Contractor agrees to honor any
cash or prompt payment discounts offered in its bid response if county makes payment as
provided therein. In the event of a billing dispute, the County reserves the right to withhold



" payment on the disputed amount; in the event the billing dispute is resolved in favor of the

Contractor, the County agrees to pay interest at a rate of 9% per annum on disputed amounts
withheld commencing from the last date that payment was due.

5. Binding Effect - This agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their
successors and assigns for so long as this agreement remains in full force and effect.

6. Entire Agreement - This agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the
parties and supersedes any prior negotiations, written or verbal, and any other bid or bid
specification or contractual agreement. This agreement may only be amended by a signed
writing executed with the same formality as this agreement,

7. Termination - This agreement may be terminated by the County upon thirty days
advance written notice for any of the following reasons or under any of the following
circumstances:

a. County may terminate this agreement due to material breach of any term or
condition of this agreement, or

b. County may terminate this agreement if in the opinion of the Boone County
Commission if delivery of products are delayed or products delivered are not

in conformity with bidding specifications or variances authorized by County, or

c. If appropriations are not made available and budgeted for any calendar year.

\
IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties through their duly authorized representatives have

executed this agreement on the day and year first above written.

Al Scheppers Motor Co. BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI
by M B by: one .
A E el - _ J y B
Don Stamper; g Commissioner
ROVED AS TO FORM: ATTEST:

o Wendy 5. sgop s
CoTty Counselgr Wendy S. Noreh, County Clerk

AUDKTOR CERTIFICATION

In accordance with RSMo 50.660, | hereby certify that a sufficient unencumbered appropriation balance exists and
is available to satisfy the obligation(s) incurred by this contract. (Note: Certification is not required for a term and

supply contract or where the terms of the contract do not result in a measurable county obligation.)
2040-92400 - $266.164.00
2040-92300 - $36.597.00
& / 2040-92300 - $13.845,00

e O Lol d. sefes T TR —
Signature G R Date Appropriation Account

Y




AZ -2002
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 20 02
ea
County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31 day of January 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
following budget revision:

Department Account and Title Amount Decrease Amount Increase
2040-10100; Salaries $42,840
2040-37210: Training and Schools $5.,500
2040-48100: Natural Gas $8,144
2040-48200: Electricity $1,855
2040-48300; Water $5,001
2040-59050; Engine Fluids $2.591
2040:59105: Tires $2.200
2040-71100: Outside Services $26.000
2040-91300: Machinery and $276
Equipment
2040-91302: Computer Software $180
2040-92300: Replacement $159
Computer Hardware
2040-92400: Replacement Trucks $24.419
2040-60200: Equipment Repair and $20,191
Maintenance
2040-26200: Rock $108,527

Said budget revision is to cover shortfalls for materials and repairs.

Done this 31* day of January, 2002. /}g%i

‘Don Stamper
Pres1d1ng/Comm1ss1oner

ATTEST: /V‘ (e /b NI,
Wendy 3. DHLOJL Kareh M. Miller

Wendy S. Ndren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission
e

Skip E1k1n
District 1T Comm1ss1oner




= BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI  42-2002

REQUEST FOR BUDGET REVISION

k,

Y
¥

Fla.

kg

¥ ; .
4 r Moo A
T LA

T 0?7

1/23/02
DATE FOR AUDITORS USE
Account Title Transfer Transfer
Department Account (or managerial code) From To
(Decrease) | (Increase)

2(0(41(0 1{0([1 0|0 [Salaries (ok per Sue Lake) 42,840
3(7|2]|1]|0 | Training & Schools 5,500
418|100 | Natural Gas 8,144
4|18(2]0]|0 |Electricity 1,855
4/8|3|0(0 | Water 5,001
519(0|5]|0 | Engine Fluids 2,591
5(9|1]0|5 | Tires 2,200
711 |1/[0]0 | Outside Services 26,000
9(1|3|0]|0 |Machinery & Equipment 276
911(3]|0|2 | Computer Software 180
9(2|3]|0/|0 | Replacement Mach & Equipment 9,553
912(3|0]|1 | Replacement Computer Hardware 159
9(2|4]|0|0 | Replacement Trucks 24,419
6(0|2]|0|0 | Equip Repair & Maint 20,191 |
26200 Rock 108,527

128,718 | 128,718 |
Explanation:

/-23-02 -

shortfalls, mat
-~ / Approved - Auditor—" \

}kﬁ Mm Sl TSNy

PRESIDING COMMISSIONER DIST kl( T I COMMISSIONER DISTRICT I} COMMISSIONER
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A3 2002
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 20 )2
ea

County of Boone
In the County Commission of said county, on the 31 day of January 20 (2

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve Change
Order #7 for Gans Road project in the amount of $28,170.18. It is further ordered that the
Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said change order.

Done this 31* day of January, 2002.

Don Stamper
Presiding Commissioner
7

ATTEST: < . ,

I,_\ VO Qd} ! 3, ﬁ oA s/ Kareh M. Miller
Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission ? : M—/_\

Skip Elkm
District 11 C ommissioner




JE—
: BOONE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 4’3 —20D
_ DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Change Order No.: Seven (7) Job No.: 9127 Date:  January 7, 2002

Contract No.:21-11MAY00
Project Location: Gans Road Project
Contractor: C.L. Richardson Construction

It is hereby mutually agreed that when this change order has been signed by the contracting parties, the following described
changes in the work required by the contract shall be executed by the contractor without changing the terms of the contract

except as herein stipulated and agreed.

Description of Changes:  The contract amount should be adjusted to reflect the final in-place quantities. See attachment

for details.

CONTRACTORS PROPOSAL FOR THE ABOVE DESCRIBED CHANGES:

[/We hereby agree to the modifications of the contract as described above and agree to furnish all material and labor and
perform all work in connection therewith in accordance with the requirements for similar work in existin g contract except

as otherwise stipulated herein, for the following considerations:

Contract Amount; Add to the Contract Amount a total of $28.170.18
2 ) chf
| R | 2337 -
CONTRACTOR - C.L. Richardson Construction 25 2 = -
SIGNATURE DATE_//08/6 £52dg (8-
L] EE E --) ~
%gu& ‘\-.é. ) - \\,
Supervisor Approved by Director QH/M = g 2 §§ < i’::
=8 e
& & 4 % N
DATE ///,é /()&' Efga)g'é = AN
: 5533 e
/ LES 5208 L
. :g 3
SE 09 R =
i3 ;“8 g g
J-3)-0o - CoisEs
—_— -~
DATE
STATEMENT OF CONTRACT AMOUNT:
ORIGINAL CONTRACT AMOUNT 3 674,681.27
PREVIOUS ADDITIONS $  47,072.62
TOTAL $ 721,753.89
PREVIOUS DEDUCTIONS 3 0.00
NET PRIOR TO THIS CHANGE $ 721,753.89
AMOUNT OF THIS CHANGE __ X ADD DEDUCT 3 28,170.18
CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE $ 749,924.07



43-20072

1/22/02 PURCHASE REQUISITION
DATE BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI
2180
VENDOR NO.
Bid Documentation
(Check One)
Vendor Name: CL Richardson Approved Sole Source:
Address: Written Bids(attached):
Add to PO 2001 167 Bid or Comm Ord Number:
City, State, Zip: Not Required:
Bill To Dept. No. 2045
Ship To Dept. No. 2045
Item Description Unit
Department Account (or managerial code) Qty Price Amount

210 |4 |5 711110 Change Order #7 — Gans Road 1 28,170.18

CLERK'S OFFICE

*DO NOT UNSTAPLE THESE PAGES

*THE ONLY ACTION NEEDED IS
TO WRITE THE
COMM ORDER # ON THE FORM AND RETURN TO

ANNIE.

I certify that the goods, services or charges above specified are necessary for the use of this department, and are solely for the
benefit of the county.

Not Applicable

Requesting Official

County Commission Approval

Auditor Approval



4 4 2002
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 2002
ea
County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31 day of J anuary 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve Change
Order #3 for Dee Woods Road project in the amount of $21,600. It is further ordered that the
Presiding Commissioner be hereby authorized to sign said change order.

Don Stamper /
Presiding Commissioner

.
ATTEST: I~ oz
% ..l MI %/"’7 /,Z(A_:%:, 4 I

U ngﬂ! [ ,S D&ﬁQg p 24 ’Karéen M. Miller

Wendy S! Noren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission QQ/‘/
Skip E]ki%

District IT Commissioner

Done this 31* day of January, 2002.




44-z2007

BOONE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Change Order No.: Three (3) Job No.: 9619 Date: 1-10-02
Project Location: Dee Woods Road Improvement

Contractor: J.C. Industries, Inc.

It is hereby mutually agreed that when this change order has been signed by the contracting parties, the
following described changes in the work required by the contract shall be executed by the contractor
without changing the terms of the contract except as herein stipulated and agreed.

Description of Changes: Add 1,800 tons to the line item for temporary rock.

CONTRACTORS PROPOSAL FOR THE ABOVE DESCRIBED CHANGES:

[/We hereby agree to the modifications of the contract as described above and agree to furnish all material
and labor and perform all work in connection therewith in accordance with the requirements for similar
work in existing contract except as otherwise stipulated herein, for the following considerations:

Contract Amount: Add to the Contract Amount a total nol to exceed $ 21,600.00 - ~B
Twenty-one Thousand Six Hundred Dollars & 00/100 o = = g ~ N
£56 Eﬁ 22 L X
. HEs28e @ > -
CONTRW - 1.C. Indugfrics, Inc. 3 ‘E S25 X
; LEEEE T
7% — D 58088 S -
SIGNATURE 77 72~ DATE / &~ P00 5— g2 g ;d«; p R
/ 52855 - ¢
; . Of_l_) o %-: Bf_ —
Recommended by: Project Manager Approved by Director _ gz E g 2 B ; § 1 !fl
DES P59 € >
SIGNATURE 1 DATE _ [-10-02 L2298 48 S
2o YR s L N
=003
E5EE 20

Accepted by \Boan unty

SIGNATURE _/\L/T\, a’ﬁ’}@\ DATE /-

STATEMENT OF CONTRACT AMOUNT:

ORIGINAL CONTRACT AMOUNT $385,651.95
PREVIOUS ADDITIONS $ 500.00

TOTAL $386,151.95
PREVIOUS DEDUCTIONS $ 0.00
NET PRIOR TO THIS CHANGE $386,151.95
AMOUNT OF THIS CHANGE $ 21,600.00

CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE $407,751.95



A4-726D2

1/24/02 PURCHASE REQUISITION
DATE BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI
8234
VENDOR NO.
Bid Documentation
(Check One)

Vendor Name: JC INDUSTRIES INC Approved Sole Source:
Address: Written Bids(attached):

Bid or Comm Ord Number:

City, State, Zip: Not Required:

Bill To Dept. No. 2045

Ship To Dept. No. 2045

Item Description Unit
Department Account (or managerial code) Qty Price Amount
2 (0 |4 |5 7111110 |0 | CHANGE ORDER #3 DEE WOODS 1 21,600
CLERK'S OFFICE

*DO NOT UNSTAPLE THESE PAGES

*THE ONLY ACTION NEEDED IS TO WRITE THE

COMM ORDER # ON THE FORM AND RETURN TO
ANNIE.

I certify that the goods, services or charges above specified are necessary for the use of this department, and are solely for the
benefit of the county.

0 ,Lr[lrl._(t« /C {7’\(.’. e s

\ {
Requesting Official
Not Applicable

oA

County Commission Approval Auditor Approval



45 2002
CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 2002
ea
County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31% day of January 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the
contract with the Curators of the University of Missouri for the EPA Clean Water Act Phase 11
Stormwater Regulation. It is further ordered that the Presiding Commissioner be hereby

authorized to sign said contract.
/AOM‘ Ng—
v

Don Stamper
Presidiy Commissioner

ATTEST: 9 J
:’(_),24-1({; S, L et s Karen M. Miller

Done this 31* day of January, 2002.

Wendy S/ Noren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission ;
Skip Elkin \

District IT Commissioner



A5-2007
AGREEMENT

This agreement is entered into on this 8\ day of S-A&L\ &‘2 i, 2002, between the County of Boone | #»
(hereinafier “County”), Missouri and the, University of Missouri (hereinafter “University”). ( i/

[Curators of the'

County and University agree as follows:

1.

Services - University agrees to provide a project director, an environmental educator, and related services
to County for its implementation of EPA Clean Water Act Phase II Stormwater Regulations. University
agrees to provide an environmental educator who is employed full-time by the University to perform the
following duties:

Information and Education Materials

Identify or create additional information and education materials (i.e., brochures, flyers, posters, booklets, and slide
shows) that explain the importance of water quality; identify storm water related sources of water pollution; and
outline actions that the general public, contractors, and municipal employees can take to protect water quality.
Distribute the information and education materials to the general public, contractors, municipal employees, and the
media.

Watershed Partnership Activities
Provide staff support for Watershed Partnership activities (i.e., Bear, Hominy, Grindstone, Clear, Gans, Mill, Flat

Branch, County House Branch, Meridith, Harmony, Hinkson, and Rocky Fork). Activities will include expanding the
number of partnership members, organizing and advertising for at least two public meetings in each watershed,
providing information and education materials for citizens that attend the meetings, and providing support for
partnership community activities reducing storm water pollution (e.g., storm drain stenciling).

Community Watershed Partnership Commitiee
Provide staff support for the Community Watershed Partnership Committee comprised of representatives from the 12

Watershed Partnerships in Boone County. Work with Committee members to coordinate activities with Boone
County. Facilitate access to the media for Committee public information activities and serve as a media spokesperson
for the Committee, when appropriate.

Storm Water Planning
Work with representatives from the Boone County and the Community Watershed Partnership Committee to facilitate

public input to identify major storm water problems in Boone County watersheds and to seek public recommendations
to Boone County on selecting priority storm water problems and best management practices to solve the problems.

Presentations

Coordinate and/or deliver at least five presentations to community groups (e.g., neighborhood associations, stream
teams, youth groups) and five presentations to development related groups (e.g., home builders, realtors, construction
engineers) on opportunities for preventing storm water pollution.

Community Storm Water Project Web Page

Maintain the Community Storm Water Project web page (integrated with Boone County's web page) that provides
information on Community Storm Water Project events and activities; guidance for home owners, builders, and local
business' on how to prevent storm water related pollution; up-dated information on progress toward development of
the city/county storm water permit application to EPA and DNR, and links to other sources of information on storm
water.

Quarterly Reports
Provide written quarterly reports to the Boone County Public Works Department on progress toward accomplishing

project education and partnership formation activities.

Other Goods and Services
Provide necessary office and communication equipment, supplies, and services as necessary to carry out the services
provided herein subject to the budget set forth below.

Agreement Duration - Services under this agreement shall begin February 1, 2002, and the agreement
shall terminate January 31, 2003.

ANUMC-County stormwater contract-2002.doc 12/28/01

1

5/

(3



L&y
Uyo. SO

3. Budget and Compensation — County agrees to pay University the sum of Twenty Nine Thonj‘éa‘gﬁi Nine
Dollars ($29,009.00) for the above services. Payment shall be made within 30 days after receipt of an
invoice after execution of this agreement. County and University hereby approve the following budget for
services under this agreement:

Personnel $26,043
Position Percent Time Salary Benefits Total .
Project Director 5% $3,643 $911 $4,554
Environmental Educator 50% $17,191 $4,298 $21,489
Supplies (Misc. office supplies) $216
Other Costs $2,750

Educational Materials ($500)
Educational Events ($1,250)
Telephone ($250)

Copying ($250)
Postage ($500)

Total $TZ9,009
IN WITNESS WHEREQOF, the parties hereto have been duly authorized to enter into

this Agreement as of the above referenced date.

FOR THE CURATORS OF THE

UNIVERSITY OF MISSOURI BOO INTY, MISSOURI
) /—' ;
The Curators of the Urfivel vers:ty of Missouri Don &tam erl Pmmdnﬂg Commissioner
'‘Michael J. Warnock, PhD
Director
Office of Sponsored Program ATTEST:

Administration
MU Proposal #02110081

Wendy 5. Oegod v

Wendy Noren, County Clerk
Approved: App s to Legal Form:
X% 2 / /Zw ,Z
David Mink, Directof Public Works County Codnselor
I certify that this contract is within the
purpose of the appropriation to which it
is to be charged and there is an unencumbered
balance to the credit of such appropriation
sufficient to pay therefore.
Mo Q \ L Lebo /oo L ’/3"/0'3-
June E. Pitchford, Auditor/ /- ¢ L Date

J ROUS 710 tag, 009

A:\UMC-County stormwater contract-2002.doc 12/28/01



1/24/02

DATE

8620

VENDOR NO.

Vendor Name:

Address:

UNIVERSITY OF MISSOURI Approved Sole Source:

45-2002

PURCHASE REQUISITION
BOONE COUNTY, MISSOURI

Bid Documentation
(Check One)

Written Bids(attached):

Bid or Comm Ord Number:

City, State, Zip: Not Required:
Bill To Dept. No. 2045
Ship To Dept. No. 2045
Item De:cription Unit
Department Account {or managerial code) Qty Price Amount
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CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI } January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 2002
€a

County of Boone
In the County Commission of said county, on the 31% day of January 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby authorize the
extension of temporary employment of Sheree Nichols as housekeeping temporary until such time
that the full time employee she is replacing returns to full duty not beyond the close of business on
March 22, 2002.

Done this 31* day of January, 2002.

Don Stamper v

Presiding Commissioner

AT Pacer /5 Able)
Wiendy S, Deton w Kardn M. Miller

Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner
Clerk of the County Commission %
Skip Elkin)

District II Commissioner
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Shawna Victor - Extending temp FMLA employee Page 1

From: Ken Roberts

To: Karen Miller

Date: 1/25/02 3:30PM

Subject: Extending temp FMLA employee

Commissioner. | have received information that Glen Whithurse has had his back surgery and is at home
recovering. Glen will need to stay out till at least 3-22-02.

I would like to put on the Commission agenda Tuesday 1-29-02 that the commission extend Sheree
Nichols temporary employment for 6 more weeks till 3-22-02.

Thank you for you consideration to this matter.
Ken Roberts
Manager BCFM

CC: David Mink; Shawna Victor
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CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI January Session of the November Adjourned Term. 20 02
ea
County of Boone

In the County Commission of said county, on the 31 day of January 20 02

the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

Now on this day, the County Commission of the County of Boone does hereby approve the flexible
hiring rate procedure forms as recommended by the Personnel Advisory Committee.

Done this 31* day of January, 2002,

/ \Q peZl] Qg —
Don Stamper v
Presiding Commissioner
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wQqu S. LSOQ_QJ\ & Karen M. Miller

Wendy S. Noren District I Commissioner

Clerk of the County Commission
L.
AR

Skip EIkWy,
District IT Commissioner




43-2002

FLEXIBLE HIRING RATE

In order to provide Administrative Authorities with the flexibility to compete for highly qualified
individuals and to compete where the desired job skills are scarce, Boone County will utilize a
flexible hiring rate plan. Under the plan, an Administrative Authority is authorized to hire a new
employee between 80% - 90% of the mid-point without further approval subject to the Auditor
certifying that budgeted funds are available. Such certification shall be indicated by Auditor’s
approval of the Personnel Action Form. If the requested salary amount exceeds the salary
budgeted for the position in the adopted budget, the Administrative Authority shall prepare a
schedule demonstrating that funds are available and attach the schedule to the Personnel
Action Form. However, if the prospective employee requires a higher starting salary (i.e.,
between 91% - 120% of the mid-point of the pay range), the approval level for hiring rates
above the minimum of the pay range shall be correlated to position in the salary range, as
outlined in the table below:

Position in

Salary Range Approval Level

80% - 90% Administrative Authority

91% - 100% Human Resource Director Review/Liaison
Commissioner Approval

101% - 120% Human Resource Director Review/County

Commission Approval

In summary, steps are outlined below:

1. The Administrative Authority shall complete the attached form “Request to Hire Between
91% - 120% of the Salary Range Mid-Point” and prepare a schedule that demonstrates
that funding is available within the salary and wage appropriation (account #10100) and
calculates the amount for a budget revision, if needed. The Administrative Authority shall
submit the form, the schedule and the budget revision (if needed) to the Auditor for
certification of fund availability.

2. The Auditor certifies fund availability and approves budget revision (if applicable) and
forwards to the Human Resource Director for review and processing.

3. The Human Resource Director will review the request and provide his/her
recommendations regarding the proposed starting salary and forward to the Liaison
Commissioner for approval/denial.

4. The Liaison Commissioner will either approve or deny a request, and budget revision (if
applicable), for a proposed starting salary between 91% and 100% of mid-point and
return the request form to the Administrative Authority. If the proposed starting salary is
above the mid-point, the Liaison Commissioner will schedule the issue for review by the
County Commission for approval/denial.

5. The County Commission will review all requests for a starting salary above the mid-point
and will either approve or deny the request. After approval/denial, the County
Commission will return the request form to the Administrative Authority.

6. The Administrative Authority will attach a copy of the approved “Request to Hire
Between 91% - 120% of the Salary Range Mid-Point” form to the Personnel Action Form

and submit to the Auditor's office.
(HR/Betty/Flexible Hiring Rate) Revised 1/22/02



BOONE COUNTY

Description of form: To request approval to hire between 91% - 120% of the salary range mid-point.

Procedure:

1. The Administrative Authority or designee completes the form and prepares a schedule that demonstrates that funding is available within the salary and wage
appropriation (account #10100) and calculates the amount for a budget revision, if needed. The Administrative Authority submits the form , the schedule, and
the budget revision (if needed) to the Auditor for certification of funds availability.

2. The Auditor certifies funds availability and approves budget revision (if applicable) and forwards to Human Resource Director .

The Human Resource Director reviews the information, makes recommendation, and forwards to Liaison Commissioner.

4. The Liaison Commissioner reviews the request. If the proposed starting salary is between 91% - 100% of mid-point, Liaison Commissioner will
approve/deny request and budget revision (if applicable) and return this form to the Administrative Authority. If the proposed starting salary is above
the mid-point, the Liaison Commissioner will schedule the issue for review by the County Commission for approval/denial. After approval/denial, the
County Commission will return this form to the Administrative Authority.

5. The Administrative Authority will attach a copy of this approved form to the Personnel Action Form.

w

Name of prospective employee Department

Position Title Position No.

Proposed Starting Salary (complete one only) Annual: % of Mid-Point
OR Hourly: % of Mid-Point

No. of employees in this job classification within your Department?
Justification (Describe the prospective employee’s education and/or work experience which supports this proposed
compensation level)

If proposed salary exceeds what other employees in the same job classification are paid, explain how the prospective
employee’s background exceeds others working in the same job classification:

What effect, if any, will this proposal have on salary relationships with other positions in your office and/or positions in
other offices?

Additional comments: -

Administrative Authority’s Signature: Date:

Auditor’s Certification: Funds are available within the existing departmental salary and wage appropriation (#10100).
Funds are not available within the existing departmental salary and wage appropriation (#10100);
budget revision required to provide funding is attached.

Auditor’s Signature: Date:

Human Resource Director’s Recommendations:

Human Resource Director’s Signature: Date:
Liaison Commissioner: Approve Deny

Comment(s):
Liaison Commissioner’s Signature: Date:
County Commission Approve Deny

Comment(s):

Presiding Commissioner’s Signature: Date:
District I Commissioner’s Signature: Date:
District IT Commissioner’s Signature: Date:

(hr/forms/Request to hire between 91%-120% of Midpoint) Revised 1/22/02




Shawna Victor - Commission Agenda Item - Flexible Hiring Rate Page 1

From: Betty Dickneite

To: Bobbitt, Melinda; Boehm, Ted; Crane, Kevin; Elkin, Skip; Hendren, Connie; Johnson,
Bettie; Lensmeyer, Patricia; Mallicoat, Michael; Miller, Karen; Mink, David; Murray, Kay; Noren,
Wendy: Pitchford, June; Schauwecker, Tom; Shawver, Stan; Stamper, Don; Victor, Shawna

Date: 1/22/02 3:19PM

Subject: Commission Agenda Item - Flexible Hiring Rate

To all: | have asked Shawna Victor to place the Flexible Hiring Rate Plan on the Commission agenda
for next Tuesday, January 29th at 9:30 a.m. This item was discussed at the PAC meeting on last
Thursday and the PAC recommended adoption with some minor modifications. Attached for your
information is a copy of the revised procedure/form. If you have further comments, please feel free to let
me know, contact the Commissioners or attend the Commission meeting.

This item was discussed at length at the January PAC Meeting. The minutes of that meeting have been
distributed by Susan Wells if you care to review the transcripts for more details.

Thanks!
Betty Dickneite, Director HR

Boone County

CcC: Adkins, Bonnie; Ayers, Angela; Davidson, Jacquelyn; Richards, Cathy; Wells, Susan



